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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 10:18 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Claims'; SUR; assignments
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS SDH 381 K

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDH 381K (Excess $0/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4083933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October 2019 1:15 PM

To: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS SDH 381 K

Dear George,

Received with thanks.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October, 2019 1:09 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: OD CLAIMS SDH 381 K

Dear all,



View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SDH381K (37671851755G)
oD
Aug 29 2019 7:15AM
[LIM MEI LING, JENNY(LIN MEILING, JENNY)]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

l Reply l Reply All | Mark as Unread] Print Message I Delete Message | ForwardJ

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 22/10/2019 09:37 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$8659.00) - SDH381K - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Approved:8659.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

[DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

| There are no documents.
I




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.reg.No:198607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Date: 16 Oct 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SDH381K Accident Date . 29/08/2019
Make 1 AUDI Q2 Policy No. : 1700030033-02
Assignment Date : 16/10/2019 Excess : 5%$0.00
Date of Inspection : 15/10/2019 Est. Duration of Repair :3.00
Inspection At - PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S$ 15,252.00
Revised Amount :S$ 8,659.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S$ 597.00
Total :S$ 9,256.00
Lump Sum Repair :S%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :5%
Pre-Accident Value :S$ 85,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S$ 47,153.00
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S$ 37,847.00

Remarks

( x ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us have
your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( ) Other comments :



Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coRregNo:19e607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Date: 16 Oct 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SDH381K Accident Date : 29/08/20
Make : AUDI Q2 Policy No. : 1700030
Assignment Date : 16/10/2019 Excess : 5§$0.00
Date of Inspection 1 15/10/2019 Est. Duration of Repair :3.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S$ 15,252.00
Revised Amount :S$ 8,659.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S$ 597.00
Total :S$ 9,256.00
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value :S$ 85,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S$ 47,153.00
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S$ 37,847.00

Remarks

( x ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Ki
your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( )  Other comments :

19
033-02

ndly let us have



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exp.orted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Oct 2019

Singapore NRIC
170F

SDH381K

No

15 Oct 2019

AUDI

Q2 1.0TFSISTRONIC
Red

2017

CHZ390643
WAUZZZGA3HAD59997
85.0kW (113 bhp)
$26,087.00

24 Jul 2017

24 Jul 2017

0

$18,522.00

Yes
23 Jul 2027
$13,891.00

23 Jul 2027
A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$42,801.00

$33,262.00

$47,153.00

7



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 WIP : 10489
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop i  UbiRoad1

Contact No ! 63662323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference : PA/0D/1038/2019/NS
Date :  30-Aug-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your insured vehicle no : FBE5645G

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name i MsLim MeiLing
Address . Blk 254 Bangkit Road
#08-216
Singapore 670254
Telephone 1 HP+6597849097
Type of Claim :  Own Damage Claims
Policy No. i 1700030033-02
Vehicle No : SDH 381K
Model Code :  Q21.0TFSIS Tronic
Model / Year t Jul-17
Engine No :  CHZ390643
Chassis No : WAUZZZGA3HAQ59997
Mileage
Date In :
Estimated By : Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date ! 29-Aug-19

Place of Accident ¢ Along Road 1 Travelling Towards Road 2 Bangkit Rd



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax ”O({O

,t

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SDH 3

Es
S/n Nature of Jobs C

To remove, check and reinstall front wire harness for
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor and s/n S
headlight washer assy.

/

To dismantle and renew front bumper and lhs ./
2 headlight. Re-organise rear crash management 5

components. Reinstall all parts removed. {7~

~ X
3 To respray front bumper and lLhs front fender. S
x 477

4 To carry out diagnostic checks. S/N S

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SDH 381 K

Estimated Surveyor's
S/n Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
To remove, check and reinstall front wire harness for
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor and s/n S 360.00 /
headlight washer assy.
/7
To dismantle and renew front bumper and lhs
2 headlight. Re-organise rear crash management $ 1,600.00 7¢0
components. Reinstall all parts removed. {7~ '
-~ X
3 Torespray front bumper and Lhs front fender. $ 2,000.00 §S7
(e, '
4 To carry out diagnostic checks. S/IN S 192.00 /f; A
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,152.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SDH 381 K

Damaged Parts & Prices

S/N Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 FRONTBUMPERASSY X K $  1,706.00
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS X nn S 314.00
3 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE-CENTER X Nn $ 179.00
4 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE-LH s 154.00
5 FRONT BUMPER END CAP-LH xnn $ 31.00
6 FRONT BUMPER SPOILER , [ ] $ 273.00
7 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT * Nn $ 142.00
8  FRONT WHEEL SPOILER-LH X nn $ 31.00
S FRONT ADAPTER-LH $ 32.00

10 RADIATORGRILLE -~ (“T s 1,301.00
11 RADIATOR GRILLE STRIKER PLATE $ 114.00
12 FRONT BUMPER CARRIER % nn $ 625.00
13 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE X $ 71.00
14  FRONT BUMPER COVER X nn s 91.00
15 FRONT BUMPER DISTANCE PIECE | $ 12.00
16  FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH | $ 32.00
17 HORN-LHLOWTONE X nn 5 262.00
18 HORN SPRING SHACKLE-LH ¥ nn ) $ 29.00
19  MAIN BEAM HEADLIGHT MOUNTING $ 107.00
20 LED HEADLIGHT-LH -~ (71 s 4,491.00
S

SUB-TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES

9,997.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SDH 381 K

Damaged Parts & Prices
S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remark

21 LED HEADLIGHT LIFT CYLINDER - LH X nn

$ 128.00

21  FRONT WHEEL COVER-LH/RH .~ /1 2% 588.00
22 RADIATORAIRGUIDE-LH X nn S 27.00
23 CAUTIONSIGN X nn NEC & 13.00
24 AIRCONSTICKER X nn NEC $ 7.00
25  FRONT NO.PLATE X nn S/IN S 40.00
26 SUNDRIES ’? s 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES : $ 11,100.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,152.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 15,252.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.



LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey before/after spray painting

= To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
° Parts prices are subject to confirmation

P re m i u m Au to m O bi Ies ® Third party survey 1s on a *Without Prejudice” basis

| : ® No illegal modification(s) is allowed
55 Ubi Road 1, Smgapore 408699 ° SUQDIEH‘IEHIEE] item(s) must be resurveyed angd

Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 Is subject to final approval from Insurance Company
Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:
Telefax
i ﬂﬂf /,.f:v,, !},{ty /Cayf’/ )
e (Lkk) O — (177 e C R
Name ;e L )
4

Surveyed Date : J /

Authorised Date i ﬂ /‘f!j’

Excess Cost 3 n fff’p L |

Liability : A r/,?

/ /
. o g

Remarks : / Lof] — (

Please Note : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.
Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




