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10/15/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Re: [MV]: Market value for SKD7413U as at 04 October 2019

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Tue 15/10/2019 3:50 PM

To: ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg <ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg>

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo®@lIkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
<olivialau@Ilkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Dear Ivy,

The market value for SKD 7413U is $ 45K (est) as at October 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October 2019 10:48 AM

To: ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg <ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: [MV]: Market value for SKD7413U as at 04 October 2019

Hi lvy,
Thank you for your email.

Valuation Team — FYNA please.

Best Regards,

=

Olivia Lav | Admin Manager

LKK Auto Consultants

H

£

%

phone: 6256-3561 | email: glivialau@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §{408933)

From: lvy Yong [mailto:ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 14 October 2019 5:34 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; simonho@Ikk.com

https://outiook.office365.com/maillinbox/id/AAQKADUXOWNIYmYzLTFhM2QtNDISNy0SZWFILTZIMZAQ OTIlyM2M5NwWAQAJStmbueBEzQiLgTy3d... 1/2



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 583G
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SKD7413U
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Oct 2019
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model: C 180
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2011
Engine No.: 27182030364292
Chassis No.: WDD2043492F785441
Maximum Power Qutput: 115.0kW (154 bhp)
Open Market Value: $39,839.00
Original Registration Date: 03 Jan 2012
First Registration Date: 03 Jan 2012
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $39,839.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 02 Jan 2022
PARF Rebate Amount: $23,903.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 02 Jan 2022
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $65,058.00
COE Rebate Amount: $14,173.00
Total Rebate Amount: $38,076.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Oct 2019

OK

M- 4§k



10/14/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Market value for SKD7413U as at 04 October 2019

Ivy Yong <ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg>
Mon 14/10/2019 5:41 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; simonho@lkk.com <simonho@Ilkk.com>
Cc: Phoebe Xie <phoebe xie@ergo.com.sg>

mJ 2 attachments (3 MB)
PHOTO SKD7413.pdf; rebate_skd7413.pdf;

Hi,

Please provide market value for the above vehicle.
Thank you

Data Classification: Confidential, C3

Warmest Regards,
Ivy Yong
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID.: +65 6829 9197

ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg

ERGO

WWW.Ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and

concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world’s leading risk carriers.

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance
on or commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify
the sender by replying to the email and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does not represent, warrant or
guarantee that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. No part may be reproduced by any process or for

any purpose withaut prior written permission.

Disclaimer: This message and its attachments are confidential, intended only for the named addressee, and may be privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you should not disclose, distribute, copy or use this communication. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by return email and
delete this message. By opening any attachment to this message, you agree to accept the risk that it may contain a virus or damaging code, and you agree

that ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd. will not be liable for any loss or damage thereby caused.

https://outiook.office365.com/mailfinbox/id/ AAQKADUXOWNIYmYzLTFhM2QtNDISNy0SZWFILTZIMZAOO TIYM2MSNWAQAE3W%2BSNmroLUsfM...  1/1



