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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 1:55 PM

To: Mandy; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: 'venus'

Subject: RE: RE : FINALISATION FOR SMP448 D DOA 25.09.2019

Dear Mandy, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Confirmed amount $1675.20 @ 4 working days. 
  
Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to TOKIO MARINE 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mandy <mandy@ltm.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2019 12:42 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg> 

Subject: RE : FINALISATION FOR SMP448 D DOA 25.09.2019 

Importance: High 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

Pls revert on the finalization. 

 

Thank you and regards, 

 

Mandy LimMandy LimMandy LimMandy Lim    
 

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 

 

www. LTM.sg 

+65 6452 0893 (Office) 

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 

 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 

www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Mandy [mailto:mandy@ltm.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November, 2019 2:49 PM 

To: 'veronchen@lkkauto.com' <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE : FINALISATION FOR SMP448 D DOA 25.09.2019 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Hi Veron, 

 

Pls confirm the finalization at PBP $ 1,675.20 with 4 days repairs period. 

 

Thank you and regards, 

 

Mandy LimMandy LimMandy LimMandy Lim    
 

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 

 

www. LTM.sg 

+65 6452 0893 (Office) 

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 

 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
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www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 

 

 

 

 


