Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 March, 2020 2:58 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SKR 1992E - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 201S AND SKR 1992E
ON 01/10/2019 - LKK REF CC4/LPC19017922/Kha3

Attachments: Rental Agreement.tif; DV.tif; LOA tif

Dear Vic,

As spoken today, pls find attached documents for you to effect payment.

Pls take note that the original copies except rental agreement (in photostated copy) will be mailed to your office
shortly.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 10:22 AM

To: Enquiry

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SKR 1992E - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBD 201S AND SKR 1992E ON 01/10/2019 - LKK
REF CC4/LPC19017922/Kha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Ms Wong,
We refer to the subject matter.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer settlement as follows:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 4,494.00
Loss of Rental (5100 x 8 days) S 800.00
TOTAL $ 5,294.00

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the enclosed DV then forward back to us (LKK) the original hard copy
together with the copy Authorization to Act Letter and Rental Agreement (signed by owner) for our principal to
process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to S & H MOTOR PTE LTD.



Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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