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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 8:54 AM

To: Darren Lee

Cc: Vanessa Ngoi

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION NOV 2019

Dear Darren, 

 

The revised valuation of GBE 8563P is as below: 

 

MV: $37K                           FS: $31K 

 

As at November 2019 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Darren Lee <Darren.Lee@hlbank.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 10:36 AM 

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Vanessa Ngoi <Vanessa.Ngoi@hlbank.com.sg> 

Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION NOV 2019 

 
Hi Celine, 

 

As spoken just now, please assist to provide revise valuation for GBE8563P as Nov 2019 

 

Thank you 

 

 
Best Regards 

 
Darren Lee 
PFS Credit Approval & Collections 

 
1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881 
HL: +65 6818 0503 || DID: +65 6349 8319  
Website: www.hlbank.com.sg  
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From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 10:45 AM 

To: Darren Lee 

Cc: LKK Valuation; Lim Ai Lian; Vanessa Ngoi 
Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION OCT 2019 

 
Dear Darren, 

 

The valuation of SKD 7608A is as below: 

 

MV: $63K                           FS: $58K 

 

 

The valuation of GBE 8563P is as below: 

 

MV: $39K                           FS: $32K 

 

 

The valuation of GBG 4559T is as below: 

 

MV: $48K                           FS: $40K 

 

 

As at October 2019 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Darren Lee <Darren.Lee@hlbank.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2019 5:24 PM 

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; Lim Ai Lian <AiLianLim@hlbank.com.sg>; Vanessa Ngoi 

<Vanessa.Ngoi@hlbank.com.sg> 

Subject: QUOTATION FOR DESKTOP VALUATION OCT 2019 

 
Dear Celine, 
 
We would like to have a desktop Valuation for the above 3 vehicle. 
 
Attached with log card. 
 
Thank you 

 
Best Regards 

 
Darren Lee 
PFS Credit Approval & Collections 
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1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881 
HL: +65 6818 0503 || DID: +65 6349 8319  
Website: www.hlbank.com.sg  
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