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The information contained herein is correct as at 09 Oct 2019

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of |
> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner I1D: 693N
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SMA6131G
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 09 Oct 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: WISH 1.8 CVT
Primary Colour: Beige
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine No.: 2ZRB585180
Chassis No.: JTDGG20W00J002531
Maximum Power Output: 105.0 kW (140 bhp)
Open Market Value: $23,454.00
Original Registration Date: 17 Jun 2015
First Registration Date: 17 Jun 2015
Transfer Count: |
Actual ARF Paid: $19.,836.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 16 Jun 2025
PARF Rebate Amount: $14,877.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 16 Jun 2025
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $75,002.00
COE Rebate Amount: $42,646.00
Total Rebate Amount: $57,523.00

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDereglnput ?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 09-Oct-19
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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - SMAG121G vs SMPAG0LE (OH) an DLOA: DTHOZ0TS

From o Vinnd

w nsmegreTe BN aLAD Com Agrmin & | mrmrae s com )

== rmg_.-.p.e..-a.'t.mnL—-w.mm.mm.m.im_w.mm.tn.mm.m Asamwanneninaur. Panninen Tresnran, Sutramsnem, Dy
Sent VWIHZDTE S22 48 AM

Hi,

Piease refer o the enclosed request from Exclusive Enterprise Pre Lad. 10 23umD4 }Iﬂ}l?‘-"\ﬂ
xhﬂrwmﬂmwmﬁmhmmmhwnmmﬁm

If you have any queriewconcems, please let us know “[h‘f_‘.t h'"l
E:d&mmwﬂmﬂnummqlm“q.w F: N\S{"ﬁ

Thanks & Regards, Sw: H,uﬂ‘-g'

Her ¥in Bul (Viviana)

AlG

ERCIL, Adtjiemten |

Singapore FROL | Clmme Operunons - Susg

Tol: B0 1200558 | Ext 1DITI08
Firrut Honlieg 00 | e

From: exchshvoenterpriseS0@gmail.com [maikto:exclusivesnterpriseSO@gmall.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 08, 2019 5:29 PM

To: Hee, Yinrd
:nm,wm,mmmmmmmwmmmmmrmmmmm;
Subsamaniam, Dhoyeshol

MWWIW-WMWMMMWMMBEMWHWH

Hi,

We choose LKK Aute Consultants Pie Lid Name sarveyor: Marcus Chua

Kindly nrrange for surveyor come down ASAP {or tomommow.

Thank you very much.
Best Regards,

ICE

Exclusive Enterprise Pte Ltd
& Kaki Bukit Avenus 4 #03-50
PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT

Singapore 413875
Tel! 6245 9655 Fax: 6245 9678

Fram: Hor, Yinrul

Sent: Tue, 8 Oct 2009 06:02:37 +0000

To: exclusiveenterprise S0 gmail com .

Ce: Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azian, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Aashweenjectkaur,
Purthiban, Theerthan, Subrmaniam, Divyashni

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMP4G02Z AND SMABI31G ON 07/102019

Wit Brefudios
Your Heference - SMABI MG
Our Referenee SMPIG02E
Deenr Sir'Madam,

W refer to vour Nothee af Accldent of even date.

We fend (o comduct & pre-repair survey of the damoge (o your client's'your customer’s vehizle jumily with your clienyyour motor workshop, W propase 1o st one of the malar
warveyors named in the sstachod kst 1o conduct the joint pre-repair survey a4 & single joint expert:

| I I




m-r%u Compuny Name
AlG In Surveyor AlG Amia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid

Lawgence Ng Cham Kee Priamity Services

# [ Teffrey Ong Leng Kiat Prinnty Services
Timmy Lee Priority Services
EC Loal Automobile Inapection Services Pro Lud
Tang Riah Keen (Frankie) Formicam Adjusiers Pio Lid
Wi You Han Fermtenm Adjurers Pie Lid
Soan HmXm (Gary) Farmizam Adjusiers Pie Lid
[ Chow Ba Xiong Formteam Adpusicrs Pie Lid
Chizs 500 Teck (Benjamin) Formieam Adjusters Fie Lidd
Kalvin Ang WK Aulo Consulmms e Lid
Xing Guo Ciang LKE Auio Consulnts Pie Lid
Marcus Chus LRE Auto Conaultants Pz Lid
Wohmmad Taufich LK Auto Comsulinnts Pie Lid
Adrian Ling LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
Mehamaned Rasul LK Auto Conaultants Pie Lid
Kenneth Koty LRK Auio Coneatant Pie Lid

Plense lat us know within mt:lmmdnm-ﬂmmwuﬁewﬂhmalwarmmmrmmuummmpm\'nunlydmmutmmnfh
I:l.-L-.Irminnurnynm%H]lhﬂ:hmnfmmﬂmwmﬂwwhuﬁjmm

Tharks & Regards,

Hew ¥im Rul (Viiang)

AL

FrROL Acjunmer |

Singapore FNOL | Claims Coerusans - Auto

Tl BDO1J0A550 | Ext 1002208
Yeuyl Hor@hgio oo | seew S0.30

From: MotorClaims [ malitoexckisheenterprisss0Egmal.com]

Sent: Tussday, October 08, 2019 11:13 AM

To: ClaimsDocManagement

Subject: [EXTERMAL] ACT INVOLVE SMA 6131 G & SMP 4502 Z ON 07102018
Importance: High

This message is from an external sender: be coutions with links and attachments.

Hi.
Please ser attached for clalm document.
Thank you.

fest Ragards,
ICE

EYCLUSIVE EXTERPRISE PTE LTD
£ Kak! Bukil Breave 4 #05-50
PROMIERFKAN] BUNIT

Slagapore 415875
Tel: 6345 9655 Fan: 6945 Vo784

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The miormation in this email (snd any stiachments) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipient, you must not iae or disseminate the information. If you
have received this email in error, please immedintely notify me by "Reply” commund anid permanenily deleie the original and any copies o printouts thereal
Although this email and any attachments are believed to be fres of any virus of other defect that might affect any computer system into which }i is recerved and
apened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibilify is sccepted by American Internationsl Group, Inse. ar its subsidinriey
ot alfiliates either jointly or severnily, for sny loss or damage arising in any wiy from its use

IMPTINTANT NOTICE:

Tha infarmafion @ His amad (and sny stschments) is confidental, If you arw ot the intended receent, you imust ol use of disseminate the mformaton. If you have received this smal in gro, peese
immadintaly nadily me by *Feply” command and parmanarfy dele I ongmal end any copses or priniouts theml, Although tis amal #nd sy aBChmmnts s Gebsved |0 b fres of @ny vios o
mullnlhllmwmﬂwmr,ul-ﬁlrﬂql'ld!IIl.-nhdmﬂlp-ud.hauwﬂﬂrﬂhmhm“lhmhﬂﬂm-mﬂwm
Intarnatioral m.uquuMﬂMam.hm,h#mm in mrry way from it use.



Merimen e-Claims

» 112712618
Print Received Message

This mail 15 associaled wiih ;

"SMAB131G (98445453625G)
[SMP4602Z]
P
AL AUTORENT FTE LTD
Oot 7 2019 10.00AM

[SONG JIANPENG)
Exclusive Enterprise Pte Lid

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS). sent on 27/11/2019 16:55 PM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$4257.45) - SMAG131G - Claim Handler: Ler, Bernard-JQ

|Appmve—::l;425?,45:t:ust of Repair ; $3,850.00 Loss of Rental : $400.00 4 days @ S$ 100/day LTA/ GIA Search Fee
: $7.45 Tota| : $4,257 .45

hitps:/isingapore. menmen.comiclaimsindex cfmHusebox=5\Cmalldfuseaction=dsp_Prnl&CFID=611836814CF TOKEMN=60aZZof6e0d4bdaZ-BT. iH



X

EXCLUSIVI

RPRISE

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-50 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT Singapore 415875
Tel: 6245 9655 / 97356016 Fax: 6245 9678 (Co Reg No: 201906614W)
Email: exclusiveenterprise50@@gmail.com

N

Accident Involving Vehicle No: SMA €131 & gnd SMp &0 T g 'f{hi 2019
At Merq Cairnhill Circle

L

L

'We, the owner of wehicle no: S™A €131 & hereby instruct and  authorize
Exclusivl Enteeprose PHe Lfd (“the workshop™) to commence repairs to the said
vehicle. Pending the outcome of my/our claim against the third party, ['we forthwith pay you the
sum af § being refundable deposit of the repair o my/our said vehicle,
You are further authorized to appoint solicitors on myfour behalf and give the solicitors full
instructions as if the appointment is made and instructions are given by me/us with respect to the
conduct of my/our clnim against the third party driver and/or his insurers including if necessary, o
commence legal proceedings in court in my/our name against the third party,
You have my/our full authority to instruct my/our solicitors to negotinte & settlement with the third
party and/or his insurers on such terms as vou deem fit.
Upon resolving my/our claim, vou are authorized to agree with my/our solicitors on the amount of
their professional costs and disbursements for acting for me/us and 1o receive payments of the
balance of the settlement sum on mv/our behalf directly into vour sccount. In the event that my/our
claim or legal costs of the third party s well as the professional costs and dishursements of myv/onr
solicitors notwithsmnding that my/our solicitors were appointed by you on our behalf.
|/'We also hereby instruct and authorize you deduct directly from the claim monies received from
the third party all outstanding balances that are still owing to vou, namely the balance of repair costs
and rental of substitute vehicles.
In the event that l'we sm/are required 1o atend at myfour solicitors office or o attend court in
connection with my/our claim. L'we shall render full co-operation.
In the event that my/our claim ngaimst the third party and/or his insurers are not successful or cannot
be proceeded with and/or if any Judgement or settiement is not honoured or satisfied by the third
party, ['we autharize you to revert the claim against my/our own insurers for the cost of repairs and
any other Josses recoverable under my/our policy of insurance. In this respect, l/we undersiand and
accept that the excess amount applicable under policy of insurance shall be borne by mefus.
If far whatever reasons, my/our insurers reject my/our claim for indemnity for the cost of repairs
and/or amy other losses recoversble under the policy of insurance or make an offer to pay less than
the amount claimed by you, I/we agree and undertake to pay the full emount of vour repair bill and
survey fees and any other expenses reasonably incurred on myfour behalf or 10 pay vou the
difference in amount, as the case may be.
I"'We shall keep you informed of any comrespondences and/or summons that | may receive due 1o
this sction agreeing 1o pay or receive any monies due o this claim.

Datedthis > ° dayof °¢] 20 |19

Signature: J& ' AL Witnessed By:
Name: AL Autorent Pre Lrd £ _‘\..-'*::_
ICNe: 201832493 N S =

(Company stamp if applicable)
Address: 210, Turd Ciub Faad

LG’T Eﬂl Thae {:Ir'nn.ﬂ Ctand f 2!%15
Tek: i?t?—g 515




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
[ Wotified Est Submitted Ad) Assigned LAd) Bt | Adj Gubemitted | Ins Auth'ed Sratus
09 Oct 2019 | | Pending for Survey
- (R Ll e ey
keie agj Aot | | Cancet casa |

Referance

Main Cinim Detalls

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Insured: | SONG JIANPENG, 1D: GI817862N =
E‘;‘:‘mm AL AUTORENT PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No,: 2018326930

o ¥ sMAG131G (pate of Loss: ?:ilm ::sn:nn::s From LTA fleg Date [M2n ¥r))
Chaim Type: (TP / 98445453625G | olley/Cover | compranensive)

vmm lﬂ SMPA602Z '?g'ﬁ:_:f:‘ﬂ 5111765135

{Insured)! m

Repairer. | Exclusiva Enterprise Pta Ltd (HQ) B KAKI BT AV 4#03-50 PREMIERDXB, 415875 Kaki Bukit - Tel:

Handiing AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pto. Lid, (Express] - Telr 85-6415-3000 ... [Handied by Ler, Bernand-3Q]
{nsurer: Bernard1iQien. Lergalg.com

ﬂ:::::“ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Lid (HQ) - Tel
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] . [i‘lnll Rpt du=s 18/10/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case Mail |

s AIG_SG_ENPRESS (I7/11/7019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (554257.45) - SMAG131G - Claim Mandler: Ler, Bernar...

‘ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS- view Ml | Searcn Tasks | Create Hew Task | Compiete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?
N FedullE

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 3/12/2019



Menmen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*SMAG131G (958445453625G)
[SMP4602Z]
™
AL AUTORENT PTE LTD
Dct 7 2019 10:00AM
[SONG JIANPENG]
Exclusive Enterprise Pte Ltd

Lutters/Correspondances - [iperpsge [V &4
Mo | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
[ |{orah Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown 0 e
_assessmant Reports - [perpsge [v] W
Mo | Finafized Cin LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
1 |31/10/19 14:49 Adjuster Immadiate Advice | @ | Load HTM
Phates / Images 3 per I |
Ne | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |0%/10/19 17:10 | Odometer Reading 0| waawc | A
2 |oe/10/19 17111 Chassls Number 0| waws | &4
1 |oainv19 17011 Ganeral View D | Load PG
4 |pann1917:11 | General View D | ioedirs
5 |09/10/19 1711 | General View D! warc | A
B | D9/10/19 17:11 | Ganaral View 0| wadirc |
7 |09/10/1917:11 | General View @ | weaws | M
B |00/10/18 17:11 | Genersl View 0| wadirc | M
9 |D9/10/19 17111 | General View 0D | edirs | A
10 |09/10/19 17:11 | General View 0| weavc | A
11 |psfione 17: General View 0 | wadirc | @A
12 |09/10/19 17:11 General View D odic | A
13 |00/10/1917:11 | Genaral View 0 | losdrc |
14 |09/10/1917:11 | General View 0 | losdivc | &
15 |09/10/19 17:11 General View 0 cedirc | M
16 |09/10/1917:11 | General View O | adc | &
(17 |09/10/19 17:11 | General View Q| v | H
10 | 09/10/1817:11 | General View 0| oadirc | A
15 |0%/10/19 17:11 General View 0| Leadirc | 4
20 |09/10/18 17:11 Ganaral View D | Load i &
21 | 09/10/19 17:11 General View 0| s |
22 |09/10/1917:11 | General View 0| s | B
21 |08/10/18 17:11 | Genaral View 0| cadre |
24 |09/10418 37:11 General View D | lcedirc | M
15 | 09/10/19 17:11 | General View ﬁ_ Load 3rG | B4
26 |09/10/19 17:11 | General View 0| wadiee | &
27 |09/10/19 17:11 Ganeral View 0D | cedws | H
28 |09/10719 17:11 General View E Load PG | BA
79 |08/10/18 17:11 | Genersl View 0| loedies | A
30 |09/310719 17:11 | Genersl View 0| tadws | |
31 |09/10/19 17:11 | General View | @ | osd G |
37 |09/10/1% 17:11 | General View 0| wadirs | &
31 |09/10/1917:11 | General View 0 | wea e | B
34 |08/10/1917:11 | Genersl View g Load 3G | BA
35 (08010715 17:11 | Genersl View g Load PG | A
36 [08/10/19 17:11 | General View 0| wawc | @
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|Letters/Correspondences [iporpage  |~]| &
{No | Finakzed On LKK Auto Consaltants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print

17 |09/10/18 17:112  [Reinspection Photo O oewrs | A
l DE/I0FIS 17113 Reinspection Phote - 0| weawc | B
139 |09/10/1917:12 | Reinspection Photo Q| werc M
;“; D9/10/19 1717 | Reinspection Photo 0| wurs | &
la1 |pa/10/19 17012 Relnspection Photo Q| waoaws | M
41 |09/10/1917:12 | Reinspection Pheto 0| wdws | F
41 |09/10/1817:12 | Reinspection Photo 0| wurs | B
|44 |09/10/19 1712 Reinspection Photo 0| Ladws | P
45 |09/10/1317:12 | Reinspection Photo B wars | &
|46 |08/10/1817:12 | Relnspection Photo 0| wors | A
47 |09/10/1017:12 | Reinspection Photo 0| wadrc | &
48 |08/10/18 17:12 | Relnspection Phato 0| oadwc | A
49 |09/10/1917:17 | Reinspection Photo Q| wers |
50 |09/10/1% 17:12 | Reinspection Photo 0| weurs | &
51 |12/10/13 0B:51 | Afeer Repair Bhota 0| wwws |
52 |12/10/19 0B:51 | After Repalr Photo 0| wadws | A
53 [12/10/19 08:51 | After Repair Photo 0D weaws | A
Documentation | 7 |
No | Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print

! |08/10/19 15:08 | EMAIL FRDM AIG DD 08102019 Load POF

2 |09/10/19 15:08 | TP POLICE REPORT Lasd POF

3 |09/10/1% 15:08 | NOTICE & GIA REPORT Load POE

4 |10/10/1917:32 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED ) | ioad Poé

5 |14/10/19 10:34 | EMAIL TO O1 Load POF

& |14/10/19 10:34 | LETTER TO OI loadPOF | |
|7 | 31/10/19 18:25 TP LOD Load POF
'8 |m12/1910:2% | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

% |03/12/1910:2% | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

10 |03/12/19 10:28 | Release Voucher Load PDF

11 |03/12/19 10:2% | RENTAL RECEIPT € | Losd POF

12 |03/12/1910:28 | LTA SEARCH Load PDF

13 |03/12/19 10:38 (10D Load POF

Mo | Fimalized On ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |10/10/19 11:39 | OI GIA REFORT @ | Losd por

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | Pt
There are no docurnent checkiists configured,
sl
L

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer

fele | ety Siw (ewals uvEsE vas how 1D siher serme
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

| vehicie No: SMP4602Z (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A)
SMAB131G (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |07/10/2019

Global Sum Settlement | : | [X] Yes | [ 1 No
Repair Estimate ' & 7.181.70
Final Repair Cost i | 4 250.00
Loss of Use $ days at 50.00 per day
Rental (if any) ' $ 4 days
LTA / GIA Search Fes 1§
Others: -
8
Final Setllement Sum (Global Sum) s 4.250.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registarad? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicale
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agread Liability 100 (%a)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

B) For GlA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply,
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payes's Breakdown

1) |Exclusive Enlerprise Ple Lid | 4,250.00
2) 1|
3 S

03 Dec
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act: Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1ssso71sem)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel; 6256-3561 Fax: G844-B805 Email: sur@lkkavio.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC4/AIG19017817/UHB3G2

Date: 031272018
BEFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SMAB131G Insured Vehicle No : SMP46022
Dale of Loss. 0710/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 984454536256
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No. SMAB131G
Make & Model TOYOTA VASH, 1.8 (A) Engine No: 2ZRB5B5180
Reg. Date 17/06/2015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: JTDGG20W00J002531
Colour Beige Odomeler: 139252 km
Engine Capacity: 1T88 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/65 R15
Front Left Side: Michelin 6 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The above vailues represent (he rermamnng fyre osds deph
(COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Paris 4,081.70 284407 1,247 B3 30.49
Miscellansous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3.100.00 1.880.00 1,110.00 3581
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 7,191.70 4,834,007 2,357.63 32.78
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 3,850.00
Nett Amount (5§) 7,191.70 3,850.00 3,341.70 46.47
+ Car Rental (4.0 x 55100.00/day) (S5) 400.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.45
Natt Liability (S5) 4,25T.45
Global Sum Settlement (S$) 4,250.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment DeMo2018
Date Inspecied: D8/M1Q2018 Inspected At Exciusive Enterprise Ple Lid (HQ)
8 KAKI BT AV 4803-50
PREMIER@KB
Singapore 415875

Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This reparf reprosents our findings af ihe time and plsce of inspection sfated harein. Such ingpection has been carmied out 1o the bes! of our
knowledge and abilty but any ofher Kability under any offwy Slroumsiances is hereby erpressly sxcided.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
Mo. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR GATE Badly Dented 1.023.00FL *1.023.00FL
2 1 *‘REAR GATE EMBLEM ELEGANCE MNecessary 111.00FL *62.00 FL
3 1 *REAR GATE EMBLEM VALVE MATIC Necessary 88.00FL *65.50 FL
4 1 *REAR GATE LOGOD Necessary 98.00 FL *68. 50 FL
5 1 *REAR GATE LOCK Dented / Shorted 288.00FL  *2BB.00FL
6 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 761.00FL *605.10 FL
T 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH Not Necessary 898.00 FL *-FL
a 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH Mot Necessary 98.00 FL *-FL
2 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR LR Mol Necessary 262.00FL *FL
10 1 *REAR BUMPER IMPACT BRACKET LIR N/S Dented 264,00 FL *88. BOFL
11 2 *TAIL LAMP LIR Mol Necessary 57340FL *FL
12 1 ‘END PANEL Badly Dented 581 40FL *581.40FL
13 1 *END PANEL TOP GARNISH Twisted 289 90FL *289 90 FL
14 1 *WHEATHERSTRIP Twisted 299 90 FL *2088 80 FL
15 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 50.00FS *50.00FS
1% 1 *SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 300.00FS *200.00FS
17 1 *END PANEL SEALANT MNecessary 100.00FS *50.00FS
F=Francruse pan. S=Spchen L=ListhemDiss
Sub Total (S§) 530560 3,692.10
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (5%) 1.213.890 B548.03
Total Parts (S§)  4,001.70 2,844.07

Repor was unsubmilied during this prinl-oul.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 WIRE CHECKING New 50.00 20.00
2 TRANSFER REAR GATE COMPONENT FROM OLD TO New 150.00 60.00
NEW
3 RA&R REAR TRIMS ,CARPET TO FACILITATE REPAIRS New 150.00 80.00
4 RA&R REAR REVERSE SENSOR New 100.00 50.00
5 R&R REAR WIS New 150.00 120.00
8  TUFF COAT New 100.00 60.00
7 LABOUR New 1,200.00 600.00
8 PAINTING MNew 1,200.00 1,000.00
Gross Labour Cost (58) 3,100.00 1,990.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 3/12/2019



