
Our Ref: CC3/CTI19017814/Kha3               
 

 

06 FEBRUARY 2020        

 

NG MUN KIT                By Post and By Email               

BLOCK 204 BOON LAY DRIVE 

#16-35 

SINGAPORE 640204 
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 848E AND SHC 5020Z ON 06/10/2019  
 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance 

(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under 

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had 

amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as 

the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement 

with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise. 

 

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, 

kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 18/02/2020, after we 

shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis 

and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the 

other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh  

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 
c.c. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  

            (Motor Claims Dept) 

 Munkit22@gmail.com                   

            (Email) 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 22 March 2022 4:12 pm
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLN848E (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC5020Z (TP : 

LKK REF - CC3/CTI19017814/Kha3) on 06/10/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We have check with TP repairer on the status update and they mention they have already settle the claim and closed 
the case.  
 
We will proceed to submit WP and close the case at our end as survey has been done.  
 
Thanks  
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2019 1:57 pm 
To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLN848E (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC5020Z (TP : LKK REF - 
CC3/CTI19017814/Kha3) on 06/10/2019 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have inspected TP vehicle SHC 5020Z at M/s Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd - Ang Mo Kio on a WP basis and 
TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement. 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 22 March 2022 4:21 pm
To: claims; Ng Wai Yin
Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; Admin A
Subject: RE: TCS REF:AAD1412-206--Accident involving GZ8654R & SHC5020Z on 18/12/2014

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Wai Yin, 
 
As spoken with jasmine earlier this afternoon, she mentions that this case has been settled and closed at your 
end with payment received.  
 
Therefore, I will procced to close the case at our end.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 11:47 am 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg 
Subject: FW: TCS REF:AAD1412-206--Accident involving GZ8654R & SHC5020Z on 18/12/2014 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm 
 


