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l\livitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2019 7:01 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'; 'Admin A’; 'SUR'
Cc: '‘Claims’

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SGX 580 H ON 8/10/2019
Attachments: SGX 580H - 08102019.PDF

Dear All,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.
Please arrange survey on 9/10/2019, 9.30 am. Owner waiting.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e._claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE
.8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI' Q8.

Email Disclaimer
I'his email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

au have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from vour system
itor use it for any purpose. or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

Please do not copy



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 4:13 PM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGX 580 H ON 8/10/2019

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SGX 580 H (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 8:23 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SGX 580 H ON 8/10/2019

Hi Denise,

Any approval yet?

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Ezuwan Huzaini
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
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View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
*SGX580H (2325863365S5G)
oD
Oct 8 2019 9:00AM

[TAN KEAN HUI]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

| Reply I: Reply All ] Mark as Unread | Print Message I Delete Message ] Forward | _

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), senton 11/10/2019 15:43 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$14743.00) - SGX580H - Claim Handler: Chan, Yoke Shi

Approved:14743.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documents,




Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregnNo:19960718R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Date: 10 Oct 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SGX580H Accident Date : 08/10/2019
Make : AUDI A3 Policy No. :
Assignment Date :10/10/2019 Excess : §50.00
Date of Inspection : 09/10/2019 Est. Duration of Repair :16.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages o/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S§ 22,053.00
Revised Amount :S$ 14,743.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S% 856.00
Total :S$ 15,599.00
Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S$
Pre-Accident Value :S§ 137,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S% 63,015.00
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S% 73,985.00

Remarks

( x ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us have
your authorisation.

( )  The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( )  Other comments :



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Oct 2019

Singapore NRIC
975F

SGX580H

No

10 Oct 2019

AUDI

A3 CABRIOLET 1.4 TFSISTRONIC
Grey

2018

CZC774164
WAUZZZ8V7)1054082
85.0 kW (113 bhp)
$33,910.00

10 May 2018

10 May 2018

1

$39,474.00

Yes
09 May 2028
$29,605.00

09 May 2028

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$38,941.00

$33,410.00

$63,015.00



