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ROC:53360061L

LKK Auto Consultants hence

the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey before/after spray painting

« To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
« Parts prices are subject to confirmation

* No lliegal modification(s) is allowed

Acknowledged by Repairer

* Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis

Supplementary ) must be resurveyed and
hwbwmm Insurance Company

GST:53360061L
M
QT19/PC4710C/TPC-578 (e (LKK) wl L 0/ "77/ 11, I o
LIS
Lonpac Insurance Bhd Al
100 Beach Road 6 [/
#19-00 Shaw Tower ‘7
Singapore 189702
QUOTATION
Dear Sir,
Cost of Repair to Vehicle PC4710C
With reference to the above-mentioned, we are pleased to quote as follows:-
No. | DESCRIPTION QTY U/PRICE (SS)| AMOUNT (SS)
1. | Front windscreen /e 1 3,800.00 380000  |7804/
2. | Front windscreen inner moulding /s 1 680.00 680.00 400/
3. | Front RH rear view mirror assy / ﬂ‘ 1 1,350.00 1,350.00 (0997
4. | Front RH panel [L ‘)) 1 4,200.00 4,200.00 700/
5. | Sealant - W 8 40.00 320.00 .
6. | Labour to remove & refit front windscreen 1 1,000.00 1,000.00 i‘p i
7. | Check wiring 1 20.00 2000
8. | Labour charges 1 1,200.00 1,200.00 [gg
9. | Spray painting 1 800.00 800.00 700
SUB-TOTAL $$13,370.00
* Price before 7% gst
p- 4 q/oﬂ
- 107s
Thank you.
" Y4l
Yours faithfully, in 3540
@\/\) ki
Winnie Chai LIS= ()99

HP: 9850-9666




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 16, 2019 7:59 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Finalization for PC4710C

Ok

Thanks & regards

On 16 Oct 2019, at 9:01 AM, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@]lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Winnie,

Kindly refer our finalize.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2019 4:39 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Finalization for PC4710C

Hi Steve
Attached is the after repair photos.

Pls kindly revert on finalization.

Thanks

Winnie Chai



