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PRECISE AUTO SERVICE

NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-33/34/36 AUTOBAY SINGAPORE 417883

CO. REG. NO.:

08-11-19

Date Of Accident : 05-10-19
Our Ref: SGE 3113D/T/19
Tan Cheng Nam

Blk 106 Spottiswoode Park Road

#19-138
Singapore 080106

LIST ITEM

Rear Bumper Fascia

Rear Bumper Side Retainer LH
Rear Bumper Chorme Moulding
Rear Bumper Clips

Rear Door Assy LH

Rear Door Hinge

Rear Door Checker

Rear Door Weatherstripe

Rear Door Stopper

Rear Door Inner Lock

Rear Door Inner Trim Board
Rear Door Quarter Glass Moulding

Rear Door Window Regulator

TEL : 67457367 FAX : 68413390
A5766600C

KK Auta Consuitanty hance notif

ihe Foana | Ta "ORHANEY

e R A B

/280.3 L

Rear Door Window Regulator Motor

Rear Door Window Glass Channel Rubber

Rear Door Outer Handle
Rear Door Outer Handle Knob

Rear Door Speaker

GST REG. NO. : 35766600C
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471 80.00
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10pes @500 AL 5000 _—
-‘L.@ P> 118000
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49 8000
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SGE 3113D/THe
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}ﬂ‘ckzl Panel Spoiler

Rockel Panel Spoiler Bracket
Rear Knuckle Arm LH

Rear Absorber LH

Rear Lower Arm

Rear Control Arm (Short)
Rear Control Arm (Long)
Rear Trailing Arm

Rear Wheel Bearing Hup

Sport Rim Assy

SPECIAL NETTITEM

Rear Door Quarter Glass Sealant

Tyre Assy

LABOUR CHARGE

Towing

To check wiring system

To tuff coat affected areas

To reset electrical module system

To remove & refix rear LH door mechanism

To remove & refix rear LH door guater glass

To check & adjust computer wheel alignment (Before & After]
To remove & refix rear LH undercarriage components

To remove & refix rear LH sport rim & contact wheel balancing

To respray affected areas

i
¢ }6_ 680.00_—~
49 5800 %

‘L./Ar,., (101000~

a1 48000 X

4 32100 X

Ty 180.00_—
A1 29200 X
41 s580.00X

PML 51000 —

L) 157000 fﬂﬂaj_ N

11,225.40
Less Discount 5%: 561.27
10,664.13

A 6000 X
Sve- 48000 X

A-1 12000 ¢

L
100.00 30

200.00 (U

380.00 Cpy
2B0.0
150.03&)
240.00 /90
400,00/ (

144 12000 X

1250.00/85)

To renew damaged parts, straighten & repair rear LH fender, door pillar 1,250.00 Mo

and aligned all parts

SGE 3113D/T110

15,694.13
GST 7% - 109859
TOTAL AMOUNT: 16,792.72
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of |

E.nquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
684F

SGE3113D

Yes

08 Oct 2019

B.M.W,

3281 2.0 AT D/AB 4DR ABS HID NAV
White

2011
A3220115N20B20A
WBA3A52020F253478
180.0 kW (241 bhp)
$42,783.00

01 Mar 2012

01 Mar 2012

1

$42,783.00

Yes
28 Feb 2022
$25,669.00

28 Feb 2022

E - Open Category
10

$74,340.00
$17,312.00
$42,981.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Oct 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput ?FUNCTION ID=F030... 08-O¢t-19




Used BMW 3281 Car for Sale in Singapore, Car Empire Automobiles Pte Lid - sgCar...
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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - [l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, B October, 2019 10:46 AM
To: Precise Auto Service; 'sur@Ilkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Cc: C Meenachi - M
Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SGE 3113D. Your Insured Vehicle no : SJA 3193H
Attachments: 07102019163416 pdf
Dear Sir/ Mdm,
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SGE3113D and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Meena, P Brne
“Kindly upload this survey request emall to merimen. T: hoha »
Thank You. V. In
Best Regards, E- \//
Gabriel Wee
. INDM
o @ InTERNATIONAL

InsurANCE

P I NG & F DRI

Serving ihe ragin maes | RD
&4 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Bullding
Singapore 049711

Tel: 5347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg)

Sent: 08 October, 2019 10:12 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Pre-repair Inspection for SGE 3113D. Your Insured Vehicle no : SJA 3193H.
Dear Sir,

We refer to your email on dated 08-10-2019. Please be informed that we would like to select Mr. Marcus
Chua from LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid as our SJE.

Car in workshop ready for PRL

Thank You.

Best Regards
Arine

On Tue, 8 Oct 2019 at 09:40, Motor Claim - [1l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

1




Dear 'Sir { Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We propose using one of the following motor surveyors:

= Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
+« VP Appraisal

* Form Team Adjusters Pte Ltd

= |nfiniti Appraisal Service

= IP Knights Adjusters

LB5 Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

RT Appraisal

LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd

Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

. ® ® @

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

. IHDM
P INTERNATIONAL
( InsurANCE
I NGALAPFPFODERE
Srruing B g mner §RIFT

64 Cecil Street, 405 - 10B Bullding
Singapore 049711

Ted, 6347 6100, Ext — 248




From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg)

Sent: 07 October, 2019 5:29 PM

To: Motor Claim - 11| <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

*Subject: Pre-repair Inspection for SGE 3113D. Your Insured Vehicle no : SIA 3193H.

Dear Sir,

We refer to the above mentioned matter, herewith enclosed 2 days notice for your attention.

Kindly arrange a date and time to do a PRI for our client vehicle (SGE 3113D) in our workshop ASAP,

Thank You

Best Regards

Arine

-

T:67457367 | F:6841 3390

E ! support@preciseauto.sg

W: www.preciseayto.sg

A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Follow us on social media:




Witips/www.insta gram.com/preciseautosvs/

Ll Atwitter.comypreciseautosvs

L ttps s www, acebook.com/PreciseAutoService/

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

T:67457367 | F:6841 3390
E: i i

w: ;

A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kakl Bukit, Singapore 417883




Follow us on social media:

L https:hvww.instagram.convpreciseautosvs/

_=pmm:ﬁhviucr.mmr’grecismumsu§

Mittps://www. facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No, 198703792-K




212672020 Mearimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SGE3113P (MPC2019D0001213)
[SJA3193H]
TP

TAN CHENG NAM
Oct 5 2019 12:00AM
[MOHAMED ALIFF BIN ZAINUDIN]
Precise Auto Service

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Il_SG), sent on 05/02/2020 14:28 PM,
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($$9810.00) - SGE3113P - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi

Approved:9910.00:0UR RECOMMENDATION 1S AS FOLLOWS : COR $8,560.00 LOR ($150 x 9 DAYS) 1,350.00
TOTAL 9,910.00 OFFER GLOBAL $9,500.00

hitps-faingapore. metmen,.com/claimsfindex cfm7fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_PrntACFID=6TTE52534CFTOKEN=1 b0258800e2eTBba-FE... N




PRECISE AUTO SERVICE
NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-33/34/36 AUTOBAY SINGAPORE 417883
TEL : 67457367 FAX : 68413390
CO. REG. NO.:35766600C  GST REG. NO. : 35766600C

ETEm

ST oTooooooooooonsooSooos

IS S S EEEREEEEEEE ST EEEEEET D=

Accldent Date : 05-10-19

OUR REF: SGE3113D/T/19(S]E)

TAX INVOICE
Tan Cheng Nam
Blk 106 Spottiswoode Park Road Involce No. : TP1911-003
#19-138
Singapore 080106 DATE : 15-11-19
FINALBILL ON VEH. NO.: SGE 31130
VEHICLE MODEL : BM.W 318i
LUMP SUM REPAIR
INCLUDING SUPPLY OF PARTS & LABOUR
PANEL BEATING & SPRAY PAINTING 2,000.00
SUB-TOTAL : 8.000.00
ADDGST 7% 560.00
TOTALAMOUNT SGD | 8.560.00

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.




AM9/2020 Meriman o-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SGE3113P (MPC2019D0001213)
[SJA3193H]
TP

TAN CHENG NAM
Oct 5 2019 12:00AM
[MOHAMED ALIFF BIN ZAINUDIN]
Precise Aulo Service

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 02/03/2020 10:23 AM.
To LKK_HOQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$10180.00) - SGE3113P - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi

Approved:10180.00.

hitps:/isingapare. merimen.comiclaimsfindex.cim Musebox=5VCmall&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=6887 10684CFTOKEN=301411265c47727-651... 11




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settimmant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Motified Est Submitted Ad| Assignad Ad) Apt Ad| Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
120002019 DROCtZ01S  |sem 00000  [5$8,000.00 oo et

| | so g | g Estmates | | view mgt | Cance Gaee | l

Hain Claim Details

|CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster] '

Insured |MOHAMED ALIFF BIM ZATNUDIN, [D: SE740326R

Main
| Clmimant: TAN CHENG HAM, |0 SDO036B4F

Vihicle Reg To5/10/2019 00:00 - <59
Ne.: SGE3113D Date of LoSS! | 193 Months and 4 Days From LTA Rleg Dats (Man Yr})
Claim Type: | TP / MPC2019D0001213 Policy/Caver | o) smpc0003098

MNote No.:
Vahicle Reg
Ne. SIA3193M fCiarney. | Moocss1s
[Insured): =
! Excess:
Repaiver Precise Auto Service (HQ) No | Kaki Bukit Ave &, #02-34/36, 417883 Kakl Bukiy - Tel: 67457367
Handlnd | india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 . [Handled by C. Meenachi - 6347 6073)
W‘ Etigs Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 61360477
Adjuster | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) - Tnl- 6256-3561 __|Handisd by MARCUS CHUA] _ [Final Rpt due 17/10/2019)

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al |  Compose Case Mad |

« 1I1_SG (02/03/2020): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$10180.00) - SGEJ113P - Claim Handler: C. Meensch...
s [11_SG (05/02/2020): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$9910.00) - SGE3113P - Claim Handler: C. Mesnachi

« QI1_SG (17/01/2020): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$9500.00) - SGE3113P - Claim Handler: C. Meanachi

o HI_SG [26/1172015): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (550.00) - SGEI113P - Clalm Handler: C. Meanachi

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= viaw Al | Search Tasks | Create wew Tasy | Complete |

Due Date  Priority Typs  Task Group  Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=d... 27/3/2020




Merimen e-Claims Page | of 3

Claim Documents

*SGE3113D (MPC2019D0001213)
[SIA3193H]
™
TAN CHENG NAM
Oct 5 2019 12:00AM
[MOHAMED ALIFF BIN ZAINUDIN]
Precise Auto Service

Photos/Images e
o | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Fie Ltd (HG) Thumbmall | Print
1| 30/12/150%:27 | Chassis Number 0 arc || B
2 |anznsoeiaz | odometer Reading 0 teaws | A
1| 10/12/1909:22 | Ganeral View @ wars | A

& |30/12/1909.22 | Genersl View O v | 2
5 |30/12/1909:22 | General View @ | osdws | & |
5 |30/12/1909:27 | General View )| teadec | A
7 |amnane cezz General View 0 | adies | A
B [30/121909:22 | General View 0| o | B
5 |30/12/1908:22 | Genersl View 0| waaws | A
10 [30/12/1909:22 | General View 0| eaws | A
11 |30/12/1905:22 | General View Q| tmewc | A
12 |30/12/19 09122 General View 0| wmews | A
11 |30/12/19 08:22 | General View 0| wecws | A
14 3012/1906:22 | General View 0| tcacwc | A
15 | 30/12/1909:22 | General View o 0| leeawc | A
16 |30/12/1909:22 | Ganeral View _g Leadrc | B
17 |30/12/13 0%:22 | Genersl View 0| edre |
18 |30/12/1909:22 | Genaral View @ wore | B
18 |a121000:22 | General View @ | Losdwc | & |
20 |30/12/1909:22 | Genarsl View 0| eeaws | @
21 |3012/1909:23 | Genaral View B i | A
22 |30/12/1909:23 | General View Q| wears | A
3 |30/12/1909:21 | Genersl View Q| e | A
24 |[30/12/1909:23 | General View 0| wdwe | A
25 |30/12/1909:23 | Geners! View Q| atws |
26 |30/12/1909:23 | Genersl View Q| tcseaws B
27 |30/12/1909:23 | Ganersl View 0| cadws | B
26 |30/12/1909:21 | General View i Load 0G| B
20 |3I0/12/1609:23 | Genersl View 0| wtwc | &
30 |30/12/1909:23 | General View D | ladws | A
I1 | 30/12/1909:23 | Genersl View 0| dws | B
3z |30/12/19 09:23 General View D | Loas o o |
11 |30/12/1909:21 | General View @ | waws | B
34 |30/12/19 0927 | General View | adrc | A
35 [30/12/1909:23 | General View @ | toadis | 4
36 |30/12/1909:23 | General View 0! oodwrs | A
37 |3012/1909:23 | Genersl View 0| teeawrs | &
38 |20/12/19 09:23 | Genersl View | woows | &
15 |30/12/19 09:23 | General View ! Lead PG | BA
40 [30/12/1909:23 | General View 0| odirs | &
81 |30/12/19 0923 | Genersl View 0 | Loedirs
42 |30/13/1909:23 | General View Q| tcoars | @A
43 |30/12/1909:23 | Genaral View @ o | @
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7 |10/12/19005 | Relnapection Phote - Q| e | B
58 |30/12/1909:35 | Reinspection Photo 0 | lcedwc | B
59 |30/12/1902:35 | Reinspection Photo @ | Loedrws | @A
60 |30/12/1909:25 | Reinspection Photo Q| wwws | B
61 |30/12/1909:25 | Reinspection Photo O dwc | B
B2 [30/12/1309:25 | Reinspection Photo _g load G | B
B3 |30/12/190%:35 | Rsinspection Photo Q| s | A
B4 |30/12/19 08:25 | Reinspection Photo 0| wws | B
65 |30/12/1809:25 | Reinspection Photo @ | weaws | B |
66 |30/12/19 09:2% Relnspection Photo ! wad G | ¥
67 |30/12/1909:25 | Relnspection Photn | oadws | B
68 |30/12/19 09:35 Reinspection Photo O | Loaawe &
69 |30/12/19 09:25 Reinspection Photo 0| wacwc | B4
70 |30/12/19 0925 | Reinspection Photo 0| eews || A
71 |50/12/18 08:25 | Relnspection Photo 0| dws | A
72 |m/12/1908:25 | Reinspection Photo 0| e | A
73 |30/12/19 09:25 | Relnspection Photo 0| weawc | A
74 |30/12/19 09:25 Reinspection Photo ! Laad %G | B
75 |30/12/19 09:25 | Reinspection Phota 0| saws | A
76 |30/12/18 09:25 | Reinspection Photo O tswwc | H
77 |3/12/1909:2%5 | Reinspection Phota 0 s | 2
78 | 30/12/190%:75  Reinspection Photo 0| lesomc | @A
79 |30712/19 09:25 Raeinspection Phato ! Load G |
80 |30/12/1909:25 | Reinspection Photo 0| weaws | M
Bl [30/12/1509:25 | Reinspection Photo O | toadirc | &
B2 |30/12/1909:25 | Reinspection Phota 0| eooirs | A
B3 | 3012190925 Reinspection Phota 0| tosarc | B
84 |30121909:25 | Reinspection Photo @ odws | B
85 |30/12/1909:25 | Reinspection Photo 0| woaws | A
86 |30/12/1909:25 | Reinspection Phots O | teadirc | A
87 |30/12/15909:25 | Reinspection Phota ! load 3G | A
86 |30/12/1909:25 | Reinspection Photo 0| wawrs | A
B9 | 30/13/19 09:25 Reinspection Fhoto i Load #G | B
90 |30/12/15 09:25 Reinspection Photo B waws | A
91 |30/12/1909:25 | Relnspection Photo @ | oews | &
37 |30/12/1% 09:25 Relnspertion Phote 0| edivs | A
93 [30/12/1909:25 | Relnspection Photo 0| taaws | A
g | 30712719 05225 Reinspection Phats O | eawc | 4
Documentation 1 ~1| &
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1 |08/0/18 1512 | EMAIL FROM II1 DD 08102019 Load POF
2 |0W10/19 1512 | WNSP NOTICE Laad POF
3 0910/1917:31 TP GIA REPORT @ | LoaeFoF
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1eseo71s8m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusinial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6B44-BB0S Email sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC41118017716/UGS302
Date: 2710312020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: |1g® '"ermational Insurance Ple pojey no: D18MPC0003098
Claimant Insured Vehicle
Vehicle No SGE3113D SJA31683H
Date of Loss:  05/10/2019 Nature of Claim: TP ﬁ‘;”“ MPC2019D0001213
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SGE3113D
Make & Model: BMW 3281, 2.0 (A) Engine No: A3Z220115N20B20A
Reg. Date: 01/03/2012 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: WEASASZ020F253478
Colour: White Odometer 140823 km
Engine Capacity: 1987 cc
Markel Value/New Car
: NIA
Price
Sum Insured (S$) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/45 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 225/45 R18
Front Lefl Side: Pirelll & mm Rear Laft Side: Pirelli & mm
Front Right Side: Pirelll & mm Rear Righi Side: Pirelli & mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre imads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  DIff %)
Parts 1120413 7.782.23 3.411.90 30.45
Miscellansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4 490.00 2.210.00 2,280.00 50.78
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 15,694.13 10,002.23 5,691.90 3827
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 8,000.00
1560413 8,000.00 768413 49.03
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 1,088.59 580.00 538 59 49.03
Nett Amount (58) 16, 792.72 B8,560.00 8,232.712 49.03
+ Car Rental (9.0 x $$180.00/day) (S5) 1,620.00
Nett Liability (S$) 10,180.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment. 0B/10/2018
Date Inspected: 08/10/2018 Inspecied Al Precise Auto Service (HQ)
No 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #)2-34/38
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 6.0 days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE This raport represents our findings &t the fime and pigce of inspection statad Nersin. Such inspection has been carmed out fo ihe best of our
knowledge and abiity bul any other lpbilly undes Bny other circumelances (s hoereby axpressly exciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

| Reference

|Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 10 Jan 2020)

Parts: 143 BMW 3281 20 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no prini-code for SGE3113D) i

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts
Part

No. Qty No. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount

1 1 *REAR BUMPER FASCIA Deep Cut/ 1.320.00 FL *1.205.32FL
Deformed
2 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH Not Necessary 80.00FL *-FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING MNecessary 13140FL *131.40FL
4 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary S0.00FL *50,00FL
5 1 *REAR DOOR ASSY LH Badly Dented 1,180.00 FL *1,1B0.00 FL
8 2 *REAR DOOR HINGE Mol Necessary 240.00 FL *.FL
7T 1 *REAR DOOR CHECKER Mot Necessary B80.00FL *.FL
8 1 *REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP Necessary 150.00FL *150.00FL
g 1 *REAR DOOR STOPPER Necessary 4B.00FL *48.00FL
0 1 *REAR DOOR INNER LOCK Shored  Twisted 260.00FL *260.00FL
1 1 *REAR DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD Deformed / Twisted 630.00FL *630.00FL
12 1 *REAR DOOR QUARTER GLASS MOULDING Necessary / Bent 220.00FL *220.00FL
13 1 *REAR DOOR WINDOW REGULATOR Benl 220.00FL *220.00FL
14 1 *REAR DOOR WINDOW REGULATOR MOTOR  Jammed 325.00FL =325.00FL
i5 1 'REARU DOOR WINDOW GLASS CHANNEL MNecessary 230.00FL *230.00FL
RUBBER
16 1 *REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE Damaged 120.00FL *120.00FL
17 1 *REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE KNOCB Mol Necessary BO.OOFL “-FL
18 1 *REAR DOOR SPEAKER Nol Necessary 180.00FL *.FL
%9 1 *ROCKER PANEL SPOILER Cut / Deformed B8000FL *B80.00FL
20 1 *ROCKER PANEL SPOILER BRACKET Mot Necessary 58.00 FL *.FL
21 1 "REAR KNUCKLE ARM LH Bent / Twisted 1.010.00 FL *1,010.00 FL
22 1 *REAR ABSORBER LH Mot Necessary 480,00 FL “.FL
23 1 *REAR LOWER ARM Not Necessary 321.00FL - FL
24 1 *REAR CONTROL ARM (SHORT) Twisted 1B0.00FL =180.00FL
25 1 *REAR CONTROL ARM (LONG) Mol Necessary 282.00FL “FL
26 1 *REAR TRAILING ARM Mot Necessary 580.00 FL " FL
27 1 *REAR WHEEL BEARING HUP Damaged 510.00FL *510.00FL
28 1 *SPORT RIM ASSY Cut 1,481 50 F5*1,000.00FS
20 1 *REAR DOOR QUARTER GLASS SEALANT WNot Necessary 60.00F5 “.FS
30 1 *TYRE ASSY Serviceable 480.00 FS “-FS
F=Franchise part 5=5pcNell L=ListemDisc.

Sub Total (S§) 11,686.90  B8,149.72

- List Item Discount on L ltems 5.00/5.00% (5%) 48277 357 .48

Total Parts (S5) 11,204.13 7.782.23

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out
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Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TOWING MNew 120.00 0.00
2 TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM MNew 100.00 30,00
3  TO TUFF COAT AFFECTED AREAS Mew 200.00 50.00
4  TORESET ELECTRICAL MODULE SYSTEM MNew 280.00 50.00
5 TOREMOVE & REFIX REAR LH DOOR MECHANISM } New 280.00 BO.00
6 TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR LH DOOR GLASS } New 150.00 0.00
7 TO CHECK & ADJUST COMPUTER WHEEL ALIGNMENT MNew 240.00 120.00
(BEFORE & AFTER)
8  TOREMOVE & REFIX REAR LH UNDERCARRIAGE MNew 400.00 150.00
COMPONENTS
%  TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR LH SPORT RIM & CONTACT New 120.00 0.00
WHEEL BALANCING
10  TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS New 1,250.00 1,080.00
11 TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS ,STRAIGHTEN & REPAIR New 1.250.00 650.00
REAR LH FENDER ,DOOR PILLAR AND ALIGNED ALL
PARTS
Gross Labour Cost {S§) 4.490.00 2,210.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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