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Denise Tay (LKKAut

0)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 August 2019 10:51 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Ng, Jeffreysaykiat; SUR

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE; 2659083049SG003 - check MV

Dear Jeffery,

The market value fore SKR 3670X is S50K- $53K(est) as at Sept 2016

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 1 August 2019 4:32 PM

To: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat <leffreysaykiat.Ng@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: 26590830495G003 - check MV

Dear Jeffery,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Sur,

Kindly assist

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat [mailto:Jeffreysaykiat.Ng@aig.com]
Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 4:23 PM
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>




, Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat <Jeffreysaykiat Ng@aig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 1 August 2019 4:23 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: 26590830495G003 - check MV

Attachments: 2659083049SG003.pdf

Dear Vivian,

Please let me have the market value for SKR3670X at time of loss dated 04.09.2016, thank you.

Jeffrey Ng

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 ‘é

Tel +(65) 6419 1916 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Jeffreysaykiat. Ng@aig.com | www.aig.com.sq

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit 100.aig ro learn more.

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

Follow us:

flin’ e+

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanentiy delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof  Although this email and any attachments are believed [0 be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 57662

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SKR3670X
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
:'3‘;‘“_‘*’" De-registration 55 Noy 2016

te:

Vehicle Make: VOLKSWAGEN
Vehicle Model. NEW GOLF 1.4 AT 5K13G5
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2009
Engine No.: CAX286119
Chassis No.: WVWZZZ1KZAW255602
Maximum Power Output:  90.0 kW (120 bhp)

Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

$21,852.00
11 Aug 2010
11 Aug 2010
1
$21.852.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 10 Aug 2020

PARF Rebate Amount:

$14,203.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount:

10 Aug 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$36,162.00

$13,444.00

$27,647.00

Tha infarmatian rantainad harain ie ~armact ac at 27 Nav 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/tta/vrl/action/pubfunc?ID =EnquireRebateBeforeDeReg
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VOLKSWAGEN AG

'VVVVVZZZ1KZANV255602

41850 ko
3180 kg
1- 1020kg
.9. 0880 kg

2




VEHICLE NO: SKR 3670 X Our Ref' ¢ TP/BSL/SKR3I6TON/7436
MODEL : VOLKSWAGEN NEW GOLF 1.4 AT 5K13GS

ASSESSMENT SUMMARY

The vehicle is assessed as Not Economical to repairs, therefore Total Loss Recommended.

Market value of the similar make and model is approximately $56,800.00 at time of loss.
Parf & COE rebate amount is approximately at $27,647.00 on 22 November 2016.
Margin of economical repairs $29,100.00.

Under normal circumstances, estimated days required if the vehicle is to be repairs : One Hundred Twenty ( 120) working days.
Enclosed Sixty-Four (64) photographs depicting damage to the vehicle.

Inspection conducted at : 19 Kim Chuan Terrace Singapore 537041,
Name of Workshop : Brightstar Leasing And Recovery.

The survey was conducted on a WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS.

Yours faithfully
KTO Automobile Assessors

-

Es W

Ong Ah Keng (CAE, AMIMI, MSAAA)
Automotive Appraiser




