Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: 4 September 2020 11:55 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AMENDED FINAL REVISION - SKD4476H - TP AIG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-

SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

Hi Khanchna,

AIR FILTER - CRACK
FRONT NO PLATE - NECESSARY
SUNDRIES - NECESSARY

Regards
Taufikh

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 4 September 2020 10:52 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: AMENDED FINAL REVISION - SKD4476H - TP AIG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

Hi Taufikh,
Please let me know the conditions for the item 63, 66 and 67.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: 15 May 2020 2:49 PM

To: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AMENDED FINAL REVISION - SKD4476H - TP AIG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

HilJia Yee,

COR $10,000, 10 days.

Please forward before paint of after repair photos, thank you.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg [mailto:jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 2 April 2020 5:07 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'

Cc: 'Carrine Leong'; khanchna@Ikkauto.com; 'Claims Dept'

Subject: AMENDED FINAL REVISION - SKD4476H - TP AIG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

Hi Taufikh,
Amended estimate is attached.
Please confirm limit repair 10,000.00 @10 days.

We appreciate your kind approval for early closure.

Thanks & Best Regard
JiaYee Yap
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 f. +65 6841 1183

e. jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

LT 111 TR

audisndemand.com.sg

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
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Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 1 April 2020 10:48 AM

To: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: 'Carrine Leong' <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; khanchna@lkkauto.com; 'Claims Dept'
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINAL CLOSURE - SKD4476H - TP AIG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

HilJia Yee,

| have checked with Chang for item 50, lock carrier, and it was not changed. Therefore labour should be 1750 instead of
3250. Please amend the necessary changes.
And forward the after repair photos.

Thank you.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg [mailto:jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sq]

Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 3:07 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; khanchna@Ikkauto.com; cs-a@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com

Cc: 'Carrine Leong'; 'Claims Dept'

Subject: RE: FINAL CLOSURE - SKD4476H - TP AIG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

Hi Taufikh,

Reminder

We have yet receive your confirmation of repair cost and days of repair for above vehicle.
Revised estimate was mailed to you 30 Dec & 19 Feb 2020.

We sincerely appreciate your early closure.

Thanks & Best Regard
JiaYee Yap
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 f. +65 6841 1183

e. jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

S LT TN T

Audiandamand.eom. g

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.




If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Carrine Leong [mailto:carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 19 February, 2020 4:26 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'Khanchna (LKK Auto)' <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; 'cs-a@lkkauto.com'
<cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'admin-a@lkkauto.com' <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; 'Premiumauto Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>;
'llayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg' <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINAL CLOSURE - SKD4476H - TP AIG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

Hi Taufikh,

Reminder

We have yet receive your confirmation of repair cost and days of repair for above vehicle.
Revised estimate was mailed to you 30 Dec 2019.

We sincerely appreciate your early closure.

Thanks & Best Regard
Carrine Leong
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 f. +65 6841 1183

e. carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Carrine Leong [mailto:carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 30 December, 2019 6:12 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'Khanchna (LKK Auto)' <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; 'cs-a@lkkauto.com'
<cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'admin-a@Ilkkauto.com' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; 'Premiumauto Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>;
'liayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg' <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL CLOSURE - SKD4476H - TP AlG - SURVEYED 09 OCT 2019 RE-SURVEYED 21 OCT 2019

Hi Taufikh,



We wish to inform you that we have completed repairing the above vehicle at a Limit repair $10,000.00 @ 10
days.

We appreciate your kind approval for early closure.

Thanks & Best Regard
Carrine Leong
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 f. +65 6841 1183

e. carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




