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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 13 April 2020 7:09 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: SKK2151X - Finalize

Dear Denise, 

 

The above vehicle file with me and finalize closed. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

 

From: victorwong@wengkeemotor.com [mailto:victorwong@wengkeemotor.com]  
Sent: Monday, April 13, 2020 6:38 PM 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: SKK2151X - Finalize 

 

Hi Steve, 

 

I confirmed the amount to be 32050 with 5 days 

 

 

Regards, 

 

Victor Wong 

WENG KEE MOTOR 

HP:81821895 

 

 

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 8:36 AM 

To: victorwong@wengkeemotor.com 

Subject: SKK2151X - Finalize 
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Dear Victor, 

  

Kindly refer our finalize $3250 (L/S, before GST). 5 repair days. 

  

Kindly confirm. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Thanks. 

  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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