Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: Anthony Cheong <cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 10 October 20719 10:31 AM

To: Asher 5ng (LKKAuUtO)

Subject: Accident involving SFE3822C & SK559327 on 03/10/2019
Attachments: 20191010101654.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref | SKS59322
Our ref - 3822/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence
of the driver of your insured's vehicle SKS59322

We hereby quantify our client's claim as follows in respect of property damage

COR § 1,050.00 as per your surveyor's recommendation
LOU@3$90/-perday 3 180.00 ( 2 days )

Total $ 1,230.00

Enclosed herawith copies of the fallowing In support of our client's claim
a8 Final repair bill
We thank you for your kind attention and appreciate your early reply

Best Regards

Anthony Cheong
Claims

Massive Trading & Auto
H/p 81082728



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 21 October 2019 11:18 AM

To: WLLEEGE@GMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 5923Z AND SFE 3822C ON 03/10/2019

Our Ref: CCHAIGI9017526/Keal

21 OCT 2019

LEE WAN LOONG

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 59237 AND SFE 3822C ON 03/10/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid 1o resolve the claim
against you and/or vour authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior 1o our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersngialkkauto.com

ce.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



SIGNED WITHOUT PREJUDICE FOR
ONLY PROPERTY CLAIM

AUTHORISATION TQ ACT

’Jﬂ IWT gﬁ"“L (“the third party detment”) of BIL 776 ey dlan) ¢
('fﬂtcud' A LE = b iq }%Oiﬁﬂﬂm} ownerof SFESBIZC (vshicle no.) herehy
sothorize__MASOVE Trad > huck (“the workshop®) to sct for
me with respect o my cisim for repair costs and/or rentel and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my
vehicle 0. SFE 3813 C hat wer demeged porsuzrt to mcmmmmmﬁ_m_ﬁﬁ
(ete) gleng b, Ave 3 /thya ehav 1) (iocetion] involving vehicle
nals SLSNir2 Z it zeciden™),

1 furiber suthorize 1be warkshop © sexile noy sbove mentioned clsim in & menner e they deem it
mmmquﬁmhﬁ&ﬂmmmmiwmmmmsﬂﬂmmldmydﬂmﬁm
payment chequels being made in favour of the werkshop.

I further acknowledge that any setfiement the workshop may reach on mry behalf is on & withgut

prejudice &nd without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/ownes/insurers of the other
vehicle/s Is concemned.

Dated this L (day) of U"f (month) 151 (year)

Signed by "the third party claimant"' Signed by “the workshop”
(with company stamp if applicahle) (with company stamp)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, MASSIVE TRADING & AUTO (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached
an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$1,050.00
(Repair Cost), S3180.00 (Loss of Use/Ressed), 8§ - (Dishursement) for vehicle no. SFE 3822C
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 03/10/2019 (date) along JUNC AT

UBIAVE 3 & PAYA LEBAR RD (location) involving vehicle no/s SKS 5923Z.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 07/10/2019 (date) al “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l arc/am authonized by the owner NG HAN SONG (“the third party claimant™)
of vehicle no. SFE 3822C make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full
authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the
letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining 1o costs of repairs and/or rental andior loss of use pursuant to the damage to SFE
3822C (vehicle no,) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
thard party claimant” pursuant to the sccident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liahility basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Counts have
exclusive junsdiction over any dispute ansing out of the same.

Dated this hs (day) of k‘ ﬂj\] (month) Zﬂ'l-_LL (year) T

¢ \J g
(LKK o LL\ 4
!{i\L‘
Signed bv Jppﬂlnt:d surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)

SIGNED WITHOUT PREJUDICE FOR
ONLY PROPERTY CLAIM




Massive Trading & Auto

Bik 5038 #01-405 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Pk 2 Singapore 588541
H/P 81082728

Fax ' B4B18131

Ng Han Song Daie ; 10.10.2018

Blk 778 Woodlands Crescant

#0G6-56 Invoice Mo - 38222019

Singapore 730776

Oty Description Unit Prica Amount

SFE3822C

1 Total repair cost as per your surveyor's recommendation $1.060.00

Grand total $1.05000

Mastive Troding & Auto

Chegues should be made payahle 1o Masiae Trading & Auls



