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Celine Fong (LKKAuto) _ My Limn C (Vonee :

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 5:54 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ; SUR

Subject: (URGENT!) AIG Ref: 97466148955G-003 || Market Value to vehicle (DOA: 21/01/2019)
Hi Bennie

The market value of FBJ5824E is $3.5K - $4K (Estimated) as at Jan 2019

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ [mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 01, 2019 2:09 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: (URGENT!) AIG Ref: 97466148955G-003 || Market Value to vehicle (DOA: 21/01/2019)

Hi LKK

Referring to our email below.

Any updates on this?

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 5:06 PM

To: SUR; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: (URGENT!) AIG Ref: 97466148955G-003 || Market Value to vehicle (DOA: 21/01/2019)

Hi LKK

Kindly assist to advise on the Market Value for the above vehicle.
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Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 5:06 PM

To: SUR; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: (URGENT!) AIG Ref: 97466148955G-003 || Market Value to vehicle (DOA: 21/01/2019)

Hi LKK

Kindly assist to advise on the Market Value for the above vehicle.

Thanks.
» Back to OneMotoring
Engquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Viehicle

Vehicle Owner Particudars

Qwaner 1D Typer Sngagore NEIC
QOwener iD 18381
Vehicle Details

Viehicie No FRUSEISE
Vehicle 19 be Esported: Mo

Interded Deregistration Date 19 Feb 2017
Vehicle Make M

Vehic de Mode! COMBIT 125A
Pruvary Coldur Grey
Manulacuaring Year k]

Engine Mo KITO1648
Chassis No RFGAPAIDIESD0 1650
Manmmum Power Oulgaat

Ot Mar ket Value $157800

Or gl Regostration Dase 24 il 2014
Frst Regrstrataon Date. 24 Jul 2014
Trarader Court 1

Acbaal ARF Pisd $23700
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Enghility: ™

PARF Engtality Expery Date -

PARF Rebate Amount $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Exgery Date I3 Jul 2024
COE Category 0 - Mogtorcycie
COE Period{Vears: 10

GP Paid $400100
COE Rebate Amcunt 4217100
Total Rebate Amount $217100

The information oot ared beroin i correct as 3t 15 Feb 3019
oK f\/\ \ N 1‘) K Af‘ L

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd



78 'Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you
must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify
me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this
email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free
and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either
jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



10/1/2019 SYM Combiz 125 For Sale, Motorbikes, Motorbikes for Sale, Class 2B on Carousell

. corouse" Items ~ Search for an item, user or group... Q New User? Register

Cars & Property v Fashion v Home & Living v Mobiles & Ele.. v Hobbies & Ga... v Jobs & Services v

Home Motarbikes Motorbikes for Sale Class 2B

Advertisement

https://sg.carousell.com/p/sym-combiz-125-for-sale-178011570/

Advertisement

miketan.sg

W w2

S$4,800 (" Share O 3

SYM Combiz 125 For Sale

(=) Singapore
€ Meetup

i*! Used

Cee expire January 2024 road tax till January 2019
ideal bike for carrying goods Low fuel
consumption instalment plan available call mike

1 year ago In Class 2B

@ SYM @ Scooter
Insurance
Meet-up

) Singapore (2

Listed by miketan.sg

€D veryrespornsive Q) @ (.

Check seller profile

Reviews for miketan.sg

hafiz0808
2016 Feh

Brought it Cbr1000rr 2005 from nan wah. Super
nice seller. Got it with excellent engine. Done up all
to provide best in service! Thumps up! Pleasant

Login Sell

Others v

Advertisement

%
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