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11/29/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

<« Service Request Details
Claim
S9M0230V

Reference

None f

Loss Date
September 22, 2019

Report Date
Oct 10, 2019 4:52:00 PM

Request Date
November 29, 2019

Due Date
November 29, 2020

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Direct settlement
Actions

Next Step
Finish the work

Complete Work More =

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
FBD8364C

https://ivp.smartclaims.axa.com .sg.'clalm-pnrta!fhtmI!lndex-vandur-service-raquests.htmhfﬁservica-requests!‘?servlceRequeslNumber:149511 112



11/29/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) ~ Menu

viogel
WAVE 125X A

Service Address

51 Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25, , , 408933

Primary Contact/Insured

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No.2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63, 569111, Singapore

Claim Handler
WANG Peter

peter.wang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
Duplicated case as S9M02244. Please submit report and invoice here.

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes
New Message
TYPE o
SENT 11/29/19 10:25 AM
FROM WANG Peter
SUBJECT Pls submit report and invoice here
BODY
L o

hnps:INp.smartclaims.axa.cnm.sg.’claim-portalfhlmb'index-vendar—senﬁce-requasts.htmt#i’sarvice-requesls!?sawicaRequeslNumbeF149511



10/3/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

<« Service Request Details
Claim
S9M02244

Reference

None &

Loss Date
September 22, 2019

Report Date
Qct 3, 2019 11:02:00 AM

Request Date
October 3, 2019

Due Date
October 10, 2019

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pre-Repair Survey
Actions

Next Step
Agree to perform service

Decline Worlk Accept Waorl

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
FBD8364C

https:ﬂvp.srnartclalms.axa.ccm.sg!claim-porlalfhtmli’indax-vandor-service-requesls.htm*#!senrice-requasls!?serviceRequeslNumberﬂ40255 1/2



101312019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

Moaodel
UNKNOWN

Service Address

51 Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25, , , 408933

Primary Contact/Insured

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No.2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63, 569111, Singapore

Claim Handler
LIU Yiwen

yiwen.liu@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
Urgent PRI: Vehicle already dismantle at the workshop. Company Name : Sang Motor Address : 20, Cha...
(expand)

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/html/index-vendor-service-requests.htmi#/service-requests/?serviceRequestNumber=140265 212



Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: OH Vale

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October, 2019 10:00 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM DC Motor

Cc: GOH Allen; NIKAM Santosh Pandurang

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Urgent PRI-TRANSCAB P1680520-SHD454H RISK 716
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Sentosh

Pls follow up on the registration and send it to the correct handler, thanks.
Aside to Allen & Idah
Thanks for informing!

Best Regards

Vale Oh/A.Manager — Motor Claims
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd/ 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 /www.axa.com.sg

vale.oh@axa.com.sq
Customer Care No. 1800 8804741

‘&L GLOBAL l'es%:._ucs
BRAND FOR

50 Years #

in Singapore

Please consider the enviranment before printing this message

CONSECUTIVE YEARS

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whale or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify
the sender immediately.

From: Distributor.care.motor <distributor.care.motor@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, October 2, 2019 9:26 AM

To: OH Vale <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Cc: GOH Allen <allen.goh@axa.com.sg>; NIKAM Santosh Pandurang <santosh.nikam@axa.com.sg>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Urgent PRI-TRANSCAB P1680520-SHD454H RISK 716

Hi Vale,

Its under P2203857 risk 627. i will endorse to amend the VRN to appear as SHD454H as omitted to remove the 0
before adding.

Regards,

Idah

-— Original Message -

From: vale.oh@axa.com.sg

Sent: 01/10/2019

To: santosh.nikam@axa.com.sg; allen.goh@axa.com.sg; distributor.care.motor@axa.com.sg
Subject:RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Urgent PRI-TRANSCAB P1680520-SHD454H RISK 716

Hi DC/Allen



Please check urgently if we are at risk for SHD454H, we are not able to do registration as system shown not at risk!

Best Regards

Vale Oh/A.Manager — Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd/ 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811/www.axa.com.sg
vale.oh@axa.com.sg<mailto:tiongbeng.tan@axa.com.sg>

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741

[InternalComm_EmailSignature_50_Brand (003)]
Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: NIKAM Santosh Pandurang

Sent: Tuesday, October 1, 2019 11:21 AM
To: OH Vale <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>
Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] Re: Urgent PRI

Hi Vale
Please assist on the below email.

Please assist as the RISK id 716 is not showing on smart claim and the termination date is showing on AS400
21/12/2018 what action need to be taken.

Regards,
Santosh Nikam

From: Eddy Yap [mailto:Eddyyap@arcclaimslic.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 01, 2019 10:42 AM

To: NIKAM Santosh Pandurang <santosh.nikam@axa.com.sg<mailto:santosh.nikam@axa.com.sg>>; SG AXA
Insurance SM Motor Doc <motor.doc@axa.com.sg<mailto:motor.doc@axa.com.sg>>; SG AXA Insurance SM AXA
SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg<mailto:motor.survey@axa.com.sg>>

Subject; [EXTERNAL] Re: Urgent PRI

Can we start to repair our vehicle after our surveyor have inspected or we still have to wait for your surveyor which
might take more then two days ?

Please advise urgently.

Thank You.
Eddy

On Mon, 30 Sep 2019 at 16:35, Eddy Yap <Eddyyap@arcclaimslic.com<mailto:Eddyyap@arcclaimslic.com>> wrote:
Can we start to repair our vehicle after our surveyor have inspected or we still have to wait for your surveyor which
might take more then two days ?

Please advise urgently.

Thank You.
Eddy

On Mon, 30 Sep 2019 at 16:02, NIKAM Santosh Pandurang
<santosh.nikam@gxa.com.sg<mailto:santosh.nikam@axa.com.sg>> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir



We regret that we are unable to arrange a survey for your client's vehicle as we need more time to confirm the vehicle
no. SHD454H. In order not to delay any further, you may proceed to arrange your own surveyor as deemed fit.

Regards
Santosh

From: Eddy Yap [mailto:Eddyyap@arcclaimslic.com<mailto:Eddyyap@arcclaimslic.com>]
Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 2:42 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

<motor survey@axa.com.sg<mailto:motor.survey@axa.com.sg>>; SG AXA Insurance SM Motor Doc
<motor.doc@axa.com.sg<mailto:motor.doc@axa.com.sg>>

Cc: Irene Seow Siew Eng <irene@arcclaimslic.com<mailto:irene@arcclaimslic.com>>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Urgent PRI

Dear Sir,
Kindly arrange your surveyor to conduct a PRI. Please let us have you list of surveyors for SJE.
Details are as follow :

Company Name : Sang Motor
Address : 20, Changi North Crescent VICOM Vehicle Inspection Centre, 499613 Singapore

Our Vehicle : FBD8364C
Your Vehicle : SHD454H
Date of Accident : 22.09.2019

Qur Fax : 68153273

Thank You.

--—-Disclaimer----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are not
the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
—---Disclaimer---—

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are not
the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

Regards,

|x%]| &

Idah - -

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

ref:_00DbOKy1f._5002v2VG6j7:ref



Sang Motor
Vicom Inspection Centre (Changi), 20 Changi North Crescent, (8)499613

Your Ref : SHD454H
Our Ref: FBD8364C

Date : 02.10.2019

AXA INSURANCE
Shenton Way, #24-01
AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLE FBD8364C AND SHD454H ON
22.09.2019 ALONG CHANGI BUSINESS PARK CENTRAL 2 ABOUT 13:45.

We act for the owner of vehicle no. FBD8364C.
We are instructed to claim damages against you in connection with the above accident.

Pursuant to NIMA protocol, we hereby give you notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of
our client’s motor vehicle at the under-stated workshop: -

Sang Motor

Vicom Inspection Centre (Changi),

20 Changi North Crescent

Singapore 499613

Tel : 9689 2218 (Ah Sang) Fax : 6548 2352

. TAKE NOTICE that you are required to respond to us within 2 working days (excluding
Saturday, Sunday and Public Holiday) of receipts of this notice as to whether you wish to
carry out or waive a pre-repair inspection. If we do not hear from you in this regard by the
stipulated time, we shall construe your silence as waiver of the requirement for a pre-repair
inspection and our client’s repairers shall proceed to repair our client’s vehicle.

Yours faithfully,

Sang Motor



| i 74 74

o el o wh Consultants
A B L. Pte Lid
S1 UBLAVE 1. #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (065) 621
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 29/11/2019
Survey details

Date of loss 22-Sep-19
Date of appointment 3-Oct-19
Date of survey 3-Oct-19
Location of survey SANG MOTOR

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third Party
Vehicle number FBD 8364C
Make and Model HONDA WAVE 125X A
Date of registration 17-Aug-09
Excess

Market Value $3,500

Parf Rebate $1,551

Nett Loss $1,949

Repair details

[Initial Estimate

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts

Check item

Labour

Total

Lump Sum(if applicable)

[Number of days of repair

Remarks:

The estimated repair cost of the
damaged vehicle is in the region of
$2,000.00 - $3,000.00




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount;

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
305G

FBD8364C

No

01 Nov 2019
HONDA

WAVE 125X A

Red

2009
NF1255TEQ027380
NF1255T0027380
$1,789.00

17 Aug 2009

17 Aug 2009

4

$269.00

No

$0.00

31 Jul 2024

D - Motorcycle
5

$1,634.00
$1,551.00
$1,551.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Nov 2019

OK



2019/11/28 Used Honda Wave 125 bike for Sale in Singapore - Price, Reviews & Contact Seller - SGBikemart

REPORT ERROR 2 (/LISTING/LISTING/ERROR/USEDBIKE/15076/)  + ADD TO SHORTLIST Like 0 Share
© SHARE (WHATSAPP://SEND?TEXT=HTTPS://WWW.SGBIKEMART.COM.SG/LISTING/USEDBIKE/HONDA-HONDA-WAVE-125/15076/)

Honda Wave 125

Listing Type Paid Ad

Brand Honda (/listing/usedbike/brand/honda/)

Model Honda Wave 125 (/listing/usedbike/model/honda-wave-
125/)

Engine Capacity 125cc

Class 2B (/listing/usedbike/model/motorcycle-for-

Classification
sale/class/class-2b/)

Registration Date 17/08/2009
COE Expiry Date 16/08/2024 (4 years 8 months left)
Mileage -

No. of owners -

Type of Vehicle Cubs (/listing/usedbike/model/motorcycle-for-sale/cubs/)

Price: 56P$3500

DETAILS

Honda Wave 125. COE Till Aug 2024. Good Condition. Loan Available, Welcome Trade In. Come Visit Us
At Sin Boon Motor. Interested Buyers Are Welcome To Negotiate.

SIMILAR BIKES VIEW ALL (/LISTING/USEDBIKES/LISTING/)

Honda Wave 125

https:/iwww.sgbikemart.com.sg/listing/usedbike/honda-honda-wave-125/15076/ 215



519457
Tel Noo 1800-5852699
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Page No.:1 of 1

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REPORT

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref: CS3/ASM19017448/Gcef3e2
8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 AXA TOWERSINGAPORE Date: ~ 29-11-2019 I“”I"""mmmu ||||
068811
ATTN : LIU YI WEN Code: ASM
a3 Policy Particulars :- (THIRD PARTY CLAIM)
Insured Veh.  SHD 454H Veh. Inspected FBD 8364C
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. SamMo230v Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LIU YI WEN Assign Date 03/10/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA WAVE 125X A c.c 125
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. NF125ST0027380 Colour RED / BLACK
Odometer 560129 KM Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |80-90/17 DIAMONDS 2mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre |B80-90/17 DIAMONDS 2 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S AND N/S BODY. P — Y -
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/09/2019 |Tnspect Date / Time 03/10/2019 (12:24 PM)
Survey held at SANG MOTOR
NO. 20 CHANGI NORTH CRESCENT(VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE)SINGAPORE 499613
5a. Remarks
A) THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A "WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B) THE REPAIR ESTIMATE WAS NOT PRESENTED AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION.
THE REPAIRER WAS TOLD TO PREPARE THE ESTIMATE.
C) ENCLOSED PLEASE FIND DAMAGED VEHICLE PHOTOGRAPHS.
D) THE ESTIMATED REPAIR COST OF THE DAMAGED VEHICLE IS IN THE REGION OF §2,000-53,000

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days

Report Ref No. CS3/ASM19017448/Gcf3e2

Inspected By
XING GUO QIANG K.K.LAU CPT(RET)

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Mo liability of responaibility whatsoever, in contact or tor pted to an
replying on this Report, In whole or In part, doas so al his or her own risk.

BEng(Hons),B.Bus,MBA,PEng,PE, MinstAEA,MASME,MIRTE

REGD Auto Consultant-SAE, Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is mada solely for the use and banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




