Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: 29 April 2020 11:25 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: SJIK6106M & PC2128Y DOA 1.10.19 - LKK REF CC6/CTI19017446/Aka3
Attachments: GIA.pdf; INVOICE LOA.pdf; Ita fee.pdf

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 28 April, 2020 8:18 PM

To: Admin A

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SJK6106M & PC2128Y DOA 1.10.19

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is invoice , GIA report , LOA ,invoice & Ita .

As request following :

1. RC $4708(54400+7% GST - AS AGREED )
2. Loss of use $480 ( S60 x 8 days -6 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 days weekend
3. Ita §7.45

@ 100 % TOTAL  $5195.45

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBOLIE PTE LTD
HP: 92712214



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

IWe, \"'\0_ (arhdlo of
, owner of SJK é 10 6 M hereby

authorize Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd, (“The Workshop”) to act for me/us with respect to my/our

claim for the repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use for my/our vehicle QS K , 0
px{hat v!as da;gljgeg ~ pursuant to >he accident gccurred on | / ’U/] ‘0! at
AVQ OU‘Q (\,QAQ upes ( 7KLV Y] Shinvolving vehicle number

,

I/We further authorize the Workshop to settle my/our above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem
fit and The Workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my/our claim with
payment cheque being made in favor of Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd.

PC 2128Y

The settlement The Workshop may reach on my/our behalf is on without prejudice and without
admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Pursuant to Personal Data Protection Act 2012, I/'We hereby agree that The Workshop may disclose or
share my personal data to any authorized service providers whom The Workshop would necessarily need
to cooperate, interact or work in one way or another in serving me or meeting my requests.

If I/we are not able to recover full amount for the repair cost from the third Party’s Insurance Company
in 6 (six) months’ time from invoice date, Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd shall bill to you/your
Company for the balance/full amount of the repair cost. The Workshop will close this case without prior
notice if we are unable to recover within 2 years.

ywe THE CARHUB understand the above explanation by Green Forest
Automobile Pte Ltd.

Datedthis 2  day of OCTOBER (month) 2019 (year)

d
‘-. /\
Claimant’s Signature < S
(Company’s stamp for company vehicle) Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy No : DMB1SN1745521802 Claim No : SNM19D204647
Claimant : THE CARHUB
Amount 4 $$2,400.00

Singapore Dollars TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED Only
I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to me/us in full g
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages

sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SJK 6106M

Insured Vehicle No. : PC 2128Y
Date of Loss : 01/10/2019
Place of Accident : OUTSIDE MOM (EU TONG SEN STREET)

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : M/S LONGLIM PTE LTD
Driver Name : YE LIJUAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Global Sum S$ 2,400.00
TOTAL . & % & 5 ¢ w5 % % % &« & S8 2,400.00
NEW  HioiK
Claimant Name : aTAN NRIC No : 368 121 &K
G

~ng AQS&

i m
Signature 2 Date 13 NOV 2020




2017

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

'8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875

INVOICE

THE CARHUB Date: 28" april 20
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 GST Reg.No: 201723238H

#05-25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Accident date:01* OCT 2019
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SJK6106M TOYOTA VIOS

Descriptions

AMOUNT

iLurgg_Sﬁqm‘ repair cost as recommended by

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTSPTELTD
Surveyor : Mr Adrian

$4,400.00

Totai $4,400.00

GST 7% $308.00
Grand Totaa $4,708.00

S/ DLRS : FOUR THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED EIGHT ONLY

Page 539




Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 01 Oct 2019 / 15:22:20
Receipt Date/Time : 01 Oct 2019/ 15:22:16
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-191001-002361
Previous Receipt No. :
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (S$) (S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - PC2128Y
As at 01 Oct 2019/09:20:00
Insurance Co: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - PC2128Y
Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20191001152122645231
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
Credit Card: Visa
XXXXXXXXXXXX4105 /MasterCard 7.45
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Tracking:

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Monday, 18 November 2019 3:42 PM

BC@LONGLIM.COM

Admin A

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC2128Y & SJK6106M ON 01/10/2019

Recipient Delivery
BC@LONGLIM.COM

Admin A

shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 18/11/2019 3:42 PM
Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 18/11/2019 3:42 PM
olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 18/11/2019 3:42 PM

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19017446/Aka3

LONGLIM PTE LTD
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC2128Y & SJK6106M ON 01/10/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver

may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them
in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 27/11/2019, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party
claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your

driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: 2 September 2020 1:21 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: MANDATE REQUEST - YOUR REF: SNM19D204647-PC2128Y-OCK-Direct Settlement

- Accident Involving PC2128Y (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SJK6106M (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI19017446/Aka3) on 01/10/2019

Hi Khanchna

Please proceed with your proposed offer.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

Thanks.

Pauline Tham
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6541 | F:(65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AEJfits; Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 3:10 PM

To: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: MANDATE REQUEST - YOUR REF: SNM19D204647-PC2128Y-OCK-Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
PC2128Y (Ol : CTI- TBA) AND SJK6106M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI119017446/Aka3) on 01/10/2019

Your ref : SNM19D204647-PC2128Y-OCK
Qurref : CC6/CTI19017446/Aka3



Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Conflicting versions, both allege the other party cut into their lane. Liability is 50% against Insured.

We have informed insured about third party claim and agreeable to let Insurance handle and settle.

Hence, we seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD" at $2,447.45
(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount IAmount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair $11,341.35 $ 4,400.00
2. Loss of Use (8 days x $60) $ 480.00 % 480.00 ( 8 days x $60)
TOTAL $ 4,880.00
50% $ 2,440.00
3. LTA Search $ 7.45 $ 7.45
Total | $11,828.80 S 2,447 .45

**6 days recommendation for repair + 1 Sunday + 1 PRS = 8 days
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
Appreciate your approval please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: 16 October 2019 2:52 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto)
<khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D204647-PC2128Y-OCK-Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC2128Y (Ol : CTI - TBA)
AND SJK6106M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19017446/Aka3) on 01/10/2019

Dear Mei Kwan,
Please find attached our insured’s GIA report.

Thank you.



Ong Chin Kiat
Assistant Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6174 | F:(65) 6224 7174 /6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K-FJifili Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or patrtial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 11:47 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC2128Y (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SJK6106M (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI19017446/Aka3) on 01/10/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SJK 6106M at M/s Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd (Kaki Bukit) on a WP basis and
TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- Wheel alignment report

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Khanchna and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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