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10/2/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlook

RE: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR YP1565A (DM18H003527-JG) DOA: 17/12/2018

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Tue 16/4/2019 5:32 PM

To: 'Joe! Goh' <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
_Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Dear Joel,

The market value for YP 1565A is $53K — $54K(est) as at Dec 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 12 April 2019 11:42 AM

To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR YP1565A (DM18H003527-JG) DOA: 17/12/2018

Dear Joel,
Thank you for your email.
By copy to SUR dept.

For your immediate action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan(@]kkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 9:13 AM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; elgene@rta.com.sg; aasschee@singnet.com.sg; jimmy,lee@priorityservices.sg; mi@aisnl.com.sg; Survey@jpknights.com; admin
<admin@Ibs-auto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; edward cho <edwardchowl@yahoo.com>; Infiniti CN <infinitiappraisal.cn@gmail.com>; Information aapl
<info@aaplpro.com>

Subject: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR YP1565A (DM18H003527-JG) DOA: 17/12/2018

Dear all,
Please advise the prevailing market value of YP1565A as at 17/12/2018 asap.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

«

eqnsur ance
e q.-r.?:;._.,a,

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-

00 Tower Block MND

Complex Singapore

069110

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65

62239433 ext 772 |

fax 656223 4190

WWW.eginsurance.com.sg

Wy A Member of Citystate

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

hnps:I/outlook.ofﬁce365.comlmaillsearchlidlAAQkADUxOWNIYmYzLTFhM2QtNDISNyOSZWFlLTZIMzAOOTIyM2M5NwAQAI%ZBngp4TES3ISS... 11




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

. Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

* Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |ID Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Ofiginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PAREF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Company
3461H

YP1565A

Yes

12 Apr 2019
MITSUBISHI
CANTER FEB21ER4SDEB (CBU)
White

2015
4P10C01080
FEB21EA20248
$29,920.00

29 Mar 2016

29 Mar 2016
=
$1,496.00

No

$0.00

28 Mar 2026

C :Gbodls Véhide & Bus
P

$4,636.00

$3,226.00

$3,226.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Apr 2019

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/ [ta/vrl/action/enquir

OK

Page | of 1
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Sh'irlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

Frcm: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 12 April 2019 11:42 AM

To: Joel Goh; SUR

Cc: Admin A; Simon Ho (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR YP1565A (DM18H003527-JG) DOA:
17/12/2018

Attachments: DM18HO03527 - COE REBATE (12.04.19).pdf; YP1 565A.pdf

Dear Joel,

Thank you for your email.

By copy to SUR dept.

For your immediate action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 April, 2019 9:13 AM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; elgene@rta.com.sg; aasschee@singnet.com.sg; jimmy.lee@ priorityservices.sg;
mi@aispl.com.sg; Survey@jpknights.com; admin <admin@Ibs-auto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;
edward cho <edwardchowl@yahoo.com>; Infiniti CN <infinitiappraisal.cn@gmail.com>; Information aapl
<info@aaplpro.com>

Subject: PREVAILING MARKET VALUE FOR YP1565A (DM18H003527-JG) DOA: 17/12/2018

Dear all,

Please advise the prevailing market value of YP1565A as at 17/12/2018 asap.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

egnsurance

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 656223 4190

WWw.eginsurance.com.sg
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4/12/2019

Used Mitsubishi Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

Fuel Type: Diesel

1 Owner Mitsubishi Fuso Canter 3,0 For Sale, Many Units Available. Interested Party Can Come And View And Take The One You Like. Regular

Servicing And Maintenance Done, Client Don't Take Risk For Vehi,,,

Posted: 25-Mar-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuse Canter FEB21 $54,800 $7,970 fyr 25-Feb-2016 2,998 cc
Fuel Type: Diesel
Car (S) Pte Ltd

Posted: 10-Apr-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 - N.A 25-Feb-2016 2,998 cc
Fuel Type: Diesel Auction Closing Time: 25th Mar 2019 at 11:00 PM

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsubishi fuse, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuso,

- Truck

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fusa, 2016 mitsubishi fuse, Mitsubishi Fuse, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuso,

- Truck

GST Registered, 2 Keys Available, Road Tax Expiry On 24/02/2019, Mileage Of 110503 Km, Financing Up To 100% Possible Subject To Credit

Approval, Call Us To Enquire. Mitsubishi Canter FEB21ER4SDEB, Max..,

Posted: 20-mar-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Super Great $112,800 §Y6, 380 Tyr 01-Mar-2016 11,967 cc
FV51S

Fuel Type: Diesel

Best In Heavy Industrial Vehicle, Full Agent Maintain New Paint Work All In Perfect Working Condition No Repair Required, Come On Down To Our

Showroom To See The Vehicle Yourself!
Car (S) Pte Ltd

e
Posted: 03-Apr-2009 o' Mitsubishi

Buying a Parallel Imported Car?

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuse, mitsubishi fuse, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuse,

36,000 km Truck

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fusa, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuso,

Are you afraid of losing your hard-earn meney? Heard too many stories about Parallel Importers? Be a smarter car buyer now! Choose only

sgCarMart's Verified Ready Stocks for a total peace of mind!

Find out more!

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FECX1 £70,777 $10,260 /yr 04-Mar-2016 2,998 cc
Fuel Type: Diesel

41,000 km Truck

Best 20 Feet Truck Available In The Market. Able To Carry Up To 5 Ton Load. New Paint, New Tax, Tip Top Condition, With Our Easy Loan And

Insurance Team To Support, Call Us Now To Check Out And Test D...
Bell Auto Pte Ltd

Posted: 28-Mar-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Super Great - N.A 15-Mar-2016 11,967 cc
FS$529S

Fuel Type: Diesel

New Year Offer! Come And View This Like New Self Loader! Only 1 In The Market! Condition Is Superb. Crane Installation Can Be Discuss! View To

Believe. Call In To Arrange For Viewing. Appointment Only...
Bell Auto Pte Ltd

. 11-Mar-201
Posted: 11-Mar-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB50 $53,800 $7,750 Jyr 22-Mar-2016 2,998 cc
Fuel Type: Diesel

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuse, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuso,

- Truck

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuse, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuso,

57,000 km Truck

1 Owner, 14 Feet Lorry, Class 3 Can Drive, No VPC Needed. Tip Top Condition, Doorstep Viewing Can Be Arrange, 100% Loan Are Welcome!

QiFei Auto Pte Ltd

Posted: 12-Mar-2019 |, 25 v ibishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $55,800 $8,030 /yr 22-Mar-2016 2,998 cc
Fuel Type: Diesel
New Paint Work, Auto Transmission, In House Loan Available, Trade In Welcome,

Posted: 09-Mar-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB50 & N.A 22-Mar-2016 2,998 cc
Fuel Type: Diesel

Posted: 07-Mar-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Mitsubishi Fuso Fighter FM65 $98,800 $14,190 fyr 28-Mar-2016 7,545 cc
Fuel Type: Diesel

A Vehicle Not To Be Missed And Its Ready To Serve You Right On The Dot. In-House Loan Available. Trade In Are Welcome, Make An Appointment

With Us To View The Vechle While Its Still Available.
ABWIN (1994) Pte Ltd

Posted: 30-Mar-2019 Used Mitsubishi

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuse, fuso,

- Truck

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fuse, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuso,

- Truck

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fuso, 2016 mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fusa, fuso,

- Truck

Tags: 2016 Mitsubishi Fusa, 2016 mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi Fuso, mitsubishi fuso, Mitsubishi, Fuso, fuso,

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?ORD=RGD_ASC&MOD=Mitsubishi&MMO=Fuso&RPG=20&VEH=0&RGD=2016

Available

CLOSED

Available

Available

SOLD

Available

Available

Available
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