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10/2/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlook

RE: FBK2445E on 24/3/19 -OD Market Value- CLMOMVMO000000474

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Mon 15/4/2019 6:03 PM

To: 'Ng, Sharon' <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Sharon,

The market value for FBK 2445E is $7K (est) as at March 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 9:22 AM

To: 'Ng, Sharon' <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FBK2445E on 24/3/19 -OD Market Value- CLMOMVYMO000000474
Dear Sharon,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Shirley,

Kindly assist

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ng, Sharon [mailto:Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com] On Behalf Of Motor Claims
Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 8:58 AM

To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FBK2445E on 24/3/19 -OD Market Value- CLMOMVMO000000474

htlps:l.’outlook.ofﬁce365.com/maillsearchlidlAAQkADUxOWNIYmYzLTFhMZQtNDI5Ny052WFILTZIMzAOOTIyM2M5NwAQACr409USZE3LtJRNa... 1/2



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 09 Apr 2019

Company
0882K

FBK2445E
No

09 Apr 2019
YAMAHA

MW 125 3-WHEELER

White
2015
E3N9E027711

MLESE782000027711

$2,927.00
20 May 2015
20 May 2015
0

$440.00

No

$0.00

19 May 2025
D - Motorcycle
10

$6,512.00
$3,978.00
$3,978.00




Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com> on behalf of Motor Claims
<MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 April 2019 9:16 AM

To: ‘SUR'

Subject: FBK2445E on 24/3/19 -OD Market Value- CLMOMVYMO000000474

Attachments: PARF_COE Rebate Enquiry.pdf

Hi LKK

Please advise Market value .

Thank you,
Sharon Ng
Great American

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.
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Listing Type

Brand

Model

Engine Capacity
Classification

Registration Date
COE Expiry Date
Mileage

No. of owners

Type of Vehicle

DETAILS

Used Yamaha MW125 Tricity for Sale in Singapore - Price, Reviews & Contact Seller - SGBikemart

Paid Ad

Yamaha (/listing/usedbike/brand/yamaha/)

Yamaha MW125 Tricity
(/listing/usedbike/model/yamaha-mw125-tricity/)

125cc

Class 2B (/listing/usedbike/model/motorcycle-for-
sale/class/class-2b/)

05/08/2015

04/08/2025 (6 years 3 months left)
8800km

2

Three Wheeler (/listing/usedbike/model/motorcycle-for-
sale/three-wheeler/)

Price: 6P$7900

Yamaha Tricity in mint condition. Not even 9000 Kms. Second owner after buying it from a lady 1.5
years back with 7000 Kms. Selling because just bought a car as family grew and seldom use it. New
battery and annual inspection done. COE until Aug. 2025. All maintenance in official Yamaha shop.

Interested please can contact me.

Accessories
1 Helmet for free.

SIMILAR BIKES

VIEW ALL (/LISTING/USEDBIKES/LISTING/)

o)
; BIKEAAT

https:llww.sgbikeman.com.sg/listing/usedbike!yamaha-yamaha-mw125-tricity!12050/

2/5



