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OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
Co mog Mo BOUNBABIW

OPT/MNAIERHKZ

A e W ATt
/ SINGAPORE o »
Date: 01.10.2019 Third Party Insurer: EQ
Vehicle No: SMM9729A Third Party Veh No:  5GY2558E
Maodel: HONDA VEZEL 1.5RS CVT Date of Accident: 27.09.2019
Chassis: RU11201731 - 2016 Ader Appheny s
Reg Year: L1584401731 - 2019 z
: ',’ 5" = r
ESTIMATE 2~ Fote, rear QUH2 52
NO. DESCRIPTION ary umr 55 AMOUNT 5%
1 |FRONT HEAD LAMP RH 1 T 41,755,00 | —
2 |FRONT BUMPER 1 A, 5677.20 | w—
3 |FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RH 1 @7 S3IBI0| —
4 |FRONT BUMPER UPPER BRACKET RH 1 A s1a0| &
5 |FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 8 $550| “Is %4400 —
6 |FRONT BUMPER LAMP RH 1 A~s23a00| R
7 |FRONT BUMPER LAMP FINISHER RH 1 82,7 55460 w—
8 |FRONT FENDER EXTENTION COVER RH 1 Fs1a860| X
9 |FRONT FENDER INNER LINER CLIPS g8 5580 e 54640 | —
10 |FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER REPAIR
11 |[FRONT FENDER RH REPAIR
SUB TOTAL 53,072 10
LESS 20% -$614.46
PARTS TOTAL §2,457.84
UR CHARGES: Fa. o/
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE, REPLACE, REPAIR, READJUST FRONT ACCIDENT $400 00
AREAS & ETC
?ﬂg’
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS $700,00
AT FRONT ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC
TO TUFF KOTE & UNDERSEAL MATERIALS M 512000 X
TO CHECK WIRING & ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS ss000 Zer
TO DIAGNOSIS FAULTY CODE & RESETMEMORY “A 512000 X
] - = LABOUR TOTAL §1,3%0.00
oNG | TOTAL 53,847.84
-
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Adn ma®m  Pelid Company Registration No. 199607 198R

S1 UL AVE 1, MI2-25 PAYA LUBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE S08933 TEL @ (065) 62563561 FAX : (I65) 61564315

Y our ref: To Be Advised
Owur ref: CCo/EQI1901 T347/Kgb3 Date: 08.10.2019

The Motor Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SMM9T729A
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 07.10.2019
al the premises of M/s _Optima Werkz Pte Lid _and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 3.847 84
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 2,712.32
"Check” ltems Amoant : 5% 365.52
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value 1S3 -
Nett Value : 5% =
Description of Damage: remrn—
The vehicle sustained damages at the o m s
Front O/S Portion

ofmcis
Comments/Present Status:
Diamages Consistent

Estimated normal period for repairs: 23 days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



OPT/MALERKZ

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
Co. Fog. NO. 2OTRIZ4BEW

/ SINGAPORE  “*wov= BiSctmsen S ——
Date: 01.10.2019 Third Party Insurer: EQ
Vehicle No: SMM9729A Third Party Veh No: SGY2558E
Model: HONDA VEZEL 1.5RS CVT Date of Accident: 27.09.2019
Chassis: RU11201731 - 2016 Aoy "fﬂdm;{_/
Reg.Year: L15B4401731-2019 Z
ESTIMATE 7- .?ﬁf-g.{
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT 55 AMOUNT 5%
1 |FRONT HEAD LAMP RH 1 C47  51,755.00 | —
2 |FRONT BUMPER 1 A 5677.20| «—
3 |FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RH 1 Cr7 53820
4 |FRONT BUMPER UPPER BRACKET RH 1 s7430| 7
5 |FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 8 s550| “ts $44.00| —
6 |FRONT BUMPER LAMP RH 1 5234.00| 7
7 |FRONT BUMPER LAMP FINISHER RH 1 ¢ §5460 | w—
8 |FRONT FENDER EXTENTION COVER RH 1 $148.60 | 7
9 |FRONT FENDER INNER LINER CLIPS 8 S5.80| ~-t¢ 54540 |—
10 |FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER REPAIR
11 |FRONT FENDER RH REPAIR
SUB TOTAL $3,072.30
LESS 20% -$614.46
PARTS TOTAL $2,457.84
LABOUR CHARGES: ey
LABOUR CHARGES TD REMOVE, REPLACE, REPAIR, READJUST FRONT ACCIDENT $400.00
AREAS & ETC
?ﬁ’q
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS $700.00
AT FRONT ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC
TO TUFF KOTE & UNDERSEAL MATERIALS e 612000 X
TO CHECK WIRING & ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS $50.00 Zef
TO DIAGNOSIS FAULTY CODE & RESET MEMORY A 12000 X
LABOUR TOTAL $1,390.00
ONG TOTAL $3,847.84
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Cecilia Chnnﬂ !LI{K Autu!

From: sharon@ow.sg

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 2:22 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: angelatan@ow.sg; lily loi@ow.sg; adeline@ow.sg

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM9729A & SGY2558E ON 27/09/2019 // Our ref:
TP#320

Without Prejudice

Dear Cecilia,

We accept your offer at $3,118.18. Please send DV.
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Sharon Ten (Ms.)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D:+65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

ORPT/MALERHZ seus

Hoad affics O Kung Chong Bosd SIngagore VS04 Teb («00) G47Z 1373 Fan: («B5) 8472 2112
e e 1y BA Serangoon Morth Ave 6 SIngapors L4800 Mmm“nn:-ﬂmm

Branch 452 Tagore industrial &ve Sngapors TOTEED Tt [(+65) G462 B0 Fax: [«08) 8452 G220

www ow <g | www facebook.com/OptimaWerks

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained |n this message. If you are not the intended recipiant, yoo mest nat copy, distribute or use it for any purposs
nor disclose s contents to any other person.
Fliase notify the sender if you recenve this @mail in eveor, and dedete the email and its content immediately after which

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 11:10 AM

To: 'angela.tan' <angela.tan@ow.sg>

Ce: lily.loi@ow.sg; "Sharon Ten' <sharon@ow.sg>; adeline@ow.sg

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM97294 & SGY2558E ON 27/09/2019 // Qur ref: TP#920
Without Prejudice

Dear Angela,

We are pleased to offer total amount of $3,118.18 (all-in).

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liabllity on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in respact of the

1




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Janet Tan <janettan@eqinsurance.com.sg»

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2019 5:06 PM

To: Shu Pei (LEKAuUte)

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGY2558E (Ol : EQI - DM19HO02702/IT)
AND SMM9729A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI19017347/gb3) on 27.09.2019

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE- MARKED pdf; Preliminary_Advice pdf

Hi

Please proceed to direct settle,

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

egnsurance

I“"'i wran G‘.r"r T s;-l.-'du

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapare 069110
did £5 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.Bginsurance. com.s

W\ A Member of Cayware (ﬁ_}

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the ser

From: Shu Pai [LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 8, 2015 4:57 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Ce: Cecilla Chong [LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SGY2558E (Ol : EQI - DM19H002702/1T) AND SMMOT729A (TP : LKK
REF - CCR/EQI19017347/gb3) on 27.09,2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle SMM 9729A at M/s Optima Werkz Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.



Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Bpst Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-15 | S{408933)

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2019 3:41 PM

Ta: Shu Pei [LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CecillaChong@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5GY2558E (01 : EQI - DM19HO02702/1T) AND SMMS729A (TP : LKK

REF - CCH/EQI19017347/gb3) on 27.09.2019
Hi
As attached.

Regards,

lanet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eéinsuronce

L G'?SF"- R

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
www.eginsurance.com.sg

W\ Memter of Crystate ‘-ﬂ-—}

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the ser

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupei@|kkauto com]
Sent: Thursday, October 3, 2019 3:29 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CecillaChong@|kkauto.com:>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlernent - Accident Invelving 5GY2558E (01 : EQ - TBA) AND SMMS7294 TP : LKK REF -
CCA/EQI19017347/gb3) on 27.09.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Janet,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel @ ikkouto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Fark, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) < i@ |kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 2:44 PM

To: Janet Tan' <janet tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LXK Auto) <Cecilia .com

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGY2558E (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SMMS729A (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI19017347/gb3) on 27.09.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Janet,
We refer to the above matter.

We have received a new assignment from M/s Optima Werkz Pte Ltd and TP repairer proposed for a direct
settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Cecilia and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274,

Thank you.

Best Ragards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ikkauto.com | faw; 6741-4108
8lk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Rag Mo: 198807188R GST Reg. No. 19-9507198-R

Affillated to Faderation Internationale Des Experts En Automaoblls

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Ref - CCB/EQI18017347/Kgb3q2

170 ToNER B HHT

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 11-12-2018

MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110

Code: EQI

13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGY 2558E Veh. Inspected SMM 87284
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-006116 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM1SHOO2T02/JT Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date o71o/2019

2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL (A) c.c 1406
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2019
Chassis No. RUT1201731 Colour METALLIC PEARL WHITE
Odometer 1911 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD

3. Conditions of Tyres:

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R18 DUNLOP g mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R18 DUNLOP 9 mm

4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

5. ‘General Information .
Accident Date  27/08/2019 Inspection Date 07102019
Survey held at OPTIMA WERKZ PTELTD

8A SERANGOON NORTH AVE S
SINGAPORE 554500

S5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

Reg, No: 188607188R GST Reg No. 18-8607188-R Page No.:1af 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SMM 9729A
: = ey = Condition | EStimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
oty phlones wondition | \workshop (5)] m
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP RH cuT 1.755.00 1.755.00
1|[FRONT BUMPER BENT 677.20 677.20
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RH DISTORTED 3820 38.20
1|FRONT BUMPER UPPER BRACKET RH TO REPAIR SEE 74,30 .
LABOUR
8|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @86.50 NECESSARY 44,00 44.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LAMP RH SERVICEABLE 234 00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER LAMP FINISHER RH DISTORTED 54.60 54 60
1|FRONT FENDER EXTENSION COVER RH SERVICEABLE 148,60
8|FRONT FENDER INNER LINER CLIPS @$5.80 NECESSARY 46.40 46.40
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE " .
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER RH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE 3 =
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT £14 46 52308
245784 2,092 32
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO 400.00 300.00
RMEOVE,REPLACE ,REPAIR ,READJUST FRONT
ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT BUMPER UPPER BRACKET RH,FRONT BUMPER
LOWER COVER AND FRONT FENDER RH
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT T00.00 300.00
& FURNISHING MATERIALS AT FRONT ACCIDENT AREAS
& ETC.
TO TUFF KOTE & UNDERSEAL MATERIALS. NOT NECESSARY 120,00 =
TO CHECK WIRING & ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS 50,00 20.00
TO DIAGNOSIS FAULT CODE & RESET MEMORY NOT NECESSARY 120,00 =
1.380.00 620.00
GRAND TOTAL 3.847.84 2,712.32

Report Ref No. CCEB/EQI19017347/Kgb3g2




- N TR W
Adm mm B
Page No.:2 of 2
|  RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS R S [T TR TR

Report Ref No. CCB/EQI19017347/Kgb3q2

y/iva

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appralser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repari is made saisly lor the uss and benafil of the Cllent named on ihe fron page of fhis Report.




