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HIN LUNG WORKSHOP

Blk 1008 Buiit Merah Lane 3 #01-20, 3'pore 159722, Tel:. 68583000 Fax. 64760075

Habs:.te WWW . hmlung com. 89 G3T Rean. Hc- HZ*UUEEBE?—H
Your Ref: Page: 1
Our Ref . 0G72/09/19 Date: 30/04%/201%
M/s ; INDIA INTEENATIONAL INSURANCE EB.LTD

64 CECIL STREET
#04/#05 10B BUILDING
SINGAPORE 049711

Attn ¢ MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTHENT

Dear 3ir/Madam,

ACCIDENT REPAIR ﬂﬂ : 3LG5160J - 3161 0
INSUREL ¢ CHARG YUYANYAN

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 26/09/2019%

YOUR INSURED VEH NO: SHA4822T

AFPENDED BELOW ARE THE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR & PARTS TO BE REPLACED:-

g% s$ 8%
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1 FRONT BUMPER Ste~” 1@ 1,040.00 1,040.00
2 BOTH FRONT GRILLE F.u—m]w*" 18 128.00  128.00 (4
3 FHONT BUMPER LOWER LIPS Ser ~ 18  93.00 98.00
4 BUMPER CLIPS A ~ = 10 @ 3.50 35,00
5 FRONT NUMBER PLATE GARNISH 7. 18  70.00 70.00
& REINFORCEMENT 7. ﬂ-*~ 1@  378.00 378.00
7 sponge 7 10 45,00 45.00
SUB-TOTAL 1,794.00
*SPECIAL NETT
3 FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING 3¢A - 1@  35.00 35.00 -
LABOUR CHARGES
L EBEMOVE, REPATR AND REFLACE PARTS FOR ul apa./m) 250
] THE EFFECTED AREAS. a
1 v 10l
2 SPRAY PAINT ON THE EFFECTED AREAS ”f' 3pe7c0 25V
2 WITH 2K PAINT 3
2 cﬂﬂn{&
3 CHECK WIRING AND PROPER FUNCTIONING 80.00 )5
Nett Total Before GSY ‘-{3 3,109.00

Yourz faithfully, T i e—




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
* > Back to OneMatoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |0 Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Vehicle 1o be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manulacturing Year

Engine MNo.:

Chassis No.:

Maxirnum Pawer Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaunt:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Penod{Years);
QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount;
Tatal Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Sep 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public BeforeDeregInput 2FUNCTION _ID=F03...

Singapore MRIC
193

SLGS140)

Yes

30 Sep 2019

BMW

3161 1.4 AT VAB4DR ABSHID
Black

2013
A&A5JAEANT1IB 164
WHAIA1Z030) 720428
100.0 kW (134 bhpl
£33029.00

17 May 2013

17 May 2013

1

£2R.241.00

Yes
14 May 2023
51835600

16 May 2023

A - Car (1600cc & balow)
10

$42.497.00

$22 66300

£41.019.00

57
\( ol

&, 11

Page | of |

30/092019



foeilia

HIN LUNG WORKSHOP

Blk 100 Bukit Merah Lane 3 #01-10, 5'pore 1589722, Tel: 68583000 Fax: 64760075

Waebsite: mhinhngmnﬁg

— e e

four Ref:

Our Bef . OG72/09/19

M/e . INDIA INTERNATICHAL INSURANCE F.LTD
&4 CECIL STREET
#04/#05 108 BUILDING
SINGANFORE 049711

Attn . HOTTR CLALIM DEFARTHENT

Dear 3ir/Madam,
ACTIDENT REPAIR ON : 3LGS1600
INSURED : ZHANG YUYANYAN
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 26/09/201%

YOUR INSURED VEH NO: SHA4822T

GST Rsgn. HG lﬂ-ﬂlﬁ!ﬁﬂ*—l

- 3161 0

Page: 1
Date: 30/09/201%

\PPENDED BELOW ARE THE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR & PARTS TO BE HEPLACED:-

-

FRONT BUMPER St~
B7TH FRONT GRILLE n.u,mﬂu TR
FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIPS Sot ~

|

4 BUMPER CLIPS A 7

5 FRONT NUMBER PLATE GARNISH XJer
6 BRI | L

T SPONGE T g

SUB-TUTAL

*SPECIAL NETT

J FHONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING s¢l -

:

CHARGES
HEMOVE, REPAIR AND REFLACE PARTS FOR
THE EFFECTED AREAS.

SPRAY PAINT ON THE EFFEUTED AREAS
WITH ZK PAINT.

[ W N S

CHECK WIRING AND' PROPER. FUNCTIONING

Rett Total Before GST

Youre faathfully, Loy Aiae
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.:‘-,-——’ L “Hu“mﬂmﬁ'@_ﬂ
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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

*

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iil.comsg>

Tuesday, 1 October, 2019 10:26 AM

hlungws; 'sur@lkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
assignments@Ikkauto.com

RE: Re : SLG5160) / SHA4822T , DOA : 26/09/2019 , TP Survey & Liability
SLG5161)_26092019 pdf; MEMO JPG; ESTIMATE.JPG

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLG5160J and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Ms Sherini.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

InDIA
|nTERNATIONAL
InsurancE

f§ I NG APFDALE
Jwrveng the regine sy 16T

64 Cecll Street; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ex1— 248

P. Bma
1. 23%pr

v ':NJ(

From: hlungws [mailto:hlungws@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: 01 October, 2019 9:48 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il emotorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: assignments@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: Re : SLG5160) / SHA4822T , DOA : 26/09/2019 , TP Survey & Liability

Hi Gabriel,

We have received a call from your colleague Summer we need to wait for LKK

to inform for the survey.

Thanks & Regards,
Anna

Hin Lung Warkshop
Tel: 6858 3000 Fax: 6476 0075

Address: Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lans 3 #01-20 Singapore 155722

From: Motor Claim - Il [mallte:motarclaim @iii.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 9:22 AM

To: hlungws <hlungws@singnet.com.sg>




l:':::' assignments@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: Re : SLG5160) / SHA4822T , DOA . 26/09/2019, TP Survey & Liability

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
# \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
abowve list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o InpIa
® @ |nTERNATIONAL
InsuraNCE

s i MO AFrORI
ey The g siir §RET

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: hlungws [mailto:hlungws@singnet.com.sg)
Sent: 30 September, 2019 6:59 FM

To: Motor Claim - lll emotorelaim @lli.com . sg>
Cc: assignments@|kkauto.com
Subject: Re : SLG5160J / SHA4B22T, DOA : 26/09/2019 , TP Survey & Liability

Dear All,

We refer to the above subject and we are the authorized representative for owner of motor vehicle no. SLG5160] to
resolve the abave matter.,

The attachment is for your reference.
Kindly take note that the vehicle is not in workshop and we need to arrange with the owner.

Please let us hear from you and we wish to know on the liability.

Thanks & Regards,

Anna

Hin Lung Waorkshop

Tel: 6858 3000 Fax: 6476 0075

Address: Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3 #01-20 Singapore 159722

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including

the General Insurance Association of Singapore, This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
2



and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may comtain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,

which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately,

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



HIN LUNG WORKSHOP

Blk‘lﬂﬂa Bukit Merah Lane 3 #01-20, 8'pore 159722. Tel: 68583000 Pax: 647600735
e Website: www.hinlung.com.sg GST BRegn. No: M2-0065859-%

TAX INVOICE

IRVOICE KO. : TPS03
Acc/Rep Date: 26/09/201%

M/s8 INDIA INTERNATIOHRAL INSURANCE P.LTD Policy Ro. : DMPCSEN3120121902
64 CECIL BSTREET Model ¢ 3161 O
#04/#05 IOB BUILDIRG Veh Reg, No.: SL35160J
SINGAPORE 049711 Invoice Date: 26/12/2019 Page. 1
REELACEHMENT OF PARTS —
1 GLOBAL SUM SETTLEMENT (COR) 1,392.52
Hett Total Before GST 1,392.52
Add GST @ 7% 97.48
Nett Total After GST 1,490.00
1 REIMBRUSEMENT OF LOB3EB OF USE 3 DAYS 150,00
Hett Total After GST 1,640.00

{One Thousand Six Hundred Forty Only)

HIN LUNG WORKEBHOF
(Workshop Managser)



12/28/2018 Manman a-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall s associated with ;

*SLG5160J (MCT19000668)
[SHA4B822T]
TP

ZHANG YUYANYAN
Sep 26 2019 6:00PM

-]
Hin Lung Workshop

From India International Insurance Pie Lid (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 17/12/2019 13:58 PM.

To LKK._HQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandale Approved (S$1678.00) - SLG5160J - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillal

Approved:1678.00,

hiips:iisingapore, menmen.comiclaimsindax.cfm ?fusebox=SVCmalldfuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=64B574428CFTOKEN=B7R28{aT0ebconae-7C in



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiamant

| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
|  Cass  [Notifed [ Ext Submittad Ad| Assignad Adj Rpt Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
| Pending for Survey
o 05 Dec 2019 g;,g' WY S81,400.00 | 5§1,400,00 g
in i
s | | i At e | Edit Estimates | | view hat | Cancei Case |

Raference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [[ﬂ"ll‘llﬂ by mdjuster]
Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. Mo 1593038318

Haln ZMANG YUYANYAN, 1D: SB4B4193F

Chyirmant;
hicke “26/09/2019 18:00 - :59
Mo "9 sLes160 Date of LoSS: |1g ponehs and 9 Days From LTA fag Dats (Man Yr)]
Ciwim Type: | TP / MCT19090668 rOlcy/COVer | MeOMOO1S
Vehicle Reg
Mo SHA4822T Paficy No. | nypcenaia0121002
(Clabmiant):
{Tnsured):
Excess:

Aepairer Hin Lung Workshop (HQ) Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 1. #01-20, 159722 Bukit Merah - Tel: 6B583000

[aTEIRE | india International Insurance Pte Lt (HQ) - el 63476100 ... [Handled by Sherinl Pillai]

SASmancy China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. (HQ) - Tel. £389 6111

Insurer:
Adjuster- | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel- 6256-1581 _ [Handied by Chong Pul Lin] . [Final Rpt due 10/10/2015]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case Mail |

v ITI_SG (17/13/201%): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S31670.00) - SLGS160) - Claim Handler: Sherini Pil...
v (115G (03/10/2015): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SLG51607 - Clalm Handler: Sherini Pillai

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Sewech Tasks | Cremte New Tast | _compiete |

Due Date  Priprity Type  Task Group  Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On  Dane?
Mo results.

hitps:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=d... 13/1/2020



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*5LG5160) (MCT19090668)
k ™
ZHANG YUYANYAN
Sep 26 2019 6:00PM

[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Hin Lung Workshop

Page 1 of 2

Lummmu] Upload Pratos | mmmml View [imw in Browser |
Photos/Images [a ~]| B
ho | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
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7131141914118 | Genersl View 0| wdrs | B
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https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 13/1/2020



Menimen e-Claims

Page2 0f 2

Photos/ Images |3 per page «] &
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https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 13/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreqno 19ssor108m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: surf@lkkauto com:assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/1118017304/R1GA30Q2

Date: 13/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No: MCOMDD15
Claimant 3
Vehicle No : SLG5160J Insured Vehicle No : SHA4822T
Date of Loss 26/08/2019 MNature of Claim TP Claim No: MCT19090668
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLGS160J
Make & Model: BMW 3161, 1.6 AT D/AB 4DR ABS HID (A) Engine No: AB45J464N13B18A
Reg. Date: 17/05/2013 (Man. Year: 2013) Chassis No: WBA3A12030J720428
Colour Black Odometer 105835 km
Engine Capacity. 1598 cc
Market Valua/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S5); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabla) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accideni Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fronl Tyre Size: 225/45 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 225/45 R18
Front Left Side: Pirelli & mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli & mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 8 mm Rear Right Side: Pirefli & mm
The above vilues reprasent (e Aamawrng Iyra reads dopen
|COST OF CLAIMS Repalirer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 1.829.00 1.272.00 557.00 30.45
Miscellaneous [tems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.280.00 500.00 780.00 60.94
Paintwork Labour D.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 3,109.00 1,772.00 1,337.00 43.00
Approved Total {Overridden) (S§) 1,400.00
(8$) 3,100.00 1,400.00 1,70800 5497
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (55) 21783 98.00 119.63 54 87
Nett Amount (S5) 3,326.63 1,498.00 1,828.63 5497
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x $550.00/day) (S5) 150.00
Nett Liability (55) 1,648.00
Global Sum Settlemeant (S5) 1,640.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 01102019
Date Inspected: 02/10/2019 Inspected At Hin Lung Workshop (HQ)
Blk 1008 Bukilt Merah Lane 3, #01-20
Singapore 159722
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
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Adjuster; Chong Pui Lin Manager: MOHD RASUL

NOTE: This report mpresents our findings af ihe time and place of nspection siated hevein. Such inspection hag been carmied oul Io the best of our
knowlpdge and abiity bat any offvar dabilily under any other ciroomstances i hersby erpressly exciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 06 Dec 2018)

Parts: 143 BMW 3161 1.6 AT D/AB 4DR ABS HID (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapare 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's lFrir.a—dunminaiad_ Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLG5160J)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they conlain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker an the last estimate page

Further Info: ltemsivalues not in reference calalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Scratched 1.04000F  *1,040.00F
2 1 *BOTH FRONT GRILLE O/S Scratched 128.00F “64.00F
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIPS Scratched G8.00F "98.00F
4 10 *BUMPER CLIPS Mecessary A5.00F *35.00F
5 1 *FRONT NUMBER PLATE GARNISH Mot Necessary 70.00F *F
L *REINFORCEMENT Mot Necessary A7B.OOF *-F
7 1 *SPONGE Mot Necessary 45.00F *-F
8 1 *FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING Scraiched A5.00Fs *35.00FS

F=Franchise pan. 5=Spcett
Total Parts (S§) 1,829.00 1,2T2.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus ilema selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour llams
1 REMOVE ,REPAIR AND REPLACE PARTS FOR THE New 900.00 250.00
EFFECTED AREAS
2  SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTED AREAS WITH 2K PAINT  New 300.00 250.00
3 CHECK WIRING AND PROPER FUNCTIONING MNew B0.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,280.00 500.00

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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