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JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD

PRy UF

SINCE 1986

REPAIR ESTIMATE

ATTM: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Est. No. : E19090007
OWNER: Date 30/09/2019
TP INSURER: India International Insurance Singapore Vehicle Num. - SMK8589D
POLICY NO: 5108970168 .
REEERENCE: TP CLAIM Make/Model .cl-‘:'i__'il-HDA.EHUI TLE 1.5G

DOA: 300572019 Chassis/Eng# - GK82001222

¥r. of Manu 2018

No Description Qty u/P Amt
Section: LIST ITEMS

1 RH Front Door 4.,-‘_5@ 1.00  757.20 757.20 —

2 RH Rear Door Aofemrs 100 70340 70340

3 RH Side Skirting 27 L 1.00 363.10 363.10 &

Amt S5 1.823.70
Discount {20.00%) 5% 364.74
Subtotal 55 1.458.96

Section: LABOUR
4 To Panel Beat The Necessary Damaged Parts 1.00 600.00 600.00 300
5 To Dismantle and Reinstall Door Components 1.00 160.00 160.00 /2.2
6 To Sand Down, Putty and Spray Paint on Necessary Damaged Part 1.00 880.00 880.00 & ©D
Amt 55 1.640.00
Discount (0.00%) 55 0.00
/D lé Subtotal 53 1.640.00
ﬁ
A /< (180 ). (4606
I - wZ
f FYEL "!|__|_" T -_,.,.-l'"'"'-_
e ol 2 J/7 06g-ef
7 21&
%’y /9 (&0
Tho pH Hs: e
I|
|1 LIST ITEMS Subtotal 5% 1.458.96

§ o AR LABOUR Subtotal 5% 1,640.00
=a Total S$ 3,098.96

™

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte, Ltd,

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-406, SINGAPORE 408701 TEL: 68743 1813 FAX: 6743 5234 CO/GST REG NO: 201300083W
BLK 3014 UBI ROAD 1 #01-324, SINGAPORE 408702 EMAIL: admin@]hk.com.ag WEBSITE: www.[hk.com.ag

b5t
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back'to OneMotoring

Page | of' |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
085B

SMK8589D

No

02 Oct 2019
HONDA
SHUTTLE 1.5G CVT
Grey

2018
L15B6001514
GK82001222
97.0 kW (130 bhp)
$18,070.00

26 Apr 2019

26 Apr 2019

0

$8,070.00

Yes
25 Apr 2029
£6,052.00

25 Apr 2029

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$29,159.00

$27.887.00

$33,939.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 02 Oct 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDereglnput 7FUNCTION _ID=F030... 02-O¢t-19



Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 30 September, 2019 3:43 PM
To: shimin poh; ‘sur@|kkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Cc: Kelvin Teo; Sherinl Pillal
Subject: RE: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SMK8589D DOA :
30/09/2015
Attachments: SAS REPORT.PDF
Dear Sir / Mdm, P hi miv
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SMEESA50 and let us have your report urgently,
: T:3 SOP-M
This claim will be handled by Ms Shenni,
*Kindly upload this survey request email fo merimen, V. Our

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee
o) [HDM
@2/  Internariona
(l * INsurancE
f i NG AFDRLI
e Lreimng Che Frgies sy | ST
64 Cecil Str 105 - 108 Bullding
Singapaore 4
Tel: G347 67 it =248

gV

Fram: shimin poh [mailto:shimin@jhk.com.sg]

Sent: 30 September, 2019 1:57 PM

To: Motor Claim - I <motorclaim@ijii.com.sg>

Cc: Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>

Subject: Re; NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SMKB589D DOA : 30/09/2019

Dear Gabniel:

We choose | KK, please note car will be in on 2/10/2019 after 10am no waiting.

Thank You!

Bridget Pol (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pre Lid
Blk 3007 1/hi Road |
#01-406 Singapore 408701
Office: 67431913

On Mon, Sep 30, 2019 at 1:52 PM Motor Claim - [II <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

1




.
Dear Sir / Mdm,

We ackno o dge receipt of your emall,

We propros- using one of the following mator surveyors:

» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
= Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please not!! us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above lis
Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
[noia
[NTERNATIONAL
[NsurancE
il NG AFODREI]
Serving B ey mnce JNIT
64 Cecll & #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapo 1
Tel: 6347 Exl—248

From: shimin poh [mailto:shimin@jhk.com.sg]

Sent: 30 September, 2019 1:11 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll < laim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Kelvin Teo <kelvin@ihk.com.sg>

Subject: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SMK85890 DOA : 30/09/2019



qunr Sir™Mdm,

Kindl}' arrange pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do direct settlement.

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.

Attached is the accident report for your reference and we're currently in the midst of preparing the estimate.

Thank you und hope to hear from you soon.

Thank You!

Bridget Poh (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Lid

Blk 3007 L/bi Road 1

#01-4006 Singupore 408701

Office: 67431913

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing umd processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,

handling and’or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable luws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This emuil 15 intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contuin confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted. corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore. we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or uny delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modilication.

Print this cmail only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No., 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your persanal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore] and/or with other insurers In the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.



DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contun confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you arc not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistuke, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified thut uny use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

ol this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Intemnet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore. we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any madilication.

Print this croml only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India Internunional Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Cecilia Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: Sherini Pillai <sherini@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2019 427 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHC 3032C (OUR REF: CC4/111N19017283/gb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SHC 3032C (O1) & SMK 85890 (TP) ON 30/09/2019 ***

Hi Cecilia,
Please reject 1* & then proceed to settle up to 50%.

Best Regards,

Skerins Pitts

Motor Claims Department
. [N A

P InTERNATIONAL

Insunance
By T OA D RN
[ e e

B4 Cecil Street, #04/#05 |0B Building. Singapore 049711
= p347 6128 Fax: 6224 4174
Company Registration No. 198703792K

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 03, 2019 4:04 PM

To: Sherini Pillai <sherini@iii.com.sg>

Subject: YOUR REF: SHC 3032C (OUR REF: CC4/11119017283/gb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 3032C (O1) & SMK
8589D (TP) ON 30/09/2019 ***

Dear Sherini,

Kindly refer to attached for the TP AVF.

Please upload Into merimen,

We are in the view that Ol is not fully liable far this.

As you can see from the AVF is a single lane road, TP should wait for Ol to reverse and parked into lot in order to move
off.

However, TP fail to do so, but try to overtake OIV when OID has not complete his parking.

We are in the view of rejecting TP claim, otherwise to settle at 50/50. Kindly let us have your instruction. Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 674g-4274 | emml: CecilinChong @lkkauto.com! fax: 6741-4108

1



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has
reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that
any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any
manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or
accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not
acceplt liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may
arise as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.



Cecilia Chnna (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2015 5:05 PM

To: shimin pah

Subject: RE: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SMKB5890D DOA : 30/09/2019
Your Ref: SMK B589D without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/III19017283/gb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 3032C (Ill) & SMK 8589D ON 30/0%/201%
We refer to the obove matter.

Base on your client Video Footage, We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not
liable for the occident. It is a single lane road, and your client saw that Our Insured driver is attempting to park
his vehicle therefore your client slow down and slop his vehicle, however, your client did nol wait for Our
Insured driver o complete his parking but frying to proceed to overtake Our Insured driver vehicle.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client's
matter.

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilin Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChongd@ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933)

¥ ESES

et am = -rﬁwmm-wmmm-

From: shimin poh [mailto:shimin@jhk.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2019 2:23 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Re: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SMK8589D DOA : 30/09/2019
Dear Cecilia:

Please refer to the attached video footage. hope it helps.

1



Cecilia Chung (LKK Auto) e

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, B October 2019 10:28 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SMK8589D DOA : 30/09/2019
Dear Cecilia:

We have informed our client and we will withdraw our ¢laim on our side.

Thank You !

Bridget Poh (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1
#01-406 Singapore 408701
Office: 67431913

On Thu, Oct 3, 2019 at 5:05 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Your Ref: SMK B58%D Without Prejudice

Cur Ref: CC4/1I19017283/gb3

Deaor Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 3032C (Ill) & SMK 8589D ON 30/0%/201%

We refer to the above matter.

Base on your client Video Footage, We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not
liable for the accident. It is a single lane road, and your client saw that Our Insured driver is attempting to park
his vehicle therefore your client slow down and stop his vehicle, however, your client did not wait for Our
Insured driver to complete his parking but frying to proceed to overtake Our Insured driver vehicle.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liabllity and unable to lock into your client's
matter.



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

.+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
We

|CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING =
Case | Notied Eof Submirted | Ad) Assignas | Adj ot Ad) Gubmitted |Ins Auth'ed | Status
11 Oct 2019 30 Sep 2015 Pending for Survey
$51,750.00 | 5%1,750.00
Main 16:37 0o:00 Report
Ft ang | it adi e | ar tmates | | _view ot | cance cane |

[Created by adjuster]

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

| Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Rag Mo -
o . |WOMENG cHIP, ID: SO59808SB
| Vahice Reg. . | 30/09/2019 09:00 - 5%
o SN Date of Los3: |15 \onths and 4 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r))
Claim Type: (TP wﬂiﬂw
Yehicle Reg
ho. sHCI032C E"’m":;}_ $108970168
{Insured): . :
Excess:
Repaires . Joo Hak Kes Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) Bk 3007 Ui Read 1, #01-406, 406701 Ubi - Tel: 67431913 I
:::ﬂr“ India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ] - Tel! 3474100 .. [Handied by Sharinl Pillal]
ﬁ:;TI‘ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel
Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 _[Hondied by MARCUS CHUA) . [ Final Rpt due 10/10/2013]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED iew A8 |  Compose Cass Mail |
v 115G (09/10/2019); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SMKES89D - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillal
o 1I_SG (03/10/2019): Alert - Ad) Mandate Malntained - SMKESEOD - Claim Handler; Sherinl Plliai
ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS— View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Compiete |
Due Date  Priodty Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Crested On ~ Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/mdex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/10/2019



Mermen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SMKBS89D
[SHC3032C)
TP

HO HENG CHIP
Sep 30 2019 9:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

uposd Dacuments | Upioad Fhaton I Comgass Wew Letter ]

Page | of 2

| Wideo tperpage (v} WA
'nu Finalizad On Indla International Insurance Pte Lid (H) ﬁuﬂ'l;ﬂnl Print
1 |03/10/1913:50 | Video - OI0 Load MP4
7 |03/10/1916:37 | Video - TP _g Losd Mp4 | |
Photos/Images 1 per ;-J__E &
Mo | RelabelfReorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [(HQ) | Thumbnail Print
1 |DB/10/19 15:37 | General View B | wedies | H
2 [0W10/19 1537 | General View O | wedps | M |
3 |oB/A0/19 1537 | General View 0| waws | A
4 |OB/I0/19 1537 | General View 0| wedwc | &
5 |0B/10/19 1537 | General View O | tosaws | B
6 |08/10/1815:37 | General View 0 | teaas | B
7 |08/10/19 15:77 | General View 0 wwdws |
8 |o8/10/19 1537 | Genersl View O ouic | B
9 |08/10/15 1537 | Genersl View 0| cadirc | &
10 |08/10/19 15:37 | General View 0 | Lesdwc | F
11 |08/10/1915:37 | General View 0| s | &
12 |0B/10/1% 15:37 | General View 0| adirs | &
13 |OE/10/10 15:37 | General View 0| s | &
(14 | OB/I0/19 15:37 | General View 0| wauws | &
15 |08/10/19 15:37 | General View 0| wars | F
16 |0B/10/19 15:37 | General View 0| oawc | B
17 |08/10/19 15:37 | Genaral View @ | wedws | B4 |
18 |08/10/19 15:37 | General View 0| woows | A
19 |08/10/1% 15:37 General View 0| ledwe | F
20 |(08/10/19 15:37 | Genersl View 0| eaare | A
21 |[0B/10/19 15:37 | General View 0| exic | B
22 |08/10/19 15:37 | General View 0| ware B
23 |0B/10/1915:37 | General View O | v | B
l24 |08/10/1815:37 | Genaral View Q| adrps | &
{35 |06/10/19 15:37 | General View 0| e | A
126 |08/10/1915:37 | General View 0| cedec | |
{77 |oE/10/18 15:37 | General View 0| Ladwc | A
28 |DE/L/18 15:37 | General View D casw: | A
29 |om/10/19 15:37 | General View 0| cadws | HA
30 |0E/10/1%15:37 | Ganeral View 0 tedivc | &
31 |DBAD/1515:37 | General View 0 eawc | &
32 |08/10/18 15:37 | General View O | e | H
Documaentation 1perpage =] H
{%o |Relabel/Roorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |01/10/19 16:29 | EMALL FROM 111 DD 30092019 @) | Looa FoF
2 |01/10/18 16:29 | TP G1A REPORT Load FOF
3 |03/10/1917:28 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
4 | D06/10/19 15:34 EMAIL FROM TP - Lopd POF | |
5 |08/10/19 15:34 | REJECTION EMALL TO TP Load POF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 14/10/2019



Mernimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2
|‘l"||lrlﬂ 1 [w]| M
(Mo | Fnalized On [India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
{Mo | Fralized Dn India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbmnall| Print
1 |02/10/19 08:38 | Singapore Accident Statement @ | LoasrOF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

Thare are no document chacklists configured.

ris - LEK }
e
Show Remarks To: [ Handiing Insurer
WigkE Bamarcs are privaie esiess voi a8 STOET Darfes
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregne1sssor1sem;

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkaulo.com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/I118017283/UGB302

Date: 14/10/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Inlermational Insurance Ple Lid Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SMKB5890D Insured Vehicle No : SHC3032C
Date of Loss: 300ez2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: WA
Ri TIFICATION OF VEHI
Reg No SMKB589D
Make & Model: HONDA SHUTTLE, 1.5 (A) Engine No: L15SB6001514
Regq. Date: 26/04/2018 (Man, Year: 201B) Chassis No: (GKB82001222
Colour: Grey Odometer. 21008 km
Engine Capacity 1468 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (55} Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
Genaral Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceabla): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condilian:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/50 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/50 R16
Front Lefi Side: Goodyear B mm Rear Lef Side: Goodyear B mm
Front Right Side: Goodyear & mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear 8 mm
The above vilvas epresent the remaining fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1,458.96 1,168 .48 289048 19.91
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.640.00 1,020.00 620.00 37.80
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 3,008.96 2,168.48 910.48 29.38
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,750.00
(585) 3,098.96 1,750.00 1,348 96 43.53
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (58) 21693 12250 84 43 43.53
Nett Amount (55) 3,315.89 1,872.50 1,443.39 43.53
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment; 30082018
Date Inspecied; 02110/2018 Inspected At Joo Hak Kee Auto Ple Lid (HQ)
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1, #01-406
Singapore 408701
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster;: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE: Thiz mport represents our findings al the lima and place af ingpection stated harein. Such inspecton fas been caymed owt fio fhe best of our
kncwiedge and ability buf any other liabilly under any cifier circumstances U hereby expresaly axcluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 11 Oct 2019)

Parts: MNFA HOMDA SHUTTLE 1.5 (A) (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitied. no pnni-code for SMKB5880)

Validity: These estimates are valid only If they contain the print code (above) on all estmale pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

\Further Info: temsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amaunt
1 1 *‘RH FRONT DOOR Badly Dented 757.20FL *7T5T20FL
2 1 *RH REAR DOOR Badly Dented 703 40FL *T03.40FL
3 1 *RH SIDE SKIRTING Repair 363.10FL *“-FL

F=Franchise par. L=LmiitemDisc

Sub Total (S$) 1,823.70 1,460.60

- List Item Discount en L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S§) 364,74 268212

Total Parts (S5) 1.458.96 1,168.48

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. ]
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thare are no new miscellaneous itens selectod.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO PAMEL BEAT THE NECESSARY DAMAGED PARTS New 800.00 300.00
2 TO DISMANTLE AND REINSTALL DOOR COMPONENTS New 160.00 120.00
3 TO SAND DOWN PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ON Mew B80.00 600.00
NECESSARY DAMAGED PART
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1.640.00 1,020.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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