Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 11:37 AM

To: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg

Cc: 'Raymond’; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK1391H & SLX1391X on 09/09/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG19017264/Uhb3

Attachments: STATEMENT.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Hasrianah,
We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that libaility is unclear at the moment. Our Insured reported that he was hit behind by your
client. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a
copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.
We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us.
Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

B 2s 7T

P
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg [mailto:hasrianah@bhh.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 9:31 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: CS A Team; 'Raymond'

Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK1391H & SLX1391X on 09/09/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19017264/Uhb3

Dear Vic

Appreciate for you to advise your insured liability for direct settlement.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hasrianah

Insurance Department

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 222 | Fax:(65) 6281 2830
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg

Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN

Ca., Pte Lid

No. 6 Defu Lane 4, Singapore 539410

www.bhh.com.sg | facebook.com/b
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From: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg <hasrianah@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2019 10:22 AM
To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Skesrichs zmpurnistan 4

Cc: 'CS ATeam' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Raymond' <raymond@bhh.com.sg>; 'Vic

(LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK1391H & SLX1391X on 09/09/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19017264/Uhb3

Dear Mei Kwan

Appreciate for you to advise your insured liability for direct settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hasrianah

Insurance Department

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 222 | Fax:(65) 6281 2830
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg

Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg.




‘t?f 24 BAN HOCK HIN

e Co, Ple Lid
FIHE 7

No. 6 Defu Lane 4, Singapore 539410

www.bhh.com.sg | facebook.com/b

I ———————————
MOTORCYCLE ACCESSORIES | SERVICE CENTRE | MODIFICATIONS | SPRAY PAINTING AND BODY WORK | METAL WORKS | L

@ RESURGENCE  Yoawmese  MPRAM. Eoty Sksriche EmpunisTan

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 11:21 AM

To: Raymond <raymond@bhh.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBK1391H & SLX1391X on 09/09/2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19017264/Uhb3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our principal to release OI GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Raymond <raymond@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October, 2019 10:17 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hasrianah@bhh.com.sg

Subject: Accident Involving FBK1391H & SLX1391X on 09/09/2019

Dear Mei Kwan,

Mr. Marcus has surveyed our client bike at our workshop yesterday.
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Appreciate for you to advise your insured liability for direct settlement.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN

Ca., Pte Lid

No. & Defy Lane 4, Singapore 539410

www.bhh.com.sg | facebook.com/b
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