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_Veron Chen (LKKAuto) Y Lim

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 September 2019 2:19 PM

To: Pauline Tham; Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Request for Market Value for SFZ339R - DOA 21/8/2019

Dear Pauline,

The market value of SFZ 339R is $186K-$187K (Estimated) as at Aug 2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Tham <pauline_tham@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 September 2019 9:12 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Request for Market Value for SFZ339R - DOA 21/8/2019

Dear Veron/Denise,

We would like to request for the market value for SFZ339R.
DOA 21/8/2019

Hope to hear from you soon.

Thanks.

Pauline Tham

Senior Executive, Claims Services, Motor
D: +65 6594 2545 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pauline_tham®sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o . @ C’E

AMemberof BRI INSURANCE GROUP
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From: Pauline Tham

Sent: Friday, 30 August, 2019 9:23 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <#eronchen@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay @lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Request for Market Value for SFZ339R - DOA 21/8/2019

Dear Veron/Denise,
We would like to request for the market value for SFZ339R.

DOA 21/8/2019

Thanks. /

Pauline Tham

Senior Executive, Claims Services, Motor

D: +65 6594 2545 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pauline_tham@®@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o @ Q

A Member of BMETACNR INSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any
person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
> Backto OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
" Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

fﬁtéri&é&ﬁérégistration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Prima‘ld'uc-&:l‘ctlxr:

- -Manuracturing‘fear: S

Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:

i Open Market Value:
Origingl_ﬂg'glls_tration Date:
First Registration Date:

(' Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date:

; COE Category: e
COE Period([Years): .
o e
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The Information contained herein is correct as at 29 Aug 2019

_ pof: 1 f(ig
i (MsI&y

SFZ339R
No
29 Aug 2019
BENTLEY
" CONTINENTAL SUPERSPORTS 6.0 A
" “White —
2010
CKHO000574
SCBCGS3W9IACO66643
463.0 KW (620 bhp)
$265,779.00
. 06Aug2010
06 Aug 2010
1
$265,779.00

Yes
05Aug 2020 __
©. $132,889.00

(30 Apr2029 )
£ - Open Category -
PRari S
$35,411.00
$34,240.00
$167,129.00

OK

Page 1 of 1

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquircRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION ID=F0... 29-Aug-2019




9/2/2019 Used Bentley Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
scCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

a

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Bedok Mall, Level 1 Atrium, 28 Aug- 3 Sep 2019

1 Civic EK4 SIR (COE Till 02/2029 -
Post an Advertisement -
Sell it yourselft Advertise it at just =
$58 until it's SOLD! g 4
Wrtl;wtr 200 units of vehicles -
Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling :‘:lcE:,?:;.f::r.:' E;E:a!‘:r:‘r:k“. = |
Browse by Category |
7 vehicles :Bentley - = M
Model Price Depreciation e ! Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Search Selection Bentley Any Any 2010 Any Any Any All

Bentley Continental GT $168,000 N.A 27-Jan-2010 5,998 cc - Sports Available

Attractive Financing Available, Ideal For COE Renewal,

Tags: 2010 Bentley Continental, 2010 bentley continental, Bentley Continental, bentley continental, Bentley,
Continental, continental, Used Bentley

Posted: 26-Aug-2019

Bentley Continental Flying $188,000 N.A 25-Jun-2010 5,998 cc 91,022 km Luxury Available
Spur 6.0A Speed (New 10-yr
COE)

Original Registration Date: 05-Oct-2009 Imported Used Vehicle. Eligible for PARF rebate.

Rare Bentley Continental Flying Spur 6.0A Speed Model In Current Market, Bentley Embroidery Head Nest, Electrical Retractable Side

Mirrars, Paddle Shifters, Multi-Zone Auto Climate Control Aircon, Driver And Passenger Comfortable Electric Memory Leather Seats. Car... | APORT USED ]

Motor-Way Credit Pte Ltd

T ” ine i o ine e 2 ine
Posted: 22-Aug-2019 ags: 2010 Bentley Continental, 2010 bentley continental, Bentley Continental, bentley continental, Bentley,

Continental, continental, Used Bentley

Bentley Continental GT $230,000 N.A 28-Apr-2010 5,998 cc - Sports Available
Convertible 6.0A Speed (New
10-yr COE)

Original Registration Date: 06-Jul-2009 Imported Used Vehicle.

Beautifully Well Maintained Unit, Regularly Serviced And Grooming, Extremely Low Mileage! Almost New! Comes With 10 Yrs COE!
CONSIGNMENT UNIT, Strictly By Appointment Only. Calls Us Now To Book An Appointment!

DM Pre-Owned Pte Ltd

Tags: 2010 Bentley Continental, 2010 bentley continental, Bentley Continental, bentley continental, Bentley,

Posted: 21-Aug-2019  ~irental, continental, Used Bentley

Bentley Continental Flying $115,000 N.A 07-Oct-2010 5,988 cc 69,548 km Luxury Available
Spur 6.0A Speed
Original Registration Date: 23-Sep-2009 Imported Used Vehicle. Eligible for PARF rebate,

Cheapest Bentley Flying Spur Speed! Warranty Can Be Provided!

F1 Auto Cars Pte Ltd

Tags: 2010 Bentley Continental, 2010 bentley continental, Bentley Continental, bentley continental, Bentley,

Posted: 07-Aug-2019 Centinental, continental, Used Bentley

GETYOUR ~ Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

| COE Getting your COE renewed is easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it. Get the cheapest loan in town and an
RENEWAL approval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today.
LOAN

Bentley Continental Flying $178,800 $246,270 [yr 25-May-2010 5,998 cc = Luxury Available
Spur 6.0A (COE till 05/2020)

Car In Pristine Condition! Loans Available! Call Or Message Our Friendly Sales People To View This Unit!

Tags: 2010 Bentley Continental, 2010 bentley continental, Bentley Continental, bentley continental, Bentley,

Pasted: D1-AUG-2019 ¢ ofinental, continental, Used Bentiey

Bentley Continental Flying - N.A 10-Feb-2010 5,998 cc - Luxury SOLD

Spur 6.0A Speed (New 10-yr

COE) —
Original Registration Date: 14-Aug-2009 Imported Used Vehicle. it

Rare Speed Model. Speed Sports Rims. Bentley Embroidery Head Nest. 50 More HP Than The Standard Model. Excellent Condition. Low
Mileage. Easy In-House Financing Available. Contact Our Friendly Consultants For More Info. Price Inclusive Of GST,

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MOD=Bentley&RPG=20&VEH=0&RGD=2010 1/2



