cvaha 1017231 [FE

C“OD,‘"‘!!!\"'M ~ ’ Sﬂ!\o = e
20 fugusk. 209 o TN
i tAawer ! T i 3 = o
swene  DOA/E@EM 20 Agust- 203 ‘
p MEWGAR F Sl
I - Socpssd sy | e e
OSSR T SO TOh L Sepremper 2e\b
wmount: T (PARF)- *@oE) -3 s O SR
i ian for abata: _[C;m:umtlon r'.,:r‘-."._alu&ti:m: - a
[ P 2 =____ M Avarage AV o ;
< e —|
= kiths Galetlatian for Rapossassad vahlclo: :
e SRS : . S i
I = Mihs  JHigh delnand vehicle: Yas [MNo 1 - % ‘
ceMomhs s *|Paraliel Impart vohilcle:. ¥ésfNo | - 3 o
‘ora than 1Qyre cld: Yos/No | - & \
g o = ekl Aine-for-Rofioshggocd-vetilgje— - - om T B
s {a) ) . ‘ i o |
j JEngine Capacity! High / Low i S A
Hal i = Euppae [ Asla Gar L= 5 .
}’! eglster-Bolore rFA 204 Car Condlijon: Guod/Falr/Poap/Burmt | - & N
oy P X S Md, of trapsfar: S -5 S
LT ! Othardeduction - | - % o e ]
| Farced Sales Valus derived: =D et
E b : e ' A :
{Oate/Tirme | Aclion / Instruction Additional Infarmation: . i
i
e
i \
IR = 3 - = T T
CHR ANR- cslgnpifo2cA 3B ined 3o pon: el )aeig o TR, -
= o 4 & L oo
: = |
S S EFEREE S S LT S e
| ‘
e DU = e e e e




inga

_-x to OneMotoring

cnquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Company
5369K

SHB1721R

No

21Dec2018
TOYOTA

PRIUS TAXI (SMRT)
Maroon

2014

2ZR6099902
JTDKN36U405747206
100.0 kW (134 bhp)
$32,920.00

23Jul 2014
23Jul2014

0

$8,088.00

Yes
22 Jul 2022
$6,066.00

22 Jul 2022

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
8

$53,269.00

$23,877.00

$29,943.00

Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Dec 2018
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Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 11:36 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: Sompo Ref: CMTD1805035/THE; LKK Ref: CS/SMO18020935/NTD3E2
Importance: High

Dear Shiau Chan,
We refer to your reference above

Please advise on the net value left for repair for Vehicle SHB1721R urgently.

Best Regards

Thelma Choo

Claims Division

D: 6322 4681 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

¢ Downiodd onthe

Download now @ . ppStore or

L For Travel Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click_here for
our Privacy Policy.




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 August 2019 10:51 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Ng, Jeffreysaykiat; SUR

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: 26590830495G003 - check MV

Dear Jeffery,

The market value fore SKR 3670X is $50K- $53K(est) as at Sept 2016

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 1 August 2019 4:32 PM

To: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat <Jeffreysaykiat.Ng@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: 26590830495G003 - check MV

Dear Jeffery,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Sur,

Kindly assist

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat [mailto:Jeffreysaykiat.Ng@aig.com]
Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 4:23 PM
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>




SHB 1721R Finalization

Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Sves/A
RC/AR & SC/Taxis) <YeoPo
hsuan@smrt.com.sg>

Wed 20/2/2019 8:30 AM
Naz (LKKAuto)

Hi Naz,
As per your request.

Thanks & Regards
Poh Suan

From: Sam Kwok Kok Meng (TPHS/Ops/Fleet Ops/Ops)
Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 6:08 PM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/AR & SC/Taxis)
Subject: RE: SHB 1721R Finalization

Hi Poh Suan,

The purchase value was 5111,799.00 for SHB1721R.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Sam Kwok
DID : 68662752




