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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crmer 1D Type:

Owmer I

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Dersgistration Date:
YWehicle Make

Yehicle Mogel

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

Chassls Mo,

Masmrmum Power Cutput:
Dipert Marked Value:

Original Registration Date,
First Registration Date:

‘r:lmler Count;
ual ARF Paic:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibliity Explry Date
PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perod(Yearsh

QP Paid;

COF Rebate Amount:

Tatal Rebate Amaunt.

Singapore MRIC
TB&L

SMG4R1ER

Mo

26 Sep 201%
MERCEDES BENZ
E250 AVG (R18 LEDI
Black

2018
274%2031661720
WDD2130452A55171%
155.0kW (207 hhp)
$58,787.00

21 Dec 2018

21 Dec 2018

0

$7TRI17.00

Yos
20 Dec 2028
£58.342.00

20 Dec 2028

E - Open - all except motarcycle
10

£30,959.00

L£28579.00

$84,941.00

The information contafred herein is correct as at 26 Sop 2019

lal'l

OK

hnps:iiv e o gov sglmvilacnon/engquire Rebate By PublicBelone

zh-SEP' 19, 4:04 PM




Used Mercedes Benz €250 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMan
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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Janet Tan <janettan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 30 September, 2019 10:54 AM

To: assignments

Cc: admin-a@|kkauto.com

Subject: FW: DM19HO02652/IT: Request for 3rd party claims survey SMG4818R Claims
against GBH2482M

Attachments: SMGA4818R190925 pdf; SAS2675500.FDF

Dear all, P Pt

Please arrange to attend to the PRS.

T. Wipam
Liabllity is cleared.

v.n
e Vv

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eéinsuronce

At G Tl

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 656223 4190
WWW.BQiNsSurance.com.sg

J‘ A Mewntser of Cityiste >

Privileged/Confidential infarmatiaon may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t}

From: Susan Low [mailto:liusbro@ymail.com]

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 10:45 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Ae: DM19HO02652/1T: Request for 3rd party claims survey SMG4818R Claims against GBH2482M

We did like to chose as follow

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Kindly arrange

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop




"Mo. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Monday, 30 September 2019, 8:5%:31 am SGT, Janet Tan <janat.tan & eginsurance.com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Save As To Costs

Dear Sir,

We have received a request from another workshop for your client earlier.

Please confirm if your client has chaged workshop.

[Regm'ds.

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

-edinsuronce

o T S fr-"r_' Tl

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW.egITSurin ce.comm.sg
‘,‘ & Yermdae s ol Cofyalabe @____H_

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If vou are not the intended recipient, please notify th

From: Janet Tan
Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 8:58 AM

To: 'liusbro@ymail.com' <liusbro @ ymail.com>
Subject: DM19HO02652/JT: Request for 3rd party claims survey SMG4818R Claims against GBH2482M




Without Prejudice

Save As To Costs
Dear Sir/Madam,
We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have
any objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are
deemed to have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please

specify one or more of our proposad motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1)  AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808

Fax: 68499155

2)  Automobile Inspection
Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

3} LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte
Ltd

L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866
Fax: 6281 8748

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

4)  Priority Services
Tel: 62934822
Fax: 62963283

Contact Person: Sharon

5)  RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

Tel: 67486076
Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561

Fax: 67414108

7)  Kelvin Automotive Appraising
Services

Tel: 81825263

Fax: 67461148

8)  Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Services

Tel: 96623655

Fax: 67655662




- " | Contact Person: Kelvin Contact Person: Mr Chee
9) JP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070
11) Infiniti Appraisal Service 12) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd
Tel : 96684818/90099001 Tel: 65091788
Fax: 64587432 Fax: 65006221

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor
surveyors whom you consider as suitable to appaint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2
waorking days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection. kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
returmn your client's vehicle to him/her.

Thank you.

Regards,

Hanet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eqnsuronce

--E' Vol

Eg Insurance Cnmgnn! Limited|

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
id 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

W eginsurn

|.I| & Vrnbee of ityrtate @“____

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify th




From: Rose Koh
Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 8:49 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan @ eqinsurance.com.sg>
Ce: liusbro@ymail.com
Subject: FW: Request for 3rd party claims survey SMG4818R Claims against GBH2482M

Hi Janet

Fyna.

Regards,

[Rose Koh

Customer Service

eqnsuronce'

e Gt " Trvendls

Eg Insurance Com pany Limited
Maxwell Ropd #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

hel 65 6223 9433 | fax 65 6224 3903

"‘ A Member of Citystate 9 o :

the sender immediinely and delete all copies

From: Susan Low [mailto:liusbro @ ymail.com]
Sent: Saturday, Septamber 28, 2019 9:15 AM

To: Marketing
Subject: Request for 3rd party claims survey SMG4818R Claims against GBH2482M

Accident on 25/09/2018 Along Defu Lane 10 Carpark

Invalving SMG4818R and GBH2482M




We refer to the above accident and 3rd party claims.

We hereby write to request of 3rd parly claims pre-repair inspection for our client’s vehicle.,

Please let us have your single joint expert motor surveyors list (SJE) to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage 1o
our cllent's vehicle jointly with our client/our motor workshop at No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki
Bukit Singapore 417883 as soon as possible,

Kindly arrange.

Thank you.

Best Regard

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6741 1730

Fax: 6744 5746

Date of Survey:-

Name of Authorise Surveyor:-

Surveyor Email:

Remark :-
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» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:
Owerier 11
Vehicle Detalls
Vehick: No.
Yehicle o be Eaported
Intended Deregistration Date:
Yehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Yesr
Engine Na.:
Chassin No
Ml Poweer Qutpuit:
Open Marke| Valus
Original Registration Date:
First Registrahion Date:
ransfer Count:
ctual ARF Paig:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibillty:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date
COE Categony:
COE Period(Years)!
QP Pajd.
COF Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
TB&S

SMGAB18R

Mo

26 Sep 201F
MERCEDES BENZ
E250AVG (R1BLED)
Hlack

2018
27T4%2031661920
WDDZ13I0452A551719
1S5.08W (207 bhp)
£58.787.00

21 Dec 2018

21 0ec 2018

o

$77817.00

Yirg.
20 Dwec 2028
$58,34200

20 Dec 2028

E - Open - all except matorcycle
10

$30.957.00

$28.572.00

$84,941.00

The intormation contained herein is correct as at 26 Sep 2019

loll

OK

biteps: v el o gov sg/livrl/action/enguireRebateBy PublicBelor

26-Sep-19. 4:04 PM




Hsiao Tnnﬂ !LKI[Autn!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2020 7:55 AM

To: Susan Low

Ce: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref SMG4818R190925 *LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19017143/Upa3q2 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING GBH 2482M(EQ) AND SMG 4818R ON 25/09/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We confirm settlement at a global sum of $13,280.00{all-in).

Please let us have a copy of authorisation to act signed y your client, Woo Peng Hiong for our necessary action.

Note; For EQ, no DV is needed if settlement < 520K,

“please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basls, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s] in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter |s made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arlsing from this offer in any other related matters.

settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for

settiement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”

“Wishing you & Happy and Prosperous New Year

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@[kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 2:44 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMGA818R190925 *LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19017143/Upa3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH
2482M(EQ) AND SMG 4818R ON 25/09/2019]




We regret we are unable to accept yours offer.

We counter propose of your offer as follow settlement:-

Global sum of $13,280.00(all-in)

We would appreciates it if you could review this case more objectly and let us here from you urgently.

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Tuesday, 14 January 2020, 9:00:57 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

(save as to coslts)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We are of the view that our previous offer is fair and reasonable. Surveyor recommended 4 repair days.

For an amicable settlement, we are prepared to improve our offer at a global sum of $13,180.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.




“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be
disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is
made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
In any other related matlers.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of
Discharge Voucher (for settiement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintift/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be
retained by us after we have made payment on the settlement sum.”

“Wishing you & Happy and Progperous New Year”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0225 | 5{40B933)

From: Susan Low <liusbro @ymail.com>
Sent: Monday, 13 January 2020 4:18 PM

To: Hslao Tong (LKKAuwto) <chewht @ lkkauto.coms
Subject: Re: Your Rel: SMG4818R 190925 “LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19017143/Upa3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH

2482M(EQ) AND SMG 4818R ON 25/08/2019]

We regret we are unable to accept yours offer.

We counter propose of your offer as follow settliement:-

Global sum of $13,400.00{all-in)




We would appreciates it if you could review this case more objectly and let us here from you urgently.
Thank.

Bast Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Saturday, 28 December 2019, 10:21:27 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ Ikkauto com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer o our email dated 02/12/2018.

Please confirm.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an
admission of liablility on our part or on tha part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be
disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is
made salely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Seltlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of
Discharge Voucher (for settlement sum above 520,000/) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be
retained by us after we have made payment on the settlement sum.”




“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Hapyy New Year 20207

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew [Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(402933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2019 4:09 PM

To: 'Susan Low' <liusbro @ ymail.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SMG4818R 190925 "LKK Ref: CC4/EQI18017143/Upa3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH
2482M(EQ) AND SMG 4818R ON 25/09/2019]

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below emall.

We are prepared to improve our offer at a global sum of $13,150.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please nole that our above setilement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settiement shouid also not be
disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is
made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters,

5




Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of
Discharge Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintitf/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be
retained by us after we have made payment on the settiement sum.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew [Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhit®@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Susan Low < il
Sent: Friday, 15 November 2019 4:20 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMG4818R190925 *LKK Ref: CC4/EQI19017143/Upa3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH

2482M(EQ) AND SMG 4818R ON 25/09/2019)

We regret we are unable to accept yours offer.

We counter propose f your offer as follow settlement:-

COR S$12,541-49  Legal Rental Fee S$1,155-60 (S§120/- + 7% GST X 08 Days) =S%13,697-08
We would appreciates it if you could review this case more objectly and lel us here from you urgently.
Your prompt action will be very much appreciated.

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
Mo. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit




Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Thursday, 14 November 2019, 12:01:05 pm SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ kkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SMG4818R190925 Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC4/EQI18017143/Upadq2

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 2482M(EQ) AND SMG 4818R ON 25/09/2018

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $13,000.00(all-In).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please nole that our above settiement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be
disclosed in any other related matter(s) Iin respect of the accident. Our offer made In respect of this present matter is
made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Settiement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of
Discharge Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintitf/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be
retalned by us after we have made payment on the settlement sum."




Best Regards,

Hslao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bl 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




LETTER OF DISCHARGE

We, M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop (workshop), hereby agreed and confirmed
that we are authorized by the owner uf motor vehicle SMG4818R to accept the global sum of

ousan ( ighty Only (5$13,280-00) (all-in) (inclusive of inter alia,
damages , interests , loss nf use , cost and disbursements) from M/s EQ Insurance Company

Limited , the Third Party’s insurers , on this marter.

This acceptance is in full and final settlement of any claim made against GBH2482M pursuant
to the road accident which occurred along Defu Lane 10 Carpark on 25/09/2019.

M/s Lis h to Engineerin kshop (workshop) are further authorized by
the said owner that this settlement is reached on strictly “Without Prejudice” basis on the
part of M/s EQ Insurance Company Limited and or their insured or other person or people
arising out of this said accident.

In consideration of the said payment by the said M/s EQ Insurance Company Limited, we , the
said authorized workshop , shall fully discharge them from any further claim whatsoever in
respect of the said accident.

We also declare that we are authorized by the said owner to receive the said settlement sum
and hereby undertake to indemnify M/s EQ Insurance Company Limited, against any claim
made or which may be made in respect of this marter.

- “ g

For and on behalf of the owner of
SMG4818R

( Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
authorized signature)




Company Registratian No. 1088071987

S1UREAVE 1, M12-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (068) 62563561 FAX : (45) 2564318

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 19/03/2020

P. DIRECT S

Vehicle No. GBH 24BEM_ ({Insd Veh) Eour Ref No - DM18HO02652/JT

SMG 4818R (TP Veh) |OurRef No.: CC4/EQI19017143/Upa3q2
Date of Accident 25/9/2018 ] -
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost ? 12,541.49 ]
Loss of Use . 3 days_ o o
Rental (If any) 8 77040 | 6 days ) -
Others: '8 ' - -
/ >

13,311.89

Final Settlement Sum |: § 13,280.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks % - R -
1) [UU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP :$ 13,280.00
'3 -
JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid



’ ” L’ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
i B = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
-”#. TEL 5256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607168R GST Reg, No. 19-8607188-R

_ i ~ Affilisted to | ‘oder '
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref
5 MAXWELL ROAD
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date :
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code : EQI

el T B R T e e T o
5 ;- THIR { :| PARTY C ._:_.- ]

=
b

GBH 2482M

Assign From

Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected

Policy No. DMCPHQ19-000965 Coverage ($) 0.00

Claim No. DM19HO02652/JT Excess ($) 0.00
JANICE Assign Date 30/09/2019

2 ___\Venhicle Particular
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E250 (A) |e.c 1981
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WDD2130452A551718 Colour GREY
Odometer 18955 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
R/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 PIRELLI 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre [245/45R18 PIRELLI 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |275/40R18 PIRELLI 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |275/40 R18 PIRELLI 7 mm

| of Damages

RTION.

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED

LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SPNGAPQH1BB

Remarks

A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

Estimate Days of Repair




18 74 74

i mE B

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park. Singapore 408533

TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9807188-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMG 4818R

Page No.:1of2

aty Description of Parts
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BONNET DENTED/
BUCKLED
1|FRONT BONNET LOGOD NECESSARY 108.50 108.50
2|FRONT BONNET HINGES @5168.00 NOT NECESSARY 332.00
1|FRONT BONNET LOCK CENTRE LEVEL SERVICEABLE 125.00 =
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 1,465.00 1,485.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @3%65.00 NOT NECESSARY 130.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE TORN 162.90 162.90
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT B85.32 685,32
1|FRONT BUMPER PDC SENSOR SHORTED 23233 232.33
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 21B.ZDr -
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED BG5.00 BO5.00
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO CRACKED 112.00 112.00
1|FRONT GRILLE CHROME MOULDING CRACKED 2B8.20 288.20
1|FRONT BUMPER TOP INNER RUBBER TORN 115.00 115.00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL DENTED / BENT 904 .30 o04.30
2|FRONT HEAD LAMP ASSY @$3687 25 N/S HOLDER 7.,374.50 3,BB7.25
CRACKED
1|FRONT LICENCE PLATE GARNISH TORN 68.50 68.50
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP BRACKET BENT / TWISTED 255.00 255.00
1|FRONT VIEW CAMERA SHORTED 680.00 680.00
1|FRONT CENTRE RETAINER TWISTED 148,50 148.50
1|FRONT AIRCON CONDENDER NOT NECESSARY 1.213.15
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL CENTRE GARNISH TORN 266.20 26620
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -1,257 .84
18.285.03 11.321.49
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT LICENCE PLATE WITH HOLDER (SN} TORM / BENT 50.00 40.00
50.00 40,00

Repart Ref No. CC4/EQI19017143/Upa3q2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL- 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

TO CHECK ALL WIRING & ELECTRICAL COMPONENT §0.00 20,00
FOR PROFER FUNCTION.
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING ,RESEAL TUFF-COATING 50.00 30.00
TREATMENT ON ACCIDENT AREA.
TO REPROGRAMME & RESET SYSTEM. 150.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX AIR CON RE-FILL AIR CON GAS & |NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TEST FOR LEAKAGES.
LABOR FOR PANEL BEATING .CUT WELD .STRAIGHTEN 800.00| 500.00
& REPLACING PARTS ETCS.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING & INCLUDING TOUCH UFP 800.00 550.00
PAINT ONM ACCIDENT AFFECTED.

1,870.00 1,180.00
GRAND TOTAL 20,305.03 12,541.49

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TG THIRD PARTIES: This Report Is made sclaly for The use and bensflt of the Cliant namod on the front pege of this Repor.




