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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

» Back to OneMotoring

Page | of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
114F

FY5018P

No

30 Sep 2019
YAMAHA

YBR125

Red

2004
JYM154FMI04405648
LBPPCJLB440183728
$1,277.00

07 Oct 2004

07 Oct 2004

4

$192.00

No

$0.00

06 Oct 2019

D - Motorcycle
5

$2.160.00
$6.00

$6.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Sep 2019

https://vrl lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 2FUNCTION _ID=F030... 30-Sep-19



' 1074 /d
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - FYS01AP va SKXETT2X (Of) on D.0.A: 21/00/2019 : '

From  bes Yiend

To © mssigamesss s ksuen com, Admun A game-s @ik haun.com

e Fang, Ay, Coin, Lae-¥ing Abu iassim Moot Madesa. Axien Syazaicinn. Chas. Yoke 55 Lim. Sneag Yang, Mehoasingh. Asshwseriaeiiaur. Fannicar. Thearten, Sunmmansm, O
Gt RITI0IN 248:00 P

Anpatrmiis % roaon ey zeggs il

Hi,

P Sven

"lewsar refer o The enclased request from Koy & Partners

Climne - G27TH9ER84650007 '[ ] -'i%?.w'
Cuse Owner - Bernard Ler Ji Qlan
If you have awy queties'concerna, please lel us know. v M

Kimelly meviet to aasign Marces Chas ay Single ot Exprert as reguestod
Thanks & Aegards.

c Vv

Har Yin Rul iViviaiha)

AN

PO Adyuieter |

Sngapors FNOL | Came Opembans = Auls

T, BRO1I0DEEM | End: 1007308
TG GO |

From: jlarong@royzartners.com.sg [madto:jisrong Grovpartnars.com.sg |

Sent: Friday, September 77, 3019 12-30 PH

Ta: Her, Yinrul

Cer Fong, Andy-57; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azian, Syazawdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashwesmecthaur; Parthiban, Theerthan;
Subramaniam, Drsyashnd

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTIDN - ACCIDENT INVOLVING QUR INSURED VEHICLE SKXET72X AND FYSO18F ON 21/09/201%

Diear Sirs,
Crur Client seleets Mareus Clua froom LK a3 the Single Joint Expert for the pre-repair inspection

Regards,
Jis Rong

From: Hor, Yinrul

Sent: Fri, 27 Sep 2019 032244 <0000

To: jisrongroypartners.com.sg

Ce: Fomg, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying. Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairding, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Asshweenjectkaur,
Parthiiban, Theerthan, Submmaniam, Divyaskni

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKX8T72X AND FYSOIAP ON 21/0972019

Withaut Prepudics

Your Reference - MK T0M 9286200 Do jr
Our Refarence : BITROREE4ASCH00

Dienr Sir/Madam,

We refer to your Motice of Accident of even dit

We insenad 1o conduet & pre-repair survey of the dimage 1o yoar clienl'syour custamer’s vehicle joindly with yoer clicm/yos motor workshop. We proposs Lo use ane of the mator
surveyor named in the attsched list 1o conduct the joint pre-cepair survey 58 8 single joing expert:

Name of Surveyur Cutnpany Name
AlG In House Sarveyor AID Asia Pacific [nsuzunce Ple Lid
Lawrenee Ng Chun Kee Pricerity Services
JelTrey Ong Leng Kt Prionty Services
Timamy Lee Prionity Services
| EC Lool Autnmobile Inspection Services Pie Lid
Pang Kiah Keer (Frankic] Formican Adjusters Pie Lad
Ng Tuu Han Formicam Adjusters Fie Lid
Soom HanXm (Gary) Formieam Adjusiers Pre Lid
Chow B Xiomg Formicam Adysters e 11d
Chim Som Teck (Rerjamm) Formicam Adjusters Pie 1id
[ Ealein Ang LKK Auto Consultanis Pie Lid
Xing Gus Qliang LEK Autt Consultants Ple Lid




Moo Chus LEK Auto Conayl 1d
Mohemad Tesfikh LEK Aute Consultames Pic Lid

Adrimn Ling LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Mohamased Rasul LI Auto Consultants Fe L
Kenncth Keng LKK Auto Consaltamts Ple Lud

Please let ug know within twe () working days whether you agree 1o the appaintment of sny of thess mlor surveyors s 8 single joint expert. You may select ong or more of the
lstod motor surveyore. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey camod out by the single joinl expert.

Thanks B Negards,

e i B | et |

AT

FROL Adyase |

Ergapom FRNOL | Claerns Operaheng - Aulo

Tl BOOTIDESSE | Eab 100T20H
Yo, ey G | v i 4

From: Chis Jia Aong [maiito:jlarong@iroyparinens com sg]

Sent: Friday, September 27, 2019 11:42 AM

To: Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Asshweenjestiaur
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Pre Repair inspection

This message I from an external sender: be cautions with links and attachments.

Without Preludics
Save 35 tp coal

[ TR T

Duif Ret: MKR/103/9246/2019/as jr
Your Ref: Yot insuned wehicle SEX BTTIK

Diear Sy,

CLATMANT] RATMAN BIN ARDLUIL RAHIM
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. FY SO18F AND KX §T72X ALONG TAMPINES AVE 5 AND TAMPINE AVE 3 ON 71.08.2019 AT ABOUT 0430 HOLURS
Wa refer 1o the above matter

We zct for Razman bin Abdul Rahim, the ownet of the motorbike No. FY S01EP.

We are instructed by our client to notify you of & road traMic sccident on 21.08.2015 st sbout 0430 hours along Tampines Ave 5 involving out client’s motorbike registrabion
number FY SOLEP and motsr wehicle regiitration number SKX ET72X drven by your insured at the matenial fime. A copy of the Sngapore Genersl Inturance report filed
enclosed.

Ag @ reilt of the sccigent, our chent's matarbiee FY SO1AP has been damaged, Before pur client procesd to repair the demaged motor ear, please let us know within tso (3]
umnulmol'wmlptn!w:mwmhn\-nuumuldIi‘u!:u:mlu:tnﬂmhwwﬂmrdmwhﬂ!Mﬁﬂwﬂimihﬂmmm

il | : i i 3. Your waid surveyor may contact e Les
nﬁ_ﬂ_ﬂﬂulnmthnldlnmm HMMMMMWHWMMHMWMIMMM wmmmﬂww-mwwmlm
mferance ta you.

With regarda,

Chin Jia Rong

M/s Ray & Fartners

133 New Bridge Road

LS9

China Towwn Peint

Singapare 053413

Tel - 6534 8465 Fax . B336 1963
Emuil : flarengsreypariners.cam. g

IMPORTANT FOTE © Tha iformaion i thes email i@ confidental and map also be priodeged.  If gou are nal the svendad recpsant, any s sr dl af L o ol gy
dinciowure o copying of this email i sroidheised and sicely prohbited. [ you haie recensed tus emadl in erver, plecse katlfly the sender smediately  You should also delewr o
dlwwtrog all copes af i Thank pou.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any stischments) s confidentlal, 1If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you
have roceived this email in error, please mmedintely notify me by "Reply” command and permanenily delete the onginul and any copies or printouts thereof.
Although this enall and any aitachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any compuier system into which it is recelved and
operied, 1 is the respensibility of the recipient (o cnsure that it is virus free and no responsibility is sccepled by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiares
or alTiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage ansing in sny way from its e,

WPORTANT NOTICE

Tha infarmation |7 Rt e |End Ery anachersets | s confdanmtial, f you are ot the slentud recgent, you must nit use o dinseminats te nformaion. I you have rceived i emal i erio/, gease
immacisiady notify me oy “Faply” command mnd perTEreniy delsts (e origmal snd any copes o prnlouts Barsol Ahough Bie amsl end any Machmants ae Seleeed 1o b free of any vine o
aiher defuct that might sflect ary computar systern iro which i |3 received and coenod, i is e feaponsibilty of the recipien 15 eneee al 8 s v fee and na respansbility i sccemed by Arencan
Intnrmanonal Seoup ine or iin sutisidanes o affiiniem nmum_hmmwwmnwwm 18 el



211472020 Meriman a-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with

*FYSDLBP (62789BBEB465G)
[SKXBTT2X]
™
RAZMAN BIN ABDUL RAHIM
Sep 21 2019 4:00AM
[CONNECTACAR PTE LTD]
Erofia Motor Trading Pre Lid - (kaki Bukit)

| meply | mepty Al | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Duleleﬂmltl Forward |

From A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 14/02/2020 14:29 PM,
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$474.00) - FY5018P - Claim Handler: Ler, Bernard-)Q

Approved:474,00:Cost of Repairs 194 [Total loss value) Loss Use 280 (14days x $20) Total 474

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
| Thare are no documents.

hitps://singapore.merimen comiclaimsfindex.cim?fusebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=14iinboxid=16318424i0omainld=11410bjid=8... 12



EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD  z01z02250m

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-62
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67527740 Fax: 67528669
H/P: 90696165 (Mr Teo)

INVOICE
Number Date Page
FYS018F 15-Jan-20 1
YOUR REF:
VEHICLE NO: FYs018P
MAKE/MODEL: YAMAHA YBR125
NAME: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
ADDRESS: 78 SHENTON WAY #07-16

AlG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX8772X AND FY5018P ON 21 SEPFTEMBER 2019

TOTAL LOSS AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION S5 194.00
LOSS OF USE (16DAYS X $20.00/DAY) PRI & LOSS DA’ 33 320.00
SUB-TOTAL: S5 51400

SINGAPORE DOLLARS: FIVE HUNDRED AND FOURTEEN ONLY

-

TOTAL : S5 514.00

EROFIA MOTOR TR.HDIHE PTELTD

A\

T T TP R e A ———



Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fantinne

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case  |Motified [Est Subminted | Adj Assigned Adj Apt Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed | Status
23 Sep 2019 |27 sap 2009 $5194.00 $$194.00 | Panding for Survey
Man 00:00
| _touneg | | | e ay e | £on tamues | | Ve et | Cancel Case_|

Claim Details

Main Reference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - |[Created by adjuster]
Insured: CONNECTACAR PTE LTD, Co Heg No: J01411455M

Main .
Claimant: RATHMAMN BIM ABDUL RAHIM, [D: SEA02114F
o . [21/08/2019 04:00 - :55
e i Date of LoSE: | 1y g mMonths and 14 Days From LTA Reg Oate (Man Yr))
Claim Type: | TP/ 627898884656 :ﬁl"ﬁm (Compre# 3
Vehicle Reg.
i R Y N0, |5040756657-08
{Insiired) .
Extess:

Rapsiear: Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd - (keki Buklt) (HQ) 1 Kakl Bukit Avenue &, #02-62 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, 417883 Kaki Bulit - Tel
i E7527740 / SDESE1ES

Handllng AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: £5-6419-3000 .. [Handied by Ler, Bernard-2Q]

Insurer: BernardliChan, Ler@akg.com

Claimant'y NTUC Income Insurance Co-operstive Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Insures H

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (MQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 _ [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] . [Final Rpt due 0B/10/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED mu] Compose Casz Mai |

« AIG_SG_EXPRESS (14/02/2020): Alert - Ad)] Mandate Approved (5$474.00) - FYSO18P - Claim Handler: Ler, Bernard-...
& MG SG_EXPRESS [13/02/2020): Alert - Ad)] Mandate Maintained - FYS018P - Claim Handler: Ler, Bernard-1Q

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View All | Sesrch Tasks | Create Mew Task | comgiete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On ~ Done?
No results.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 13/3/2020



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FYS5018P (62789888465G)
[SKX8772X]
™

RAZMAN BIN ABDUL RAHIM
Sep 21 1019 4:00AM
[CONNECT4CAR PTE LTD]
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd - (kaki Bukit)

Page | of 2

Lrprmad Documents | Liploasd Photoe | mmmw] umvml mﬂml Mm
Letters/ Corraspondences [loepage [v] &
Ne |Finaiized On LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd [HQ) Thumbnall | Print
i {Dvafy) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown Edr
Assassmant Reports i per ~]| &
Mo |Finalized On LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) Thumbanall | Print

1 |22/01/20 1418 | Adjuster Immediate Advice @ [ e rime
Photes/Images Sperpege V]| &
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbaail | Fring
1 |30/09/19 16:26 Chassis Wumber 0| wcws | A
7 |30/09/19 16:27 | Ddometer Reading 0| weews | A
31 |30/09/19 16:27 | General View i Load PG | A
4 |30/08/19 16:27 General View D | losdws | B |
5 |30/09/19 16:27 | General View 0 | tosaec | B
6 | 30/09/19 16:27 General View 0| tmawe |
7 |30/09/19 16:27 | General View O wewe | @
8 |30/09/19 16:27 General View 0| leadc | &
o |30/09/19 16:27 | General View D lwaws | &
10| 30/09/19 16:27 | General View 0| wwawc | @

11 |30/0919 18127 | General View O ers | B
12 | 30/09/19 16:27 | General View 0| wwowe |
13 |30/09/19 16:27 | Genaral View O i | 2
14 |30/00/19 16:27 | Ganaral View 0| Lwaws | A
15 | 30/09/18 16:27 General View 0| twdwc | A
16 |30/0919 16:27 | General View @ | oeaiwrs | B |
17 |30/09/19 16:27 | General View 0| s | A
18 |30/09/19 16:27 | General View @ | wive | 2
19 | 30/09/19 16:27 General View 0! teawc | A
20 |30/09/19 16:27 | Ganeral View 0 | edwc | &
21 |30/09/19 16:27 | Ganersl View © | eivs | B
23 |30/09/19 16:27 | Genaral View 0| wsaws |
23 |30/09/19 16127 | General View 0| eadwc | A
24 |30/09/19 16:27 | General View © | ooavc | A
25 |30/06/19 16:27 | Ganeral View 0| t=mawc | A
26 |30/09/19 16:27 | General View 0| wawrs | A
27 | 30/09/19 16:27 Genaral View i Loea IFG | B
28 | 30yo9/19 16:27 General View 0| adwc | A
29 |m0/09/19 16:27 General View 0| leaawc | A
30 |30/09/19 16:27 | Genaral View _i Load PG E_
3| 30/0919 16:27 | General View i_ toed 7G| b4

'3z |30/0/19 18:27 General View i Loea %G |
13 | 30/09/19 16:27 | General View 0| eawc |
34 |30/09/18 16:27 | Ganaral View i Load G | A
35 | 30/09/19 16:27 | General View i Lond pG | A
36 | I0/09/19 16:27 | General View _é d PG | B

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 13/3/2020




Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

Latters / Correspondances 1 per page >l &
No_|Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
37 |10J09/18 1627 | Genersl View I EE
38 | I0w1916:27 | General View 0| dwc | A
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SKX8772X (Insd veh) Model: YAMAHA YBR125 124CC
FY5018BP (TP veh) (M)
| Date of Accident: | 21/09/2019
Global Sum Settiement| | [ ] ves | [X] No
Repair Estimate : 0.00
Tolal Loss - $ 184.00
Loss of Use - $ 280.00|  14.00 days at $20.00 per day
Rental (if any) $ 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 'S 0.00
Others. $ 0.00
E
Final Settlement Sum $ 47400

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [=x] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/No BOLA Scenario No
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: PP

BOLA Liabllity: (%) Assessed Liability (") (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks TOTAL LOSS

Paymant Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd E 474.00
2) -]
13 Mar
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN el
LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report! Bill {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (ccreg no:1sssoriser;
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sur@@lkkauio.com;assignmenis@/kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/AIG19017079/UDA3O2

Date: 13/0372020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Palicy No:
Claimant -
Vehicle No : Fy5018P Insured Vehicle No : SKXBT72X
Date of Loss 21/08/2019 Mature of Claim TP Claim No: 8278988846506
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FY5018P
Make & Model: YAMAHA YBR125, 124¢cc (M) Engine No: JYM154FMID4405848
Reg. Date: 0710/2004 (Man. Year: 2004) Chassis No: LBPPC.JLB440183728
Colour Red Odometer: 30679 km
Engine Capacity: 124 cc
Markel! Value/New Car N/A
Price
Sum Insured (55): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls), Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 80-80-18 Rear Tyre Size: 36018
Front Left Side: FKR 5 mm Rear Laft Side FKR 5 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values represent the remamning fyre reeds deplfh
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %|
Paris 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 0.00 0.00 0.00
Approved Total (Overridden) (5%) 194.00
Nett Amount (S§) 0.00 194.00 -194.00
+ Loss of Use (14.0 x S$520.00/day) (5%} 280.00
Nett Liability (S$) 474,00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 27/09/2019
Dale Inspeciled 30/092019 Inspecied Al Erofia Motor Trading Pte Lid - (kaki
Bukit) (HQ)
1 Kak| Bukit Avenue 6, #02-62
AutoBay (@ Kak| Bukit
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair. 0.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: CHAN JIA LE
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NOTE Thig repor represents our findings al ihae ime and place of ingpection stabed hersin, Such inspection has been carned oul to the best of aur
knowiedpe and ablity but any other kability under any ather crcumstances is heveby expressly exciided
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SPECIAL REMARKS
PLEASE BE INFORMED OWNER THAT THE VEHICLE NOT ECONOMICAL FOR REPAIR

MARKET VALUE ; $200.00
LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE (RV) : $6.00
NETT VALUE : $194.00

IN VIEW OF THE ABOVE. THE VEHICLE 18 UNECONOMICAL TO BE REFAIRED.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts
There are no now parts sslected.
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscallansous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

Thers are na labour lema selected.
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out ]

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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