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Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Cheok.Leewai@aig.com

Cc: admin-d@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; 'Accounts (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: #9653046854SG003#023#   LKK~AIG Outstanding Survey Fees as at 5/2/2020 

Attachments: LKKAdjustment.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice-SLN 582X.pdf

 

 

 

 

Your Ref : 9653046854SG 

Our Ref   : CS3/AIG17014503/Hqd3e2-1 

 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Enclosed herewith the evaluation report and our note of charge for your necessary action. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 
Best Regards, 
ELAINE | Reports 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Fax: 6741-4108   email: report@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

 

 

 

From: Cheok, Lee Wai [mailto:Cheok.Leewai@aig.com]  

Sent: Friday, 7 February 2020 11:16 AM 

To: Chew Lian (LKK Account); Nivitha (LKK Auto) 

Cc: PRDSG.DFILE; 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' 

Subject: #9653046854SG003#023# LKK~AIG Outstanding Survey Fees as at 5/2/2020  

 

Dear Chew Lian, 

 

We refer to your email of 6 February 2020. 

 

We have appointed LKK to conduct the paper survey but we have not received the paper survey report and invoice. 

 

Kindly let us have the same in order for us to process payment. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 
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Kathlyn Cheok 

AIG 

Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

 

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120 

Tel +64191880  

cheok.leewai@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click 
here to find out more 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the 
information.  If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any 
copies or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer 
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG 
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use 
 

 

From: Chew Lian (LKK Account) [mailto:account@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2020 5:44 PM 

To: Cheok, Lee Wai <Cheok.Leewai@aig.com> 

Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] LKK~AIG Outstanding Survey Fees as at 5/2/2020 (Cheok, Lee Wai) 

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Kathlyn 

 

Please assist on payment for the following:- 

 

S/no Inv Date DOA Vehicle No Insured Invoice No Reference Policy No. Claim No. 

1 11/12/19 25/07/17 SLN 582X SKT 4409T AC1912481 
CS3/AIG17014503/Hqd3e2-

1 
0999995184 9653046854SG 

 

Thank you. 

 

Wishing you a Happy and Prosperous Lunar New Year 

 
Best Regards, 

Chew Lian | Account Dept  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6742 9588 | email: account@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, be 

advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply 

email and destroy the message and its attachments.  
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This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


