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Ms @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cokeq tio 1950001060 GST R be M2 00016764
& Rafties Quay 421-00 Singapore D48580
Tek (B5) 6222 2311 Fax [65) 6222 3547

[laims B Medor Undenwriting Depe 36 Robinsan Road #16-01 City House Singapore DBBSTT
Tel [65) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
www mefirstcapitalcom.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.
Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
20-09-2019 Our Ref No. D13006079MFSH
18-09-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC7481M Third Party Vehicle. SKQ7785C

BLK 2 KRANJI LOOP #01-02 (OFF KRANJI ROAD)
SALLY ANG

63660288/ 0 Fax No. 63685943

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TOH AH SWEE SPRAY
PAINTING CO.
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: claims claims <claims@tohahswee.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, October 18, 2019 2:04 AM

To: Steve Chen (LEK Auto)

Subject: Re: FINALIZATION FOR VEHICLE SKQ7785C
Dear Steve,

Yes confirmed, L/S $950 (B4 GST) for 3 repair days.

Thanks & Best Rgds,

Sally Ang

Toh Ah Swee Spray Painting Co.
Tel: 63660286

Fax: 63685943

P/S: Please be informed that our company will be relocate to 60 Jalan Lam Huat #07-33/34 Carros Centre
8737869 with effective from 22/04/2019.

On Wed, Oct 16, 2019 at 5:51 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sally,

Kindly refer our finalize 5950 (L/S, before GST). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor



10M10:2018 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta) - Outlook

Re: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006079MFSH/1

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Thu 10/10/2019 444 PM

To: 'Sithara’ <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKQ 7785C.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5408533}

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 27 September 2019 10:35 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006079M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims ImaiItcr'.::wsr‘nnmrcIaims@msﬁrstcapitaLcam.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 5:19 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006079MFSH/1

hitps:ifoutiook office 365 comimallfinbox/id AAQKADUXOWN [YmYzLTFhMZOtNDISMy05ZWFILTZIMZADOTlyMZMSNWAQAESISr7gluxPpBate2B2... 112



Land Transport Authority

Vehicle Details

SKQ7785C TOYOTA /WISH 1.8 CVT

P11 - Passenger Station Wasgon/Jeep/Land
SR L bl 2 o Mo Attachment
ROV

z N

Norma JTDGG20W601001917

27RB481309

105.0 kW (140 bhp)

1935 kg 1360 kg

i e | N i i e o i

014 26 Dec 2014

i e dliEE LD

B - Car above 1600cc or $7kW (130bhp

EADIrY LITE

570,8%0.00 25 Dec 2024

DA RF Elizibility :>.::

25 Dec 2019 25 Dec 2024
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159,00 (g/km $5,000.00



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Ohwner 1D Type:

Cwner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Na.;

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Oct 2019

Singapore NRIC
845]|

SKQ7785C

[R=}

10 0ct 2019
TOYOTA

WISH 1.8 CVT

Grey

2014

2ZRB481309
JTDGG20WE0J001717
105.0 kW (140 bhp)
32345400

24 Dec 2014

26 Dec 2014

0

£19.8346.00

Yes
25 Dec 2024
$14,877.00

25 Dec 2024

B - Car above 1600ce or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$70,870,00

$36,912.00

$51.789.00



BV K B & ~F o
TOH AH SWEE SPRAY PAINTING CO.

NO 60 JALAN LAM HUAT #07-33/34 CARROS CENTRE SINGAPORE 737869 0‘\

TEL: 63660115 (WORKSHOP), 63660286 (OFFICE) FAX: 63685943 Q)
EMAIL: claims@tohahswee.com.sg
RN wAe ik~ Sl L7 a
Croye (AR el i) Sl | | &/ LS 2P
26/09/2019 ft | o
.l?.l'l I i I. ot _I" <M |
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED o ' {1/} J
36 ROBINSON ROAD / ,"f j
#16-01 CITY HOUSE _
SINGAPORE 068877 L1 4L ™
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT S -
ESTIMATED REPAIR BILL
YOUR REF : SHCT481M
TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
CLAIMANT : TENG WEI LING EVELYN
VEHICLE NO. . SKQ7785C .~
MAKE' MODEL : TOYOTA WISH 1.8(A)
ACCIDENT DATE : 18/09/2019
MATERIAL COST o il
IPC BOOTLID X ML it $ 1,522.00
1PC BOOTLID CHROME * Al 5 468.00
IPC BOOTLID LAMPRH X S 478.00
IPC TAILLAMPRH X MU S 480.00
IPC  REARBUMPER [/ s 565.00 /
s 3.513.00-71%
LESS : DISCOUNT 25% _ S 878.25 411.7¢
S e LT Tk
Hr_,'_ (] 78 S 2.634.75
MATERIAL COST - SPECIAL NETT A= 790
IPC  REVERSE SENSOR .~ i P, $ 720 380.00
L-S70
i L
LABOUR CHARGE : 937
cC _
TOREMOVE AND REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN : {»T I:? o 5 180,00 X
'O REMOVE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK WIRING. - “?Sff'_ S 60.00 77
TO REMOVE DAMAGED PARTS. TO KNOCK OUT DENTS. TO
STRAIGHEN. ADJUST, CHECK. RESHAPE INCLUDING
CUTTING AND WELDING WHERE NECESSARY, TO REMOVE
AND REINSTALL NECESSARY FITTINGS TO FACILIATE s
REPAIRS . TO REPLACE AND ALIGN THE ABOVE PARTS. g 777 600.00
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON RHS BODY AND ABOVE NEW AND 1§
REPAIRED PARTS INCLUDING SUPPLY OF PAINT MATERIALS § s 600.00
% 4.454.75
ADD : GST 7% $ 311.83
TOTAL : g 4.766.58
SINGAPORE DOLLARS : FOUR THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED SIXTY SIX AND CENTS FIFTY
EIGHT ONLY.

NOTE: THE ESTIMATED PERIOD OF REPAIRS IS FIVE (5) DAYS

C ..'|..'|,r|.’l|:j_'

TOH AH SWEE SPRAY PAINTING CO. T A e, T
SALLY ANG (TEL : 63660286) *Pa naficn
: _' ot Prejudice” basis
|;L'I:~LIIJFEG1E"J .‘-.-1:?. .-. :_\ | x: L& resurveyed ang

irom |

NIwrance C nmpaﬂ.r
Acknowladged by Repairar

Sig.'lar:_-re:

Date:




f V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;;’;;_.'_; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9507198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19017054/Esd3n2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Pales Si1a MN"“”"““”""M
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7481M Veh. Inspected SkKQ 7T85C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim Ne. D19006079MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 26/09/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWISH c.C 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JTDGG20WE0J001917 Colour GREY
Odometer 83478 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RfH Front Tyre |195/65 R15 PIRELLI 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 PIRELLI 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 PIRELLI 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/65 R15 PIRELLI 5 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/09/2019 |Inspection Date 08/10/2019
Survey held at BLK 2, KRANJI LOOP #01-02
Repairer TOH AH SWEE SPRAY PAINTING CO.
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|E$T|MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' 7d V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

o 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
(,_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg, MNo. 19-9807198-R Page No.:1 af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKQ 7785C
; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty P Workshop ($)) (s)
BREPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOOTLID MOT NECESSARY 1,522.00 -
1|BOOTLID CHROME MOT NECESSARY 468.00 -
1|BOOTLID LAMP RH MOT NECESSARY 478.00
1| TAIL LAMP RH MOT NECESSARY 480.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 565.00 565.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -B78.25 -141.25
263475 423.75
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSCR (SN) SHORTED 380.00 200.00
380,00 200.00
LABOQUR
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR WINDSCREEMN. HOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
TO REMOVE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK E0.00 20.00
WIRING.
TO REMOVE DAMAGED PARTS.TO KNOCK OUT 600.00 300.00
DENTS, TO STRAIGHTEN.ADJUST, CHECK,RESHAFPE
INCLUDING CUTTING AND WELDING WHERE
NECESSARY TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL NECESSARY
FITTINGS TO FACILIATE REPAIRS. TO REPLACE AND
ALIGN THE ABOVE PARTS.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON RHS BODY AND 600.00 250.00
ABOVE MNEW AMD REPAIRED PARTS INCLUDING SUPPLY
OF PAINT MATERIALS.
1,440.00 570.00
GRAND TOTAL 4.454.75 1,193.75
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 950.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref Mo, CS/FCI19017054/Esd3n2
CHEN TSUE YEE ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMAER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frant page of this Repor.




