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Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreq.No:193607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.
5 Temasek Boulevard
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

Attn:

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

30 Sep 2019

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No  : SGD5580E
TP Vehicle No : SBS3347G
Make : HONDA CITY
Date of Inspection : 26/09/2019
Inspection At

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

Accident Date : 22/09/2019
Assignment Date : 26/09/2019
Est. Duration of Repair e

The vehicle sustained impact / damages FRONT O/S portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check Items (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

Remarks

( ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us

have your authorisation.

:S% 4,040.90
:S% 2,110.90
:S% 0.00
:S§ 2,110.90

:S$

:S%
:S$
:S$
:S$
:S$

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( X ) Other comments : THE ABOVE SURVEY WAS CONDUCTED ON A WITHOUT "PREJUDICE" BASIS.



Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) - — FE—

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2019 5:04 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad

Ce: Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi; SUR

Subject: RE: SBS3347G - AFTER PAINT PHOTOS : ERGO ref no. (P) COMPG19001785 PRS FOR

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBS3347G & SGD5580E ON 21/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG
JURONG EAST AVE 1

Hi Lynn

Kindly send final invoice and all supporting documents directly to ERGO INSURANCE.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:Bazlin.Ahmad @towertransit.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2019 11:39 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>; Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi
<Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SBS3347G - AFTER PAINT PHOTOS : ERGO ref no. (P) COMPG19001785 PRS FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SBS3347G & SGD5580E ON 21/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG JURONG EAST AVE 1

Hi Taufikh

We accept your COR $2,110.90 with 2 working days.
Please advise LOD to send to your side or ERGO?

Thank You

Best Regards

Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987
Mobile +65 9199 0025
Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.s

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd



21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K

www.towertransit.sg

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December, 2019 10:46 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin. Ahmad @towertransit.sg>

Cc: 'Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)' <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SBS3347G - AFTER PAINT PHOTOS : ERGO ref no. (P) COMPG19001785 PRS FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING
$BS3347G & SGDS580E ON 22/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG JURONG EAST AVE 1

Hi Lynn,
COR $2110.90, 2 days.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 9 October 2019 8:52 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto (admin-d@Ikkauto.com); Admin A (admin-a@Ikkauto.com); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto
(Meikwan@Ikkauto.com); Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying

Subject: SBS3347G - AFTER PAINT PHOTOS : ERGO ref no. (P) CDMPG19001785 PRS FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SBS3347G & SGD5580E ON 22/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG JURONG EAST AVE 1

Dear Taufigh
Please find attached, please finalise by this week.

Thank You

Best Regards
Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987

Mobile +65 9199 0025

Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg
Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depat, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 11:10 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad; Admin-D (LKKAuto (admin-d@lkkauto.com); Ivy Yong; Phoebe Xie;
Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto (Meikwan@Ikkauto.com)

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying

Subject: RE: Claims ref no. (P) CDMPG19001785 PRS FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBS3347G

& SGD5580E ON 22/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG JURONG EAST AVE 1

Hi LKK,

Please conduct this survey request.
(Note: Survey vehicle only)

Kindly contact us if you are not able to make it.

*** NOTE: Please assist to quote our claims ref no. as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports
/ Survey Reports.

Thank you

Date Classification : Confidential, C3

Warmest Regards,
Pauline Soh
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985
DID.. +55 68299194

pauline soh@ergo.com.sg

WWW.ergo. com.sq E RG

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in maore than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group). one of the world's leading risk carriers

Disclaimer This message and its attachments are confidential, imended only for the named addressee and may be privileged If you are not the inlended recipient, you

Id not disclose. distribute. copy or use this communication. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by return email and delete this message
ng any attachment to this message. you agree 1o accept the risk that it may contain a virus or damaging code and you agree that ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd w
be liable for any loss or damage thereby caused

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg]
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 10:52 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department); Ivy Yong; Phoebe Xie; Pauline Soh
Cc: Wu Tzu Ying

Subject: RE: Claims ref no. (P) CDOMPG19001785 PRS FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBS3347G & SGD5580E ON
22/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG JURONG EAST AVE 1

Dear Officers
Kindly arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey today.
1



Thank You

Best Regards

Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987

Mobile +659199 0025

Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg

Operation Hours : Monday - Friday from
0900hrs - 1800hrs

TRANSIT

e ———— Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170

Registration number 201419417K

www.towertransit.sg

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September, 2019 9:49 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad @towertransit.sg>; lvy Yong <ivy.yong@ergo.com.sg>; Phoebe Xie
<phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>; Pauline Soh <pauline.soh@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Claims ref no. (P) CDOMPG19001785 PRS FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBS3347G & SGD5580E ON
22/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG JURONG EAST AVE 1

‘THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE = Do not click links or oper
senderfemail.
Ifin doubt, please check with IT Suppori!

Dear Lynn

Please refer to our list of surveyors

1 | AIS | Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 | FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
3| IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service

4 | JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd

5 | LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 | LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 PS Priority Services

8 | VAC Vicom Ltd

9 | AJAX AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
10 | QRM Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd
11| AA Appraisal Associate




Date Classification - Confidential C3

Warmest Regards
Pauline Sch
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

& Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID . +65 8829 9194

pauline soh@ergo.com.sg

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers

Disclaimar This message and its attachments are confidential intended anly for the named adaresses, and may be privileged Il you are not the inlended recipient. yo
should nol disclose, distr 2 this ication. It you are not the intended recipient. pleas otify the sender by return email and delete this message
By cpening any altachme s L ree 1o accepl the nsk that it may contain a virus or gamaging code, and you agree thal ERGO Insurance Pte Lid will
0t be liable for any loss or damage thereby caused

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2019 5:41 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Claims Department)

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi

Subject: PRS FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBS3347G & SGD5580E ON 22/09/2019 AT 16:20HRS ALONG JURONG
EAST AVE 1

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Mdm,

We would like notify you of a road accident on 21/09/2019 at about 16:20hrs along Jurong
East Ave 1 involving our bus, SBS3347G & your insured vehicle SGD5580E.

As a result of this accident, our bus has been damaged. Before we proceed to repair the
damaged bus, please let us know within the next 48 hours if you wish to conduct a pre-
repair survey of our bus. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated
timeline, we shall proceed to repair the bus without any further reference to you.

Please advise if the survey appointment could be arranged tomorrow 26/09/2019 between
2pm —4pm.

Survey Location : Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170

Contact Person : Lynn @ +65 9199 0025

Thank You



- Bést Regards
Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987
Mobile +659199 0025
Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sq
Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
TRANSIT Registration number 201419417K

__""""'-—- www.towertransit.sg

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender
immediately. If you do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email
arey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender
immediately. If you do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email
arey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit




MTOT19125599 | Taower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd - HO
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 23/08/2019 12:40
SUBMITTED BY: Bazlin Binte Ahmad

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report ccrrectlx the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2, This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of malerial facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission of pelicy liability on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the Insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that coples of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by Interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

23/09/2019 12:40
22/08/2019 16:20
JURONG EAST AVE 1
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

Passport No/FIN

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SBS3347G

TOWER TRANSIT SINGAPORE PTE LTD
201419417K
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-62480987

VOLVO
BOTL-9.4 D (A)

NO

THIRD PARTY
BUS

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

YES

D-18092210MFBP

MOHD FARID BIN MOHD HASLAN
(G2546673Q

15/08/1985

OUTDOOR

25/08/2018

1 YEAR AND 0 MONTHS

MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98888888

NOEMAIL

Page 1 0of 14



Address 21 BULIM DRIVE SINGAPORE 648170
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - MAJOR/MINOR RD
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

Invaolved in the accident :
Was any body Injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? NO
| hgv_g been approached by unknownlperson(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 10
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER ATTACHED

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number SGDS580E

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HONDA CIVIC

Detalls Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver LIM TOW SHIANG RUSSELL
NRIC/Passport Number $90273011

Contact Number

Address 68 SARACA VIEW

Postcode 807328

Insurance Company Name ERGO INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 14
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Statement Form

BC Name: v.pHD FARID punN NMIOHWD HAaSLAM Dete Taken: Vg /U‘f /JD!"
BCNo :__ /7673 Time Taken: /7 /%
Natureofincident:__ T VO be o Wit way Bu S
Dute of Incidents __2:/65 /2419 Time of Incident: __(€ ¢
ServicaNo: >4 PE5- BusReg No: _S%5 334714  putyNe:__ 334 POS
, Outaley bes Nio $7 33Y1C

T1Bc 12648 o~ que 334 dvivingal Turony Fovi
QUQ L, Oong Pf'\vtxkc. Car :gVUH—L-‘—Ll: r—chkJ, Ryc !S! a
| Yurn Vo ﬂ»xw-\ml——-onul |(}(‘AL—-U\_E|L‘\__M} |
No_ \f\\b—fl <, r‘ar‘of’«- d tx-iJ Vs pt\qi‘eﬂg;rr onboard
Deameageg o { “’\HM"JLL\\: Ricde ﬂrur\{- bumper
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*1 confirmaed that the above statement given by me is corract to the best of my knowledge.

C) 12
MoND FREID BN ApsD AAsinns : LY /cm /l“T ¥ Y1 ey

| BCName & No. (Diyy Signature Date & Time
Statement Taken By:
S Wil e~er 307 f Inderchange Supery
| Name Designation
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Sketch Plan #3
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7. By the lodgmant of this report to the Insurers, you hersby consent
iy yeu ¥ thdmhmﬂnthﬂdbmd

8. Consant under the Parsonal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, ackrowiedge, agres anc sorsent than

‘ ) procussing, handiing and/cr dealing with my clatma Including the of
| ey my ding the ssttiement hﬁumuwm

(4) Investigating the sccident and/or my diafims;
manwhﬂWmemmuwmwm

(W) administaring my cisims {inchuding the malling of corraspondanc, sttements, Invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could Invoive disclosura of certain parsonal data about me to bring about delivery of tha sema as wall 2s on the -
axtamal covar of envelopes/mail peciagas); snd/or v

(Vi somplying with applicabis lsw In administering, procassing. handling snd/or desling with my clairms.(collectivaly the .

(o) all Insurer(s) whe have insured vehicle(s) Involved In this sccident and the Insurers’ lswyers/law firms, may/sre permitted
to collect, use, disciose and/or process my Parsonal Information for ane o1 mare of the sbove Purposes; and

¢} my Parsonal information may/can be disciosad by any of the Insurars and/or GIA to thair third party service providers or
agants{including thair lswyers/lew firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the sbova Purposes.

(d) my Persondl Information ikl alse be and used to complie clalrms Ristory for the purpcse of fraud detection,
Investigation and managsmant in and afl futurs seime.

fa] the information s collectad under (d) sbova may be shered / disclosed:

) toall Insurers snd/or any third parties that assist in evaluating, Investigating, controlling or marmging fraud,
regulstors, lsw snd government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes steted, or '

(] for complying with requireiments under sy reguistions, ws or court orders.

Policyholder's Signaturs Driver's Signature feporting Cantrs Personnal’s Signeture
Dats & Tima: {If driver ls not the policyhoider) Mama!
MekTme 5 /9 (3009 WNRIC/FIM No L

11 4% rs
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 417K
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SBS3347G
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 30 Sep 2019
Vehicle Make: VOoLvo
Vehicle Model: B9TL
Primary Colour: Multicolor
Manufacturing Year: 2013

Engine No.: D9190099
Chassis No.: YV354P926DA160833
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $479,149.00
Original Registration Date: 03Jun 2013
First Registration Date: 03 Jun 2013
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $0.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Rebate Amount: $0.00

Total Rebate Amount: $0.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Sep 2019

OK



-l

ESTIMATED ACCIDENT REPAIR COST

oe ...
ENGINEERING

w

L ¥\¢ - Touhth

ACCIDENT TIME y
| oy 16:20HRS
ACCIDENT DATE 22-Sep-19
BUS CAPTAIN NAME MOHD FARID BIN MOHD HASLAN
THIRD PARTY CLAIM
i ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

SECTION 1: PARTS & CONSUMABLE ITEMS (MATERIAL COST)

BUS REGISTRATION

SBS3347G
NUMBER
BUS TYPE (SD/DD) DD
BUS ROUTE NUMBER

BUS ADVERTS (Y/N)

Part No. Part or Item Description Quantity Total Cost
0O/S DEFLECTOR 4 / $390.00
0O/S/F CORNER BUMPER CUL'( - $240.00
O/S/F BEZEL LIGHT (A — $190.90
82090
7% GST $57.46
PARTS TOTAL COST $878.36
SECTION 2: ASSESSMENT / REPAIR / SPRAY PAINT (LABOUR COST)
LABOUR ITEM (PLEASE SPECIFY IF ITS ASSESSMENT, REPAIR OR SPRAY PAINT) TOTAL COST

TO REMOVE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS 650 $1,300.00
SPRAY PAINTING '/: /%O $1,920.00

(290-00
7% GST $225.40
LABOUR TOTAL COST $3,445.40

wouo A0

PAGE 1




ESTIMATED ACCIDENT REPAIR COST

wr

 romer R

I
ENGINEERING

SECTION 3: REPAIRS TO BUS ADVERTISMENT VINYLS/PANELS (ADVERTISEMENT COST)

TOTAL ADVERTISEMENT REPAIR COST

SECTION 4: RECOVERY OF ACCIDENT BUS (TOWING COST)

TOTAL TOWING COST

SECTION 5: NUMBER OF DAYS UNDER ACCIDENT REPAIR (LOSS OF USE COST)

Date In For Repairs

Date Out From Repairs

BUS TYPE (SD / DD) Number of Days Under Repair 0
LOSSOF USECOST o $1,600.00
\ N
\ S
SUMMARY /),‘ ’ k /
SECTION NO. cost 4 ldf\ {’;’L{ fl- 9% )
< /
1 $878.36 Wr ZL/‘)'/(? ¢ %4;_
2 $3,445.40 . "
3 e
5 $1,600.00 UZ%
GRAND TOTAL $5,923.76 Quor @ l[dm,\,\,xo Lo
PAGE 2
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ESTIMATED ACCIDENT REPAIR COST

LYY - it

ENGINEERING

ACCIDENT TIME . BUS REGISTRATION
g 16:20HRS | o $8533476
IACCIDENT DATE lz*SIﬂ-l’ BUS TYPE (SD/DD) DD
[suscarramname | MOHD FARID BIN MOHD HASLAN |ms ROUTE NUMBER
m"m' Ty ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. BUS ADVERTS (Y/N) N
SECTION 1: PARTS & CONSUMABLE ITEMS (MATERIAL COST)
Part No. Part or tem Description Quantity Total Cont
0/5 DEFLECTOR a1 $390.60
0/S/F CORNER BUMPER Cny _~ 1 $240.00
0/S/F BEZEL LIGHT %t ~ 1 $190.90
7% GST $57.46
PARTS TOTAL COST 5878.36
S _?_ O~ C' )
SECTION 2: ASSESSMENT / REPAIR / SPRAY PAINT (LABOUR COST)
LABOUR ITEM (PLEASE SPECIFY IF TS ASSESSMENT, REPAIR OR SPRAY PAINT) TOTAL COST
TO REMOVE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS 6 S0 $1,300.00
SPRAY PAINTING /: %0 $1,920.00
(2.90-
7% GST $225.40
LABOUR TOTAL COST $3,445.40
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ESTIMATED ACCIDENT REPAIR COST

T%ANS[T
ENGINEERING

SECTION 3: REPAIRS TO BUS ADVERTISMENT VINYLS/PANELS (ADVERTISEMENT COST)

TOTAL ADVERTISEMENT REPAIR COST

SECTION 4: RECOVERY OF ACCIDENT BUS (TOWING COST)

TOTAL TOWING COST

SECTION 5: NUMBER OF DAYS UNDER ACCIDENT REPAIR (LOSS OF USE COST)

Date In For Repairs

Date Out From Repairs
BUS TYPE (SD / DD) Number of Days Under Repair 0
$1,600.00

LOSS OF USE COST

SUMMARY
SECTION NO cost
1 $878.36
2 $3,445.40
3
]
5 $1,600.00
GRAND TOTAL $5,923.76
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1
...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
Case Notified Est Submitted Adj Assigned Ad) Rpt Ad] Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
32‘Dec 2019 26 Sep 2019 ae2;110:90 I p— Pending for Survey |
Main  |16:06 00:ha Edit Estimates View Rpt pen
Edit Reg | Edit Ad) Rat | : o Cancel Case | |
r Main Reference Claim Details Documents Show All
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Insured: -, Co. Reg. No.: -
Main
Claimant: N
Vehicle Reg. . |22/05/2019 00:00 - :59
No.: SBS3347G ) Date of Loss: | 155 onths and 19 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
Claim Type: | TP / CDMPG19001785 PaNey(Cove
Vehicle Reg.
Policy No.
No. |SGDS580E s
(Insured):
Excess:
Repairer; Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd (HQ) 21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, 648170 Jurong West - Tel: B1688950
pandind | ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6829 9199 ... [Handled by Ivy Yong - 6829 9197)
adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] .. [Final Rpt due
] 07/10/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View All I Compose Case Mail I

There are no mail for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS®= view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |
Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 30/12/2019




Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SBS3347G (CDMPG19001785)
[SGD5580E]
TP
Sep 22 2019 12:00AM

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 1

Upload Documents | Upload Photos |  Compose New Letter | View
Assessment Reports N |1 per page v] ;B_—
No | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 30/09/19 16:24 | Adjuster Immediate Advice € | Load HTM
Photos/Images [3perpage [v]| M |
No |Relabel/Reorder |LKK a_uin_;':nnsultanu Pte Ltd (HQ) i Thumbnall | Print
1 |18/10/19 18B:11 | General View €Y | Load PG
2 |18/10/1918:11 | General View o o © | Losd G
3 |18/10/19 18:11 General View B wadirc | M
4 |18/10/19 18:11 aem;r-i\new € | wadrc | &
5 |18/10/19 18:11  |General View € | wadirc | M
6 |18/10/19 18:11 General View O | wadwc | M
7 |18/10/1918:11 | General View Load PG | M
8 |18/10/19 18:11 General View € | wadirc |
5 |18/10/1918:11 | General View 0 | wadwe M
10 |18/10/1918:11 | General View € | ladic |
11 |18/10/19 18:11  |General View © | adirc | &
12 |18/10/19 18:11 General View € | adrc | M
13 |18/10/19 18:11 G‘erle;al_\ﬂew o Load G | M
14 |18/10/19 18:11 General View o Load PG | M
15 [18/10/19 18:11 General View € | wadirc | M
16 |18/10/19 18:11 General View ) | Load G
17 |18/10/19 18:11 Gamtal_Vlew @) | Load IrG
18 |17/12/1910:41 | Replacement Part Photo € | Load G
19 |17/12/19 10:41 Replacement Part Photo € | adwc | M
20 |17/12/1910:41 | Replacement Part Photo @ | adc | M

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

Reset | save | print |

There are no document checklistsafipured‘

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Note: Remarks are private unless you show It to ather parties.
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 30/12/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coRreg N0 198607198R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/EGI19016976/T1YD3E2
Date: 30/12/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SBS3347G Insured Vehicle No : SGD5580E
Date of Loss: 22/09/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: CDMPG19001785
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SBS3347G
Make & Model: VOLVO B9TL, 9.4 D (A) Engine No: D9190099
Reg. Date: 03/06/2013 (Man. Year: 2013) Chassis No: YV3S4P926DA160833
Colour: Green Odometer: 411040 km
Engine Capacity: 9364 cc
Market Value/New Car
Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 275/70 R22.5 Rear Tyre Size: 275/70 R22.5 (D)
Front Left Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 8/8 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 8/8 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
ICOST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %|
Parts 820.90 820.90 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,220.00 1,290.00 1,930.00 59.94
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 4,040.90 2,110.90 1,930.00 47.76
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 282.86 147.76 135.10 47.76
Nett Amount (S$) 4,323.76 2,258.66 2,065.10 47.76
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 26/09/2019
Date Inspected: 26/09/2019 Inspected At: Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd (HQ)
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot
Singapore 648170
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: YVONNE WONG YIN CHENG

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out to the best of our

knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 30/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 30 Dec 2019)

|Partzr.: N/A VOLVO BYTL 9.4 D (A) (Model not available in database)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List) |
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SBS3347G)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

! numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
'Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *0/S DEFLECTOR Cracked 390.00FS *390.00FS
2 1 *0/S/F CORNER BUMPER Cracked 240.00FS *240.00FS
3 1 *O/S/F BEZEL LIGHT Cracked 190.90FS *190.90FS
F=Franchise part. S=SpcNett
Total Parts (S$) 820.90 820.90
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.con/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 30/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Items

1 TO REMOVE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS New 1,300.00 650.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING New 1,920.00 640.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 3,220.00 1,290.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

|

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 30/12/2019



