Hsiao Tong {LKKAut_u]

e —————————————
From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 2:35 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER DELIBERATION : M2018/00036 - Accident involving
SHC4163B & GBB5241D on 12.09.2014 |SMRT ref TAX/09/14/2089/LG | CNTP ref
SMNM14003737C02

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We have mandate up to $826.98.
Pls proceed to resolve claim accordingly.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079509
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXAX XXXX | F:(65) 6222 1033

W: www sq.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: KU Taiping SG 3 Anson

Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079308
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (B5) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 30 August, 2019 2:26 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER DELIBERATION : M2018/00036 - Accident involving SHC4163B & GBB5241D on
12.09.2014 |SMRT ref TAX/09/14/2089/LG | CNTP ref SNM14D03737C02

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Further to the below email from third party.

Kindly get back for an offer as third party had called in on this.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933)



From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & I/ Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 5:52 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com; Chong Boon Sen {boonsen.chﬂng@sﬁ.mtaipina.mm}
<hoonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com?>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: URGENT / REMINDER DELIBERATION : M2018/00036 - Accident invelving SHCA4163B & GBB5241D on
12.09.2014 |SMRT ref TAX/09/14/2089/LG | CNTP ref SNM14D03737C02

URGENT
REMINDER

Dear All,

Since the matter has been deliberated and ruling is 50:50% between the parties, please let us have your offer on
quantum by 15" August 2019, otherwise we shall have no option but to seek legal redress since the issue is on
quantum. Thanks.

RL-!I:_J-'_."F-!"'.JS

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 SMRT

ALUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Taxis)

Sent: 27/06/2019 09:04

To: Chong Boon Sen

Cc: Chee So Chow; Claims Dept of CTI

Subject: DELIBERATION : M2018/00036 - Accident involving SHC4163B & GBB5241D on 12.09.2014 |SMRT ref
TAX/09/14/2089/LG | CNTP ref SNM14D03737C02

Dear Boon Sen,
Please let us have your offer on quantum. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Cynthia Chan [mai to:cynthia.chan@agia.org.sq)

Sent: 26/06/2019 15:07

To: Chong Boon Sen; Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)

Cc: Chee So Chow; Claims Dept of CTI; ARC Bola

Subject: DELIBERATION : M2018/00036 - Accident involving SHC4163B & GBB5241D on 12.09.2014 [SMRT ref
TAX/09/14/2089/LG | CNTP ref SNM14D03737C02

Dear All

The Panel of Adjudicators has deliberated and decided that ruling shall be in favour of neither parties.

2



BOLA Scenario 24A is applicable. The settlement shall be 50/50 between the claimants. As viewed from
the video footage, both parties are reversing.

The Adjudicators deem that this case should not have come for adjudication.

The below BOLA Fee chargeable in the month of June 2019 to the respective parties will be deducted by
Merimen via GIRO.

SMRT - $$250.00

China Taiping — S5250.00

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Cynthia Chan

Executive, Technical

cynthia.chan@gia.org.sg | www.gia.org.sg
DID: +65 6202 8895 | Tel: +65 6221 B788

General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA)
180 Cecil Street, #15-01, Bangkok Bank Building, Singapore 069546
UEN Ng: SE6550020G

From: Cynthia Chan

Sent: Monday, August 20, 2018 12:12 PM

To: 'Chong Boon Sen’ <boonsen.chong@sg. cntaiping.com=; LeeGek@smri.com.sg

Cc: ARC Bola <ARCBola@gia.org.sg>

Subject: RE: M2018/00036 - Accident involving SHC4163B & GBB5241D on 12.09.2014 |SMRT ref
TAX/09/14/2089/LG | CNTP ref SNM14D03737C02

Dear All

We have received the complete document submission for case M2018/00036. This escalation will be in
queue for adjudication.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Cynthia Chan

Executive, Technical




cynthia.chan@agia.org.sg | www.gia.org.sgq
DID: +65 B202 9895 | Tel: +65 6221 B7B8

General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA)
180 Cecil Street, #15-01, Bangkok Bank Building, Singapore 089546
UEN No: SBES30020G

From: Chong Boon 5en <boonsen.chong(@sg cntaiping.com=

Sent: Friday, August 17, 2018 1:11 PM

To: Cynthia Chan <cynthia.chan@gia.org.sg>

Ce: LeeGek@smrt.com.sg; ARC Bola <ARCBola@gia.org.sg>

Subject: RE: M2018/00036 - Accident involving SHC4163B & GBB5241D on 12.05.2014 |SMRT ref
TAX,/09/14/2089/LG | CNTP ref SNM14D03737C02

Dear all,
Pls find Insured report and requested pg 2 of Letter of Consent filled as requested.
Thank you.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive

Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079209

Ca. Reg. No, 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.cheng(@sg.cntaiping.com
Website. www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidentiol; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Toiping Insurance (Singopore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in a written ogreement between you and Ching Taiping insurance (Singapare) Pte. Lid. Any unouthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Cynthia Chan [mailto:cynthia.chan@gia.org.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, August 14, 2018 11:27 AM

To: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/ Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>; ARC Bola
<ARCBola@gia.org.sg>

Subject: M2018/00036 - Accident involving SHC4163B & GBB5241D on 12.09.2014 |SMRT ref TAX/09/14/2089/1LG |
CNTP ref SNM14D03737

Dear So Chow

We refer to below escalation initiated by SMRT for an accident involving SHC4163B & GBB5241D on
12.09.2014,

We would like to highlight to all who wish to escalate such disputes that they must be prepared to agree
that the Panel of Adjudicators will deliberate and make a decision based on BOLA Chart effective 1* May
2012.



Please also take note that by submitting the case for adjudication under the DRM, the parties involved in
this dispute have agreed:

i. To waive any right to pursue / further pursue against any other Claimant or party / parties
involved in the accident:

ii. That the Decision under the BOLA DRM is final and binding on all the Claimants;

iii. To abide by the Decision; and

iv. MNot to appeal the Decision in court or bring a fresh action following the Decision issued at the
BOLA DRM, whether in court or in any other dispute resolution forum, including mediation and
arbitration, except as directly necessary to enforce such Decision.

Kindly fill up your Counter Party (CP) portion on pg 2 of the Letter of Consent attached and submit
together with supporting documents and video evidence (if applicable).

Please send in your submission by 20 August 2018, Monday, else the case will be subjected to ex-parte
proceeding.

PS: video footage (font CCTV.mov) will be uploaded and sent via separate email.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ynthia Chan

E};:E{:I..iti"l.rE. Technical

cynthia chan{@agia.org.sg | www.gia.org.sg
DID: +65 6202 9895 | Tel: +85 6221 8788

General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA)
180 Cecil Street, #15-01, Bangkok Bank Building, Singapore 069546
UEN No: SBESS0020G

From: Cynthia Chan [mailto:cynthia.chan@gia.org.sq]

Sent: 10/08/2018 16:38

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & A/ Taxis/Claims)

Cc: Chee So Chow; ARC Bola

Subject: RE: SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2089/LG ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

Dear Lee Gek

We have obtained the consent from China Taiping to escalate this dispute.

Attached is the Letter of Consent submitted from SMRT. To proceed with this case, kindly submit the rest
of supporting documents such as SAS, Sketch Plan, photographic evidence and video evidence |if

available).

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Cynthia Chan

Executive, Technical

cynthia.chan@gia.org.sq | www.gia.org.sq
DID: +65 6202 9895 | Tel: +65 6221 8788

General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA)
180 Cecil Street, #15-01, Bangkok Bank Building, Singapore 069546
UEN No: SB63S0020G

From: Tan Lee Gek [Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & |A/Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, August 7, 2018 12:27 PM

To: Cynthia Chan <cynthia.chan@gia.org.sg>

Cc: sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com

Subject: SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2085/LG ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

Dear Cynthia,
Please be informed that there is still no response from China Taiping by the due date. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRET Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Chee So Chow [mailto:sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: 30/07/2018 10:27
To: Cynthia Chan

Cc: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims); ARC Bola
Subject: RE: SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2089/EB ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

Dear Cynthia

Moted. Shall let you know by deadline.

Fegards

CHEE SO CHOW
Deputy Manager
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance |(Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No, 200208384E



DID 63896176

Fax G224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sq cntaiping.com
sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer ;- This message is confidential; ils contents do not constitiie o commitment by China Taiping Inswrance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. excepi
where provided far in a written agreement benween vou and Ching Taiping Insuvance (Singaporve) Pre. Lid. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or
dissemination; either in whole or pavtial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message. please notify the sender immediately

From: Cynthia Chan [mailto:cynthia.chan@gia.org.sg]

Sent: Monday, July 30, 2018 10:22 AM

To: Chee So Chow <sachow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>; ARC Bola
<ARCBola@pgia.org.sg>

Subject: FW: SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2089/EB ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

Dear So Chow
Accident involving SHC4163B and GBB5241D on 12.09.2014.

SMRT would like to escalate the above dispute for ruling under DRM. Kindly advise if China Taiping is
agreeable to the escalation. We look forward to your advice by 06.08.2018, Monday.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Cynthia Chan
Executive, Technical

cynthia.chan@agia.org.sg | www.gia.org.sq
DID: +65 6202 9895 | Tel: +65 6221 8788

General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA)
180 Cecil Street, #15-01, Bangkok Bank Building, Singapore 069546
UEN MNo: SB6SS0020G

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 9:02 AM

To: Cynthia Chan <cynthia.chan@gia.org.sg>
Subject: SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2085/EB ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

Dear Cynthia,
Fyi, to-date there is still no response from China Taiping. Thanks.
Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)

Claims Department



SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@,-smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svecs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)

Sent: 10/05/2018 10:59

To: claimsdept@sa.cntaiping.com

Ce: Alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); ARC Bola; Cynthia Chan (cynthia.chan@aia.org.sq)
Subject: URGENT SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2089/EB ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

URGENT
Dear Sirs,
Kindly get the OIC to let us have your consent by 17™ May 2018 to escalate the matter to GIA for their deliberation.

If we do not hear from the QIC by the due date, we shall deem that consent has been given. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smm

ALTOMOTIVE

From: Cynthia Chan [mailto:cynthia.chan@qia.org.sg]

Sent: 10/05/2018 10:36

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)

Cc: ARC Bola

Subject: RE: SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2089/EB ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

Dear Lee Gek
Thanks for the submission.

We noted the consent for escalation was in 2016. We would need the consent to be of recent date. Kindly
confirm with the Counter Party if the escalation consent still stands.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Cynthia Chan
Executive, Technical

cynthia chan@aia. org.sg | www.gia.org.sg
DID: +85 6202 B895 | Tel: +65 6221 B788



General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA)
180 Cecil Street, #15-01, Bangkok Bank Building, Singapore 069546
UEN No: S665S0020G

From: Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & |1A/Taxis/Claims) <eileenbay@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, April 16, 2018 2:30 PM

To: Cynthia Chan <cynthia.chan@gia.org.sg>; Sharon Chen <sharon.chen@gia.org.sg>

Cc: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong
{chewht@{kkauto.com) <chewht@ lkkauto.com>; [ason.tea@sg.cntaiping.com

Subject: SMRT REF: TAX/09/14/2089/EB ; CNTP REF: SNM14D03737 ; LKK REF: CC3/CAI14017530/K1py3

Dear Cynthia / Sharon

We would like to escalate this matter to GIA for deliberation.
Attached are the letter of consent and attachment and scene photos.
We have video footage of the accident and it will be sent to you in a CD via post.

Thanks and regards,

Eileen Bay

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct Line +65 6866 2797 | Direct Fax + 65 6368 7421 | eileenbay@smrt.com.sg
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://'www.symanteccloud.com
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6 SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
680 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Eil'tﬂ‘ﬂpﬂm TETTOS
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd g e
51 Ubi Ave 1 WIAW, SMILCOMm .5
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Date : 08/10/2014
Singapore 408933

Our Ref.: TAX/09/14/2089/ML

Your Ref.:cc3 fcAL\ 401 75%0/K lou §
Dear Sirs, ; e

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC4163B AND GBB5241D ON 12/09/2014 ALONG
KELANTAN LANE CAR PARK

LETTER OF CLAIM

We claim on behalf of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD, owner/hirer of the vehicle Reg. No.; SHC4163E,
Your driver's negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered
the following losses:-

1. Cost of Repair . *),043.95
2. Loss of Use for days @ S8 iday

3. Loss of Rental for _4-5 days @ S% 133.75 /day : % 60| .38

4. Loss of Income for 45 _days @ S§ 80:90 /day . ¥ 34p.00

5. Police Report/ SAS Report/ LTA Search Fee : 3 5.00

6. Survey Fee

7. Others

Total Claims $ 2{ ol GEE

We enclose the following documents :

A" Repair Invoice [ Letter of Authorisation
[] survey Report [ L7A Search resuit

D Photographs pcs [T others:

[[] Investigation results 1. _Leid -Up Refcﬁ

|2T Proof of Loss of l4sefRental/lreerms 2,
E”P:ﬂioﬂ | SAS report of SH<AH638 3.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this
letter. Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

Yours sincerely,
SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
‘/L c.c First Capital Insurance Lid

Madeleine Lee

For Manager, Claims

Claims Department

DID: 6866 2698

Emall: madeleinelee@smrt.com.sg

FR-AS-CLM-02 REV 2



Auto
! !{!‘{ Consutianis
Oedlh RS B Plelfa

51 URLAVE 1. #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62363561 FAX : (065 AI5R4315

Our Ref; CCI/CAI14017530/K 1py3
30 SEP 2014

SENG JOO HARDWARE PTE LTD
BLK 26 JALAN BERSEH

#01-164

SINGAPORE 200026

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 5241D AND SHC 41638 ON 12/09/2014
ALONG/AT KELANTAN LANE CARPARK

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer,
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to settle a THIRD PARTY claim against you for
an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Our record shows that to date, you'your driver have not reported the accident to us. We wold
appreciate it if you could urgently file a report at any of China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte Ltd reporting centre. You may reler to your Centificate of Insurance for the list of the
reporting centre.

Please note that you had been notified by your insurer via mail by post on 17/09/2014.

To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within ten (14)
days from date of this letter (by 14/10/2014},

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy,

failure of compliance, our principal M/s China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple L
reserves the right to repudiate liability.

If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned.

Y ours faithfully,

C,L- L

Chew Hsiao Tong

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

oL Claims Manuger
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore} Pre Led
iMuotor Claims Dept}



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

. SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant™) of BLK 60 WOODLANDS

INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (8) 757705 (address), owner of SHC 4163B (vehicle no.) hereby
authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no
SHC 4163B that was damaged pursuant to the accident which oceurred on 12/09/2014 (date) along
KELANTAN LANE CARPARK (location) involving vehicle no/s GBB 5241D (“the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTELTD.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driverfowner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this a 6 {duy}of’_%[}k ~ (month) ZG_IE] {year)

k )

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop”™

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



Policy HNo @ DMCVSNI419371400 Claim Neo = SNM14DD3737C02
Claimant i SMRT TARXIS FTE LTD
Amount ¢ B5B26.00

Singapore Dollars EIGHT HUMDRED TWENTY 31X only
I/We agres to accept the above menticned amount to ba paid teo mefus in full &
Final settlement of all ¢laims, copsts & disbursemsnts for injuries [/ damages

sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Claimant ¥ehicle No: : SHC4163E

Insured Vehicle Mo. i GBEBSZ41D
pate of Loss . 12/09/2014
Place of hccident : KELANTAN LANE CARPARE

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSUBANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHIMNA TAIPING INSURRNCE {STNGRAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/for

Insured Hame : SENG JOO HARDWARE FTE LTD
Driver Hame £ CHOW HOCE SO00N

From all claims, present or future in respect of all loss; dnjury or damage
sustained by mefus arising cut of the sald accident.

T acknowledge that this payment is made without admigsion of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIFPING INSURANCE (SINGAFPORE! PTE. LTD.

{1 Gloebal Sum g% 826,00
POTAL .. s, w woow we b % 5w @ e 4 & B ___EEG‘UQ o
/’T-_-' \
! ‘.'.
Claimant Mame : ,.-"'% P Spraen , 4 MNRIC Mo : EWK';H}LF
S
Slgnature i Date ZE EEF ml!

injunizs clam-andio wninsured lnsses claim

Furihot, the Sét

an e

clam andior ofher uninsated

sublsct mallarin thie adtion,

*=* This Dischage Voucher gpplies only 10 the claimanl's ciam
of s groperty damage and will not aitect s pafsana




BMRAT Autcmotive Services Pte Ltd
251 Rorth Bridge Road Singapoxe 175102
Tel: 65 §3311000 Fax: 55 63340247

Tax Invoice

Cus tomer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. : MR-8500001-7
CEN : 1950042802
SMrR'T TaXIS PTE LTD Invoice HNo. : IV140901349
Date : 26.09.2014
Block Unit Vehicle No. : SHCA163B
Your Ref No. : TAX/059/14/2089
60 WOIDLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Our Ref No. : 24064042
SINGAPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Dascription oty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
. Cost % Amount
Parts
BUMPER, REAR: FOR TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI 1.00 % 45B.60 (25.00 ) & 114.65 £ 343.39%5
BUMPER REINFORCEMENT REAR 0.00 5 205.70 (25.00 ) ] 0.00 s 0.00
(’ WRM SUB-ASSY, RR BUMPER LH 0.00 % 139.60 {25.00 ) s 0.00 s 0.00
'END PANEL 1.00 % 602.10 (100.00} & 602.10 s 0.00
B Sub-Total 5 343 .85
Labour
TO REPAIR REAR PORTION 1.00 5 400.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 400.00
Others
TO REPSRAY REAR BUMPER 1.00 % 200.00 { G.00 ) 5 0.00 5 2040.00
TO RESPRAY REAR PAMEL 1.00 % 100.00 { 0.00 ) 5 0.00 g 100.00

Remark :

Make/Model 1 TOYOTA PRIUS
bBeoocident Date : 12.09,.2014

N.B, Fayment by cheque should be crossed and

made payable to 'SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd'.
Ho receipt will be issued unless requested.

Page 1/1

GRAND TOTAL 5 1,043.95

(]

(~!

RButhorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Serwvices Pte Ltd

F BN =



& SmMRT

Our Ref  : TAX/09/14/2089/ML

Date : 08/10/2014
To : Claims Department
From : SMRT Taxis

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC4163B AND GBB5241D ON 12/09/2014 ALONG
KELANTAN LANE CAR PARK

CONFIRMATION OF TAXI RENTAL

This is to confirm the daily taxi rental rate for taxi registration no. SHC4163B is S$133.75/ day.

Kindly proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of this accident.
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Your last login date and time was 13 Sep 2014, DB:29:10.
To return to ONE.MOTORING, please click here.
For security reasons, please CLEAR YOUR CACHE after each session,

Session Transaction History

S/No, Asset AssetlD Asset Transaction Type Transaction Log
Type Owner Amount{S§) Date/Time
1D
; 13 Sep
g . 18.32 Insurance Enguiry
1  Vehicle GBBS241D (GIRO Payment) 5.35 ﬂjﬂﬂfﬁg

Land Transport 2 Authority
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