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Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

B 1000 Yiahn Tndustrid] Park A #01-3747382. Singapore TANTH |
THL 67830142 (VIR TANX aT35TT18 (Y15 Fmoal chmatar@mmgnet com og

GRS T 20 o) | 5800 ROR MOx 20|00 [S8E

M/S:  AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
78 SHENTON WAY Estimate No:  ESI1992183/AMK
£07-16 AIG BUILDING Date- 30 Ot 2019
SINGAPORE 079120 Policy No: DMPPHQI8-007769

TEL: 64193000 FAX: 64153727 Veh Reg No:  SLHT231U

ATTN: Motor Claim Department Muke/Model:  MITSUBISHI LANCER

oy AWAM;%/ EX 1.6 AT LED TAIL
LAMP

WS Ref TPAIG AMK sy J{?m ¢y ChassisNo:  IMYSRCYIAGU005926

Claim Type: Third Party Engine No; 4AQ2CLT7200

Accident Date:  23/092019 24 Reg. Date: 17112016

TP Veh Reg No: SCR3624A

LE]

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLH723101

Description LiPrice
Net Price g

REAR BUMPLER L wei00
HEAR BUMPER CLIP Ata. £ (i
Special Net

REVERSE SENSUOR 200 (0
REAR NUMBER PLATE 35 00
Labour

REMOVE & REFIN REAR BUMPER & 150 i

ATTACHMENTS.KNOUKING & REPAIR REAR END PANEL &

REALIGN THE SAME

PUTTY & RESPRAY REAR BUMPER & JUHD, 1
ATTACHMENTS REVERSE SENSORS & ALL AFFECTEDR

LREAS

* SURVEY VEHICLE AT ANG MO K10 WORKSHOP

OQuantity List Price Amouni
] 55
1PC NOL (W] e
SpC 25N e
O] i
Less 10 9{ sl 23 40
I SET Py 20000 =—
e Ay s o —
23500 23500

LA ELITHT zﬂa(
LA soone 2 jqr

650.00 650 [

Tustal S8 LT 4D

Add GST 4i T 119 &b

Total Amsot Pavable 55 1.B29.06

For Cheng Hoe Maotor Pre Ltd

pﬂ"?p Le

[TATTTHORISERD SIGNA TURE



+ PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

. > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 497D
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SLH7231U
Vehicle to be Exported: MNo
Intended Deregistration Date: 24 Sep 2019
Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Model: LANCEREX 1.6 AT LED TAIL LAMP
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2014
Engine No.: 4A92CL72%90
Chassis No.: JMYSRCY1AGUODO5926
Maximum Power Output: B6.0 kW (115 bhp)
Open Market Value: $14,113.00
Original Registration Date: 17 Nov 2016
First Registration Date: 17 Nov 2014
Transfer Count; 0
Actual ARF Paid: $14.113.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 16 Nov 2026
PARF Rebate Amount: $10,584.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 16 Nov 2026
COE Category: A - Carup to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years); 10
QP Paid: $50,991.00
COE Rebate Amount; $36,441.00
Total Rebate Amount: $47,025.00

Page | of

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Sep 2019

OK

htps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTI...  24-Sep-1'



" PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - SLHTZ31U va SCRISZ4A (01} on 0.0.A: 23002010

?Irm'r. Mo, Vil

“Ta; '-‘:qm-rnq‘hmrf ey A, |-k com)

C#f  Fong Anoy-SY. Chin_ Lme-Ying, Abu Kassmn, Koo Wariess, Arien Syarsedinn. Chir Yoke Shi Lim. Sheag Yang, Mmoosingh Asshweanisetiaurs, Forhiban, Thesrhan, Submmanien. Ds
Sen  WESTOTE 0004 AM

Hi,
W 1aovgy 2541
Please refer o the cnclosed request from Cheng Har Motor Pre Lid (AMK)
Clam no 7 398 1 29T25AS 03 V|
Case Dwpir - Loh Chee Heng P. DD ﬁ

Il yond have any gueriss'concerns, please let us know
Kimaly wxing io axrign Kewmeth Kang ar Single Joint Expert ax regueriod

Thanks & Regard.

Har Wi Bl (Visilai)

AlG

FHOL Ayt |

Bingapors FNOL | Claims Opetation - Auto

T BOOT206558 | Ex 1002200
It Herii e o | pew 10080

From: chmami@singnet.com sy [mailtochmamk@singnet com_sg)

Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2019 10:04 AM

Te: Hor, Yinrul

Ce: Formg, Andy-57; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syarairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashwesnjeetkaur; Parthiban, Theerthan;
Subramaniam, Divyashni, chmamk@singnet com.sg

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING DUR INSURED VEHICLE SCRIG24A AND SLH72310U ON 23/08/2019

Hi Al

Our Selection as follow |
- Kenneth Kong (LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lad)

Thank you.

Rpds

Dotlyn Li

Cheng Hoe Motor Pre Lud (AME)
Tel - 64812001

From: Hor, Yinrul

Sent: Wed, 2§ Sep 2019 00:41:30 +0000

To: chmamkisingnercom.sg

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazainding, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Aashweenjestkaur,
Parthiban, Theersthan, Subramaniam, Divyashni

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SCR3624A AND SLHTZI U ON 234092019

Without Preiudice

Your Reference (SLARSIU

Our Reference £ MOB1 2075650003
Denr Sie'Madarm,

We pefer 1 vour Notice of Accldent of even date.

Wi intend 1 conduct & pre-repale survey of the damage ta your client's/'your customer's vehicle jointly with your ellent'your motor workshop. We propase to use one of the motoe
surveyors named in the attached list fo conduct the joint pre-repair survey us @ single point cxpert:

Name el Survevar Company Name
AlG In House Serveyor AlG Asia Pocific Insurance Pre Lid
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Priority Services
Jeffrey Ong Leng Kint Prionty Services
Tumamy Lee Prionity Services




Lol Automobile Inspection Servioes Pte Lul
Pang Kinh Keen (Frankie) Formiteam Adjusters Fie Lid

{ Mg You'Han Farmieum Adjusers e Lid
Soon HanXin (Gary) Formtzam Adjusters Pie Lud
Chirw: Bo Xiong Formicam Adjusters Pre Lid

[ Chua Sov Teck (Bemamin Formicam Adjusiers Pie Lud
Kalvim Ang LEK Autn Consultnnis Piz Lid
Xing Guo Qlang LKK Aute Consuliants Pie Lid
Mareus Chi LEK Auto Conrulans Pe Lud
Mohsimnd Teulikh LEK Aun Consulmnts Pre Lid
Addrun Ling LEK Auto Consultunts Pre Lid
Mahammed Rasal LEK Auto Conssiltants Pre Lid
Kenmneth Koang LEK Autn Consuliants Pre Lid

Flunlinulkmmdmln[zlmmhnwhﬂumwuhwﬂmyufmmmﬂmmqmﬂuuhlltjulm:rpm.\'uqmyldmmwmumu
\issexl muotir mrveyors. We will beat the cont of the pre-repair survey carried ol by the vingle joint expert

Thanks & Regards,

Mar Yin Bul [Wivana]

ANG

FRCIL Adjmmr |

Sirgapon FMOL | Claim Ooenmlion = Auld

Tl BOO1I085S | Ext 002208
Yoyl Horiliggen | s sio ag

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK) [mailto:chmamk@singnet.com.sg]
Senk: Tuesday, Septambeor 24, 2019 4:52 PM
'lw_i-lur.muh divyashnl subramaniamDsig.com; Mithoosingh, Axshweenjeetikaur; Lim, Sheng Yang; Parthiban, Theerthan; Chan, Yaka Shi; chmotor@sngnet.com,sg; AIG SGP,

Claim-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Repalr Survey (Single Joint Expert) <ELHTZI1U, doa 23/0G/19 (¥r insured SCRIGIA)
This message bs from an external sender; be coutious with links and attachments.

Dwar 5ir,

OUR CLIENT = SLHTIAIU
Doa - 13j09/2019 @ 0840HAS
YOUR INSURED : SCRIEIZA (THAM MAE LAN HILLI

Kindty provide us of your wwrveyer listing for the selection on the survey.
Thiank you.

Rpgards

Dorlyn L

Cheng Hos Moter Pre Lid
Tel SAR12001

Fan : 64821296

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this cmil (and any attachments) is canfidential, 1f you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disserninate the information. If you
hlumdwdlhinmﬂlnm.plmhmnﬁlldymdfymhymr'mdmdpnwmnﬂyddmmmmlmmmﬁnwpmmn
Mmmmumﬂuﬂmy-u:hnmmbdhvﬂbhl'mufmrWﬁmmwm@llﬂommrmmmwmimowhﬂimmﬁv#md
dpenad.hhﬂumpumlhiﬁlyurlhﬁmip’amlI.nmﬂmlhllilitmfrﬂlndnumpﬂn!i'hﬁhrilmpkﬂhywﬂnlnmﬂﬂﬂﬂﬂﬁtﬂp,lnr_ﬂrihmhﬂhﬁﬂ
or affiliates either jointly or severally, for amy loss or domage arising in smy way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

T ifcemnation in min emal (snd ey afachments) & confidants. # you are mot tha i recipen, you mist ol use or dessermais the information. B you have recuived this email in sror, pleass
renaaataly nodiy me nwwmmmmm#ﬂﬂmmummw.mh-ﬂﬂmw are belisved o ba Iree af any yeus of
sitvar dakect that might fect any compuie’ Bysiam il which it in recesved and apened. | i the mesponsiblly of he recipient o ermure that it iB s e 3nd 7o essonsiiny s sccepied by Amencan
e mational Groig, ne. or &y subsadiases o aMilsles uilhes joinily or sewersly, ior any logs or damage srising in sny way from fs uss



172172020 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLH7231U (39612972565G)
[SCR3624A)
i1

TEE HWEE BOON
Sep 23 2019 12:00AM
[THAM MAE LAN JILL]

Cheng Hoe Motor Ple Lid

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [Express) (AlG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 21/01/2020 08:48 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1743.06) - SLH7231U - Claim Handler: Loh, Chee-Heng

Approved:1743.06.

https:/isingapore. merimen.comiclaims/index. cfmMusebox=SVCmall&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=655278434CFTOKEN=21ed 1Md3c05467-B6C...



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Casg | Motified Est Sutmitted hed| Assigned Ad) Rpt Aidj Submitted Lns Auth'sd Status
Yor
. 23 Sep 2019 ﬁ:ﬁp s 5$1,509.40 | 5$1,509.40 Punsding for Survey
I in st Reg_ | e Ay met | gt Estimarns | | view aze | Come | |

Hain

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

tnsured THAM MAE LAN JILL, [0 S1601336F

Min :

o e, |TEE HWEE BOON,  ID: 526164970

Vehicle Reg . | 23092018 00:00 - 158

No.: SLH7231U Date of LOSS: |34 Months and & Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r))
Claim Type: | TP / 39612972565G FaCHCOUT | (Comprahensive)

Vetucis Reg.

Mo SCR3624A E‘“"""; ). |OMPPHQ18-007769

!l_n.lurld]: | -

| = Excess:

|Regairer. | Chang Moe Moter Pte Ltd (Yishun) Bik 1019 901-374/382, Yishun Industrial Purk A, 768761 Yishun - Tel, 6755 6142
Handing | A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419:3000 .. [Handied by Loh, Chee-Heng] Chee:Heng Lohaig com
;:umzn EQ Insurance Company Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 223 3413

Adjustor: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 _ [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 04/10/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case mas |

» AJG_SG_EXPRESS (21/01/2020): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved {S$1743.06) - SLH7231U - Clalm Handler: Lah, Chee-H...
* AIG_SG (28/09/2019): Request To Upload TP GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Searen Tasks | Create New Task | Compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group  Subject  Handler  Assigned By Campleted Dn Crested On  Dona?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ds... 4/2/2020



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLH7231U (39612972565G)
[SCR3624A]
TP

TEE HWEE BOON
Sep 23 2019 12:00AM
[THAM MAE LAN JILL]

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

umﬂ-nnml um-lhmitnﬂmhlnmnr| wm‘ umml

Page | of 2

|

Letters/Correspondences ME
ho | Finalired On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
| [Draft) Third Party Express Settiamant - Payment Breakdown ‘ Ednt
Assessment Reports iperpage  |~]| B2
[We [Finaliz=s On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 180120 1300 | Adjuster Immediate Advics i Load HTM
Photos/ Images Jperpage [v] M
Fo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
{1 |own19 11:25 Odameter Reading Q| wews | A
7 |owi/39 3025 Chassis Number O waws | HA
3 |ou/i1/19 11025 General View 0| edwc | |
4 |01/11/19 11:2% General View 0 | tosdwc | B
5 |04/11/1911:25 | Genersl View 0| waews | B
& |oi/11/19 11025 Goneral View 0| s | B
7 |(oW111911:35 | General View O werws | B
g |o1/11/19 11028 General View Q| waews | A
9 |08/11/1911:25 | Genersl View 0| adrc | A
10 |01/11/1911:25 | General View @ weivs | B
11 |o1s11/19 11025 Goneral View 0| waws | A
12 |pa/11/19 13035 General View Q| e | A
11 |01/11/19 11:25 General View 0| waaws |
14 |oa/11/19 11:2% Ganeral View 0| tades | B
15 |00/11/19 11:25 | General View 0| towdes | A
16 |01/11/19 11:25 | General View @ | advs | B
17 |D8/11/19 11:25 Ganeral View 0| tcadrs | A
18 | 1/01/20 12:51 Rolnspection Photo 0D | lcadire | A
19 |18/01/20 12:51 Reinspection Photo g ad G | BA
Documentation L1 per poge | &
No |Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auts Consultants Pts Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
1 |35/09/19 15:44 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 25092019 ﬁ Loag POF
I |3ys/1%05:07 | TP GIA REPORT 8 | ioad PO
3 DLI10/19 15:31 EMAIL TO OI Load POF
4 |p1/10/19 1531 LETTER TO O1 Load POF
5 |31/10/19 16:56 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load PDF
6 | 1B/D1/20 12:58 TP LOD Load POF
7 |nmiao019:39 EMAIL TO TP Load POF
] D4/02/30 13:37 WORKSHOP INVODICE Load PDF
8 |Daj02/20 11:37 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Lbad POF
10 |o4/02720 11:37 Release Voucher Load POF
11 |o4/m2/20 11:37 LTA SEARCH Load POF
12 |oamean 11:37 LOD Load POF
Ne | Finailzed On AlG Asis Pacific Insurance Pts. Ltd. (SG) Thismbnall | Brint
1 26/09/19 16:19 01 GIA REPORT ﬂ Load PDF

Documents Checklist

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 4/2/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | save | poime |
Imu are no document checklists configured

Dur Checkllst Remarks - LIKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HG)

Show Memarks To: L] Handiing Insurer

Pyt Eerean g aeN el asiEEs gmu shioe i 0 oifser G,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 4/2/2020



Page 1 of 1

Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|'u‘nhilnln No: SCR3624A (Insd veh) Model: SUBISHI LANCER 1.6 EX
SLH7231U (TP veh) T LED TAIL LAMP (A)
| Date of Accident: | 23/09/2019
Global Sum Settiement [ | [ ] Yes | [x] No
Repair Estimate - 1.829.06|
Final Repair Cost . 8 1,615.08
Loss of Use : § 120.00 2.00 days at 560.00 per day
Rental (if any) 3 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee k- 8.00
Others 5 0.00
%
Final Settlament Sum 3 1,743.06
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X] YES [ ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liahility [%a)
Appl :Yes/ Ne BOLA Scenario No.
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: Bozl':" Db -
BOLA Liability: _ 100____ (%) Assessed Liability ("} (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1} |Cheng Hoe Maotor Ple Lid - 1,743.06
2) -
3 -
04 Feb
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020 _
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=8SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do... 4/2/2020



Adjuster Report Page |1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreqna 1sseo7108m)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel; 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Fila No: CC4/AIG19016911/KHS5302

Date: 04/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SLH7231U Insured Vehicle No : SCR3824A
Dale of Loss 23/08/2018 Mature of Claim TP Claim No: 398128725656
Reg No: SLH7T231U
Make & Model mspuﬁffm LANCER, 1.6 EX AT LED TAIL Engine No: 4AQ2CLT290
Reg. Date: 17/11/2016 (Man. Year. 2016) Chassis No: JMYSRCY1AGUO05926
Colour Metallic Grey Odometer: 73190 km
Engine Capacity: 1590 cc
Markei Value/New Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
I F Hi AT THE TI F
General Condition. Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: Ne Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R18
Front Left Side: Continental 8 mm Rear Lefi Side Continental 8 mm
Front Right Side: Continental 8 mm Rear Right Side: Continental B mm
Tha above valtes represent the remaining fyre ireads deplh
'COST OF CLAIMS B Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %!
Parts 1,059.40 1,058 40 0,00 0.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 650.00 450.00 200.00 30.77
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 1,709.40 1.509.40 200.00 11.70
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 119,68 105.68 14 00 11.70
Nett Amount (S$) 1,829.06 1,615.06 214.00 11.70
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x $560.00/day) (S$) 120.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) B.0D
Nett Liability (S8) 1,743.06
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmenl: 25/08/2019
Date Inspeciad: 30102018 Inspected Al Cheng Hoe Mator Pte Ltd (Yishun)
Blk 1019 #01-374/382, Yishun
Industrial Park A
Singapore TE8761
Estimated Period of Repair 2.0 days
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE' This report represanis our findings af fhe ime and place of inspeciion shled hersin Such mspection hag been camied out fo the bext of aur
knowiadpe and ability bur any othar Nabiify under any other circumstances /s hersdy expressly excluded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo.  Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
11 *REAR BUMPER Buckled 891.00FN “891.00FN
2 5 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 25.00FN *25.00FN
i o1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 200.00FS *200.00FS
4 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE Bent 3500FS *35.00FS
FeFranchise part. S=Spchett N=NeitllemDisc
Sub Total (S%) 1,151.00 1,151.00
- Nett Item Discount on N ltems 10.00/10.00% (S$§) 91.60 91.60
Total Parts (S§) 1,059.40 1,059.40

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellansous ilems selected.

Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type

Repalrer's

Page 4 of 4

Labour ltems
1 REMOVE & REFIX REAR BUMPER & New

ATTACHMENTS KNOCKING & REPAIR REAR END PANEL
& REALIGN THE SAME

2 PUTTY & RESPRAY REAR BUMPER & MNew
ATTACHMENTS REVERSE SENSORS & ALL AFFECTED
AREAS

350.00

300.00

200.00

250.00

Gross Labour Cost (S§)

650.00

450.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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