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KAY MOTOR

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-46

SINGAPORE 575644

Tel: 6458 2283 Fax: 6459 8863
Email:kayautosg@yahoo.com

Loh Kham Hwa

26 September 2015

Estimate To Repair Toyota Altis — SML 6557

1pc a/s front door
1pc ofs rear door
Less 25%

To remove & refit ofs door glasss & auto mechanism.

To repair & panelbeat o/fs runner board panal,
remove & fit o/s front & rear door
To spray painting on o/s front & rear doors

|Dollars Three Thousand & Forty Two & Cents Eighty One Only)

Aoy WJ..,M
Ketovy 80p00y
%4,

ff $ 125230 ~— v

A 121185 T

1892.81

12000« O

aso.00 Fooy
S5000 54

Total: 5 3041.81



PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - SMLESST vs SMNIITEL (O} on D.O.A: 21/0%2019

Fr;ﬁ- Hﬁ.‘w

Fa ‘s s R cOnT Bmin A JRaemin-ad ke com)

Cx  Eong Andy-5Y. Chin, Lee-Ying, At siasim, Moor Mariess. Asian Syasseding. Char Yoks ik, Lim_ Sheng Yang, Milhoosngh. Asshweanjeaikar. Parhasn. Thesnhan, Sieamaniam, Div:
Bank  OR2ST0M0 102540 AM

Amacrrwrts o) gl joig 8 i) g0 el o] meiEtine M meies s meliling

Hi,
Fiease refer to the enclosod regquest from Kay Minar
P Terzq
Claim no IT1I0R 64056003
Case Owner - Loh Chee Heng T ”-I'Hnﬁ.-q

If you have sny queries‘concers, phease [61 w know
Kindlly gasist i geyign Kenmenh Kang ar Single Joint Expert an reguesiod V. Oukd

e Vv

Thanks & Esgardy,

Har i Rl [Wivlana)

AlG

FHOL Adier |

Hingapory FROL | Claimy Opamtons - &utn

Thet: BCITI0ESSS | Exl: 10CTI0A
Ty ey o | wa B8

From: kayautesgiiyahoa com [ maito:kayautosg Byahoo.com]

Sent: Wednesday, Septermnber 25, 2019 10:14 AM

To: Hor, Yierul

Subject: RE: PRE-AEPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMATTLIAL AND SMLGSST ON 21/09/2019

i Miss Hor,
Thanks you for the prompt reply and we would select LEK Auto Consultams P L - Mr Kenneth Kong to survey our clients’ vehicle SML 6357
soanes possibie

Thanks you!

From: Hor, Yinmul

Sent; Wed, 25 Sop 2019 00:35:29 +0000

To: kayautosgiavahoo.com

Ce: Fong, Andy-8Y, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kassim. Noor Maresa, Azlan, Syszuirdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Anshweenjeetkaur,
Parthiban, Theenhan, Subremaniaom, Divyashm

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SMNI3| 8L AND SMLESST ON 21092019

Witk Prejusdics

Your Reflerence L SMLASST

Onr Reference L 1713091 B40SG003
Dear SitMadam.

W refer 1o vour Notice of Accident of even datc

We intend 1o conduct § pre-repair survey of e damge (o your client's'vour custommer s vehicle jointly with your clientiyour motor workshop, We propose (0 use one of the motor
survieyar named in the attached list to condeset the joint pre-repair survey as o single joint expert:

Name of Surveyor Company Nume

AlG In House Surveyor AIG Asis Paciflc Insurunce Pre Lid
iﬂm N Chan Kee Priorty Services

Jeffrey Ong Leng Kiat Priarity Services

Hmmy Lee Priarity Services

EC Lool Automobile Inspection Services Pie Lid
Pang Kial Keen (Frankie) Formteam Adjusiers Pie Lid

N You Flan Formteam Adjusters Pie Lid

Soon HanXin (Gary) Formicam Adjusiers Pe Lid

Chow Bo Xiang Formtesm Adjusters Ple Lid

Chua Soc Teck (Benjamin) Formizam Adjusters Pie Lid

Kalvin Ang LKK Auto Conpultunty Pte Lid

Xing Gue Qimng LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Marcus Chuon LEKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
Matamad Taulikh LKK Awto Consultants Ple Lid

Adrian Ling LKK Auto Consultanis Pic Lid
Mahammed Rasul_| LKK Auio Consulianes Fie Lid =




| Kenneth Kong | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid |

rﬂu HEMMnmmmwmmwhh appointment of sny of thess molor surveyors &d & singlo jomt expert. You may select ona or more of the
listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cont of the pre-repair survey carmied out by the single jnint expert

Thanks & Regards,

Har Yoo Rl [Wivizins)

AlG

FhO, Az |

Sevgupoe FMOL | Clamg Oporsiions - Aul

Tal: BO01I0SS5E | Eat WOOIT0R
Imnlbardgdun | we asay

From: kayautosgiyahoo,com |mailto-kayautosg @yahoo.com)

Sent: Tuesday, Septernber 24, 2019 4:48 FM

To: ClaimsDocManagement

Subject: [EXTERNAL] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML B55T & SMN 3318 AT BLK 215 AMK AVE | CARPARK ON 21-05-2019

This message bs from an extornil sonder; be cantlous with lnks and attachments,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Raf: SML 38T

Ananbon | Mator Claims Depariment

Dear Sir

W rafar to the above socident

Kindly arrange lor your assessor o survey our chenls’ vehicls -SMLESST

al our promises -Kay Molor of Block 9 #0148

Sin Ming Indusinal Estale, Singapore STS044 Tel B458 7283 Fax: 68450 8863
‘soonasl posaibés,

Attachad herewith the third party intter, GIA repart & LTS ssarch lor your attsntion.

Your ninceraly
Toreaa Lim
Ky Mator

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any atiachmenis) is confidential, If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use of disseminute the tnformation. If you
have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by “Reply” command and permanently delete the origingl and any copics or printouts thereof.
Althoogh this email and mmy sitachments are believed 1o be froe of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system frto which it is recetved mnd
opened, it in the respansibility of the recipient to ensure that it is viras frec and no responsibility is sccepted by American International Group. Ine. or its subsidiaries
or afliliates cither jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in sny way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Tha inferrnation in tis smail (and any ettachrerts) & confidental i you s nol Be (Fended cipent, you must not use or desemnat T inermation. § you hes oo s sl n eror, plenss
mmadiatedy rohity me &y "Raply” command and permansntly delete the anginal and any copies o prAntouts thoses!, Alibough this small and any afachma s am befeed 1o be freo of Bmy v o
oifves datect thal might affect any compauter sysiem indo which if i received mnd cosned. i is the resporssiity of (he recipent to snaure thel it s virs fres Bnd no responaitelly i accepted by American
intmrnahonl Groug. Ine. of il subsickeries of afflliates sher joindy of severally for sy o o demage wrising m any wey imm i use.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 8:54 AM

To: Theresa Lim

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 655T & SMN 3318L ON 21-09-2019
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Madaom,
We refer to the above matier.

Please be informed that basing cn the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA [subject to BOLA guideline setlement] and shall proceed with direct settflement for the above
mentioned case,

Please note that this e-mail Is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Please note that all finglisation subject insurer's approval,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings, No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Khanchna Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaa lkkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Theresa Lim <teresa.lim.chi@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 November 2019 4:53 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 655T & SMN 33181 ON 21-09-2019

Noted with thanks

On Fri. Nov 15, 2019, 16:50 Khanchna (LKK Autc) <khanchna/a lkkauto.com=> wrote:




. WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ms. Theresa,
We are in the midst of liaising with our Insured on liability and will revert promptly.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, therealtér, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchnal Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaw lkkauo.com Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Theresa Lim <teresa. lim.ch/@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday. 8 November 2019 12:20 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@ lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 655T & SMN 3318L ON 21-09-2019

Dear Ms Khanchna,

As spoken to vou carlier, we attached the 1.OD and other relevant

documents for vour perusal



Kindly let us hear from vou soon

Thanks & Regards
Teresa

Kay Motor
Tel:6458 2283

Fax: 6459 8863



Khanchna SLHK Autol

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 15 November 2019 4:45 PM

To: JANETS098@HOTMAILCOM

Cc Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN3218L & SMLBESST ON 21/09/2019 ALONG/AT BLK 215 ANG
MO KIO AVE 1 CARPARK

Tm:klng: Recipient Delivery
JANETS088@HOTMAILCOM
Admin A
shupei@kkauto.com Delivered: 15/11/2019 445 PM
alivialau@kkauto com Delivered. 15/11/2019 4:45 PM
Mellwan @ lkkauto.com Delivered: 15/11/2019 445 PM

OUR REF: CC4/AIG19016904/Kkb3

YUEN WAI FOO
|POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN3318L & SML655T ON 21/09/2019 ALONG/AT BLK 215 ANG MO KIO AVE 1 CARPARK

We refer to the above subject matter, We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim against your motor insurance paolicy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liabllity is not in your favour. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount [NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 5:01 PM

To: Yahoo

Cc Janet Lim; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN3318L & SMLESST ON 21/09/2019 ALONG/AT BLK 215
ANG MO KIO AVE 1 CARPARK

Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Yahoo
Janet Lim
Admin A
Melkwan@lkkauto com Delivered. 26/11/2019 5:02 PM
shupei@lkkauto com Delivered: 26/11/2019 5:02 PM
olivislau@lkkauto com Delivered: 26/11/2019 502 PM

Dear Mr. Dave,

We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we noted that the vehicle driver was reversing to park and the driver that is
reversing bears the burden to keep a proper lookout and reverse only when it is safe to do so.

As such, we opine that liability is not In our favour and we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party
claim at best terms.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408933)

From: Yahoo . <daveyuen2009@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 23 November 2019 4:31 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Janet Lim <janet5098 @hotmail.com:>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN3318L & SML655T ON 21/09/2019 ALONG/AT BLK 215 ANG MO KIO AVE 1
CARPARK

Hi..

Regarding below:

As our vehicle was in reverse motion.

SML6E55T say in their report that their vehicle is stationary.
Thus this incident happens.

She would have horn or slight reversing

to prevent this incident,



She is also having a clear view ahead.
Wonder why she come close without
Preventive measures taken,

| wonder why liability is on me.

Regards

Dave Yuen
Hp:87527538
(Policy holder)

Sent from my iPhone

On 15 Nov 2019, at 8:26 PM, Janet Lim <janet5098 @hotmall.com> wrote:

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Khanchna [LKK Auto)" <khanchna®|kkauto.com>
Date: 15 November 2019 at 4:44:48 PM MYT

To: "JANETS098@HOTMAIL.COM" HOTMAIL.COM>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com:»

Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN3318L & SML655T ON 21/09/2019 ALONG/AT BLK
215 ANG MO KIO AVE 1 CARPARK

OUR REF: CC4/AIG19016904/Kkb3

YUEN WAI FOO
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN3318L & SML655T ON 21/09/2019 ALONG/AT BLK 215 ANG
MO KIO AVE 1 CARPARK

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss
adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with
the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not

in your favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
the Third Party.



Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries,

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



12172019 Adjuster Immediate Advice

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icsreg e esenr ser)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8806 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauta.com

To . AIG Asia Pacilic Insurance Pte. Lid,

Attn : Loh, Chee-Hang

Your Ref 171309164056

Our Ref : CC4/AIG19016004/KKB3

Date : 17 Dec 2019 "WITHOUT PREJUDICE™

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN3318L & SML655T ON 21/09/2019
Rafer to the above accident

The accident occurred when our insured driver reversed and collided into third party vehicle [BOLA 24- liability down). We
nave clanfied with the Ol on the nature of the accdent and ha/she 15 aware that histher NCD would be affected.,

On behalf of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid., we have successfully / not successfully carried oul TP Express
Settlement between your insured (vehicle no. SMMN3318L) and third party claimant (vehicle no. SMLESST).

Summary of offer made to workshop Kay Motor is as follows -

Claimad Revised

Cos! af Repairs § 304281 § 188923
Lose of Use (4 days x 5120) § 48000 % 240.00 ( 4 days x $60)

LTA Search lee - 745 § 7.45

Total $ 353026 % 2145.687

Amount of claim at Liability 100% $ 214668

Endosa harewith the relavan! supporting documenis for your parusal.
" 4 days recommendalion for repair

For your approval please.

Regards,

Khanchna Pothura
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

hitps-Nsingapore. menmen com/clamsindax, cim Tesebox=SV Cdock fuseaction=dsp_viewarsmartAnoimgviewer=18ltype=2&docid=502524858pr. 1



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

——————————————————————————

From: Ehanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 1:23 PM

To: Theresa Lim’

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 6557 & SMN 3318L ON 21-09-2019

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matier.

We propose settlement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair $ 1.899.23
2. Loss of Use (4 days x $40) $ 240.00
3. LTA Search Fee ] 7.45

Total $ 2.144.68

Please confirm acceplance,

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoeves, should be deemed [ inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, aither party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

« Wishing you @ Happy ana rrasperous Lunar New Yegq, +

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 | email: Khanchna@lkkauto com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Theresa Lim <teresa.lim.ch@gmail.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 5:19 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 6557 & SMN 3318L ON 21-09-2019



11412020 Mariman &-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associated wilh .

"SMLESST (17130916405G)
[SMN3318L]
TP

LOH KHAM HWA
Sep 21 2019 1.00PM
[YUEN WAI FOO]
Kay Motar

From AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pie, Lid. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), senl on 18/12/2019 08:47 AM.
To LEK_HOQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$2146.68) - SML6E55T - Claim Handler: Loh, Chee-Heng

/Approved: 2146.68.

nitps:{singapone. marmen, comiclaimsindex. ofm Plussbox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Prim&CFID=65560381ACFTOKEN=dblcBaccSedbBidT-502



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastipne

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Notified £t Submited | Adj Assigrad Ad| Rpt Ad| Submitted | Ins Auth'ed | Statin
g |39Sen 2018 A aap A 541,899,221 | $$1,899.22 Pending for Survay
_fan e | Eant s nee | o tstmates | | _viem ae | cancel Case |

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Ingured: YUEN WAI FOO, [D: 513577370

Mam -
Claimant: LOM KHAM HWA, 10: SO0G0667]

Viehicle ~[21/09/2019 13:00 - 58
Mo O |SMLESST Date of Los: | 14" Months and 18 Days From LTA Reg Dats (Man ¥r]]
Claim Type: |TP / 17130916405G palcy/Cover || comprenensive)
Vehicle Aeg
pio. SMNIZIBL ""'CI"' ”‘” P22B1409
[Insured):

Excess:

Repairer: Kay Motor (HQ) BLE 9 S1N MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-46, 565744 Sin Ming - Tel:

handlfd | AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel; 65-6410-3000 .. [Handied by Loh, Chee-Heng] Ches-Heng Loh@alg com

CIMmAnts | AxA Insurance Pta Ltd (HQ) - Tel- 6880 4688
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ] - Tel 6256-3561 . [Handied &y KENNETH KONG] [ﬁml Rpt due 04/10/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED wiew Al |  Compose Case Mail |

« AIG_SG_ENPRESS (18/12/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (§$1146.68) - SMLASST - Claim Handler: Loh, Chee-He...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Seorch Tasks | Create ew Task | Comotete |

Due Date Priarity Typa Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No resulls.

https://singapore.merimen.comv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 18/2/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SML655T (17130916405G)
[SMN3318L]
TP
LOH KHAM HWA
Sep 21 2019 1:00PM

Page 1 of 2

[YUEN WAI FOO]
Kay Motor
Usload Documents | Upissd Photos | Compase wew Latsar | upiosa viose | _uoiosd Auais | Wiew [vew 1 Browser| v |
Video 11 ~| &
Mo | Finalized On ALG Asis Pacific Insurance Pto. Ltd. (SG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |07/11/48 15:27 | Video - Accident i Load MRS
Letters/ Correspondences 1 per page ‘E %]
Mo | Fnslaed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) Thumbnall | Print

1 |(Dran) Third Party Express Settlement — Payment Graakdown O e

Assessment Reports 1 ~+]| EA

No | Finakized On LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print

1 [17/12/19 15:40 | Adjuster Immediate Advice Load HTM

Photos/Images 3 &

No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) T [ Thumbnail |Print

1 [1712/1915:23 | Genarsl View 0| e |

: 1112191523 Genersl View Q| ivc | B

3 |12121915:23 | General View Q| kaws | B

4 |1r121915:23 | General View 0| wuars | B

s |inzeisa Ganeral View 0| waawc | A

& |17/12/1915:21 | Genaral View 0| weaws | B

7 |17/12/1815:21 | Genersl View Q| tadwc | A

B |1712/1915:23 | General View g load PG | BA

9 |17/12/1915:23 | General View 0| weaws | @

10 |17/12/1915:23 | Ganersl View @ | waarwc | @A

11 [17/12/1915:23 | General View @ | weawc | A

12 |17712019 15:23 General View 0| wadwc | A

13 | 17/12/19 15:23 Ganeral View ﬁ Load 3rG | BA

14 171219 15:23 | Genernl View 0| wedwc | A

Documentation 1 per u-r_.ﬂ il

Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print

1 |25/09/1% 15:14 | EMAIL FROM AlG DD 25092019 Load POF

7 |25/09/15 15114 | NOTICE & GIA REPORT Load POF

3 |15/10/19 16:46 | EMAIL TO O Load POF

4 |17/12/1915:21 | LOD, FINAL REPATR BILL, LTA SEARCH, ATA Load POF

5 |17/1219 1541 | TP ESTIMATE MARKED Load PDF

6 |18/02/20 10:02 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Lond POF

7 |18/02/20 10:02 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

] 18/02/20 10:02 Release Voucher Load PDF

§ |18/02/20 10:02 LTA SEARCH a Load POF

10 |so2o010:02 (LoD Load POF

Ne | Finalized On ALG Asla Pucific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (SG) Thumbnail | Print

1 |26/09/19 16:38 | O GIA REPORT [ B |
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST peset | Save | print |

There are no document checklists configured.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_...
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Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Our Checklist Remarks - )]

Show Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer

NoAE | REMarss i=T PriVEIE NN you show ® in pther pertes

https://singapore. merimen.conv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 18/2/2020



Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[".Flhlch No: SMN3318L (Insd veh) Modal: TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS
SMLE5ST (TP veh) 1.6 ELEGANCE (A)

| Date of Accident: | 21/09/2019

Global Sum Settiement [ | | ] Yes | (%] No

Repair Estimate : 8 3.042.81

Final Repair Cost - $ 1.888.23

Loss of Use -5 240.00 4.00 days at $60.00 per day

Rental (if any) 3 0.00 days

LTA | GIA Search Fes - 7.45

Others: . 3 0.00

5|
Final Settlement Sum - 2.146.68

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes!/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (") (%)
* Assessed Liability o be filled only for chain collisions and for cases whera BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Kay Motor - 3| 2,146.68
2] ' §
3) -
18 Fab
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LEK Auto Consullants Pte Ltd Date

Flease attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 18/2/2020
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico regne 1eseorisen)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: B844-8805 Email: sur@@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/AIG18016804/KKS302

Date: 18/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant ’
Vehicle No : SMLB55T Insured Vehicle No : SMN3318L
Date of Loss: 21/0972019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 171308184056
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMLB5ST
Make & Model: TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS, 1.6 Elegance (A) Engine No. 1ZROD4T063
Req. Date: 03/05/2019 (Man. Year: 2019) Chassis No. MRO53REHE04596601
Colour: Metallic Red Odometer: 4532 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S5): Market Valuae/New Car Price
| F I
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable) Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size: 215M5 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/45 R17
Front Left Side: Michealin 9 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 8 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Righl Side Michelin & mm
The above values represent the mmavung fyme [reads depfh
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1,882.81 839.22 B853.59 50.38
Miscellaneous liems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,150.00 860,00 190.00 16.52
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (5§) 3,042.81 1,899.22 1,143.59 37.58
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x S560.00/day) (5%) 240.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (5%) 7.45
Nett Liability (S%) 2,146.67
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 25/08/2019
Date Inspected: 26/08/2018 Inspected Al Kay Motor (HQ)
BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL
ESTATE #01-48
Singapore 565744
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Khanchna Pothura)

NOTE: This report epresents our findinga af the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has bean carried oul to the bes! of our
knowiedge and ahilty but any other labiily under ary othar circumstances i hersby expressly exciudsd

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 18/2/2020
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *0/S FRONT DOCR Bent 1.262.30FL *1.252.30FL
2 1 *0/S REAR DOOR Bent 1.271.45FL *-FL
F=Franchise part. L=ListiemDisc
Sub Total (55) 2,523.75 1,252.30
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (5%) 630.94 31308
Total Parts {S5§) 1,892.81 939.22

Report was unsubmitied during this print-oul.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 18/2/2020



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

Thare are no new miscellanecus ltems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & REFIT O/S DOOR GLASS & AUTO New 120.00 60.00
MECHANISM
2 TO REPAIR & PANELBEAT O/S RUBBER BOARD New 480.00 400.00
PANEL,REMOVE & FIT O/S FRONT & REAR DOOR
3 TO SPRAY PAINTING ON OfS FRONT & REAR DOORS New 550.00 500.00
Gross Labour Cost {S5) 1,150.00 960.00
[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 18/2/2020



