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MS‘ Fi rs tca Pitai M5 First Capltal Insurance Limited coreg mo. 1950000000 65T feg b M2-0O01676.0

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D48580
Tel: (65)6222 2311 Fax |65) 6222 3547

Ulaims & Merlor Underwriling Depr: 36 Rebinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65} 6507 3848 Fao: (65) 6507 3049
wiww mafirstrapitaleom.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

24-09-2018 Our Ref No. D19006139MFSH
24-09-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC17172 Third Party Vehicle, GBD4134B

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK C #01-43 AUTOBAY@KAKI BUKIT
REENA
67479241/ 0 Fax No. 67417276

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NEW HOCK TECK

. NI
MOTOR PTE LTD Attention. NIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Yvonne Wung (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, December 09, 2019 4:30 PM
To: ‘admin@nhtmotor.com’

Ce: SUR

Subject: Vehicle no: GBD41348 DOA: 24/09/2019
Hi Sukyi

Confirm L/S $5400.00 @ 7 repair days.

Kindly send final invoice and all supporting documents directly to MSFIRST CAPITAL
INSURANCE.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4084033)



Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, December 09, 2019 3:59 PM

To: ‘CWS Maotor Claims’

Cc: 'Joanne Yong'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006139MFSH/1 GBD4134B
Attachments: GBD41348 DOA 24092019 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sirf Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBD41348
Date of survey : 25/09/2019
Number of days : 7 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: ba56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 4:02 PM

To: 'CWS5 Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006139MFSH/1 GBD4134B

Dear Sir, Mdm
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBD4134B on 25/05/2019.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.



Yvonne Wnng (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 4:02 PM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims'

Ce: 'Joanne Yong'; SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006139MFSH/1 GBD4134B
Dear Sir,Mdm

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBD4134B on 25/09/2019.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-35601 | email: ywonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2019 2:14 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006139MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone; 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)



From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 12:22 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cec: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19006139MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWw.avg.com
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51 UBIAVE 1, m01-25 PAYA LRI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (1865 62564315

Your Ref: D19006139MFSH Date: 09 Dec 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI11901689/Avd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Lid

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __GBD4134B .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 25/09/2019 at the premises of M/s NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD. and have
the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§ 20.776.40 .
Revised Estimate Amount 5% 5.387.98
“Check” ltems Amount (5% -

Market Value : S8 -

LTA Reimbursement Value 158 -

Nett Value :S§ -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATAI
Licensed Appraiser



SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Any false reporting may be referred lo the Police for investhigation.

reparn wil be i by M2 [nBUrers of the GlA Records Mananemen! Cenlrs ssiabhahar & (Seneral irsurance Association

fe= B& made svailable ur application by inlatesiad ¢

algresald

Date Of Report 24/09/2048 1750

Date Of Accident 24032013 14

Exact Location Of Accident 38 JOO CHIAT PLACE

Country/Siate of Loss EINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Mumbear GBD4134B

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registerad Owner GUAN HOE SOON RESTAURANT
Co Reqg Mo 025075000

Email Address WOERMAIL

IMobile Phona Mo

ve Fhone No OFFICE-53442781

Alternat

Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Nndel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle wes

iming under your own insurance policy
yaur vehlela?

IF Mo, Please slate action 1o e laker et
P COMMERCIAL WEHICLE
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OFPERATIVE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Palicy MO

Pohcy Mumber S084645457-03

Cover Note Mumber

Driver

Mame of Drive CU YONG KENG 3UN

MNRIC No

[#3]

1602782
Data Of Birth 25f07M19R3
Cecupation INDOOR

Dste Of Driving Pass 147011081

Driving Experience 16 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS

Mobile Mumber (LOCAL) +65-97322018
Fax Mumber
Comact Mumber

EMail Address NOEMAIL



7614

EA 47014
Vag driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES
It Mo Relationship of the Driver wilk the Insured
Yehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
ehicle .
1SUranGe o pa af Dinve o ehicle
General Information of the Accident
Type OF Aceident HIT AND RUSN /VANDALISM | DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
Vesther Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
‘Was any foreign vehicle involved i this accident?  WNO

Number of vahicles {including own vehicle
inwalved in the accidant

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO)

Was any ||'-j_L'rE‘d conveyed to hospital by MO

ambulance?

Was any other material or properly damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown personis) NS

solcitingfoffering accident claims assistance

Mumber of Passengers (Including Dnver)

Details of Police Action

WWas the accident reporied to the police? MO
If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? M
If ¥es against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

MY VEHICLE WAS PARKED STATIONARY ALONMG THE PARALLEL PARKING OF JOO CHIAT FLACE QUTSIDE SHOP
NO.38. SUDDEMLY, | HEARD A LOUD BANG AND | WENT QUT TO REALISED THAT MY VEHICLE WAS BEING HIT.
SHORTLY AFTER, DRIVER B MADE AN LU-TURN BACK TO LOOK FCR ME, WE EXCHANGED PARTICULARS AND AGREED
THAT | CLAIM AGAINST HIS INSURANCE.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? MO

Was there any audio recorded? MO

Vehicle Registration Mumber SHC1T17Z
Wehicle MakeModel/Colour

Details Of Propertias VEHICLE B
Vehicle Category TAX]

Mame of Driver
MNRIC/Pazzport Number
Cantact Mumber

Addrass

Posteode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)



KETCH FLA

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Please report gorrectly the details of the accigent te speed up the claims orocess

This Farm st be complated by the Policyhglder and/or the Authorsed Gr

lrfGringtion g ovided must oe 35 (rgghful and accurate as possibbe. Amy wittsl mesrec-esentation o withholding of materiz|

facts mey allow (nsurance companies to repudiate policy lighility.

4 The izsue and acceplance of this Form by insurence comparties is rot an admission of pelicy lability on the part of the nsurance
Companhgs.

5. Any false reporting may be referred o the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Centre extablished by the General Insurance
Assoclation of Singapore (GIA] Tor archiving and that capies of this repart will for a fee be made available upon application by
Imerested parties.

bl

Ly

7. By the ledgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre and o topies of
the repast belng made available aforesald.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Pratection Act [POPA|
| understand, acknowledge, agres anc consent that:

{2] My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assottation of Singapore [“GHA“] may/ere permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my persanal data/personzl information set cut in this [form) and any other persenal lnformation
orovided by me or possessed by my insurer [collectively the “Personal Informatian”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information T 2l insurer(s) who have Insured vehicle(s] invalved in this accident (3]l insurers) who have insured
vehicia(s) invalved In this accident shall be collectively referrad to as the "Insurers™), the nsurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Manetary Authority of Slagapore and any relevant gevernment agency/authority (such as the police), for the purposeis)
of:

I} precessing, handling snd/for dealing with my claims including the settlement of the clalms and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i} investigating the accident andfor my clalms;
tiii) carrying out and/or deafing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv} administering my claims (including the malling of correspendence, statemants, invoices, reports or notlices Lo me,
which could involve disclosure of ¢ertaln personal data sbout me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on tha
externzl cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(v} complying with applicable law in adm|nistering, processing, handling andfor dealing with my claims. leollectively the
“Purposes”)

to} &l insureris) who have insured vehiclels) Inveived in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law flrms, mayfare permitted
to collect, use, disclase and/or oracess my Persanal Information for one or mere of the abeve Purposes; snd

€] my Personal Infarmation may/can be disclosed by any of the lnsurars and/for GIA to thelr third party service providers or
agentsfincluding their lawyersTaw firms), which may ba sited outsids of Singaporse, far one or more of the abave Purposes.

{d} my Personal information wil alse be colfected and used 1o semplle dalms history for the purpase of fraud detection,
inVestigation and management in present and all future claims.

=) theinformation so collected under (2] above may be shared [/ disclosed:

18 o allinsurers andfor any other third parties that assist In evaluating, irvestigating, cantrolling ar managing fraud,
reguiatars, law enforcemant and gavernment sgancles as reasonably required for the purposes stated, ar

(1} far complying with requirements under any regulations, faws or court orders.

Paleyheldar's Sigraturs Driver's Signature 5 Reparting Centre Persornel’s Signature
Date & Time (1§ driver is not the pelicyholdar) Marne:
Cara & Time: NRIC/FIN Na.:
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

J_ _I

My OO WU povked Sedoney 010G e fONONY

ey of 1O ONGS o okt 0P 0. 36

Sddeny .\ end g \oud YoM v\ perd Qi |

ol e g YeNEE W DONg .

AW e, ey B owade 0 v backe 10 00 Py

e WP frevanged YUY o 00¥ted od |t
QOANCY W WY AR(E B

|

DECLARATION
I/ We declare the foregoing particulars ara true in every réspect.

SR |

! X REE T Ao
Poficyhaoldess Sigrature Oriver's Signaturg Heporting Centre Persannel’'s Signzture

Date & T

Trrig (IF driver is not the policyholdar) Hame:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN Mo.:
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Compare

It's Under CB Piate, MicroBus. Total 11 Passengers And 1 Drver Seating Capadity, Af Trust Certified Quaity Pre-owned Vehicle! One OF.,

A Trust Autormative

<" Pigted: OhAua-1019 AL Pssan WYASH, 2014 ivssan me50, Nissan MVIS0, nissan maksd, Nssan, NVES, AyIs)

[[] Missan Nv350 2.54 £13,800 $7,110 fyr 27-Jun-2014 2,488 cc 70,000 km Van
Fuel Type: Diesel

100% Accident Froo| Wide Space, Suitable For New Startup Business, Engine And Gearbea 15 In Excelient Condition. Mileage At 70,000km
Oaly. Guaranteed Cheapest In The Market With The Best Condition! Flaxible Financing Schermes Up To 100% LoanyFull Cash Welkcomed! .

Car (5) Pte Ltd

[[] Nissan NV350 2.5M $32,688 86,850 fyr 30-Jun-2014 2488 ¢ = Van
Fuel Type: Dissel

1 Owmer, Super Low Miles, Customer Retired Wan Sell This Viehicls, No Need Repair, Warranty Provided, Price Negaotiabke, 100 % Loan

With Lewost Intarast Rate, We Provide In House Finance Also, Dun Miss, Call Mow!

ABWIN Bus Fe Lid

' Posted: 19:Sep-1014 2 ¥ Nissa I Al 5 3 1 iy IS0 LSt

D Nissan NV3I50 2.5M $31,438 46,410 fyr 15-Aug-2014 2,468 cc 100,438 krn Van
Fuel Type: Duwesal

100% Full Loan Show Room Condition View At Phoenb Motor Trading Enterarise

114 L d 1 % (I i T L ]
.

Sawve on petrol with UDB One card!
Enjoy huge petrol savings of up to 24%, attractive cashback on your manthly spend, and 1-year annual fee walver, Apply now and start enjoying
taday,

Fird out more!

[ Missan NV350 2.5M $34,800 $7,070 jyr 26-Aug-2014 2,468 o 70,00 km Van
Fuel Type: Diesel

5 Doors Deesel Van. 1 Owner Only, Weil Maintained, No Repairs Needed, Low Mileage Unit, Suflable For New Start Up Business. Call Our
Friendly Sales Team For Viewing Now, In House Loan Available,

Husi Hus Credit Pre Lid

bl 70 A1

[7] Missan Nv350 2.5M $33,800 $5,820 fyr 08-Sep-2014 2,488 ex - Van
Fuel Typa: Diesal

Full Chiecker Plate Irnterior Worth £2000. 1 Owner, Lightly Used Interior, Leather Seats, Fresh Coat OF Paint Worth $1000, Servicing Just

Dane, Ready To Join Your Wordorce Anytime, Great Deal Not To Be Missed,

D Nissan NV350 2.5M §33,600 46,810 fyr 11-5ep-2004 2,488 oc - Van
Fuel Type: Diesel

Single (runar. No Repair Needed. Various High Loan Financing Available Speedily At Compatitive Rates! Genuing Pricing, High Trade-In
Value For Your Existing Vehicle! High Loan Avallable With Easy Loan Approval, Contact Any OF Our Sales Person To Amrange A& Test Drive.,,

e | 8 2014 Missan WVISD, 2014 nispn rwi50, Hisan NVISE, ressan ny350, NiEzan, NVIS0, redS0, Ussd
D Nissan MV350 2,54 $35.800 £7,200 fyr 15-5ep-2014 2,488 oo - Van
Fuel Type: Diessal
ABWIN [1994) Pie Ltd
E:] Nissan NW350 2.5 536,000 37,240 fyr 15-5ep-2014 2,488 cc 126,970 km Bus

Fuel Type: Dicscl
Tip Top Condition Like Mew, New Road Tax, Still Linder Tan Chong Motor Waranty, Very Careful 1 Dwner, Low Mileage (Personal Lise),
Hice Plate Number (3 Digit) And Actident Free. Price Megotiable,

i Rissan MVYSD, 2044 niszan mvi50, Missan YISO, nasan nv 50, Missgn, W3IS0, 30 Lisad

[] Missan M350 2.5M 38,458 $7,670 jyr 29-Sep-2014 2,988 - Van
Fuel Type: Diesel

Monthly 850 & Down $1550, No Gimmacks, Low Mileage And 1 Owner Ondy, Condition Mo Rapair Needed. Well Kept Interior & Exterior.
Flexible In House Loan Available, Call Row.

ABWIN Bus Pte Ltd

Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whensver a match Is found,

Available

Available

Available

Available

Available

Awvailable

Available

Bvailable

Available

.



S/n Qty Items /Special Nett U/price Amount

18 1 R/HSliding Door Advertisement Sticker ./, 45000 497
19 1 Rear R/H Fender Advertisement Sticker | $550-00 987"
20 1 Rear R/H Mud Flap Duf; S $100.30 -~ =
21 1 Rear R/H Tyre $380.00+
22 1 Rear R/H Shock Absorber [ , 4 $153.00
23 1 RearR/HAxleBearing | rt $108.10 *
24 1 Rear Axle J $5,494.40 ¥
0030
7 Subtotal :- $7,235.80
Labour charges
To remove & refit L/H door, glass, lock, rubber & trim board 5239,96 go
To remove & refit rear shock absorber, bearing & axle S480.00 -~
To remove & refit advertisement sticker $200.00 .
To check wirin —— 100,00 20
& 9170 =1
Tuff kote 515)263 )
Panel beating Sl,mﬂ’ﬁﬂﬁ
Spray painting SLB}Q{IEJ /00D
Subtotal :- $4,810.00
_— Total:- $20,776.40,
"'rrol. é}'ﬂdﬂ,}'
*Folhs pc i Lfs S™E
n S il Fpe
6 R\




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Ean RS = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19016891/Ayd3s2
e e———— L
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHC 17172 Veh. Inspected GBD 41348
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19006139MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JOANNE YONG Assign Date 25/09/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN NV350 c.c 2488
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JN1MC2E26Z0002929 Colour SILVER
Odometer 75678 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195R15 OHTSU & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195 R15 OHTSU B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195R15 OHTSU & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195 R15 OHTSU & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE Q/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
b, General Information
Accident Date  24/08/2018 Inspection Date 25/09/2019
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR WORKSHOP
BLOCK 1, KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-43
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 7 Working Days




— 2

1 74 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 4134B
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |, "Smate {;}} ;;f}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT R/H DOOR PILLAR TO REPAIR SEE 1,239.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED BET.20 B67.20
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP @ %6.50 NECESSARY 65.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $18.10 0/S NECESSARY 36.20 18.10
1|REAR R/H TAILLAMP CRACKED 224.80 224 80
2|REAR R/H TAILLAMP CLIP @ $8.00 NECESSARY 16.00 16.00
1|REAR R/H TAILLAMP PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 504.00 -
LABOUR
1|R/H SLIDING DOOR DENTED 1,355.70 1,355.70
1|REAR R/H FENDER DISTORTED 1,893.40 1,893.40
1|REAR R/H FENDER INNER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,239.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR R/H FENDER INNER TRIM EOARD NOT NECESSARY 189.00 "
B|REAR R/H FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @ $6.50 NOT NECESSARY 52.00 -
1|REAR R/H FENDER AIR DUCT NOT NECESSARY 69.10 -
1|REAR R/H FENDER MUD FLAF NOT NECESSARY 121.80 -
1|REAR R/H FUEL COVER NOT NECESSARY 104.50 -
1|REAR R/H FUEL TANEK NOT NECESSARY T67.50 -
1|REAR R/H TYRE NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
1|REAR R/H SHOCK ABSORBER NOT NECESSARY 153.00 -
1|REAR R/H AXLE BEARING NOT NECESSARY 108.10 -
1|REAR AXLE NOT NECESSARY 5,494 40 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -420.52
14, 679.80 3,784 68
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR R/H HUB CAP (SN) cuT 186.30 80.00
1|R/H SLIDING DOOR ADVERTISEMENT STIGKER (SN} MECESSARY 450.00 300.00
1|REAR R/H FENDER ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 550.00 300.00
1|REAR R/H MUD FLAP (SN) DEFORMED 100.30 100.30
1,286.60 78030
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
T 3 Workshop (S)| _(5)
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT L/IH DOOR, GLASS, LOCK, RUBBER 280.00 80.00
& TRIM BOARD.
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR SHOCK ABSORBER, NOT NECESSARY 480.00 -
BEARING & AXLE.
TO REMOVE & REFIT ADVERTISEMENT STICKER. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
TO CHECK WIRING. 100.00 30,00
TUFF KQTE. 160.00 &0.00
PANEL BEATING. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 1,800.00 1,000.00
R/H DOOR PILLAR, REAR R/H TAILLAMP PANEL AND
REAR R/H FENMDER INNER PAMEL.
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,800.00 1,000.00
4 810.00 2,170.00
GRAND TOTAL 20,776.40 6,734.98
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,400.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016891/Ayd3s2
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Licensed Appraiser
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