Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Jeslyn - VAG Singapore <jeslyn@vag.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 November, 2019 12:11 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Submission of Finalised Repair Estimate for SGZ6991E
Attachments: 28112019115340-0001.pdf

Dear Taufikh,

We accept your offer of Lumpsum COR $2,700, with 05 working days of repair.
Please find attached supporting documents.

-LOD

- Tax Invoice

-LOA

- LTA Search Fee

- Car Rental Invoice & Agreement
-DV

Kindly forward us DV if any. Otherwise, we await your fast payment.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jeslyn Chua

AVANTAGE VAG
AUTOMOTIVE SPECIALISTS

6515 9515 Sales & Service | 6795 5005 24hr Towing | www.avantage.sg

WEST Service, Tuning & Accident Reporting Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-123 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

NORTH Service & Accident Reporting Centre
160 Sin Ming Drive, #04-17 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722

EAST Service & Accident Reporting Centre
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

CARCRAFTERS Spray Paint, Grooming & Accident Repair Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

On Tue, Nov 26, 2019 at 11:48 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh @lkkauto.com> wrote:




Hi Jeslyn

Refer attached.

COR lumpsum $2700, 5 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Jeslyn - VAG Singapore [mailto:jeslyn@vag.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 10:50 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Submission of Finalised Repair Estimate for SGZ6991E

Dear Taufikh,

Attached after paint photos.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Jeslyn Chua

AVANTAGE VAG
AUTOMOTIVE SPECIALISTS

6515 9515 Sales & Service | 6795 5005 24hr Towing | www.avantage.sg

WEST Service, Tuning & Accident Reporting Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-123 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586
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NORTH Service & Accident Reporting Centre
160 Sin Ming Drive, #04-17 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722

EAST Service & Accident Reporting Centre
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

CARCRAFTERS Spray Paint, Grooming & Accident Repair Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

On Tue, Nov 26, 2019 at 9:54 AM Jeslyn - VAG Singapore <jeslyn@vag.sg> wrote:

Dear Taufikh,

Please find attached Finalise repair estimate and signed DV.

Please do revert to me your favourable Lumpsum amount with 5 working days repaired.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Jeslyn Chua

AVANTAGE VAG
AUTOMOTIVE SPECIALISTS

6515 9515 Sales & Service | 6795 5005 24hr Towing | www.avantage.sg

WEST Service, Tuning & Accident Reporting Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-123 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

NORTH Service & Accident Reporting Centre
160 Sin Ming Drive, #04-17 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722

EAST Service & Accident Reporting Centre
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

CARCRAFTERS Spray Paint, Grooming & Accident Repair Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586
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