HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1, SINGAPORE 729332
Tel: (65) 6641 9688 Fox: [65) 6646) 9699 Email: info@huahong.com.sg

Estimate Repair List

QUOT201909-000047

25 September 2019
HHTPCLAIMS19-182

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
78 SHENTON WAY, #07-16

AlG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW6629X & SLS4987J ON 16/09/2019 AT 290A BISHAN ST 24
MULTI-STOREY CAR PARK AT ABOUT 1415 HOURS

Insured 2 HUA HONG PTE LTD
Vehicle Registration No. . SKW6629X
Vehicle Make - TOYOTA
Vehicle Model :  COROLLAALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT
Vehicle Chassis No. : MROS53REH104538264
Policy No. - 5109921641-000035
Date of Accident 3 16/09/2019 Type of Claim: Third Party
S/N  Quantity Description Unit Price S  Amount S$
1 1 Front Bumper Zpp $ 511.20/
2 10 FrontBumperClip .~ Nec $ 2508 2500/
3 1 Front Bumper Retainer (RH) .~ B r- $ 55.10/
4 1 Front Bumper Foam 7 X M $ 78.39X
5 1 Front Bumper Lower Grille » ~ €M $ 14860 % /
6 1 Front Fog Lamp Cover (RH) scH / | $ 13500/
7 1 Front Fog Lamp (RH) 1 XM $  22000X
8 1 Front Grille w — (R s sea00 W97
9 1 Front Grille Top Garnish X MN $ 73.00X
10 10  Front Grille Top Garnish Clip x AN $ 250 § 25.00 X
1 I .2 Front Headlamp (RH) ~ CRU K"’H) $2816.10 $ 5632.20 756§ /
12 2] Front Headlamp Clip (RH) . pec $ 2508 500 7.§0~7
13 1 Front Reinforcement 7 X AN $  38660X
14 1 Front Fender (RH) ) $ 858.00 799 /
15 20  Front Fender Inner Shield Clip (LHRH) . AN $ 250 8 50.00 X
16 1 Washer Tank »a (M $ 145007
17 T RearBumper ¥ R § 48650 X
18 10 Rear Bumper Clip -~ Nec $ 250 § 25.007
19 1 Rear Bumper Retainer (LH) 7 IR $ 72.10 /
20 1 Emblem w - N $ 3050/
21 1 Logo (WT) 7 Nt $ 19.10/
22 1 Front Engine Under Cover X AN $ 130.80 X
$ 9,676.09
o /0 Less20% $ 1,935.22
iz $ 774087
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HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGE! KADUT STREET 1, SINGAPORE 729332
Tel: (65) 6641 9688 Fax: (65) 6661 9699 Email: info@huahong.com.sg

Estimate Repair List
QUOT201909-000047

25 September 2019
HHTPCLAIMS19-182

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW6629X & SLS4987J ON 16/09/2019 AT 290A BISHAN ST 24
MULTI-STOREY CAR PARK AT ABOUT 1415 HOURS

Estimate Repair List for vehicle SKW6629X - TOYOTA COROLLAALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT

Unit Price S$ Amount S$

S/N  Quantity Description
To dismantle & change front bumper, front RH headlamp, front RH fender, front $ 900.00

reinforcement, rear bumper, knocking & pull straight front RH panel and all area §oo
affected by accident
To perform wire checking . $ 20.00

/
To spray front bumper, front reinforcement, front support panel, front RH fender $ 900.00 Fgp
and rear bumper

-
$ 9,560.87

7% GST $ 669.26
Total $§ 10,230.13 0
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* No iliegal modification(s) is allowed

* Supplementary iten(s) must be resurveyed

o Subfect ol approval from Insurance Cambany

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature;
Date:

P- 371457
Lyr— 1179
4§ ST
Lls - 357565
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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, March 16, 2020 5:49 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X

Dear Steve,

COR (Lump Sum) $3,900.00 before GST — Confirm
Thanks

Regards

James Tan

Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

(]
_fMin WMo

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 21 February 2020 6:12 pm

To: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg
Subject: Finalize Case for SKW6629X

Dear James,
The finalize is $3900 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: James Tan [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, February 21, 2020 9:50 AM



