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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 4:19 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X
Attachments: DV.pdf

Dear Jasper 
 
Please find attached signed DV for payment processing 
 
Thank you 
 
Jerleen Tang 
Claims Department 
 

 

 HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED  
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332  
T. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg 

                 

 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 4:03 PM 
To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 3:53 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 
 
Dear Jasper 
 
We are agreeable to $4710 (all in) 
 
Kindly proceed 
 
Thank you 
 
Jerleen Tang 
Claims Department 
 

 

 HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED  
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332  
T. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg 

                 

 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 8:58 AM 
To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Jerleen, 
 
We have our principal ‘s instructions to improve our offer to $4,710.00(all in)  
 
Kindly confirm acceptance to expertise the closing. 
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 11 August 2020 6:38 PM 
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To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 
 
Dear Jasper 
 
Any updates to the below counter offer? 
 
Thank you 
 
Jerleen Tang 
Claims Department 
 

 

 HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED  
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332  
T. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg 

                 

 
 

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 6 August 2020 5:44 PM 
To: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)' <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 
 
Dear Jasper 
 
We would like to counter offer $4750 
 
Thank you 
 
Jerleen Tang 
Claims Department 
 

 

 HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED  
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332  
T. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg 

                 

 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 6 August 2020 5:36 PM 
To: james@huahong.com.sg 
Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We propose a settlement at a global sum of $4,700.00(all-in). 
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Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Thursday, 20 February 2020 5:58:20 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: James Tan; Vic (LKKAuto) 
Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg 
Subject: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 

Dear James, 
  
Kindly refer our finalize $3800 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days. 
  
Kindly confirm. 
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
Thanks. 
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  
  
  
  
  

From: James Tan [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, February 19, 2020 9:35 AM 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto) 
Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg 
Subject: Finalize Case for SKW6629X 
  
Dear Steve, 
  
I would like to finalize the above mention case. 
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Total Parts - $ 5228.10 
(Less 20% $1045.62) - $ 4182.48 
Labour - $ 1120.00 
Total - $ 5302.48 before GST 
Repair Days – 4 days 
  
Kindly revert to me asap. 
Thanks. 
  
Regards 
James Tan 
Claims Department 

 

  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED  
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332  
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg 

                 

  
  


