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Eixith-a (LKK Auto)

#

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 November 2019 2:48 PM

To: assignments

G Chua Kee Sin

Subject: Fw: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKQS550J & SKA7617P ON 25/11/2019 ***

LKK REF: CC3/AIG19020962/ka3

Dear Sirs,
Please arrange survey on 9 December 2019.

Owner leaving car in for survey + repair by 10am.

Thank you.

Regards,

Ceroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 November 2019 11:50 AM

To: Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKQ550) & SKA7617P ON 25/11/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G19020962/ka3

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 28 November 2019 11:40 AM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: BB © <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKQ550) & SKA7617P ON 25/11/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G19020962/ka3

[External Mall] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links,
Without Prejudice

D=zar Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

P ease note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair fo your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval.
1



View Sent Message

This mail is assoclated with :

*FT1247Y (SNM19D203704C02)
[XE4218C]
TP
MUHAMMAD RYHAN ZUHAIR BIN MOHD ZAIDI
~ Aug 6 2019 8:00AM
[KOK TONG TRANSPORT & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD]
Revology

| Resand || View Recipients || Print Message | Delete Message | = Forward |

From 'LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 28/11/2019 15:00 PM._
To KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com
Subjzct  FT1247Y

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Please be Informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already withdraw the claim.
We will close this file at our end without billing.

No survey was done for this vehicle,

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phore: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documents.




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Notified | EstSubmitted | AdjAssigned |  AdjRpt | AdjSubmitted | InsAuthed |Status
|
20 Sep 2019 20 Sep 2019 R
Main 17:16 Cancel G
.lssjgnJ | | |

Reference Claim Details

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - | [Created by insurer]
Insured: | KOK TONG TRANSPORT & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199904117E
Main Claimant: MUHAMMAD RYHAN ZUHAIR BIN MOHD ZAIDI, ID: 597115198
T

| 06/08/2019 08:00 - :59
Vehicle Reg. No.: FT1247Y Date of Loss: [221 Months and 17 Days From

£ LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Claim Type: TP / SNM19D203704C02 Policy/Cover Note No.: DMCVSN18225419011

Vehicle Reg. No. (Insured): I XEATIAG = Policy No. (Claimant): C/N 60801090/E02

L n s i Excess: |5%0.00 =
Repalrer: ~ Revology (HQ) 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-43, #01-43 Synergy © KB, 417800 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 84186903
‘Handling Insurer: China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 ... [Handled by Ong Chin Kiat]
Claimant's Insurer: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7888

| Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. . [Final Rpt due 01/10/2019]
Driver/Custodian (Insured): | JIANG XIANFU (48 / Male) , NRIC: G5256B89M Email:

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED _ViewAll | Compose Case Mail
There are no mail for this case.

=

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View All | SearchTasks |  Create NewTask | Complete |

Due Date Priarity Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 20/9/2019



