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AMEZ020 Marimean e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with !

“SMMNT74B89A (BB790208915G)
oD
Sep 17 2015 5:00PM
[GAD KANG]
Premium Automobiles Pre Lid

Reply | Reply Al | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 18/03/2020 14:26 PM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SMN74894 - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Malntained: The increase in labour was during the finalisation which was not approved.

| EX - =

[DOCUMENTS SUMMARY | S R
There are no documents.

https://singapere. mermen.comiclaimsfindex ofm Musebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&linbaxid=1650514&i0Domainld=11&i0bjld=1...
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31132020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with :
*SMMT4B9A (BET90208925G)
oD

Sep 17 2019 5:00PM
[GAD KANG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Reply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward | )

From AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sert on 13/03/2020 17:39 PM.

To LKK_HG
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SMN7489A - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

.Maintained :Bonnet and LH front dnur::;l;;;pray painting needed why need 1 day repair? LH headlamp, fender trim 05 day. Tntél 5.5 days at $3300.

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY e
There are no documents,

o | 99 )
. { Vo \5
(PN ] .-'/ ff €A Payy xfo0

Haowdbs f
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e’fl‘:ai)r@s.%d bj MG en

https:/isingapare mermen.com/claimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=SVCmall&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1648066& Domainld=114i0bjld=1... 112



31172020 Merimen e-Claims

View Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMN7489A (BB7I90208915G)
als)
Sep 17 2019 5:00PM
[GAD KANG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Resend | View Recipients | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 11,/03/2020 11:15 AM.
To AlG_SG; syazairdina.azlan@aig.com; Victor_KohCK
Subject Re: Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SMN7489A - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Dear Sir,

According to surveyor, the labour and the spray paint for Q8 model is $600 each. As for this case it is Q8 model.

Labour of $4200 is 7 days. To remove front bumper, LH front fender, (2 days), LH headlight,front both wheel arch
trim,
{1 day), repair bonnet & LH front door, (1 day) and to remove lock carrier (3 days). Total ;7 days

|As for the spray paint $3400 is 5.5 panel:
|Front bumper, LH front fender, bonnet, LH front door, radiator frame and front wheel arch trim.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen

=== Original Message -->

From: AIG_SG

|To: LKK_HQ

|Sent On: 05/03/2020 01:35 PM

Subject: Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SMN74834A - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Maintained:why labour $4200 and spray paint $34007

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documants,

hitps:isingapere. mermen.comdclaimsfindex.cfmfusebox=5VCmail&fuzeaction=dsp_view&mode=0&IMSGID=2045950&cur_ialiasid=12&cur_va...

172



2020 Marimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail Is associated with @

*SMN74894 (88790208925G)
oD
Sep 17 2019 5:00PM
[GAD KANG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Reply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 05/03/2020 13:35 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Maintainad - SMN7489A - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

Maintained:why labour $4200 and spray paint $34007

The labow- gacl #he if’tﬂj paird for Q& maded 1400 eacl
L3 PoAhs case f 75 O moded -

DOCUMENTS SUMI IV_IARY
There are no documents,

L&Low’ D£ .d-u 1m) f'E. '?dwi’lf 1y remove Cfn.JL w L|I ?np{' '?!'fﬁtf)L#vff‘“j'D
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https:{isingapare.merimen.com/claims/index. cfm?fusebox=5VCmaildfuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&linboxid=1643212&iDomainld=11&i0bjld=1... 112



332020 Rich Text Editor, SWVCDOCHrcantant

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreonoisssorissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 03 Mar 2020
Preliminary Advice
Vehicle No : BMNTA4894 Accident Date : 17/09/2019
Make CAUDI Q8 Paolicy Mo. ;1900152885
Assignment Date  : 20/08/2019 Excess : 5%4,400.00
Date of Inspection : 19/08/2019 Est. Duration of Repair  : 13.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES FTE LTD (UBI}
55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAFPORE 408699

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact | damages nis portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident,

(incl.supplementary (1)

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 85 91,529.36 3858+ (2) $710
Revised Amount it ] 37,368.00
Check Items (Estimated) 85 0.00

incl.supplementary (1)

Total 5% 37.368.00 $858+ (2) $710

Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 55 366,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate 5% 116,691.00
Salvage Value S5
Margin for Repair 5% 249.309.00
Remarks
[

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authorisation,

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

Other comments :

https:/'singapore. merimen.com'claimsfindex.cim Pusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rptmode=2&caseid=868033&axlid=317586&adjcu. ..

12



2MBR2020 Marimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail Is associated with ;

*SMMN7489A (BETO0208925G)
ob
Sep 17 2019 5:00PM
[GAD KANG]
Pramium Automaobiles Pte Ltd

|_R;pl-.- ! Raply All I Mark as Uﬂr‘e&d_‘ Pri-nt Hessape.l Delete r:‘lessa_gl:_f Forward ] - . 2

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 18/02/2020 15:38 PM.

To LKE_HOQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$36658.00) - SMN7489A - Claim Handler; Azlan, Syazairdina

approved: 36658.00: Bvey Fere =
DOCUMENTS SUMMARY ] ' T S B - '
There are no documents,

https:Hsingapura.maﬂmen,mwclaimsﬁnn:lax.c'fm?fusehnx=E‘u’EmaII&fusaacﬁuna:lsp_\riw&mndaﬂ &linboxid=1633575&IDomainld=11&0bjld=1...

112



12/9/2018 Rich Text Editor, SWCDOCHrcontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (coregno1sssoriser,
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 0759120 Singapore 408933
Afin:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 09 Dec 2019

Preliminary Advice
Vehicle No : SMNT4B89A Accident Date 1171092019
Make CAUDIG8 Policy No. : 1900152865
Assignment Date  : 20/09/2019 Excass : 554.400.00
Date of Inspection : 19/09/2019 Est. Duration of Repair  : 13.00
Inspection At . PREMIUM AUTOMORBILES PTE LTD (UBI)
55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact /| General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 35 90,992.00 ({incl.supplementary $858)
Revised Amount 5% 36,658.00

Check lterms (Estimated} 55 0.00

Total 5% 36,658.00 (incl.supplemeantary $858)
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value S
Pre-Accident Value ok 366,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate S5 116,691.00
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair 8% 249,309.00
Remarks
{ X))

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authorisation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

Other comments ;

hitps://singapore.merimen.comiclaims/index, cfmTfusebox= MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rptmode=2&caseid=8680338exid=317586&ad]jcur. ..



- Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2019 11:23 AM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR

Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg)

Subject: FW: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7489 A ON 17/9/2019
Attachments: SUPPLEMENTARY.pdf

Dear TRoy,

Refer supplementary marking.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 5:20 PM

To: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg) <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7489 A ON 17/9/2019

Dear TRoy,
As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMN 7489A (Excess $4400/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 11:36 AM




 To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
. Cec: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7489 A ON 17/9/2019

Dear Veron,
Hein attached with the driving license of the driver for your next action.

Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (regre tossozzrw

55 Ukl Road 1 Read Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto cOM.S8 W. WWW.audi.com.53
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singa

“It comes in blue.”

The new Audi A7 Sportback. Do you reatly need a reason?

pore 159938 p. +65 G836 2223

Find Out more

Ernail Disclaimer
This amal, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged

If you have recemved it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system

Please do not copy it ar use it for any purpose, or disciose its contents or any attachment To any other parson. Thank you.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@|kkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 11:30 AM

To: Claims; Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7489 A ON 17/9/2019

Dear TRoy,

Driving licensed?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2018 7:46 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
z




132019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMN74B9A (BEET790208925G)
oD
Sep 17 2019 5:00PM
[GAD KANG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

""Reply || Reply All | | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |
From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 03/10/2019 09:37 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$30010.92) - SMN7489A - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina

iAppmvad:auum.BZ:Eumper, LH fender and LH headlamp lanpur should be at 1,5 days why 3 days given? Spray paint $2800 - ok, Re-Inspection to be
done for damage check and supplementary Items / labour,

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewamode=1&iinboxid=1559552&iDomainid=11&I0bjld=12... 12



100272019 Rich Text Editor, SVCDOC|treontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreqgno:1ossoriesr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. Fram: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn: Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 02 Oct 2019

Preliminary Advice
Wehicle Mo : SMNT4884 Accident Date 17082018
Make : AUDI QB Policy Mo. : 1900152865
Assignment Date ; 20008/2019 Excess 1 5%4,400.00
Cata of Inspection - 19/09/2019 Est. Duration of Repair :9.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)
55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 185 90,892.00 (incl.supplemeantary $858)
Revised Amount 35 31,458.92

Check ltems (Estimated) potd 15.519.00

Total 53 46,978.92 (incl.supplementary $858)
Lump Sum Repair b=

Total Loss Consideration

Mew for Old Value 1]
Pre-Accident Value 5% a66,000.00
COE | PARF Rebate 5% 116,691.00
Salvage Valua 55
Margin for Repair 5% 249,308.00
Remarks
(%)

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

(| X4
Other comments :Kindly approved on the supplementary,

https:ifsingapore. mermen.com/claimsindex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rptmode=2&caseid=8680338extid=317586&ad|cur...

i



8/23/2019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMN7489A (BB7I0208925G)
oD
Sep 17 2019 5:00PM
[GAD KANG]
Premlum Automaobiles Pte Ltd

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 23/09/2019 16:12 PM.

From
To LKE_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Maintainad - SMN74894 - Claim Handler: Azlan, Syazairdina
Re—inﬁpec_ti;;;r._u ba d-:;e for I

'Maintained: Bumper, LH fender and LH headlamp lanpur should be at 1.5 days why 3 days El-i;En? Spray paint $2800 - ok,
damage check and supplementary items [ labour,

' DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
| There are no documents.

hitps:fisingapore. merimen, comiclaimsfindex cfm#usebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1 553703&IDomainld=11&I0bjld=12... 1/2



6/2312019

htips:/fsingapore. merimen.com/claimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=MT Radjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rptmode=24&caseid=868033&extid=317586&adjcur. ..

Rich Text Editer, SVCDOCIrcontent

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Indusirial Park
Singapore 408933

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreqno:sseoriesr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From:

AlG Building

T8 Shenton Way #08-16

Singapore 079120
Attn:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date:

Vehicle No

Make

Assignment Date
Date of Inspaction
Inspection At

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages

23 Sep 2019

Preliminary Advice

: SMNT4B3A
:AUDI Q8

1 2000942019
1 19/09/2019

: PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Accident Date 1710942019
Policy Mo, : 1900152865
Excess : 554,400,000
Est. Duration of Repair 1 9.00

The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident,

Remarks

(A0

Repairer's Estimate {Gross)
Revised Amount

Check ltems (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE | PARF Rebata
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

5%
55
5%
55

R=11

55
5%
55
5%
155

90,134.00
29,646,892
22,660.00
52,306.92

366,000.00
116.691.00

249,309.00

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation,

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wrack.

Other comments :

11



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 5:20 PM

To: ‘Claims’; SUR

Cc: (nara.khai@premiumauto.com.sg)

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMM 7489 A ON 17/9/2019
Attachments: MARK EST.pdf

Dear TRoy,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMN 7489A (Excess S4400/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-2561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 11:36 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7483 A ON 17/9/2019

Dear Veron,
Hein attached with the driving license of the driver for your next action.
Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd reg s sz

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f, +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com. 58

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2243
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i ] e |

“It comes

in blue.”

The new Audl A7 Sportback. Do you really need a reasods T

Find out mona !

Emall Disclaimer

This smaill, including any attachment, i4 confidential and may alsn be privileged
If wou have received It in error, please notify us mmediataly by reply email and then delete this message from your Sy SLaY
Plasse de not copy it 0F use it for any purpose, or disclose its cantents or any alachment to any GLher persan Thank you.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 11:30 AM

To: Claims; Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7489 A ON 17/9/2019

Dear TRoy,

Driving licensed?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 20159 7:46 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7489 A ON 17/9/2019

Dear all,

Survey was just done earlier by Surveyor. Herein attached estimate repair with marking for your
next action. Kindly assist and advise who is the case handler for this case and comment on the claims
for approval.

Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd e ne 1o

55 ki Road 1 Road Singapore 4086593

p. +65 B384 2323 d. +65 6768 0828 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims@pramiumauto.Com.sg W Www.d di.com.sg
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreqnosssoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmentsi@ikkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd.

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 079120

Aftn:

Vehicle No

Make

Assignment Date
Date of Inspection
Inspection At

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages

From:

Date:

LKK Autlo Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Indusirial Park
Singapore 408933

20 Sep 2019

Preliminary Advice

: SMNT489A
: AUDI Q8

: 20/09/2019
: 19/09/2019

: PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Accident Date + 17/09/2019
Policy No. : 1900152865
Excess : S50.00

Est. Duration of Repair $9.00

The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s pertion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Remarks

(i X )

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check Items (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

Mew for Old Value
Pre-Accident Valus
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

S5
55
5%
58

5%

5%
35
ot
85
5%

90,134.00
28,946.92
22,660.00
51.606.92

366,000.00
116.691.00

249,309.00

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and paolicy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation,

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

Other comments ;

1
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