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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner ID: 157D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBC5481Y

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 20 Sep 2019

Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: DYNA 150 MANUAL
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2012

Engine No.: 1KD2259584
Chassis No.: JTFAT35Y90K202178
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $24,970.00

Original Registration Date: 28 Jan 2013

First Registration Date: 28 Jan 2013
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,249.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: [

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 27 Jan 2023

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $62,201.00

COE Rebate Amount: $20,850.00

Total Rebate Amount: $20,850.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Sep 2019

OK



" Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> on behalf of Motorsurvey
<Motorsurvey@awac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 11:32 AM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA :09.09.2019 Our Ref:
NSV1900448/SG
The above captioned accident refers. Please conduct an "OWN DAMAGE" survey on the following:
Insured Vehicle GBC5481Y
Policy Number BVFCSB0007241912 22325’“‘ B800SDO
Policy Excess $ 2,000
Voluntary Excess NA i (Nowaiver)
Sum Insured Market Value with COE & PARF
Make / Model TOYOTA DYNA 180
Name of Workshop YEE KEONG MOTOR ENGINEERING

Contact Number

6262 20218 / 9780 8928

Person to Contact

Estimated Cost of repairs

$19,244.95

(x)

Please take photographs of the front windscreen area from inside to ascertain whether the
insured vehicle is equipped with a car camera. (Compulsory)

(X)

Please revert with your preliminary survey report with photographs

Regards,

Claims Division

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments hereto is confidential. If you are not the

intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate any of this information. If you have received this e-mail

in error, please immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete the original e-mail

(and any attachments hereto) and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this e-mail and any attachments
hereto are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which

it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by Allied World Assurance Company Holdings, Ltd or its subsidiaries or

affiliates, either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

1




51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: NSV1900448/SG
Our Ref: CS/IAWA19016571/R1td3 Date: 24/09/2019

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO GBC 5481Y
We thank you for the instruction on 19/9/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
19/09/2019 at the premises of m/s: Yee Keong and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S§ 13.563.31
Revised Estimate Amount . S§ 7.417.09
“Check™ Items Amount . S$ 2.156.00
Total : S$ 9.573.09
Market Value : S$ 37.000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value : S§ 20.850.00
Nett Value : S$ 16.150.00
Description of Damage: -

The vehicle sustained damages due to

. rear ———
Front portion @ front

Comments/ Present Status: e
Damage consistent

Repair Cost economical

Days of repair: 10

Repair on Lump Sum

Yours faithfully
Rasul
Automotive Assessor



. Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 2:43 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); Motorsurvey; assignments

Cc: SUR; Wong, Kin

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA :09.09.2019
NSV1900448/SG

Dear Denise,

Please provide us our insured’s tires thread measurement and the tires photos.

Thank you.

Regards

Stella Goh
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0857

F: +65 6423 0864

E: stella.goh@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, September 20, 2019 12:15 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey @awac.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019 Our Ref: NSV1900448/SG

CAUTION: External Email

Our Ref;

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBC 5481Y

We did not authorise repair
Repair on lump sum

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



" Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

e — e e

From: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 2:38 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); Motorsurvey; assignments

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA :09.09.2019 Our Ref:
NSV1900448/SG

Dear Denise,

We understand insured has a video footage.
Can you please assist to get a copy?

Thank you.

Regards

Stella Goh
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0857

F: +65 6423 0864

E: stella.goh@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, September 20, 2019 12:15 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019 Our Ref: NSV1900448/SG

CAUTION: External Email

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBC 5481Y

We did not authorise repair
Repair on lump sum

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> on behalf of Motorsurvey
<Motorsurvey@awac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 10:58 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Motorsurvey; Wong, Kin; Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019 Our Ref:
NSV1900448/SG

Dear Denise,
We refer to your email on even date.
Please authorize repair at lump sum $ 7,300, no supplementary items allowed.

Thank you.

Regards

Stella Goh
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0857

F: +65 6423 0864

E: stella.goh@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 10:37 AM

To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019 Our Ref: NSV1900448/SG

Dear Stella,
I've check with the repairer, they agree capped repair at lump sum $ 7,300 .

Please advise on authorization.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 9:02 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Wong, Kin; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Motorsurvey; assignments

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019 Our Ref:
NSV1900448/SG

Dear Denise,

We refer to your email dated 24.09.2019.

Please capped repair amount at $ 5,933.60 and to confirm “checked” items at $ 1,724.80 after dismantle.

Thank you.

Regards

Stella Goh
Claims Analyst
Claims Group
Global Markets

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0857

F: +65 6423 0864

E: stella.geoh@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2019 1:49 PM

To: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>; Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@Ikkauto.com>; Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019 Our Ref: NSV1900448/SG

CAUTION: External Email

Dear Kin,

Enclosed preliminary re-revised of vehicle GBC 5481Y base on cost plus 10%.
Number of days (estimated) : 10 days

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 12:15 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Motorsurvey'; assignments

Cc: SUR; 'Goh, Stella’

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019
NSV1900448/SG

Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF GBC 5481Y.pdf; gbc 5481y photo.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBC 5481Y

We did not authorise repair
Repair on lump sum

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 12:50 PM

To: 'Motorsurvey' <Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Goh, Stella' <stella.goh@awac.com>

Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA : 09.09.2019 Our Ref: NSV1900448/SG

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Goh, Stella [mailto:stella.goh@awac.com] On Behalf Of Motorsurvey
Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 11:32 AM

Our Ref:



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

e e =

From: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>
Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 3:55 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Goh, Stella; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Motorsurvey; assignments
Cc: SUR
Subject: RE: OD survey assignment for GBC5481Y - DOA :09.09.2019 Our Ref:

NSV1900448/5G
Dear Denise

This tyre look bald on the outer groove.
Can you advise which tyre is this fitted on? RL/ RR?
We will wait for your video footage in the meantime.

Thank you.

Regards,

Kin W«mg (Mr.)

Asia-Pacific Claims Group

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd.
60 Anson Road z08-o1

Singapore 079914

T: +65 6423 0894

F: +65 6423 0864

E: kin.wong(@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 3:49 PM

To: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; Motorsurvey
<Motorsurvey@awac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>



MSI319119992 / STA INSPECTION PTE LTD - Boon Lay
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 10/09/2019 13:08
SUBMITTED BY: Woodford Richard Vincent

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correcllz the details of the accident to speed up the claims process,

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies o
repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

B. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

?f By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 10/09/2019 13:08

Date Of Accident 09/09/2019 13:40

Exact Location Of Accident PIE TOWARDS CHANGI BEFORE STEVEN RD -EXIT
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number GBC5481Y

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner AIR LIQUIDE SINGAPORE PTE LIMITED
Co Reg No NA

Email Address WEIBOON.KHOO@AIRLIQUIDE.COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-92982683

Alternative Phone No OFFICE-92982683

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer TOYOTA

Model DYNA

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident WORK PURPOSE

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy YES
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company ALLIED WORLD ASSURANCE COMPANY, LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number BVFCSB0007241912

Cover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

LIM TEE RONG ERIC (LIN TILONG ERIC)
581213408

24/06/1981

OUTDOOR

24/05/2004

15 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS

MALE

(LOCAL) +65-92982683

OFFICE-92982683
NOEMAIL
Page 1 of 18



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER ATTACHED

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

BLK 180 YUNG SHENG ROAD #16-109
610180
YES

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
DRY

NO
2
NO
NO
YES

NO

NO

NO

YES
YES
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

YP1322J

LORRY

REAR PORTION
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
NG BOON CHIANG
S1572853A

98593338

Page 2 of 18
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Sketch Plan #2

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE
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5 Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.
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i) my fersoral nfermation may/an ve disclosed oy zny of the Insurers and/er GlA to their th rd party service providers or
agentslincluding their ‘awyers/iaw firms), which may be sited outs'de of Singapare, for ane or mase of the anowe Purposes

d)  my Personal Infermation will a'so 2e collectec 2nd used to compile cialms history 1or the purncse ol trzud detection,
investigation and mansgement in present and 21 futurs claims,

led  the nformatian so colected under [d} above may be shared / discinsed:

(19t all inswrers andfon any other thivd partes that sssist nevalatiog, investigal ng, contia THg OF saanagig aue,
resulaters, low enforcement and government agencies e reazonualy reguired for te purooses stated, or

i) Tor comphying with recuirements ander any regulsbens, laws or court orders.
AR il e SINGAPORE PRIVATE LIMITER

4380 Mexendin Roac /
Block B #07-01 Alexanidra Technopwss

Singapore 119658 %/' -
ALSg 142 / |afis  wsows

Policyhelder's Signature Diriver's Sigrature Report rTg Centre Pe_r-
Dale & Times: (I crees Lpol 1he col ogholds) Name:
Lraze & Time: HRIC/FIN Ne. \
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-~ YEEKEONG MOTOR ENGINEERING

—

No.14 Penjuru Road Singapore 609125

BAT™ 19 SEP- 19

Tel/Fax: 62620218 Hp no. 97808928 'S
TO: ALLIED WORLD ASSURANCE COMPANY LTD SINGAPORE BRANCH
Name of Insured : AIR LIQUIDE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
GBC 5481 Y/ TOYOTA DYNA JTFAT35Y90K202178 .
Policy No. : BVFCSB007241912- OD Claim ( Own Damage ) Motor claim
1 1pc Front cab panel b 50 972.45 2~
2 1pc Front panel garnish CR 2 375.00
3 1pc Front panel ‘Dyna’ sticker KA 59.10
4 1pc Front n/s corner panel a2 374.257
5 1pc Front n/s corner panel top garnish UX~" =G 271.25
6 1pc Dashboard - , ,}/g z' 620 970.00~ G
7 1pc Aircon blower - -~ 20 971.00 - vt
8  1pc Fronto/s corner panel &< “ 532 374.25.
9 1pc Front o/s corner panel top garnish o 7 Y, 271.25
10 1pc Front bumper r s Repair
11 1pc Front o/s door é’f/ +.1600.00
12 2pcs Front o/s door hinges@$99.6 7 eT 199.20
13 1pc Front o/s door inner lock ¢+~ (Z"’(-s‘d- 478.10
14 1pc Front o/s door check T ’ 118.10 320
15 1pc Front wiper panel g 581.90 o
16  1pc Wipertank 5 €C H-P CIO’Dld’O(sX 185.10
17 2pcs Nozzle@$19.45 ™ A 213890
18 2pcs  Wiper arm@S5174.45 H - fD 011> 348.90-" 20 b
19 1pc O/s Door Trim Pt 486.00 _
20 1pc Front windscreen w/strip re - l~(_3 374407 249 3
21 1pc Front windscreen Bz 1217.45° 14
22 1pc O/sHeadlamp ¥ (ﬁlm[(? dI¢ho 918.00
53 1set O/s Headlamp clips X | 28.00
24 1pc N/s Headlamp K I z . 918.00
25  1set N/sHeadlamp clips X/ ° EXCESS ¥V “ogh0
26 1pc Frontgrille X ! P&/M 411.10
27 1pc  Front grille panel X/ % 211.10
28 1pc Front grille logo ' A~ 98.00
29 1pc Aircon heater '77?/‘ ' Q‘»‘J\')m v 1712.50 A0
30 1pc Front n/s view mirrorarm PR ﬂfw 191.40 %5
31 1pc Front view mirror bracket n/s X8 182.25 \\+
32 1pc Frontno.plate bf — 1~ 30.00
33 1set Front windscreen sealant A2 ~ v 50,007
15044.95 -~

1 Remove all necessary damaged & attected parts,
cut/weld tront panel, tirewall panel, straighten

both tront chassis and doors pillars, both front corner inner panel g0
1600

repair both tront doors and bumper and replace parts
Remove and retit tront windscreen

Rewire tront portion and retocus both headlamp beam
Remove and retit Dashboard Cpheh)

Check complete electrical

Remove and retit air blower

Putty & Spraypaint

Tutt Kote

Remove and refit both tront doors

Remove and refit tront instrumental panel

wiring harness and electrical parts

e
HEBoxoubswnN

787AL
fra W P Lana van mdfnun"h‘?@l.qﬂw,-@""

0
18000 (¢
50.00 XA\
30000 200
109700 6o,
1000046
1406700 (e 6T

200760 (¢12

120.00 xWq

1;&06 oD .

19244.95
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ALLIED WORLD ASSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CS/AWA19016571/R1td3e2

[INHRN

(SINGAPORE BRANCH)

60 ANSON ROAD #08-01 (8th FLOOR)
MAPLETREE ANSON

SINGAPORE 079914

Date: 02-12-2019

Code: AWA
1. Policy Particulars ;- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected GBC 5481Y
Policy No. BVFCSB0007241912 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. NSV1900448/SG Excess ($) 2,000.00
Assign From  STELLA GOH Assign Date 19/09/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTADYNA 150M c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. JTFAT35Y90K202178 Colour WHITE
Odometer 221798 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [195R15C BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[195R15C BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R12 (D) BRIDGESTONE 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 155 R12 (D) BRIDGESTONE 6/6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/09/2019 Inspection Date 19/09/2019
Survey held at YEE KEONG MOTOR ENGINEERING
NO: 14 PENJURU ROAD .
SINGAPORE 609125
5a. Remarks
A)THE MARKET VALUE IS S$37,000.00(EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 10 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBC 5481Y
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | o hop (;) (SJ)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT CAB PANEL (WCP) BENT 972.45 650.00
1|FRONT PANEL GARNISH (WCP) CRACKED 375.00 243,00
1|FRONT PANEL 'DYNA' STICKER (WCP) NOT NECESSARY 59.10 -
1|FRONT N/S CORNER PANEL (WCP) BENT 37425 243.00
1|FRONT N/S CORNER PANEL TOP GARNISH (WCP) CRACKED 27125 176.00
1|DASHBOARD (WCP) CRACKED 970.00 630.00
1|AIRCON BLOWER (WCP) CRACKED 971.00 630.00
1|FRONT O/S CORNER PANEL (WCP) BENT 37425 243.00
1|FRONT O/S CORNER PANEL TOP GARNISH (WCP) CRACKED 271.25 176.00
1[{FRONT BUMPER (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE B
LABOUR
1|FRONT O/S DOOR (WCP) BENT 1,600.00 800.00
2|FRONT O/S DOOR HINGES @$99.60 (WCP) SERVICEABLE 199.20
1|FRONT O/S DOOR INNER LOCK (WCP) SERVICEABLE 478.10
1|FRONT O/S DOOR CHECK (WCP) SERVICEABLE 118.10
1|FRONT WIPER PANEL (WCP) DEFORMED 581.90 380.00
1|WIPER TANK (WCP) SERVICEABLE 185.10
2|WIPER ARM @%$174.45 (WCP) BENT 348.90 226.00
1|0/S DOOR TRIM (WCP) SERVICEABLE 486.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN W/STRIP (WCP) NECESSARY 374.40 243.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN (WCP) BROKEN 1,217.45 790.00
1|0/S HEADLAMP (WCP) SERVICEABLE 918.00 -
1|SET O/S HEADLAMP CLIPS (WCP) SERVICEABLE 28.00 -
1|N/S HEADLAMP (WCP) SERVICEABLE 918.00 -
1{SET N/S HEADLAMP CLIPS (WCP) SERVICEABLE 28.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE (WCP) SERVICEABLE 411.10 -
1|FRONT GRILLE PANEL (WCP) SERVICEABLE 211.10
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO (WCP) SERVICEABLE 98.00
1|AIRCON HEATER (WCP) CRACKED 1,712.50 700.00
1|FRONT N/S VIEW MIRROR ARM (WCP) SERVICEABLE 191.40 125.00
1|FRONT VIEW MIRROR BRACKET N/S (WCP) SERVICEABLE 182.25 118.00
COST PLUS 10% - 637.30
14,926.05 7,010.30

Report Ref No. CS/AWA19016571/R1td3e2




y L7L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AdE BE B §1 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/’J TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Qty Description of Parts Condition VE:ﬂrk“;Ia'l?pa(gj Our A(:])usted
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
2|{NOZZLE @$19.45 (SN) CRACKED 38.90 38.90
1|FRONT NO. PLATE (SN) BENT 30.00 30.00
1|SET FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
118.90 118.90
LABOUR
REMOVE ALL NECESSARY DAMAGED & AFFECTED 1,600.00 800.00
PARTS, CUT / WELD FRONT PANEL, FIREWALL PANEL,
STRAIGHTEN BOTH FRONT CHASSIS AND DOORS
PILLARS, BOTH FRONT CORNER INNER PANEL REPAIR
BOTH FRONT DOORS AND BUMPER AND REPLACE
PARTS. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BUMPER
REMOVE AND REFIT FRONT WINDSCREEN. 180.00 120.00
REWIRE FRONT PORTION AND REFOCUS BOTH NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
HEADLAMP BEAM.
REMOVE AND REFIT DASHBOARD. 300.00 200.00
CHECK COMPLETE ELECTRICAL. 100.00 60.00
REMOVE AND REFIT AIR BLOWER. 100.00 60.00
PUTTY & SPRAYPAINT. 1,400.00 1,000.00
TUFF KOTE. 200.00 100.00
REMOVE AND REFIT BOTH FRONT DOORS. NOT NECESSARY 120.00
REMOVE AND REFIT FRONT INSTRUMENTAL PANEL 150.00 100.00
WIRING HARNESS AND ELECTRICAL PARTS.
4,200.00 2,440.00
GRAND TOTAL 19,244.95 9,569.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 7,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
LESS EXCESS -2,000.00
NETT LIABILITY 5,300.00

Report Ref No. CS/AWA19016571/R1td3e2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

1) [} i

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE , AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

Ity wh i [l i is accepied 1o any third party who may n

hird party actin




