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Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

W 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
ork Paya Ubi Industrial Park

ra g C Tel : 6844 2475  Fax : 6844 2474
Pre Lid E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 2010153664
3IRD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION

Vehicle number  : SGVZ142L
Make | Model : TOYOTA/WISH
Chassis number : ZNE100368879
Accident date : 16/9/19
Reference : 1909-31
Qty Particulars Unit Price - 5GD §
PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST [TEMS
1 |FRONT BUMPER 577.40 "‘1’"
2 |FRONT BUMPER COVER 104.88 %" B
2 |FRONT BUMPER RETAINER 145.30 M K s~ 065
1 |FRONT BUMPER REFINFORCEMENT 339.36 ¥ |
1 |FRONT BUMPER SPONGE 194.10 |
1 |FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 217.30 ¥
1 |FRONT GRILLE 193.40 X | 0
1 |FRONT SUPPORT PANEL 681.50 *
2 |HORN 161.30 *
1 |FRONT RH FENDER 697.44 bf -
1 |FRONT RH FENDER INNER SHIELD 181.55 % ;' _
2 [HEADLAMP 1635.60 L4 | K Y ~con ~~ BTV
2 |FRONT FOG LAMP COVER 248.90 Lop=RAH X {is.
1 [SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH 254,00 X — :
5632.03
Less 25% 1408.01
Subtotal 4124.02
Balance C/F 4224.02
PARTS R - SPECIAL NETT
Balance B/F 4224,02
1 |FRONT NUMBER PLATE 70,007 7
1 SET|FRONT BUMPER CLIP 60.00 5V «if —
1 SET|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP 50.00 A
1 |FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP B00.00 » /.
Subtotal 980.00
Balance C/F 5204.02
S/No LABOUR AND MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES
Balance B/F 5204.02
1 |CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTNING SYSTEM 60.00 57 T"‘¢ bl
2 |PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 1600,00 47 | gy Y4
3 [SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS 160000 4051 g lq [0 ¢
4 |APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS 150.00 5%
Subtotal 3410.00 Jl'-“- = _
. ef b
Grand total 8614,02 ﬂu : } iﬁ" r
Su (_"WP-J% ey




409 -3 |

SATISFACTION OF REPAIRED VEHICLE

'We, HHH'N,D 9[' lﬁmﬁ MM’D L e , owner/driver of
vehicle No. __ SGU VXL declare that the repairs of my/our vehicle has beer
completed and to my/our satisfaction.

I/We agree that I/we hereby irrevocable absolutely accept the settlement amount and the
liability from the third party on the repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use which are final
and that the sum of amount are to be released and payment to the workshop for such repairs in
respect of the damages caused in the accident,

[/We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my/our behalf is on
a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers
of the other vehicle/s concerned.

U'We acknowledge that the Discharge Voucher applies only to my/our property damage and
will not affect any of the personal injuries claim(s) involved and/or uninsured losses claim in
alater date. Further the settlement terms herein should not be used as an evidence to prejudice
to any personal injuries claim(s) involved and/or other uninsured losses claim arising of the
subject matter in the action.

Dated this a4 day of t};t:'?r (month) 20 301{7 (vear)
@ b bs_ P mins

10

Name and Sig&mmrc

Ty



" Nivitha (LKK Auto) 03 5

From: Motor Claim - il <motorclaim@iii.comsg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 3:21 PM

To: Darren; ‘sur@Ilkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc Pool Chin Han Daniel

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 1909-31 // YOUR REF : SHA7484R ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSHAT7484R
AND SGV2142L l

Attachments: GIA REPORT.PDF 35@“‘@[@1 alley

Dear Sir / Mdm, \ll.hfdﬂ 'lh

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SGV2142L and let us have your report urgently. 0‘3 ﬂ Suﬂﬂ on

alali

This claim will be handled by Daniel,
*Kindly upload this survey request emall to merimen

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

° Inpia
5 — [NTERNATIONAL
( INsurancE
F I NG AFD R ]
Sarrymng i reyee e T

B4 Cucil Street; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Darren [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com)]

Sent: 18 September, 2019 2:36 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF : 1909-31 // YOUR REF : SHA7484R ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSHA7484R AND SGV2142L

Hi Gabriel,
Please appoint LKK

Darren

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 6B442475

Fax: 68442474

From: Motor Claim - Il
Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 2:05 PM



To: TEAMWORK
Subject: RE: OUR REF : 1909-31 // YOUR REF : SHA7484R ACCIDENT INVOLVINGSHA7484R AND SGV2142L

L]

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email,

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyars:

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
o Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
I NG A FOEY)

B4 Cecil Street, #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 5347 6100, Ext — 248

Inpia
[NTERNATIONAL
INsuRANCE

From: TEAMWORK [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]

Sent: 18 September, 2019 12:00 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <mgtorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Cc: TEAMWORK <claim rkearage.com>

Subject: OUR REF : 1909-31 // YOUR REF : SHA7484R ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA7484R AND SGV2142L

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

OUR REF: 1905-31
YOUR REF : SHAT484R

Dear Sir / Madam,
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SGV2142L
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHAT4B4R AND 5GV2142L ON 16.09.2018,

We refer to the above matter and enclosed herewith our client’s GIA report and notification of Pre-repair inspection
for your attention.

We also enclosed herewith the State Court of the Republic of Singapore Practice Direction-Amendment No. 1 of
2016 of 2016 of Pre-repair Inspection for your attention.

Thank you and have a nice day.

Regards,



Shu Shan

Teamwork Garage Pre Ltd
81k 533 Ubi Avenue 1
#01-24

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 6844 2475

Fax:6844 2474

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclasing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
[nternet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed 1o us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.



India International Insurance Pte Lid.
Registration No, 198703792-K
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TeamWork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubl Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Tel : 6844 2475 Fox : 6844 2474
E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
GST registered number : 201015366H

PROFOMA INVOICE - PI-2050

KSEVEN TRANMSPORT Date 12-Mov-19
C/0 53 Ubl Avenue 1 #01-24 Yehicle number SGV2142L
Paya Ubl Industrial Park Make Model TOYOTA WISH
Singapore 408934 Accident date 16-Sep-19
Reference number 1909-31
Description Amount SGDS
Inclusive of supplying parts, labour, panel beating and spray
painting
Lump sum repalr 2000.00
7% GST 140.00
Grand total 2140.00
Singdollars:

TWO THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED AND FOURTY DOLLARS OMLY

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd




1211372019 Menmen a-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associated with :

‘SGV2142L (MCT19090387)
[SHAT484R]
TP

KSEVEN TRANSPORT
Sep 16 2019 8:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Teamwork Gaerage Pie Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 27/11/2018 16:17 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2876.49) - SGV2142L - Claim Handler: Pooi Chin Han Daniel

Approved:2876.49.

hitps-/isingapore. merimen. com/claime/index. cfm Plusebox=5VEmail&fuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=640453888 CF TOKEN=230434501c1520e1-D.,

11




Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of ]

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Casa  |Notified |3t Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad] Apt Ad] Submitted__1ns Auth'ed Statun
o |24 0ct 2019 vt 55200000 | Punding focSureey
! : Repart
_tatses | o A v | | Eonssmmens | | Ve s | o ]

| CLAIM SURFOLDER DETAILS [Creatsd by adjuster]
Insurea. COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co Reg Mo 1893038318
Main ¥
Clumant; | XSEVEN TRANSPORT,  Co. Reg. No.: 533602730
Wehicls Beg . | 18/03/2019 20:00 - :53
pa.: SGv214aL Date of LESS: |y 43 Months and 9 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Clwim Type: | TP / MCT19090397 FaRcr/Caver | MCOMOO1S (TP, Fire & Theft)
Varicle Reg,
Palicy No.
No. SHATABAR . |msoosrz2
2 {Clalmant]:
Excess:
Repairer. | Teamwork Garsge Pte Ltd (HQ) 53 Ubl Ave 1 #01-24, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, 408934 Ubi - Tel: 6844 2475
Handing | ndia International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 63476100 ... [Handied by Pool Chin Han Daniel)
PImANTE | Tokia Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6221 6111
sgjuster | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by MOND TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] ... [Final Rpt due
30/09/2019)
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view A |  Compuse Case Mas |
« 111_SG (27/11/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2876.49) - SGV2142L - Claim Handler: Poal Chin H...
|+ 115G (24/10/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - SGV2142L - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han ..
|

Ho results.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=
Due Date  Priority Type

View All | Sesrcn Tasks | Crmste mew Task | compiete |
Task Group  Subject  Handler  Assigned By Completed On  Created On  Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ds... 6/1/2020




Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*SGV2142L (MCT19090397)
[SHA7484R]
TP
KSEVEN TRANSPORT
Sap 16 2019 8:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Teamwark Garage Pte Ltd

Upiosd Documants | _upioed Phots | _Compase New Letar | View [Viaw in Browse -]
Photos/ Images [oerage  [~]| W |
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
I |12/11/1916:31 | Genersl View Q| arvs | M
2 191631 | Genaral View 0| wdws || A
3 |12/11/19 16:31 | Genersl View 0| vadrwc | A
4 | 12/1118 16:31 Goneral View 0| wadws | A
5 |12/13/1516:31 | Genersl View B | aews B
6 |12/11/1916:31 | General View 8| wawc | A

|7 121119 16:31 | General View 0| wedws | A
8 12119 16:31 | Genersl View 0| wuows | A
e |1mne 1631 Ganaral View 0| daws | A
10 1271119 16:31 | General View Q| wedws | B |
[11 (1211191631 | Genaral View 0| waaws | B4
12 [12/1110 16:31 | Ganeral View _g load G | BA
13 12419719 16:31 | Genersl View @ | aarwc | |
14 |12/11/19 16:31 | Ganers! View Q| toaarws | A
15 |12/11/19 16:31 | General View 0| eaws | &
16 |12/11/19 16:31 | Genersl View @ | ooare | A
17 | 12711019 16:31 | General View 0 | eave | B
18 |12/13/19 16:31 | Genersl View @ | leadws | B
19 | 1271119 16:31 Ganeral View 0 | lesdc | &
0 |12/11/19 16:31 | Ganeral View 8 s | &
11 |12/11/19 16:31 | General View @0 | woows | A
2211119 1631 | General View @ | edwc | B
Documentation |1 per page L;-j 7]
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd (HQ) — | [ Thumbnail Print
1 |19/09/19 12:04 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO 111 DD 18.09.3019 g Load POF
2 |19/09/19 12:04 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
1 |24/08/19 17:48 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED @) | Load POF
& |12/11/19 16:30 | LOD AND OTHER DOCUMENTS g Load POF
5 [21/11/19 14:35 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
6 |21/11/19 14:38 | LTA SEARCH ) | LoadrpF
7 |21/11/19 14:35 | GIA SEARCH @ | Lossroe
B 214117191439 (LOD a Load POF
§ |06/01/2009:06 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load PDF
10 |06/01/20 09:06 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM g Load POF
11 |D6/01/20 09:06 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
No_ | Fmalizsd On India Intemational Insurance Pte Ltd {HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |20/09/1909:02 | Singapare Accident Statement [

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST
There are no document checkliets configured.

i
i
i

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 6/1/2020



Menmen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Qur Cherckiist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Fte Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks To! D Handling Insumr
Pihm; Rasviirhs @ed privAle anlesl you o © 70 other pertse

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 6/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg no 1sseoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-BB05 Email: sur@kkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/I18016540/T1GA302

Date: 06/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMD015
Claimant "
Vehicle No : SGV2142L Insured Vehicle No : SHAT4B4R
Date of Loss. 16/00/2019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18080387
M & IDEN
Reg No: SGV2142L
Maks & Model: TOYOTA WISH, 1.8 (A) Engine No: 1222922705
Reg. Date: O7/06/2007 (Man. Year, 2007) Chassis No: ZNE100368879
Colour: White Odometer: 275168 km
Engine Capacity. 1794 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured {S$). Market Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Fronl Left Side: Firelli & mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Fronl Right Side: Pirelli 8 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm
The above valtes represant [he remaring fyre ireads dopih
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parls 5,204.02 1.653.87 3,650.05 68.22
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00 _
Labour 3,.410.00 B60.00 2.,550.00 T4 7B
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) B,614.02 2,513.97 6,100.05 70.82
Approvad Total (Overridden) (55) 2,000.00
(5%) 8.614.02 2,000.00 6,614.02 76.78
+ GST 7.00i7.00% (S%) 602.68 140.00 4B52.98 T6.78
Nett Amount [S§) 9,217.00 2,140.00 7.077.00 T6.7B
+ Car Rental (7.0 x 55100.00/day) (S%) 700.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (5§) 36.40
Nett Liability (S§) 2,676.49
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18/09/2018
Date Inspected: 16/09/2018 Inspected At: Teamwork Garage Pte Lid (HQ)
53 Ubl Ave 1 #01-24, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park
Singapore 408834
Estimated Period of Repair: 30days

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 6/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE: This repor represents our findings &t the fime and place of inspection stalsd heram. Such inapection fas been camed out to the besf of our
kncwiadge and abiily bul any olher latdity under any cther circumatances {3 hereby exprasaly axciated

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 6/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Reference

|Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 21 Nov 2019)

|Parts: M1-MPV TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A) (Catalogue:Mearimen Singapore 1.0)
}Lahnur: Repalrer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SGV21421)

Validity:

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount

1 1 “FRONT BUMPER Deformed 57740FL *57740FL
2 2 *FRONT BUMPER COVER Mot Necessary 104 BEFL “.FL
i 1 *FRONT BUMPER RETAINER Q/S MNecessary 14530FL  *T2865FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Mot Necessary 338.36FL “FL
5 1 *"FRONT BUMPER SPONGE Mot Necessary 184 10FL *FL
B 1 ‘FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE Mot Necessary 217.30FL FL
71 *FRONT GRILLE Mot Necessary 183 40FL ~FL
B 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Mot Necassary B81.50FL *FL
g 2 *HORN Mot Necessary 161.30FL =~FL
0 1 *FRONT RH FENDER Bent 607 44FL “6OT.44FL
" 1 *FRONT RH FENDER INNER SHIELD Not Mecessary 181.55FL = FL
12 1 *HEADLAMP O/S Cracked 1,63560FL *B17.B0FL
13 2 *FRONT FOG LAMP COVER Mot Necassary 248 80FL *~FL
14 1 *SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH Mot Necessary 254 DOFL *FL
15 1 *FRONT NUMBER PLATE Not Necessary T0.00FS “FS
16 1 *SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP Mecessary B0.00FS *30.00FS
17 1 *SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP Mot Mecessary 50.00FS *FS
18 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP Not Necessary BOO.0OFS *FS

FeFranchise part, S=SpcMatt. L=UsiltemDisc

Sub Total (5§) 6,612.03 2,185.29
- List Item Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (S§)  1.408.01 541.32

Total Parts (S§) 5,204.02 1,653.97

Report was unsubmitted dunng this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Itams

1  CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM New 60.00 30.00

2 PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS MNew 1,600.00 400.00

3  SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS New 1.600.00 400.00

4  APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS New 150.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 3,410.00 860.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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