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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, January 10, 2020 11:02 AM
To: Winnie Tan
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: OFFER - Accident between GBC 4070G & SCR 6884X [AIG]  on 31/08/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Winnie, 
 
We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
 
The vehicles could have moved from the point of impact thus the position of the vehicles in the after accident 
photos. 
 
There is no accident video footage to support either parties version and the accident versions are conflicting. 
 
As such, we maintain our proposed settlement on a 50% basis for global sum of $2,877.00(all in). 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Winnie Tan <winnie.tan@tlmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 10:34 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OFFER - Accident between GBC 4070G & SCR 6884X [AIG] on 31/08/2019 
 
Our ref: TP016092019 (GBC4070G) 
Your ref: SCR 6884X [AIG] 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Khanchna,  
 
Thank you for your prompt reply. 
 
1. The photographs which we had provided were directly after the accident while they were still in their existing 
lanes without driving to the road shoulder. Do note that your principal insured’s vehicle was driven to the front 
of our client’s vehicle while our client’s vehicle was at the point right after the accident.  
 
2. Please see your principal insured’s photo as attached. The primary damages were at the front left fender and 
bumper and the side mirror. As such, based on both parties’ damages, it was unlikely to be a side swipe case as 
per your principal insured’s version.  
 
Therefore, we appeal to you to review the case again.  
 
Thank you.  
 
 

 

Winnie Tan 
winnie.tan@tlmotor.com.sg  

 
O.    +65 6858 5151  
F.     +65 6858 0877  

 

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd 
1 Defu Lane 6 
Singapore 539365 
http://www.tlmotor.com.sg 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim Motor 
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended 
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-virus 
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly. 

 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 10 January, 2020 10:07 AM 
To: Winnie Tan <winnie.tan@tlmotor.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: OFFER - Accident between GBC 4070G & SCR 6884X [AIG] on 31/08/2019 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Winnie, 
 
We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
 
The accident photos  are after the accident and again the vehicles could have moved from the point of 
impact. 
 
Our Insured vehicle is also damaged at the side door and he confirmed that this is a side swipe accident. 
 
We maintain our proposed settlement on a 50% basis for global sum of $2,877.00(all in). 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Winnie Tan <winnie.tan@tlmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 9:55 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OFFER - Accident between GBC 4070G & SCR 6884X [AIG] on 31/08/2019 
 
Our ref: TP016092019 (GBC4070G) 
Your ref: SCR 6884X [AIG] 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Khanchna,  
 
Thank you for your email dated 07 January 2020.  
 
We had spoken to our client, he is unable to accept your offer of 50%.  
 
1. The photographs were taken right after the accident.  
2. If it were to be a side swipe case,  
               a) your principal insured’s vehicle would not be in front of our client’s vehicle right after the accident.  
               b) our client’s damages were on the right side door while your principal’s insured’s damages were left 
front fender.  
Therefore, it is not considered a side swipe case.  
 
As such, appreciate if you can review the case again and let us have your offer based on the following: -  
 
Cost of repair:    S$5,350.00 
LTA:                      S$        2.00 
Loss of use:         S$    900.00 (S$180*5 days) 
Total:                   S$6,252.00 
 
Thank you and look forward to your positive response.  
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Winnie Tan 
winnie.tan@tlmotor.com.sg  

 
O.    +65 6858 5151  
F.     +65 6858 0877  

 

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd 
1 Defu Lane 6 
Singapore 539365 
http://www.tlmotor.com.sg 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim Motor 
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended 
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-virus 
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly. 

 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 07 January, 2020 12:00 PM 
To: Winnie Tan <winnie.tan@tlmotor.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OFFER - Accident between GBC 4070G & SCR 6884X [AIG] on 31/08/2019 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Winnie, 
 
We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
 
We noted that the accident photo was taken after the accident and the vehicles could have moved from the 
point of impact. 
 
Our Insured driver also confirmed that this is a side swipe accident. 
 
We maintain our proposed settlement on a 50% basis for global sum of $2,877.00(all in). 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
 
“Wishing you a happy and a prosperous New Year!” 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 


