
To:  Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 

The Concourse 

Singapore 199555 

Attn:   Motor Claims Department 

Date:  13th October 2019  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

Claimant: Able Fire Control Pte Ltd 

  

“WITHOUT PREJUDICE” 

 

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you in connection with a road traffic accident on 

16/09/2019 at along Pioneer Road North, in front of Blk 839 involving our client’s vehicle registration number GBH 

1185 C and vehicle registration number GBC 6207 S driven by your insured at the material time.  

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and/or management of your 

vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense, 

particulars of which are as follows:  

1) Vehicle Repair Costs     $8,000.00 

2) Loss of Rental (SGD$130.00 x 7Days)   $973.70 

3) LTA Search Fee      $7.45 

4) Purchase of GIA Report      $29.00 

  

Total :       $9,010.15 

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:  

- Singapore Accident Statement 

- Rental Invoice 

- LTA Search Fee Receipt 

- Purchase of GIA Report Receipts 

Please send us an acknowledgement of receipt within 14 days of your receipt of this letter, failing which our client 

will have no alternative but to commence proceedings against you without further notice.  

Yours faithfully,  

Elin Cai 

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd 
130 Bedok Reservoir Road 

#08-1339 Singapore 470130 

Mobile: 9450 7920 | E-mail: zoomautowerks@gmail.com 

 



N



24/06/2020



email: zoomautowerks@gmail.com | Contact: 9450 7920

 Co. Reg No.: 201725603G

INVOICE
To: Invoice No. : ZI0000407

Date : 4/6/2020

VRN : GBH 1185 C

Make & Model : Toyota Dyna

DOA : 16/9/2019

Terms : COD

S/N. Qty U/P Amt

1  9,000.00 

TOTAL : $9,000.00

I agree to the price as listed above and confirm that 

goods are received in good condition.

(Customer's Signature ) (by Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd)

Loss of Rental 

LTA Search Fee

Purchase of GIA Report

Singapore 199555

Description

Repair & Respray Accident Affected Portions

ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD

130 Bedok Reservoir Road, Eunos Spring

#08-1339 Singapore 470130

Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

300 Beach Road

#17-04/07 The Concourse

Type text here
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 1:52 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC - 

19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on 16/09/2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Khanchna, 
 
Kindly proceed as proposed. 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 9:08 am 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC - 19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on 
16/09/2019 [External Confidential] 
 
LPC ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022385 
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19016424/Ukb3s2 
 
 
Dear Mr. Gerald, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Our offer was rejected. We re-seek mandate as follows:  
  

Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair $ 14,699.69 $ 8,000.00 

2. Loss of Rental (7 days x $ 130) 
(w/GST) 

$ 973.70 $ 973.70 (7 day x $ 130) (w/GST) 

3. LTA Search Fee $ 7.45 $ 7.45 
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4. GIA Report  $ 29.00 $ 29.00 

Total $ 15,709.84 $ 9,010.15  

**9 day recommendation for repair  

 
Your approval please. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN  
Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 5:18 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG  
Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC - 19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on 
16/09/2019 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Khanchna, 
 
Kindly proceed as proposed. 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 1:35 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC - 19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on 16/09/2019 
 
LPC ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022385 
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19016424/Ukb3s2 
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Dear Sir/Madam, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We have highlighted to your good office on 17/09/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with 
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

This is a 3 vehicle chain collision and Insured vehicle is last. We opine that BOLA 28 is applicable. 
 
Summary to offer to third party repairer “ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD” as follows: - 
  

Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair $ 14,699.69 $ 8,000.00 

2. Loss of Rental (7 days x $ 130) 
(w/GST) 

$ 973.70 $ 898.80 (7 day x $ 120) (w/GST) 

3. LTA Search Fee $ 7.45 $ 7.45 

4. GIA Report  $ 29.00 $ 29.00 

Total $ 15,709.84 $ 8,935.25 

**9 day recommendation for repair  

The above is for your approval. 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 




