Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 1:52 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC -

19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on 16/09/2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Khanchna,
Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Bl s,

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 9:08 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC - 19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on
16/09/2019 [External Confidential]

LPC ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022385
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19016424/Ukb3s2
Dear Mr. Gerald,

We refer to the above matter.

Our offer was rejected. We re-seek mandate as follows:

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair $ 14,699.69 $ 8,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (7 days x $ 130) $973.70 $ 973.70 (7 day x $ 130) (w/GST)

(wW/GST)

3. LTA Search Fee $7.45 $ 7.45




4. GIA Report $29.00 $29.00
Total | $ 15,709.84 $9,010.15

**9 day recommendation for repair

Your approval please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 5:18 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC - 19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on
16/09/2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Khanchna,
Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 1:35 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Mandate Request - Accident between GBH 1185C & GBC 6207S [LPC - 19/19/19/VC05/022385 ] on 16/09/2019

LPC ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022385
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19016424/Ukb3s2



Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 17/09/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a 3 vehicle chain collision and Insured vehicle is last. We opine that BOLA 28 is applicable.

Summary to offer to third party repairer “2Z00M AUTOWERKS PTE LTD” as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair $ 14,699.69 $ 8,000.00
2. Loss of Rental (7 days x $ 130) $973.70 $ 898.80 (7 day x $ 120) (w/GST)
(w/GST)
3. LTA Search Fee $7.45 $7.45
4. GIA Report $29.00 $29.00
Total | $ 15,709.84 $ 8.935.25

**9 day recommendation for repair

The above is for your approval.

Thank you.
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Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




