Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Auto Bolt Body & Paint Pte Ltd <autoboltbp@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 February, 2020 9:12 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SLG8468C AND SJJ8092K ON 14.09.2019- Our Ref: 6752004929SG - LKK REF
CC4/A1G19016417/Aha3

Attachments: img-200211111615.pdf

Dear Vic,

Please see attached file for your perusal.
Appreciate.

Regards,
Kai Ling
Auto Bolt Services Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #03-01
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Tel: 9061 2555
9068 7204
9851 1300
Like us on our Facebook page @ Auto Bolt Body & Paint Pte Ltd

From: "Vic (LKKAuto)" <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Date: Monday, 10 February 2020 at 3:03 PM

To: Auto Bolt Body & Paint Pte Ltd <autoboltbp@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>, "Vic (LKKAuto)" <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLG8468C AND
SJJ8092K ON 14.09.2019- Our Ref: 6752004929SG - LKK REF CC4/A1G19016417/Aha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Kai Ling,
We refer further to our below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer below amount to settle your client’s claim.

Cost of Repair S 4,100.00
Loss of Rental (5120 x 6 days) S 720.00
GIA Search Fee S 29.00
LTA Search Fee S 7.45

TOTAL $ 4,856.45



If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward a copy to us for payment processing.
The above amount is to be made payable to AUTO BOLT BODY & PAINT PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F LI *

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Md Noor, Norsiah [mailto:Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 31 January, 2020 2:45 PM

To: Auto Bolt Body & Paint Pte Ltd; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hor, Yinrul

Subject: RE: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLG8468C AND SJJ8092K
ON 14.09.2019- Our Ref: 6752004929S5G

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kai Ling,

Please be advised that LKK will follow-up on this matter.
Dear Vic,

Refer to the above.

Please assist to revert to Auto Bolt Pte Ltd on settlement.

Thank you

Kind regards
Norsiah

Norsiah Md Noor



AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419-1606

Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Auto Bolt Body & Paint Pte Ltd [mailto:autoboltbp@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, January 31, 2020 1:23 PM

To: Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>; Chin, Lee-Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa
<NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Chan, Yoke Shi
<yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur
<Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>; 'Autobolt Pte Ltd ' <alvinong@singnet.com.sg>; Subramaniam,
Divyashni <Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>; alvinong@singnet.com.sg; Parthiban, Theerthan
<Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLG8468C AND
SJJ8092K ON 14.09.2019

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Hi Norsiah,
Can | have a status for this case?

Regards,
Kai Ling
Auto Bolt Services Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 5 #03-01
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Tel: 9061 2555
9068 7204
9851 1300
Like us on our Facebook page @ Auto Bolt Body & Paint Pte Ltd

From: "Hor, Yinrul" <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>

Date: Friday, 20 December 2019 at 1:15 PM

To: Autobolt Body & Paint Pte Ltd <autoboltbp@gmail.com>, "Md Noor, Norsiah"
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<Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Cc: "Fong, Andy-SY" <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>, "Chin, Lee-Ying" <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>, "Abu Kassim,
Noor Mariesa" <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>, "Azlan, Syazairdina" <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>,
"Chan, Yoke Shi" <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>, "Lim, Sheng Yang" <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>, "Mithoosingh,
Aashweenjeetkaur" <Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>, 'Autobolt Pte Ltd '
<alvinong@singnet.com.sg>, "Subramaniam, Divyashni" <Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>,
"alvinong@singnet.com.sg" <alvinong@singnet.com.sg>, "Parthiban, Theerthan"
<Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>

Subject: RE: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLG8468C AND
SJJ8092K ON 14.09.2019

AlG ) <

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

Este es un mensaje cifrado y seguro. Para leerlo, abra el archivo
adjunto.

Esta € uma mensagem criptografada segura. Para |é-lo, abra o
anexo.

Ceci est une sécurité, un message crypté. Pour le lire, ouvrez la
piece jointe.

NEBESEEN-BEFA—ILTY, BEICEFFTI7A41L
ZRWLTCEZSLY,

Click here by 2019-12-26 23:15 CST to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info



