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Celine Fong (LKKAuto) My Lim

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 3:54 PM

To: 'Nor Azian Binte Noordin'

Cc: assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: Urgent: MV for SIC3213Z (DOA: 16/04/2019)
Dear Azian,

The market value for SJIC 3213Z is $18K — $19K(est) as at April 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 2:46 PM

To: 'Nor Azian Binte Noordin' <NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Urgent: MV for SJIC3213Z (DOA: 16/04/2019)

Dear Azian,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Shirley,

Kindly assist

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nor Azian Binte Noordin [mailto:NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Thursday, 25 April 2019 11:35 AM

To: Undisclosed recipients:

Subject: Urgent: MV for SJC3213Z (DOA: 16/04/2019)

Importance: High

Dear all,




Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Nor Azian Binte Noordin <NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 5:39 PM

Subject: Urgent: MV for SJC3213Z (DOA: 16/04/2019)

Importance: High

Dear all,

Please let us have the market value for the above car urgently. Details of the car make and model is as per below.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Nor Azian Binte Noordin
Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o © Q

AMember of BNEYTA] INSURANCE GROUP

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type
Singapore NRIC
Owner ID
4651D

Vehicle No.

SJC3213Z

Vehicle to be Exported

No

Intended Deregistration Date
25 Apr 2019

Vehicle Make

HYUNDAI

Vehicle Model

130 (FD) 1.6 AUTO ABS AIRBAG SR 2WD 5DR
Primary Colour

Blue

Manufacturing Year

2010

Engine No.

G4FCAU829686

Chassis No.



KMHDC51DMAU243304
Maximum Power Output
89.7 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value
$12,883.00

Original Registration Date
28 Sep 2010

First Registration Date
28 Sep 2010

Transfer Count

0

Actual ARF Paid
$12,883.00

PARF Eligibility

Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
27 Sep 2020

PARF Rebate Amount
$7,085.00

COE Expiry Date

27 Sep 2020

COE Category

A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years)

10

QP Paid

$30,001.00

COE Rebate Amount
$4,266.00

Total Rebate Amount
$11,351.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Apr 2019
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Used Hyundai Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

: SGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars

Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum

. ANNOUNCING Speedo Motoring:

as sgCarMart Premium, Dealer for the 8" Consecutive Year

Resources

Pest an Ad

| Browse by Category

11 vehicles

Search Selection

GET YOUR

| COE

| RENEWAL
LOAN

Well Maintained Unit, Spacious And Reliable! Sunraof Model. Good Condition And Ideal For Short Term Usage! Fuel Efficient. Call For A Viewing
Appointment Today!

Mayfair Motoring
Posted: 23-Apr-2019  Tags: 2010 Hyundai i30, 2010 hyundai 130, Hyundai i30, hyundai i30, Hyundai, 30, Used Hyundai

Hyundai i30 1.6A Sunroof = N.A 23-Aug-2010 1,591 cc - Hatchback

Well Taken Care Of With Regular Servicing And Parts Changed, Fuel Consumption Is Great And Car Is Hassle Free. Accident Free, Perfect For
Grab/Gojek Or Short Term Drives Selling As We're Buying A Bigg...

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=201 0&ORD=RGD_ASC&MOD=Hyundai&MMO=i30&RPG=20&VEH=0

3 New 10 Years Cae Renewal Toyota Wish 1.8a | - — |
Post an d ; ﬂ
[ 3 Advertisement _ Autolinn -
Sell it yourselfl Advertise it at just “ PA Low Intorest @ AR Iipiration For Car Biyers =
on wyy
$58 until it's SOLD! click here to view E
our PRISTINE USED CARS =
GV Credit Pte Ltd at GREAT PRICES ]
Advertiser Login Ways of Selling ™
] Sort by Date Posted ¥ |[ 20 resuits/page
|Hyundai i30 | Advanced searcr g
Price Depreciation ) Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Hyundai i30 Any Any 2010 Any Any Any All
Hyundai i320 1.6A Sunroof - N.A 05-Jan-2010 1,591 cc - Hatchback SOLD
(New S-yr COE)
One Of The Most Spacious Hatchback Unit! Huge Boot Space Perfect For That 4-legged Family Member!, Option For 5 Or 10 Years Coe Renewal
Available.No Repair Needed, Low Mileage Done, Super Well Maintali...
Karz Automobile
Posted: 14-Apr-2019  Tags: 2010 Hyundal i30, 2010 hyundai 130, Hyundai 130, hyundai i30, Hyundai, i30, Used Hyundai
Hyundai i30 Wagon 1.6A 5 N.A 05-Feb-2010 1,591 cc - Stationwagon SOLD
Ex Lady Owner. Rare Unit With Full Servicing History With Komoco - Hyundai Offical Agent. Car Is In Original Paint Work And Condition. NO Admin o
Fee Or Loan Requirement. Car Is Available Immediately, ' e aii do
Posted: 10-Apr-2019  Tags: 2010 Hyundai i30, 2010 hyundat 130, Hyundai i30, hyundai i30, Hyundai, i30, Used Hyundai
Hyundai i30 1,6A Sunroof g N.A 01-Mar-2010 1,591 cc - Hatchback SOoLD
(New 5-yr COE)
Low Mileage Of Only 150000Km. Very Well Maintained By Previous Owner. No Repairs Needed, Mint Condition, Good For Short Term Ride, Definitely
Valuable Buy! Low Fuel Consumption! Great For The Family W...
Posted: 15-Mar-2019  Tags: 2010 Hyundai 130, 2010 hyundai i30, Hyundai i30, hyundai i30, Hyundai, i30, Used Hyundai
Hyundai i30 1.6A Sunroof $26,800 $5,350 /yr 17-Mar-2010 1,591 cc 91,000 km Hatchback Available
(OPC) (New 5-yr COE)
Selling Point 1, Genuine Low Mileage 1 Owner Car, 2. New Continental Tires Just Changed 2 Weeks Ago. 100% Accident Free! Conversion To Normal
Plate Available, Warranty On All Major Parts, Guaranteed B...
Posted: 11-Apr-2019  Tags: 2010 Hyundai 130, 2010 hyundai i30, Hyundai 130, hyundai 130, Hyundai, 130, Used Hyundal
Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!
Getting your COE renewed Is easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it, Get the cheapest loan in town and an
approval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today.
Hyundai i30 Wagon 1.6A $15,800 $9,470 fyr 18-Mar-2010 1,591 cc - Stationwagon Available
Sunroof
Purchase From Case Trust & SVTA Accredited Company With A Peace Of Mind! 1 Careful Owner! View To Believe! 1 Careful Owner Whom Upgraded
To New Car! High Trade-Ins/Flexible In House Loans Available! G...
Posted: 14-Apr-2019  Tags: 2010 Hyundai i30, 2010 hyundai i30, Hyundai 30, hyundai i30, Hyundai, i30, Used Hyundai
Hyundai i30 Wagon 1.6A 517,800 $9,740 /yr 27-May-2010 1,591 cc - Stationwagon Available
Sunroof

SOLD
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