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MS‘ FirstCapital

6 Raffles Quay 221-00 Sangapore D4AS80
Tel (6516222 2311 Fax {B5) 6222 3547

Clalms & Hotor Underwsiting Bept: 36 Rabinsan Rgad R1E6-01 Cly

Tel: (65} 6507 3R48 Fax {65 6507 3849
W mafirstcapital com,sp

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited .. Reg No. L

UDGLOEE. CST Aug ke M2 00016759

¥ Mouse Singapore DGAAT T

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

09-09-2019 Our Ref No. D19005827MFSH
07-09-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB3408H Third Party Vehicle. GT6990P

BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18

JOYCE TAN

62686183/ 0 Fax No. 62681429
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68415315

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

Kindly submit

SNG AH TEE MOTOR &

FANEL SERVICE PTE Attention. NIL
LTD
A TP Solicitor Fax No, NA

MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

This is a computer genarated letter, no signature required,

the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 2:47 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments; SUR
Cc: ‘Merina Chia

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005827MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF GT 6930P.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GT 6990P
Number of days (estimated) : 5 days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 3:00 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005827MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Sharon 5ng <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Friday, B November 2019 5:06 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: GT 8990P / TP / DOA: 7/9/2019

Attachments: img-191108161453.pdf; IMG_20190927_105956.jpg; IMG_20190927_110026.jpg;

IMG_20190927_110130,jpg; IMG_20190927_110158,jpg; IMG_20190927_110206.jpg;
IMG_20190927_110215,jpg; IMG_20190923_093104 jpg; IMG_20190923_093257 jpg

asking for 7 days for repair.
thanks.

From: Sharon Sng

Sent: Friday, November 8, 2019 5:05 PM

To: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GT 6990P / TP / DOA: 7/9/2019

Hi

pls refer to attachment for finalising.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

S5NG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http:/fwww sngahtee.com

-Please note that all offer/acceptance is made without prejudice.-

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2019 10:18 AM

To: Janice Chang <janice @sngahtee.com>; SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>
Cc: 'Sharon Sng' <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Subject: GT 6990P / TP / DOA: 7/9/2019

Dear Sir,

Would like check this case status. If any repair done

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2015 4:52 PM
To: Sharon 5Sng; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: GT 6930F / TP / DOA: 7/9/2019
Dear Sharon,

Confirm lump sum $4050/-, 7days.

Please submit your relevant document to First Capital directly.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Iikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2018 5:06 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com=; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: GT 6990P / TP / DOA: 7/9/2019

asking for 7 days for repair.
thanks.

From: Sharon Sng

Sent: Friday, November 8, 2019 5:05 PM

To: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; "Taufikh {LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GT 69390P / TP / DOA: 7/9/2019

Hi
pls refer to attachment for finalising.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

5SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PAMEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAH

MOTOR G

-Please note that all offer/occeptance is mode without prejudice.-
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S1LUBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065} 5156-!3!5

Your Ref: D19005827TMFSH
Our Ref: cs/FCI1s016398/T1H3
The Motor Claims Department

Fi ital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO__GT 6990P

Date: 19/09/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

18/09/2019 at the premises of M/s Sng Ah Tee have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check” ltems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Mett Value

Deescription of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion,

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Taufikh

Automotive Assessor

: 8§ 6.307.49
: 5% 4.557.56
1S 420.21

: 5%
:S$
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TTED BY' Eric Woo

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT MOTICE

1. Pleass report comrectly the desalls af the
el T

acciden! 1o speed up the claims process
2. This Form must be completed by the Palicyhelder and/or the Authorised Dhriver

3. Info

i maton provided must be as Lrulhful and accurate a5 possible. Any willul misrepresentstion or w tholding of material facts may allow insurance comasanias 1o
repudiate policy lability,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by inSurance companies iz rol an admissian of paliey i
3. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Managemen:

ability on the part of the insurance companies,

Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Bingapore (GIA) far

archiving and that copies of thie repard will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgemant of this repert to the insurers
aforesaid

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

Exacl Location OF Accident

vau hereby consent to the archiving of this repor al the centre znd ta cosies of the repar peing made avallabie

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

09/09/2019 0856

07/08/2019 08:40

SENGKANG EAST ROAD TOWARDS TPE(SLE)

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number GTG280P

Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registaraed Chwner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

WModal

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Poficy Number

Cover Note Numbar

Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

Ocoupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

MMobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number

EMail Address

B K 8 CATERING
310258008
MOEMAIL

MNISSAN
NWV200-1.5 (M)

COMMERCIAL USE

6]

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

o084398706-02

COMPREHENSIVE

PANG SENG SAN
817172754

25/05/1965

INDODR

12/11/11984

34 YEARS AND 9 MONTHS
MALE

[LOCAL) +65-93657976

MOEMAIL

FPage 1 of 14



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employes of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insuraed

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved In this accident?

Mumbar of vehicles (including own vehicle)
nvolved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

VWas any injured conveved to hospital by
ambulanca?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

MNumber of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reporied o the police?

If ¥es,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

BLK 2508 COMPASSVALE STREET #07-75

42250

YES

on

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR

DRY

MO

NO
NO
YES

MO

MNQ

MO

| STOPPED AT THE SLIP ROAD AND WAS CHECKING FOR VEHICLES ON THE MAIN ROAD. VEHICLE 8 COULD NOT
STOP IN TIME AND HIT INTQO THE REAR PORTION OF MY VEHICLE.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Vas there any audio recordad?

YES
NO
MO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

“ahicle Registration Mumber
Wahicle MakeModel/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

MName of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Fostcode

Insurance Company Mame
Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

SHEB3408H
YELLOW TAXI
FRONT PORTION
TAXI

MISS LIM

98190838

Fage 2 of 14



Sketch Plan Pg. 1
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SHETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please rgpon esrrectly e detass afthe Brzadent i soeed up e claims amcess
2. Thig Form must b= completad by the Palicvholder andlor the Authorised Driver

3. Information amvided must be 85 truthiul and accurate as poasible, Any wiliul misrspresenation or withtisiding of Tatgrig facis
mE allow BLrance comain|es 1o cppudiste oolicy fabiity,

4. The isgue ang sossptance of this Form by INBUrENCE comogniss i nol an admissan af oodicy fiabiiiny an the car of te lsurance
companies

5. Any faise recorimg may be referred 1o the Palize For invastication,

4. The mron wil be forwarded by the insurars of the GIA Records Manasemant Centre sstablished by e Genees! fsurance Assaciation
ol Bingapare (318] fac archiving and that tooles of thig repon will lor 2 fee be mace avedanle uoon apslicatan by interessed panies,

7. B thg sodasment of thi réood 1o e FISLITAE, Yo hareby consant Lo the archiving of this reper At the c=ntre and 1o copies of e
rapont feing mads available plaresaid.

B, Lonsent under the Parsanal Data Frotection Act {PBPA)
| urdersiang pehnomiedoe qroe B0 carsant tia: -

{&1 Miv Msurer . my workshoo ang the Ganaral Insurance Association of Sinaaoare (G147 maviarg warmitted to cofiect. use, disciose
arddiar eeocesE My oersansl datapersanal indormetian =8 oul i this Horm) and any oher cerseng mfarmation orovided By mE or
bDosseszed Oy my maurer (collectively the Personal Infarmeation”) and dsciose and ranatar such Parsaral infomation o gt
insuranizl wha have inswuad vehice's| Invaivesd in this scodent fal INBUrens) who have insurad wehicha!s ! invalvad I this accicigni
shal be cobsctively refersd o as the Ingurers"], the Insuners' lawieraiam fimms. the Monetary Augharsy of Sinassoee and any
eSSV SOVBFIMEN! SIensyELcrty (Sush as e pafical, far the oumosals! of -

tii srocassing, randing andior gealing w itk m zlaims including the sattemant of the caims and amy necsssany irvessioanans
rglatng Io the cleims:

fiid investigaling the acsident ardior my caims:

{i) safrana ot andior sesing with my instructions ar fespanding b2 any enauires by me:

i} adrminigiering my cleems (inouding the mailing of comeasandence, stalEmente. Invaices, regon ar notizes io me,
which could involve disciosurs of Sertain perpsaisl date aboul me o Bring ebout dadvary of the same as well 82 an the axtema
covar of afvelopas)rail nackages): sndiar

fwh eamplang whiy acoicabée law im adminislednz. proeassing, handlisg andior gesling with my clameg [eallecteiv iha “Purposas™

IB} all ingsirers) wha heve insured vehicig|s] nvalved in tis accident and the Insurers’ lawrversiaw firme. maviane permitied o collect,
usz. disclone andior (Mosass my Persang Infarmation for ohe or more of fe above Purpeses; and

[} oo Persaral Information mawean be Cacinsed by eny of the Insurers andior 14 1o Iher thind Sanly service Cooviders or eaents
finchuting thei- lewvershaw firms), which may be sised Sutsige of Sinosnors. for one o mare of the abave Pumposss.

L&} ey Peraonal mformation will 22es be calisciad and used w complis chaims history far the pumoss of fraud astechon westization and
B fubure ciaims

(e} the infornation 5o coliectad undes (4} abova fay be sharad | disclcaad:

11110 all Insurers andior ary other iird parties that 2z i =valualing, inveshinasng. controlling or manaaing faud. raousses
law enfarcement and government agencies as Teasorable required for the pureasss sigled. or

(17} Tt cempivire with reauireenants under any regulstions, |ovw O COHATL e,

BKS CATERING . T S 2
ks IR o,
e il d-F - E 82018 fe54 T L
Palicyhoioars Sionature Diriver' B 3ionalure (1] driver 18 ot the poficyhalder) fiepaning Centrg Personnels Sianatre
Date & Tima: Diae B Mame: Erc Wea Jun Kigl

NRIC! Firn No; 5882753

Page 3 of 14



SKETCH PLAN

Sketch Plan Pyg. 2

SENGKANG EAST RDAD TOWARDS TPEISLE)
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|

e |

Vehicle B: SHEMOEH | |

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

I STOPPED AT THE SLIF ROAD AND WAS CHECKING FOR VEHICLES ON THE MAIN ROAD, VEHICLE B COULD NOT
STOF [N TIME AND HIT INTO THE REAR PORTION OF MY VEHICLE.

DECLARATION

"W decarg ihe RFBgong pariculies &re inse in every respecl

BKS CATERING »

Polcyhalder's Gignsture
Dale & Time:

e Ll R

REIN1R9:58

SHEATAD NS

4

Reporang Cantre Parsonnel's Signature
Hamea: Eric Woo Jun Kiat
NAIC! Fin Mo 5833753

Page 4 of 14



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owener |D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model;

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Sep 2019

Business
2008

GT&790P

No

28 Sep 2019

MNISSAN

NV200 1.5L MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD 6DREURD 5
White

2015
KPKC4000054710
VEKYBAM20Z0104832
$20,050.00

22 Oct 2015

22 Oct 2015

0

$1,003.00

Mo

$0.00

21 0ct 2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$43,185.00
$26,178.00
$26,178.00

OK
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SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

MOTOR CLAIMS DEP

Website: www.sngahtee.co
RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: 2008104

36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-0]
CITY HOUSE SINGAPORE 068877

ATTENTION :
CONTACT : 6222 2311

FAX NO: 6507 3849

DATE

ACCIDENT DATE

VEHICLE NO
CHASSIS/ENG.NO @ VSKYBAM20Z0106832

VEHICLE MODEL :

CLAIM NO

POLICY NO

REMARK

'I!;‘STIOUUTE NO. 5Q005175

16/09/2019
07/09/2019
: GTH990P

NISSAN NV200

6990 TP AGST FIRST
CAP SHB3408H

SN, QTY UNIT

DESCRIPTION

PRICE DISC % JMSC/MARKUP TOTAL AMT

** LIST PRICE **

** NETT PRICE **

SUB-TOTAL: .00

666,00 = fﬁ"’?ﬁﬁ,m

1 1 PC REAR BUMPER 740.00 10
2 2 PC REAR BUMPER RETAINER 33.30 10 2997 WA X ¥ 5904
3 6 PC REAR BUMPER CLIPS 4.40 10 396 A 2374
4 1 PC REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR(LH) 55.00 10 4950 WA XX 4950
5 1 B REAR BOOT LID LH 1.381.10 10 124200 £C— 124200
fr 1. PE EEAR BOOT LID LOCK LH 116.70 10 105.03 b‘l‘ £ 10503
7 1 PC REAR BOOT LID TRIMBOARD LH 184.80 10 166.32 MR 1 166.32
g I PC REAR BOOT LID RUBBER 96.40 10 86.76 WA X 8676
9 I PC REAR BOOT LID RH 960.90 10 864.81 AL— 86481
10 I PC REAR BOOT LID RUBBER RH 67.20 10 60.48 WA X 6048
1 | PC REAR BOOT LID LOCK RH 116.70 10 10503 WP ' 10503
12 1 PC REAR BOOT LID TRIMBOARD RH 118.40 10 106.56 "N 106,56
13 1 PC REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH 69.90 10 iy~ 6201 &R X 6201
SUB-TOTAL 3,600,090
#% SPECIAL NETT PRICE **
1 1 PC REAR BOOT GLASS SEALANT 40.00 40.00 AL 40,00
2 1 PC  REARNUMBER PLATE 35.00 35.00mn X135 00
3 | PC  REARBOOT GLASS SEALANT 40,00 4000 M- 40.00
4 1 PC REAR END PANEL 152.40 1532.40 ',{fw 152.40
— PAGE: 1of2

ON BEHALF OF SNG AH TEE PANEL & SERVICE PTE LTD

Disclaimer clause;

E&OE

The above estimate/quotation is meant for solely the intended party stated above and in any event, we are not liable to any other parties arising from
the circumstances of this or any action taken in reliance on such estimates or quotations.
Quaotation is only valid for 14 days.
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SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

Website: www.sngahtee.co
RCB. Req. / GST Reg. hgln: 20031{144%1"!0“0113 NO. SOHESITS

FIRST CA}“ITAL INSURANCE LIMITED DATE 16/09/2019
MOTOR CLAIMS DEP ACCIDENT DATE : 07/09/2019
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 VEHICLE NO - GT6990P
CITY HOUSE SINGAPORE (68877 CHASSIS ENG.NO © VSKYBAM20Z0106832
d VEHICLE MODEL : NISSAN NV200
ATTENTION - CLAIM NO
CONTACT : 6222 2311 FAX NO: 6507 3849 POLICY NO
REMARK. © 6990 TP AGST FIRST
CAP SHB3408H
S/N. QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE DISC % MSC/MARKUP TOTAL AMT
I PC  REAR PARKING SENSOR 280.00 280.00 29 "854 00
6 1 BC 6PAX STICKER 20.00 2000 A" 2000
1 pC T0KM STICKER 20,00 2000 L~ 20.00
SUB-TOTAL 587.40
% WORK LABOUR #* 9
TO KNOCK,WELD,REMOVE & REPLACE ABOVE PARTS 85000 &7 _850.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN 120,00 /2% 240,00

85000 £ 850,00

150.00 4V 15000

TOPUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS
TO APPLY ANTI RUST COAT
TO CHECK WIRING

P s B
’ﬂfﬂ“ 73995399
. KVL” %g[%%
(87 11 @ 22§
it

/ Zﬁ-)um(«j_ n,/]zL Vﬁ,

QUVC (fharfo o

JOYCE PAGE: 2of2 SUB-TOTAL : s3 6,307.49
E ADD 7% GST. S% 441.52
GRAND TOTAL : 55 6. 749.01

L2560 ﬁé

ON BEHALF OF SNG AH TEE PANEL & SERVICE PTE LTD E&OE

Disclaimer clause:

The above estimate/quotation is meant for solely the intended party stated above and in any event, we are not liable to any other parties arising from
the eircumstances of this or any action taken in reliance on such estimates or guotations.

Quectation is only valid for 14 days,
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SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtes@singnet.com.sg

Website: www.sngahtee.co 1 h 5

=i ; RCE. Reg. | GST Reg. Mo 2005104?&51"’0["01*'3 NO. 5Q005175
WDTOR CLAMS DEP ACCIDENT DATE : 07/09/2019
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 . vental VEHICLE NO . GTH9GOP
CITY HOUSE SINGAPORE 068877 CHASSIS/ENG.NO @ VSKYBAM2I0Z0106832
T VEHICLE MODEL : NISSAN NV200
ATTENTION : CLAIM NO
CONTACT : 62222311 FAX NO: 6507 3849 POLICY NO

REMARK #990 TP AGST FIRST
CAP SHB3408H
S/N. QTY UNIT  DESCRIPTION PRICE DISC % MSCMARKUP TOTAL AMT

#+ LIST PRICE **

SUB-TOTAL: 0.00

** NETT PRICE **

666.00 G&“""ﬁ/ﬁa_m

1 1 PC REAR BUMPER 740,00 10

2 2 PC REAR BUMPER RETAINER 33.30 10 2097 ¥ 50-94—

3 6 PC REAR BUMPER CLIPS 4.40 10 396 AT 3376

4 1 PC REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR(LH) 55.00 10 49.50 % 45.50

5 1 PC REARBOOT LIDLH 1,381.10 10 124299 66— 124299

6 I PC * REAR BOOT LID LOCK LH 116.70 10 10503 Y 105037

7 1 PC REAR BOOT LID TRIMBOARD LH 184.80 10 16632 X 16633

8 1 PC REAR BOOT LID RUBBER 96,40 10 86,76 7 T

] 1 PC REAR BOOT LID RH 960,90 10 86481 AHLE— B864.8]

10 1 PC REAR BOOT LID RUBBER RH 67.20 10 6048 7 -6u.4%

11 1 PC REAR BOOT LID LOCK RH 116,70 10 10503 7 39503

12 1 PC REAR BOOT LID TRIMBOARD RH 118.40 10 106.56  °  —406.56-

13 | PC K REARENDPANEL TOP GARNISH '« . r; 69.90 10 6291 ¢ 62.91
ou - P T
** SPECIAL NETT PRICE ** '

] 1 PC REAR BOOT GLASS SEALANT 40,00 40.00 AR 30,00

2 | PC  REAR NUMBER PLATE 35.00 1500 X 3500

3 1 PC REAR BOOT GLASS SEALANT 40.00 4000 «“Y -7 40.00

4 1 PC REAR END PANEL 152.40 152.40 ‘,@ 13240

JOYCE PAGE: 10of2

ON BEHALF OF SNG AH TEE PANEL & SERVICEPTELTD E&oEr

Disclaimer clause:

The above estimata/quotation is meant for solely the intanded party stated abeve and in any evenl, we are nol able o any other parties arising from

the circumstances of this or any action taken in refiance on such estimates or quotations.
Quotation is anly valid for 14 days,
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SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

Websile: www.sngahiee.co e ) —r
RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: m:amnm‘ﬂ TE NO. SQ005175
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

DATE 16/09/2019
MOTOR CLAIMS DEP ACCIDENT DATE : 07/09/2019
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 VEHICLE NO - GT6990P
CITY HOUSE SINGAPORE 068877 CHASSIS/EENGNO @ VSKYBAM20Z0106832
- VEHICLE MODEL : NISSAN NV200
ATTENTION ; CLAIM NO
CONTACT: 6222 2311 FAX NO: 6507 3849 POLICY NO
REMARK : 6990 TP AGST FIRST
CAP SHB3408H
SIN.  QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE  DISC % )ISC/MARKUP TOTAL AMT
2 : 100 Awl gy
5 1 PC  REAR PARKING SENSOR 280.00 280.00 2 550,00
6 1 PC 6PAX STICKER 20.00 0,00 4" 2000
7 1 PC T0KM STICKER 20.00 2000 s 20,00
SUB-TOTAL 587.40
Byl
= WORK LABOUR ** df\:f'ﬁﬂ]" -
TO KNOCK, WELD,REMOVE & REPLACE ABOVE PARTS  B0o¢ fane] ek M) as000 697 ss000
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN 12000 /29 240,00
TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS sodt 1 ss000 &5 85000
TO APPLY ANTI RUST COAT 150.00 9 15000
TO CHECK WIRING 3000 7 3000
SUB-TOTAL 2,120.00

ﬂyﬁh 73Y153¢9 Genesy

S . ;
e ) 0L ol
m[ g SOT¢-10 - I _ g’d
ittt ofofir € 2o
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Suv2 (MQ*#{J et
JOYCE PAGE: 2of2 SUB-TOTAL : g8 6,307.49
: ADD 7% GST. S5 441.52
GRAND TOTAL : S% 6,749.01

ON BEHALF OF SNG AH TEE PANEL & SERVICEPTELTD E&oE

Disclaimer clause;

The above estimate/guctation is meant for solely the intended party stated above and in any evant, we are not kable to any other parties arising from
the circumstances of this or any action taken in reliance on such estimates or quotations.
Quetation iz only valid for 14 days.



SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3 Pioneer Road North #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429

Qur Ref:

Date : TI92019
ATTN:THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

SUPPLEMENTARY ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR

Vehicle Reg No. GTEO80P Model / Year NISSAN NV200
Date of Accident  07-Sep-19 Policy No.
Type of Claim  THIRD PARTY Prepared By SHARON
Survey By Chassis No.
S/INO Description Qty Unit Price Amount
1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP 6 % .00 % 54.00
LESS 10% & 5.40

$ 4860



'’ 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 94— 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCI19016398/T1tf3s2

36 ROBINSON ROAD R

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

ATVAOR

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 3408H Veh. Inspected GT 6980P
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No., D19005827TMFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From MERINA CHIA SAN SAN Assign Date 17/08/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN NV200 c.c 1461
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. VSKYBAM20Z0106832 Colour WHITE
Odometer 104703 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOooD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[175/65R14 LING LONG 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[175/65R14 LING LONG & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/65 R14 LING LONG & mm
L/H Rear Tyre [175/85R14 LING LONG & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/09/2019 Inspection Date 18/089/2019
Survey held at SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTELTD
BLK 3, PIONEER ROAD NORTH, #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457,
Sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFORT,
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL FPERIOD FOR REPAIR: 7 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GT 6990P

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607158R GST Reg. No. 19-3607196-R

Page No.:1of 2

; : Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop [;]} ﬁi}
BEPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (N} DEFORMED 740.00 740.00
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER @ $33.30 (N) NOT NECESSARY B6.60
6|REAR EUMPER CLIPS @ $4.40 (N) NECESSARY 26.40 26.40
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR {LH) (N} MOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
1|REAR BOOT LID LH (M) BENT 1,381.10 1,381.10
1|REAR BOQOT LID LOCK LH (N) BENT 116.70 116.70
1|REAR BOOT LID TRIMBOARD LH (N) NOT NECESSARY 184,80
1|REAR BOOT LID RUBBER (M) NOT NECESSARY 96.40 -
1|REAR BOOT LID RH (N) BENT 960,90 860.90
1|REAR BECOT LID RUBBER RH (M) NOT NECESSARY 67.20 -
1|REAR BOOT LID LOCK RH (N) NOT NECESSARY 116.70 -
1|REAR BOOT LID TRIMBOARD RH (M) NOT NECESSARY 118.40 -
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH (N) MISSING 69,90 £9.20
6|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP @ %5.00 (N} NECESSARY 54.00 54.00
(ADDITIONAL)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -405.41 -334.90
3,648.69 3,014.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOT GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 35.00 -
1|REAR BOOT GLASS SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|REAR END PANEL {SN) TO REPAIR SEE 162 40 -
LABOUR
1|REAR PARKING SENSOR (SN) NOT WORKING 280.00 200.00
1|6PAX STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|70KM STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
SB7.40 320.00
LABOQUR
TO KNOCK, WELD, REMOVE & REPLACE ABOVE PARTS. 850.00 750.00
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR END PAMNEL.
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN, 240,00 120.00

Report Ref No. CS/IFCI18016398/T 1tf3s2




Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607 198-R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315

FPage Mo..2 of 2

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()

TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 850.00 800.00

TO APPLY ANTI RUST COAT 150.00 40.00

TO CHECK WIRING. 30.00 30.00
2,120.00 1,740.00

GRAND TOTAL 6,356.00 5,074.10

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,050.00

(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19016398/T 11f3s2

M_

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATA|

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Raport is made salaly for tha use and benefit of the Gliant named on the front page of this Repon.

Hao fiability of responsibility whatscever. in contact or terl. is sccented to any third party wha ma

Baporl inwhole or in part, doss 86 8 his or her own risk,




