Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 September 2020 5:36 PM

To: TeamAutoPro North

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SBR 90X & SLS 1946Y (AIG) ON 28/08/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Peach,

Kindly let us have a copy of the accident video as we noted that your client has a copy of the video.
Does the video/accident photos have a date stamp?

We will revert promptly upon receipt.

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: 8 July 2020 5:04 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SBR 90X & SLS 1946Y (AIG) ON 28/08/2019

Dear Khanchna,

Any updates on the matter?

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Peach Ang



Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Fri, Jun 19, 2020 at 10:59 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Peach,

We are in the midst of clearing our Insured.

Will update accordingly.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, June 19, 2020 10:57 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SBR 90X & SLS 1946Y (AIG) ON 28/08/2019

Dear Khanchna,

Any updates from your side?

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



On Tue, May 26, 2020 at 5:15 PM TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Khanchna,

Any updates from your side?

Or did insured scan the whole page of his passport over? The accident scene photos is very obvious that vehicle
was at the scene..

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Tue, May 19, 2020 at 5:37 PM TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Khanchna,



Please check with insured if he did allow another driver to drove his vehicle? Kindly send the photos to your
insured.

The photos are so obvious that your insured vehicle with the exact same number plate has contact with our
clients vehicle...

On Tue, 19 May 2020, 5:34 pm Khanchna (LKK Auto), <khanchna@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Our Insured has passport stamp to show that he did not enter out/in from Singapore/Malaysia on 28/08/2019.

Kindly let us have the date of the accident photos and time stamp.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2020 5:26 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SBR 90X & SLS 1946Y (AIG) ON 28/08/2019

Dear Khanchna

Photo taken 28th August 2019.
Please find the attached complete GIA report of SBR90OX with the scene photos attached in the report too.

Please advice, thank you.

On Tue, 19 May 2020, 4:31 pm Khanchna (LKK Auto), <khanchna@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without prejudice

Dear Peach,

Please confirm with your client on the actual date of accident as our Insured confirmed that he was not
involved in any accident on 28/8/2019.

When was the photos taken?

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, May 16, 2020 10:48 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SBR 90X & SLS 1946Y (AIG) ON 28/08/2019

Dear Khanchna,

We have a scene photos available as per attached.
Kindly assist to check with your insured and advise us.

Thank you.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and
shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to
his personal injuries.*




Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

|Error! Filename not specified.|

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Fri, May 15, 2020 at 6:35 PM TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com> wrote:

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and
shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to
his personal injuries.*

Cheers,

Adel

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Date: Wed, May 13, 2020 at 11:23 PM

Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SBR 90X & SLS 1946Y (AIG) ON 28/08/2019
To: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

The above matter refers.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter.
We append below our Insured statement and sketch plan:
Error! Filename not specified.

We would like to request a copy of accident video footage/witness statement/scene photos/police
investigation result (if any).

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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