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s mmom  Pld Company Registration No. 199607196R

L

2| URI AVE 1, #1228 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARR, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563501 FAX : (065} [ SR B

Your Ref: D19005949MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCII9016329/Uvd3 DATE: 26/9/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMvadam
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO SMN 9769D

We thank for your instruction on 16/9/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on_17/9/2019  at the premises of M/s EURO SUCCESS SERV FTELTD

Waorkshop Estimate Amount 1 5%7,788.25

Revised Estimate Amount : §$2,800.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check" Items Amount : 8%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value 1 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
ofs front portion and o/s body

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



& Raffles Quay 821-00 Singapare 048580
Tel |65} 6222 €311 Fac (B5] 62 2¢ 3547

Claims & Hotor Undsnwiiting Dept: 36 Pobinsan Road §16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel (656507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
wien misfirsteaplital com.sg

MS . First03 pltal M First Capital Insurance Limited tofes ho. (950000060 CST Hew b M2 COULETEY

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 16-09-2019 Our Ref No. D1 g005945MFSH
Accident Date 14-09-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHB46T1G Third Party Vehicle. SMNS769D
Survey Location 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-03 Autobay
Contact Person. AH HUAT
Contact Mo. 6742 6231/ 0828 9277 Fax No. O
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:
Appointed

PPe LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number, NA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

EURO SUCCESS

Cc:W h ion.
c : Workshop SERVICES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor CROSSBORDERS LLC TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repor via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature reguired.
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 10:01 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Sithara'’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005949MFSH/1 -SMN 9765D
Attachments: SMMN 9769D PREL! ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMN 9769D
Date of survey: 17/9/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 12:36 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005949MFSH/1-5MN 976290

Dear Sir/Madam.
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMN 9769D on 17/9/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email isur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 4:50 PM

To: 'CWS Matar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15005949M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed survey on 17/09/2019.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 4:29 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005949MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 12:36 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005949MFSH/1-5MN 9765D
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMN 9769D on 17/9/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 4:50 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005949MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed survey on 17/09/2019.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 4:29 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005949MF5H/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AUG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
{ WWW.AVE.COM



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
115E

SMN9769D

No

17 Sep 2019

KIA

STONIC 1.0DCT
Black

2019
G3LCKP112201
KNAD6811VL6347625
88.3 kW (118 bhp)
$17,973.00

04 Sep 2019

04 Sep 2019

0

$7,973.00

Yes
03 Sep 2029
$5,979.00

03 Sep 2029

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$32,725.00

$32,602.00

$38,581.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Sep 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 17-Sep-19



EURO SUCCESS SERV PTE. LTD
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit 6, #02-03 Singapore 417883

TEL: 67426231 FAX: 67411019

Vehicle No: SMN9769D

List Items

FRONT RfF'DOOR  B( §

FRONT Rt MIRROR 0 ( {

REAR-R/H DOOR o [

R4H SIDE SKIRT 0[S

FRONTR?H DOOR LOWER GARNISH 9/
REAR OOR LOWER GARNISH o {
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Special Nett [tems
1 FRONT R/H DOOR MECHANISM
REAR R/H DOOR MECHANISM
1 FRONT R/H SPORT RIM

Labour Charges

TO CHECK FRONT AND REAR DOOR ELECTRICAL

WIRING

TO REMOVE, REFIX REAR INTERIOR TRIMS TO ASSIST

REPAIR
TO RESPRAY UNDERCOATING
TO RESPRAY PAINTING AND ETC

PANEL BEATING, CUT, WELD REMOVE AND

REPLACING ABOVE PARTS

ESTIMATE PARTS AND LABOUR GRAND TOTAL

LIKK Aulo Consultants el
the Repairer of the |
» To resurvey bafora/al
damaged ¢

Pty Survey

H/P: 98289277 (AH HUAT)

Model: KIA STONIC
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500.00 30
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1000.00 L-h]{}

$3,050.00
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 189607198R GST Reqg. Mo. 19-3607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18016329/Uvd3n2
601 GITY HOUSESINGAPORE 088877 Wi ShieAiEeER w””“mmlmm
Code: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, 5HB 4671G Veh. Inspected SMN 97650
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D19005949MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 16/08/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KIASTONIC (A) c.c Q98
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2019
Chassis No. KMNADEE11VLEI4TEZE Colour BLACK
Odometer 875 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |1B5/65R15 KUMHO g mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65 R15 KUMHO g mm
R/H Rear Tyre 185/65 R15 KUMHO 9 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/65 R15 KUMHO 9 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE /S FRONT PORTION AND O/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
.} General Information
Accident Date  14/08/2018 Inspection Date 17/09/2019
Survey held at EURO SUCCESS SERVICES PTE. LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #02-03 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607 198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607158-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMN 9769D
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |0 o fg:'] {5';
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DOOR QIS TO REPAIR SEE 850.50 <
LABOUR
1|FRONT MIRROR O/S DAMAGED / 450.20 450,20
SHORTED
1|REAR DOOR Q/5 TO REPAIR SEE 825,80 -
LABOUR
1|SIDE SKIRT O/ GRAZED 455.30 455,30
1|FRONT DOOR LOWER GARMISH O/5 GRAZED 266.20 266.20
1|REAR DOOR LOWER GARNISH OVS GRAZED 248.50 248.50
1|FRONT FENDER QUTER PROTECTOR /S GRAZED 250.00 250,00
1|FRONT FENDER O/S DENTED / BENT 401.00 401.00
1|REAR FENDER CUTER PROTECTOR O/fS GRAZED 295.00 295.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -404.,25 -236.62
3,638.25 212958
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT R/H DOOR MECHANISM (SN) MOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
1|REAR R/H DOOR MECHAMISM (SN) MOT MECESSARY 150.00
1|FRONT R/H SPORT RIM (SN} DENTED / WARPED 800.00 350.00
1,100.00 350.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK FRONT AND REAR DOOR ELECTRICAL 250.00 20.00
WIRING.
T REMOVE REFIX REAR INTERIOR TRIMS TO ASSIST  [NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
REPAIR.
TO RESPRAY UNDERCOATING. 500.00 30.00
TO RESPRAY PAINTING AMD ETC. 1,000.00 600.00
PAMEL BEATING,CUT WELD REMOVE AND REPLACING 1,000.00 400,00
ABOVE PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
DOOR Ofs AND REAR DOOR O/f5.
3,050.00 1,050.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.788.25 3,520.58

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016329/Uvd3n2




Page Mo..2of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

2,800.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19016329/Uvd3n2

CHUA KAMG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely lor the use and banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repor,

ar Pird party wihd may repdy On ihe Fepart Wi O A0 BArk. A

iy thind pary scting o




