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Ms ‘ Firstca pita' M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (s feq Mo 1550001060 G5T Reg No. M2 0OO1GTE9

5 Raflles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) G222 2311 Fax: (63} 6222 3547

Claims & Mator Underwriting Depie 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City Howse Singapere 0G5877
Tel: (85) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
wiwiel, mafirsicapltal.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

13-09-2019 Our Ref No. D19005937MFSH
12-08-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB4218H Third Party Vehicle. SKW5918T

BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-14/15
PERLIN
62641181/ 0 Fax No. 62611324

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MN& Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

BAN CHOON MOTOR
WORKS

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MA

Attention. NIL

JASCON TEA CHEE KIAT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via GWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

s 8




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 12:21 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc: ‘lason Tea'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005937MFSH/1-SKW 5918T
Attachments: SKW 5918T PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKW 3918T
Date of survey: 17/9/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 8 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-2561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 3:28 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: 'Jason Tea' <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005937MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6250-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstca pital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 September, 2019 3:19 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc:; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005937MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

mMotor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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- Consultanis
BN A B Piw Lid Company Registration No 159607 198R

21 UBEAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBL ENDUSTRI AL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (651 62561561 FAX DS R2EAAALE

Your ref: D19005937TMFSH
Our Ref: CS/FCI19016313/R1v3 Date : 18/9/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO: SKW 5918T

We thank you for your instruction on 16/9/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
17/9/2019 at the premises of M/s BAN CHOON MOTOR WORKS

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 55643947
Revised Estimate Amount : 585,373.10
"Check" ltems Amount : S%166.37
Market Value : 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
/s rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



MSI3181 21407 | STA INSPECTION PTE LTD - Boon Ly
EMTRY DATE & TIME: 1300520158 10:28
SUBMITTED BY: Woodlord Richard incent

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1, Please reporl cr)rrectlf the detals of the accdent 1o spaed up the claims process,
2. Tnis Form must be completed by the Paolicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wilful misreprasentalan or w trolding of matenal facts may allow nsurance companies 1o
— e

repudiate palicy liability

4, The issue and acceptance of this For

™ by ingurance companies is nol.an admission of policy liabfity on the part of the insurance companias

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Cenbre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GLA) for
archiving and that copies of his repor will. for a fee, be made available upon application by interesied parties.
7. By the kndgement of his report o the insurers, you hereby consent bo the archiving of this report &1 the centre and 1o copies of the report being made available

aforesad

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Yehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
MRIC Mo

Email Address

Mobile Phong No

Altermative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

far repair to your vehicle?

[f Mo, Please state action lo be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number
Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Oecupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Maobile Number

Fax NMumber

Contact Number
Enail Address

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
13/08/2019 10:28
12/09/2019 17:40
BOON LAY WAY/JURONG EAST STREET 11-TRAFFIC JUNCT
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SKWEDI1ET

TAN SONG YANG @ TAN SONG KHIANG
501474181

SONGYANG TAN@ASIANSEALAND.COM
(LOCAL) +65-98753084
OFFICE-98753084

TOYOTA
COROLLA AXIO-1.5 (A)

PRIVATE USE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

5102153430

TAN SONG YANG @ TAN SONG KHIANG
S0147418|

01/0171951

OUTDOOR

2411111972

46 YEARS AND 9 MONTHS

MALE

{LOCAL) +65-98753084

OFFICE-88753084
SONGYANG. TAN@ASIANSEALAND.COM

Fage 1 of 18



Address BLK 331 JURONG EAST AVE 1 #07-1738
Poslcode 600331

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWHNER

vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Wehicle 2

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - CROSS JUNCTION
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicle) 2

invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospilal by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

I hz_:r-.r_e_ been appmached by u:}knnwn _parsnn{s} NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 1

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? MO

If Yes Please state which Police Station

Was nofice of inlended Prosecution given? MO

If Yes, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER ATTACHED

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? MO

Was there any audio recorded? ND

Vehicle Registration Mumber SHB421EH
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour TAXI-BLUE COLOR - HYUNDAI
Details Of Properties FRONT RIGHT PORTION
Vehicle Category TAX]

Mame of Driver GOH KAH HENG
MRIC/Passport Number S7100513E
Contact Number 96133113
Address

FPostcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage
Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 18



Sketch Plan

SKETCH BPLAN
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Sketch Plan #2
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QrAANG

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

PARFICNE Ranata Frming

VA O Tl T 0 45 S SRS A A S SN SN

Owner 1D Type:

Singapare NRIC

Owner |D: 418l
Vehicle No.: SKWS5918T
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date: 18 Sep 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Medel: COROLLA AXIO 15X A
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine Mao.; 2MRB492430
Chassis Mo.: NRE1410008732
Maximum Power Qutput: 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $14,474.00
Criginal Registration Date: 05 Nov 2015
First Registration Date: 05 Mov 2015
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $9.474.00
ErIniended PARE Kbt D el e e i o e e e e S e L Y
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 04 MNov 2025
PARF Rebate Amount: $7,105.00
i Y T Ko o 3 ER A DT 2] e s s s SRR S S B eSS S
COE Expiry Date: 04 Mov 2025
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $57,885.00
COE Rebate Amount: $34.452.00
Total Rebate Amount: $41,557.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Sep 2019
55 v
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E ; :" BAN CHOON MOTOR WORKS
Blk 3. Pioneer Road North #01-14/15 Singapore 628457 N
Tel: 6264 1191 Fax: 6261 1324

E-mail: banchoon@singnet.com.sg
Business Req /GSTReg. No. 351915/004

GST Regn No. 35191500A

13/09/2019

MS First Capital Insurance Lid
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore 068877

Attn: Motor Claims Dept.

Dear SirfMadam

QUOTATION FOR REPAIRS OF VEHICLE NO. SKW 5918 T
MODEL: TOYOTA COROLLA AXIO 1.5X A

DATE OF ACCIDENT.: 12/09/2019
YOUR INSURED VEHICLE NO. SHBE 4218 H

1pe RH front door Bt~ $ 85301

1pc RH rear door k4 - 804.85

1pe RH rear fender bt — 892.02

1pc Rear windscreen glass moulding rus =~ 97.80

1pc Rear bumper s¢t — 1,087.80

7

1 pc RH rear fender cowling - v 22182

1pg RH rear wheel ce -l — 462.82

1 pe RH rear door inner lock u.Z‘ 7 352.50
% 4 77262

Less: 25% discount 1.193.15

] 3,578.47

1 roll Rear windscreen gum juss =~ 40.00 SN

LABOUR CHARGES:

To dismantle and reassemble of rear windscreen 120.00 /

To knocking and straightening of all necessary damaged paris,

To changing of above part. 1,58000 (OOW

To putty and spray painting on accident damaged parts. 13&1 E[} Lo

§ 643947
sLed_ —

Yours faithfully, &\ HT dolodb¥
Vel -."_‘;.kd:iu_ N 2
LS
]ea(& € L
(gqﬁ") ‘*«&“"' f“{‘&f
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| BAN CHOON MOTOR WORKS

Blk 3. Pioneer Road North #01-14/15 Singapore B28457
Tel: 6264 1191 Fax: 6261 1324
E-mail: banchoon@singnet.com.sg
Business Reg /G5TReg. No. 351915/004

GST Regn No. 35191500A

13/08/2019

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore 068877

Attn: Motar Claims Dept.

Dear SirfMadam

QUOTATION FOR REPAIRS OF VEHICLE NO. SKW §918 T
MODEL: TOYOTA COROLLA AXIO 1.5X A

DATE OF ACCIDENT: 12/09/2019
YOUR INSURED VEHICLE NO. SHB 4218 H

1 pe RH front door b1~ $ 85301
1pe RH rear door &4 <~ 804.85
1pc RH rear fender bd — 892,02
1 pe Rear windscreen glass moulding Aes =~ 97.80
1pc Rear bumper s — _, 1,087.80
1 pc FHiH-rearfendereanwting— St
1pc RH rear wheel gk =~ 462.82
1pc REH rear door inner lock Cl_;f/ 352.50 < e
§ 477262 x5L9
Less: 25% discount 119315 W3 1197
] 3,570.47 TTER 5

1 roll Rear windscreen gum Auss - 40.00 SN
LABOUR CHARGES:
To dismantle and reassemble of rear windscreen 120.00 /
To knocking and stralghtening of all necessary damaged parts.

To changing of above part. 1,§Bd.ﬁﬂ (oo
To putty and spray painting on accident damaged parts. 1,%99?‘50 o0

A7
?gs : ® 6439 <371219

Yours faithfully, HT ﬂ[mlm’ﬂﬁ"

f. [ EN L

S S 1.:..“-\]:\-\{_ g M

L( S
|
sl €%



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Weron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 2:04 PM
To: perlin; Rasul (LKKAuta); SUR

Subject: RE: SKW 5918T - Finalization

Dear Perlin,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MNoted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: perlin <banchoon@singnet.com.sg>

sent; Wednesday, 25 September 2019 12:55 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Re: SKW 5918T - Finalization

Dear Veron

We accept your offer for the above vehicle @ lump sum $4,300.00 (before G5T)

and 8 days for repairs.

Thanks & Regards.

Perlin

On 25/09/2019 12:52 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) wrote:

Dear Perlin,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $4300 @ 8 working days.



Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message----

From: perlin <banchoon@singnet.com.sg>
sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 10:18 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SKW 5918T - Finalization

Dear Rasul

Attached herewith are vehicle no. SKW 5918 T revised quotation and

after spray paint photos for your finalization.

Thanks & Regards.

Perlin
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCELTD Ref CSFCHB016313/R1vids2
376,01 I HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 D REIRe ” umm"mmmm
Code: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHB 4218H Veh. Inspected SKW 59187
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. D19005937MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JASON TEA CHEE KIAT Assign Date 16/09/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ::)YDTA COROLLA AXIO 1.5X |c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. NRE1610008732 Colour BLACK
Odometer 45642 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/60 R15 YOKOHAMA B mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/60 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R15 YOROHAMA, & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  12/09/2019 Inspection Date 17/09/2019
Survey held at BAN CHOON MOTOR WORKS
3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH
#01-14115
SINGAPORE 628457
5a, Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TC YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

8 Werking Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKW 5918T

Page Mo.:1of 1

- Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | -Su e o) {51]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RH FRONT DOOR BENT g53.01 853.01
1|RH REAR DOOR BENT BD4 BS B04.85
1|RH REAR FENDER BENT 892.02 Bg2 02
1|REAR WINDSCREEMN GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY g7.80 a7 .80
1|REAR BUMPER SCRATCHED 1,087.80 1,087.80
1|RH REAR FEMDER COWLING SERVICEABLE 221.82 -
1|RH REAR WHEEL CUT 462 82 452 .82
1|RH REAR DOOR INMER LOCK CuT 352 .50 352.50
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,1983.15 -1,137.70
357947 341310
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|ROLL REAR WINDSCREEN GUM (SN) MECESSARY 40.00 40.00
40.00 40.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE AND REASSEMEBLE OF REAR 120.00 120.00
WINDSCREEN.
TO KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING OF ALL 1.500.00 1.000.00
NECESSARY DAMAGED PARTS. TO CHANGING OF
ABOVE FART,
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT 1,200.00 800.00
DAMAGED PARTS.
2,820.00 1.920.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,439.47 5,373.10
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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Report Ref No. CS/FCI19016313/R1vf3s2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

Y 9%

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY T THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is mads solsly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frant page of this Report.




